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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

LUFKIN DIVISION

IN RE: )
BATEMAN, 111, ROBERT MIDYETTE ) CASE NO. 98-91964

BATEMAN, SARAH ELIZABETH )
) CHAPTER 7 57\

DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION,
AND REPORT OF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Stephen J. Zayler, trustee of the estate of the above-named Debtor(s), certifies to the Court and
the United States Trustee, that the trustee has faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties of the
office of the trustee, that the trustee has examined all proofs of claims as appropriate under the
proposcd distribution, and that the proposed distribution, attached hereto, is proper and consistent
with the law and rules of the court. The trustee applies for commission and expenses set forth
herein and states that they are reasonable and proper.

Therefore, the trustee requests that the Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report
of Proposed Distribution be approved.

DATE: September 8, 1999 77, L% //;47/

-~ ’/"’/ /{’
Stephen J. Zayler /
Trustee 4

ok o ok ok ok o ok o o o e o s i ok e st ol ol o ok e ok o e o ke e o ok sk ok ke o ok ke ok ok o ok ok ol ok ok o o o ok ok o ok e s ke o stk ok sk ook e sk ok ok ok ok R sk ok ok ok

REVIEWED BY THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE:

I have reviewed the Trustee's Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of
Proposed Distribution and have no objection.

United States Trustee

o
Date: /- By: ///,(/




UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
LUFKIN DIVISION

IN RE:
BATEMAN, III, ROBERT MIDYETTE
BATEMAN, SARAH ELIZABETH

CASE NO. 98-91964

CHAPTER 7

DEBTOR(S)

TRUSTEE’S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPLICATION TO CLOSE CASE AND DISCHARGE TRUSTEE

The Trustee of the estate presents the following final report:

1. The Trustee applies for commissions and expenses set forth herein: That they are
reasonable and proper; that in the course of the performance of duties, the Trustee has advanced
monies from personal funds for expenses, and that the Trustee has not been reimbursed or
indemnified.

2. The Trustee submits Schedule F as a summary of the assets and an estate property
record. Any property scheduled under 11 U.S.C. Sec. 521(1) and not administered shall be
deemed abandoned pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Sec. 554(c).

3. The Trustee has reduced all assets of this estate to cash or otherwise lawfully
disposed of them, and the estate is ready to be closed.

4. The Trustee submits Schedule A as the account of estate cash receipts and
disbursements.
5. There is no agreement or understanding between the Trustee and any other person

for a division of the compensation sought by this application except as permitted by the
Bankruptcy Code.

6. The Trustee requests approval of this final report.

7. The Trustee has examined each and every claim filed and noted his approval of
claims as filed, or he has filed objections to allowance or requests for reclassification.

8. The Trustee further requests that after final distribution of all monies in
accordance with the Trustee’s Report of Final Distribution, and upon filing of A Supplemental
Final Report and Account and certification by the U.S. Trustee the trustee be discharged from
office and that the case be closed.

I declare under penalty of perjury that this Report and attached Schedules are true and
correct to the best of my knowledge and belief. E

Dated: September 8, 1999




SCHEDULE A-1
FINAL ACCOUNT AS OF September 8, 1999

A. RECEIPTS

B. DISBURSEMENTS

(1) Secured creditors
(2) Administrative
(3) Priority

(4) Other

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

BALANCE OF FUNDS

0.00
0.00
0.00
0.00

$3,553.06

$0.00

$3,553.00
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SCHEDULE B
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION

COMPUTATION OF COMMISSIONS

Receipts $3,553.06 25% of First $5,000
Less -$5,000 ($1,250.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 10% of Next $45,000
Less -$45,000 ($4,500.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 5% of Next $950,000
Less -$950,000 ($47,500.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 3% of Balance

TOTAL COMPENSATION REQUESTED

TRUSTEE EXPENSES:

Premium on Trustee's Bond

Travel (0.00 at 0.00cents per mile)

Copies (436.00 page at (.25 cents per copy)

Postage

Telephone Charges

Clerical/Secretarial (4.50 hrs. at 15.00 per hour)  SEE ATTACHED

Paralegal/Assistance (6.80 hrs. at 50.00 per hour) SEE ATTACHED
(.40 hrs. at 30.00 per hour)

Supplies/Stationary

Distribution Expenses

Miscellaneous

TOTAL EXPENSES

$888.27
$0.00
$0.00

$0.00

$888.27

$0.00
$0.00
$109.00
$33.06
$23.00
$67.50
$352.00

$2.70
$0.00
$0.00

$587.26

Records :  Trustee did not take possession of
business or personal records of Debtor.

Notice given debtor on
to pick up business or personal records
n hands of Trustee.




THE STATE OF TEXAS )
COUNTY OF ANGELINA )

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority on this date personally appeared Stephen J.
Zayler, and under oath stated the following:

“I, Stephen J. Zayler, am the duly appointed Trustee in the ROBERT MIDYETTE
BATEMAN, III and wife, SARAH ELIZABETH BATEMENT Chapter 7 proceeding. [ am
hereby making application for the maximum amount of Trustee fees, as it is my opinion that the
maximum amount was earned by me In carrying out my duties as Trustee. I held the 34la
meeting, collected assets, filed a Response to a Motion to Lift Stay, reviewed claims, filed
necessary and had an numerous conferences and correspondence with the debtors’ attorney, and
attorneys for a secured creditor. I hereby waive any attorney fees for services rendered as
attorney for the Trustee in order to pay a larger dividend to unsecured creditors. Further, I
performed all other numerous duties of a Trustee, including, but not limited to, preparing
Trustee’s Final Report, will make disbursements and will prepare the Supplemental Final Report.

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED TO before ric on this the 8th day of September, 1999.

1 ( o
! e 2l (.,« . 4 o
f REBECCA ALLeiN ¢ L o £ A LA
Notary Public NOTARY PUBLIC, THE STATE OF TEXAS
* ;‘f aTLTE OFTEXAS
~- Cyp, 2.26-2001

wa‘-‘\u DR LN R




bankrupt.trustee.sec.cla

ITEMIZATION OF SECRETARIAL AND CLERICAL TIME

October 30, 1998 - Setting up file;

(Ra - .10)
November 5, 1998 - Telephone conference with Pam in Greg Longino's office
regarding conflict with 34la hearing date;

(RA& - .10)
November 11, 1988 - Receive and review correspendence from Greg Longino regarding
re-setting of 341a hearing;

(RA - .10)

November 24, 1998 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance filed by Linebarger, et
al on behalf of Trinity/Groveton tax office;
(RA - .10)

December 17, 1998 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance filed by Glen Rubin for
FNMA;
(RA - .10)

January 13, 1999 - Receive and calendar Notice of Hearing on Trustee’s Response to
Motion to Lift Stay filed by Citicorp;
{(RA - .10)

January 26, 1999 - Receipl of and calendar kar date;
{(RA - .10)

February 5, 1992 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order CGranting Agreed
Order on Motion to Lift Stay;

(Ra - .10y
March 3, 1999 - Organize file;
(Ra - .20)
March 3, 1999 - Open new account with NationsBank and load acccount infermation;
(RA - .20)
March 3, 1899 - Preparaticn of receipt of funds;
(CE - .10)
Mzrch 3, 1999 - Prepare deposit, post and Lransmit;
(RA - .20)
March 3, 1999 - Prepare W-9 for transmittal to NationsBank;
(RA - .10)
March 31, 1999 - Review of correspondence from IRS regarding tax identification
numpber;
(RA - .10)

Itemization of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page 1



bankrupt.trustee.sec.cla

April 12, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
{BH - .10)

Bpril 26, 1899 - Receive and note changes of change of address of debtor;
{RA - .10)

May 3, 1999 - Prepare claims reqgister for proof of claims file;
(BH - .40)

May 25, 1999 - Service of objections to claims on proper parties;
(BH - .10

May 18, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

June 16, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

July 14, 1999 - Qrganize file;
(RA - .20}

July 14, 1998 - Correspondence to Court requesting Clerk's Bill of Cost and docket
sheet;
(Ra - .20)

July 15, 1899 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BE - .10}

July 20, 1999 - Receive and review Bill of Costs and docket sheet;

{RA - .10)
August 3, 1999 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order granting claim
objection;

{(RA - .10)

August 16, 1999 - Reconcile hank statement;
(BH = .10}

September 2, 1999 - Correspondence to Bankruptcy Court returning claims folder;
(RA - .20)

Septerber 8, 1998 - Organize file;

(RA - .10)
September 8, 1998 - Copy all bank statements, deposit slips and canceled checks
for delivery of originals to U. 5. Trustee's office;

(BH - .30}

September 8, 1998 - Transfer funds from MMA to checking account at NationsBank
and post accrued interest;
(RA - .20)

Itemization of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page Z



bankrupt.trustee.sec.cla

Septemper 8, 1999 - Prepare and compile Trustec's Final Report for submission to
. 3. Trusteeg;
(RA - .30)

RECAP CF SECRETARIAL & CIERICAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN -  3.10 hrs. @ §15.00/per hr. = § 46.50
CARI PARRISH ~ .10 hrs. @ $15.00/per hr. = 1.50
BEVERLY HATCHER - 1.30 hrs. @ $15.00/pexr hr. = 19.50
TOTAL: 4.5 hrs. @ $15.00/per hr. = 8 67.50

Itemization of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page 3



bankrupt.trustes.paraleg.sel

ITEMIZATION OF PARALEGAL TIME

October 30, 1998 - Review of Schedules and Statement of Financial Affairs as to
pcssikle assets, secured creditors and matters which need to be Laken care of
prior to the 34la hearing:

(RA - .20)
October 30, 1998 -  Correspcndence to debtors requesting additicnal information
for the Trustec to review prior to 34la hearing;

{RA - .30
November 24, 1998 - Receive and review proof of claim of Trinity/Groveton tax
office;

{(SC - .10)
January 6, 1999 - Reccive and review Motion to Lift Stay filed by Citicorp
Mortgage on Florida real estate, review of file and discuss with the Trustee;

(RR. - .20)
January 6, 1999 - Prepare Response to Motion to Lift Stay filed by Citicorp
Mcrtgage;

(RA - .40)
January 11, 1999 - Conference with thce Trustee results of 34la hearing and
possible assets of case;

(Ra - .10}
January 18, 1999 - Receive and review correspondence from Virginia Catron,
attorney for Citicorp, regarding proposed changes to Agreed Order on Motion Lo
Lift Stay;

(RA - .10)

January 21, 1998 - Recelve and review 1996 and 1997 tax returns just filed and
review of schedules to determine whether or not refund was claimed as exempt;

{RA - .20)
January 21, 1998 - Correspondence Lo debtors advising that 1997 tax refund is
property and estate and requesting that they turn over recfund to Trustee upon
recelipt;

{sC - .20)

January 26, 19%9 - Prepare an Order Submission Form for submission of Agreed ordexr
or. Motion to Liff Stay;
(RA - .10)

January 28, 1999% - Correspondence to debtors reguesting a copy of 1998 tax return
whern filed;
{(RA - .20)

March 3, 1999 - Telephone conference with the debtor regarding tax refund;

(Ra - .10)
March 4, 199% Review of file and load asset, lien information and exemption
informaticn into computer;

‘RA - .BO)

March 12, 1999 - Recelve and review proof of claim of San Antonic Federal Credit
Union;

Ttemization of Paralegal Time - Page 1



bankrupt.trustee.paraleyg.sel
(3¢ - .10y

April 12, 1999 - Review of filc for status of administration;
(sC - .20y

April 12, 1939 - Conference with the Trustee regarding status of administration;

(3C - .10)
April 12, 199% - Correspondence to debtors regarding money in bank account and
cargo trailer;

(sC - .40)

April 12, 1996 - Correspondence to Charles Hamilton regarding rent due to debtors
¢n Fleorida property;
(sC - .30)

May 12, 1999 - Receive and review correspondence from debtors’ attorney responding
to additicnal reguests for information on bank accounts;

(RA - .10}

May 24, 1999 - Review claims with Trusleze for legal sufficiency;

{(RA - .40)
May 25, 1999 - Prepare Trustee’s Objection to Claim No. 1, Secured Claim of
Trinity/Groveton Tax Qffice and pruposed Order;

(BH - .40}

May 23, 1999 - Load claim information into computer;

(RA = .60
July 2¢, 1989 - Telephone conference with Virginia Calron’s office regarding
rlorida real estate;

(sC - .20)
July 20, 1999 - Telephone conference with David Sterns’s office, attorney for
Citicorp, regarding status of foreclosure;

(3Cc - .20)
July 28, 1899 - Telephone conference with Dawn in David Stern’s office regarding
foreclosure on Florida property and prepare memo to file;

(sC - .20)

August 24, 1999 - Review file for status of administration;
(RA - .20)

August 24, 1999 - Telephone conference with David Sterns’ office reyarding Florida

property;

(sC - .10}
Seprember 2, 1899 - Telephone conference with Dawn in David Sterns’ office
regarding Florida property and prepare memo to file;

(RA - .20)
September 7, 1999 - Conference with the lrustee regarding status of
administration;

(RA - .10)

Itemization of Paralegal Time - Page 2



bankrupt.trustee,.paraleg.sel

September 7, 1999 - Review of Deed of Trust of Citicorp as to foreclosure
procedure and discuss with the Trustee;

{5C - .20}
Septomber % 1999 - Conference with David Sterns’ regarding results of
foreclosure on Florida property;

(RA - .20)

RECAP OF PARALEGAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN (RA) - 4.5 hrs. R $50.00/per hr. = $ 225.00
SHERRY CARNLEY (SC) - 2.3 hrs. @ $50.00/per hr. = 115.G0
BEVERLY IIATCHER (BH) .4 hrs. @ $30.00/per hr. = 12.00
TOTAL: $ 352.00

Itemization of Paralegal Time - Page 3




SCHEDULE C
EXPENSES OF ADMINISTRATION
(1) Amount (2) Amount {3) Previously (4) Due
Claimed Allowed Paid
1. 11 US.C8ec. 507(a)(1)
_Court Costs _arld_FEeqs. _______ 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. 11 US.C Sec. 503(b)(1)(a)
_P_rf:_sgrza_ti_o_n_ ofEstae .00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3. 11 U.S.C Sec. 503(b)(2)
Post-Petition taxes and related 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
L pemaldes
4. 11 U.8.C. Sec. 503(b)2)
Compensation and
_Reimbursements ________
A. Trustee - Compensation 888.27 888.27 0.00 888.27
B. Trustee - Expense 587.26 587.26 0.00 587.26
BkMk3
5. Court Special Charges (Excess 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nofices) ___ _________
6. United States Trustee Fees (.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BkMk6

TOTALS: $1,475.53 $1,475.53 $0.00 $1,475.53



IN THE UNI™%D STATES BANKRUPTCY "OURT
FOR "~ EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXA™

InRe: Case No: 98-91964 bp
Robert Midyette Bateman Chapter: 7

Sarah Elizabeth Bateman

Debtor(s)

BILL OF COURT COSTS

To: Stephen J. Zayler
P.O. Box 150743
Lufkin, TX 75913-0743

Notice is hereby given that court costs (and deferred adversary filing fees, if applicable) are due
and owing, pursuant to 28 USC Section 1930, in the above case in the amount of $0.00.

These costs are itemized as follows:

NOTICES
$.25 per notice in excess of 50 notices mailed prior to 1/1/87, $0.00
$.50 per notice for all notices mailed 1/1/87 between 1/1/98. $0.00

NOTE: For Chapter 7 cases filed after 12/1/92, there will be NO NOTICE FEES.
(Do Not Bill for 5.50 per notice)

NOTE: For all other chapters filed after 1/1/98, there will be NO NOTICE FEES. (Do Not Bill for $.50 per notice)
PROCESSING CLAIMS

NOTE: Eliminated is the fee of $.25 for clerical processing of each claim in excess of 10 in cases filed
under the Act or Code.

DEFERRED ADVERSARY FILING FEES

0 Chapter 7 Adversary Proceeding filed @ $120.00/150.00 each.
$0.00

NOTE: For all Adversary Proceedings filed after 12/18/96 the filing fee is $150.00.

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $0.00

Check 1o be made payable 10 Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court

Date: 7/15/99
JAMES D. TOKOPH
Clerk of Court
| _
: e
X " AN /
By: ‘-’4\,’@{, )7 LL% N W WLie )
~ Deputy Clerk~

NOTE: For Chapter 11 Cases Only: Court costs are due on or before the confirmation hearing. The
Judge will confirm that these cases have been paid at the hearing.



SCHEDULE D
SECURED CLAIMS
Claim no. Amount Amount Not Amount Previously
Claimed Determined Allowed Paid
TOTALS 0.00 0.00 (.00

Due

0.00

IDENTIFICATION OF SECURED PARTIES AFFECTED:

Claim No. Name of Creditor Claim No. Name of Creditor

1 TRINITY/GROVETON TAX OFFICE



SCHEDULE E

PRIORITY CLAIMS OTHER THAN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES
IN THE FOLLOWING ORDER OF PRIORITY

(1) Amount {2) Amount (3) Amount (4} Due
Claimed Allowed Paid
1. For Credit extended - Sec. 364{e)(1) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. Claims from failure of adequate protection - 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Sec. 307(a)b)
3. "Gap Claims" - Sec. 507(a)(2) (.00 0.00 0.00 (.00
4,  Wages, etc. - Sec. 507(a)(3) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5. Contibutions to benefit plans - Sec. 507(a)(4) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6.  Consumer deposits - Sec. 507(a)(6) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7. Taxes - Sec. 507(a)(7) 0.00 (.00 0.00 0.00
8. Other (No Basis): 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TOTALS: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SCHEDULE E
PARTIES AFFECTED:
Priority No. Name of Creditor Priority No. Name of Creditor
FILED UNSECURED CLAIMS TOTAL: 26,576.09 26,576.09 0.00 26,576.09
SUBORDINATED UNSECURED CLAIMS
TOTAL: (.00 0.00 0.00 0.00



EXHIBIT A

ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER

Case Number: 98-01964
Debtor Name: BATEMAN, i, ROBERT MIDYETTE

Page 1
Claim Type Sequence

Dale: Seplember 08, 1999

Cuode # Credilor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
1 TRINITY/GROVETON TAX OFFICE Secured $0.00 $131.70 §0.00
000 P. O BOX 920 CLAIM DISALLOWED PER ORDER DATED 7-26-99.
SC GROVETON, TX 75845
Subtotal For Claim Type SC SECURED CLAIMS $0.00 S131.70 $0.00
2 AMERICAN EXPRESS CENTURION Unsceured $0.00 $7,804.87 $7,804.87
070 BANK
uc C/O BECKET & LEL LLP
P. 0. BOX 3001
MALVERN, PA 19355-0701
3 AMERICAN EXPRESS - TRAVEL Unsecured $0.00 $131.48 §131.48
070 RELATED
uc C/0 BECKET & LEE
P.0. BOX 3001
MALVERN, PA 19355-G701
4 {UUSAA FEDERAL SAVINGS BANK Unsecured $0.00 $8,679.52 $8,679.52
070 10750 McDERMOTT FWY
uc SAN ANTONIO, TX 78288-05%6
5 FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF ATLANTA  Unsecured $0.00 $5,822.14 $£5,822.14
070 C/O WACHOVIA BANK CARD
LC SERVICES
P.O. BOX 14009
ATLANTA, GA 30324
6 SAN ANTONIO FEDERAL CREDIT Unsecured $0.00 $4,138.08 $4,138.08
070 UNION
uc P.O. BOX 1356
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78299
Subtotal For Claim Type UC UNSECURED CLATMS $0.00 $26,576.09 $26,576.09
Case Totals: $0.00 $26,707.79 $206,576.09

Code #: Trustee’s Claim Number, Priority Code, Claim Type

CREGIS2

Printed: 09/08/99 04:01 PM  Ver: 4.04m



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

LUEKIN DIVISION
IN RE: )
BATEMAN, III, ROBERT MIDYETTE ) CASENO. 9891964
BATEMAN, SARAH ELIZABETH )
) CHAPTER7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE’S REPORT OF
PROPOSED FINAL DISTRIBUTIONS

The undcrsigned trustee of the estate hercby submits to the Court and to the United States Trustee
this Report of Proposcd Final Distributions.

1. The Court has entered orders which have become final, and which dispose of all objections to
claims, all objections to the trustee’s Final Report, all applications for compensation, and all other matters
which must be determined by the Court before final distribution can be made.

2. The trustee proposes to make final distribution of the funds of the estatc as follows, and will
make such distribution unless written objection thereto is made, filed and served on the trustee and on the
United States trustee.

1.

2.

8.

BALANCE ON HAND

ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES TO BE PAID * (note)
SECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)

PRIORITY CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)
UNSECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)

OTHER DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE PAID * (note)

TOTAL DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE
(Sum of lines 2 through 6)

ZERO BALANCE AFTER ALL DISTRIBUTIONS
(Line I less line 7)

* (See attached schedule of payees and amounts)

Stephen J. Zayler

$3,553.06
$1,475.53
$0.00
$0.00
$2,077.53
$0.00

$3,553.06

$0.00

(Trustee)



PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Case Number: 98-91964 Page 1 Date: Septemher 8, 1999
Debtor Name: BATEMAN, 111, ROBERT MIDYETTI:\ BATEMAN, SARAH ELIZABETH

Claim#  Pavee Name Class  Priority Amount Paid to Date Claim Balance Proposed Pymt  Funds Remaining
Beginning Balance $3,553.06
Stephen I. Zayler - [ees Admin $888.27 $0.00 $888.27 S8RK.27 $2,664.79
COMPENSATION
Stephen J. Zayler - Exp Admin $587.26 $0.00 $587.26 $587.26 $2,077.53
EXPENSES
2 AMERICAN EXPRESS Unsec 070 $7.804.87 $0.00 $7,804.87 $610.13 $1.467.40

CENTURION BANK

C/O BECKET & LEE LLP
P. 0. BOX 300!
MALVERN, PA 19355-0701

3 AMERICAN EXPRESS - Unsec 070 $131.48 $0.00 S131.48 $10.28 51,457.12
TRAVEL RELATED
C/O BECKET & LEE
P. 0. BOX 3001
MALVERN, PA 19355-0701

4 USAA FEDERAL SAVINGS Unsec 070 $8,679.52 S0.00 $8,679.52 $678.50 $778.62
BANK
107530 McDERMOTT FWY.
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78288-05%6

3 FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF Unsec 070 35,822.14 $0.00 §5,822.14 $455.13 $323.49
ATLANTA
C/0 WACTIOVIA BANK CARD
SERVICES
P 0. BOX 14009
ATLANTA, GA 30324

6 SAN ANTONIO FEDERAL thnsee 070 $4,138 08 $0.00 $4,138.08 $323.49 $0.00
CREDIT UNION
P. O, BOX 1356
SAN ANTONIO, TX 78299

<< Totals >> $28,051.62 $0.00 $28,051.62 $3,553.06 $0.00

Proposed distribution is dependent on the Court's rulings on adminisliralive expenses, contest of claims, and/or objections made to this
proposed distribution.

PROPDIST Printed: 09/08/99 04:01 PM  Ver: 4.04m



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
LUFKIN DIVISION

IN RE:
BATEMAN, III, ROBERT MIDYETTE
BATEMAN, SARAH ELIZABETH

CASE NO. 98-91964

CHAPTER 7

R S

DEBTOR(S)

ORDER ALLOWING TRUSTEE'S FINAL APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPROVING TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

ON THIS DAY came on for consideration the Trustec's Final Report filed by Stephen J.
Zayler, the duly appointed Chapter 7 Trustee. The Court finds that notice of this hearing has
been given as required by the Bankruptcy Rules. Upon due consideration, the Court finds that
cause exists which justifies the entry of the following order:

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee's final application for
compensation in the amount of $888.27 and for reimbursement of expenses in the amount
$587.26 1s Granted.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Trustee's Final Report is approved as submitted
by the Chapter 7 Trustee, including approval of the payment of the following fees and charges
assessed against the Estate under Chapter 123 of title 28 of the United States Code.

FEES/CHARGES PROPOSED PAYMENT
Clerk Noticing/Claim Fees $0.00
Unpaid Adversary Filing Fees $0.00
Unpaid Quarterly Fees $0.00

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee shall make final distribution of
the amounts set forth in the Trustee's Final Report as approved by this Court and shall file a
Supplemental Final Report and Account together with such bank statements as are necessary to
document a zero balance in all Estate accounts, following compliance with Section 347(a) of the

Bankruptey Code and Bankruptcy Rule 3011, if applicable.

SIGNED this the day of -, 1999,

BANKRUPTCY JUDGE



