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STERREISTAIT OF TEXAS
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT JAN - 7 2009

5‘7‘\

FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS "
BEAUMONT DIVISION o S S BT S

IN RE:

GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. CASE NO. 97-10989

CHAPTER 7

A S N N

DEBTOR(S)

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION F OR COMPENSATION,
AND REPORT OF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Stephen J. Zayler, trustee of the estate of the above-named Debtor(s), certifies to the Court and
the United States Trustee, that the trustee has faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties of the
office of the trustee, that the trustee has examined all proofs of claims as appropriate under the
proposed distribution, and that the proposed distribution, attached hereto, is proper and consistent
with the law and rules of the court. The trustee applies for commission and expenses set forth
herein and states that they are reasonable and proper.

Therefore, the trustee requests that the Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report

of Proposed Distribution be approved.
/WZ

StepR&(T. Zayler /

Trustee

DATE: December 15, 1999

******************************************************************************

REVIEWED BY THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE:

I have reviewed the Trustee's Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of
Proposed Distribution and have no objection.

United States Trustee

Date: /‘ é/' X¢; By: /;j//&
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURf
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: )
GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. ) CASE NO. 97-10989
)
) CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE’S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPLICATION TO CLOSE CASE AND DISCHARGE TRUSTEE

The Trustee of the estate presents the following final report:

1. The Trustee applies for commissions and expenses set forth herein: That they are
reasonable and proper; that in the course of the performance of duties, the Trustee has advanced
monies from personal funds for expenses, and that the Trustee has not been reimbursed or
indemnified.

2. The Trustee submits Schedule F as a summary of the assets and an estate property
record. Any property scheduled under 11 U.S.C. Sec. 521(1) and not administered shall be
deemed abandoned pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Sec. 554(c).

3. The Trustee has reduced all assets of this estate to cash or otherwise lawfully
disposed of them, and the estate is ready to be closed.

4. The Trustee submits Schedule A as the account of estate cash receipts and
disbursements.
5. There is no agreement or understanding between the Trustee and any other person

for a division of the compensation sought by this application except as permitted by the
Bankruptcy Code.

6. The Trustee requests approval of this final report.

7. The Trustee has examined each and every claim filed and noted his approval of
claims as filed, or he has filed objections to allowance or requests for reclassification.

8. The Trustee further requests that after final distribution of all monies in
accordance with the Trustee’s Report of Final Distribution, and upon filing of A Supplemental
Final Report and Account and certification by the U.S. Trustee the trustee be discharged from
office and that the case be closed.

I declare under penalty of perjury that this Report and attached Schedules are true and
correct to the best of my knowledge and belief.

Dated: December 15, 1999




SCHEDULE A-1
FINAL ACCOUNT AS OF December 15, 1999

A. RECEIPTS

B. DISBURSEMENTS

(1) Secured creditors
(2) Administrative
(3) Priority

(4) Other

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

BALANCE OF FUNDS

0.00
4,130.62
0.00
0.00

$68,268.81

$4,130.62

$64,138.19




%001 %08 %09

%SYY

aaANOISNN HOd
A3UIA0CDINA INIDHId

%0v

59'808'YS LL'629°4bET°L

aivd aamomyv
SWIVTIO GaUNOISNN SWIVTO A3-UNOISNN

%02 %0

I %00'0 000 (013 '8401930 01 NYNLIHEIHLO
- %8Z 08 59'808'¥S avd SWIVID 34NO3SNN
T %000 000 QiIvVd SWIVID ALIHOINd
i %000 000 aivd SWiviD a3dno3s
R %000 000 S1S0D H31dVHO Hotdd
R %000 00'0 (013 'S3IXV1I)SISNIIXT 31Vv1iST
B I %000 000 S1S09 1¥N0D
‘‘‘‘‘ 1 %S8°T 8956’1 $334 IVNOISS3H0dHd ¥3HLO
i %0V 51'656 S334 AINHOLLY H3HLO0
%9¢°'0 6.°2¥C SASNAIXT TWNOISSIIONd S. W4
b %y 00'€£86 S334 TYNOISSI408d SN
N %16'€ 01'999'2 S3SNIdX3 S.33LSNHL
— %9.'6 ¥¥'£99'0 NOISSINIWOD Sa31sNyL

'SISNI4X3 ALvis3
%00°001 18'89¢2'89% 'S1d13034 vLOL

‘IWODNI 31v1s3

00-¥0-10 :a3A0uUddY LSN 3Lva

6860L-26 HIAFDNNN 3SVD

*ONI ‘SHAWATOL LSYOD 41nNS JNVYN ISVYD

ISLNIWNOD
HIATAVZ AJ1SNYL

AUYVINANNS JSVD 1¥0d3d TVNId S33LsSnil



3OV A Wd £0°€0 66/F1/Z1 :paruny

(9 wunjo) ut junouwry Ieljo( relo])

bb# » ! {(44.1) woday [euig jo areg pa1oafolq juamun))

66/0£/90 :(WAL) Hoday feur] jo ajeq parosfold renrug

-uohoe 1o pue ‘ofes 1o Juwresy jo syep ‘Surpusd sranew PUE “9A0qE pa1o3[Jal 10U 218 YIIyMm Suisopo ases Sunosyye SaALOE o[y

000§ 18'892°89% 98°SLSY1TS 98°SLS YITS (san[eA umowyun Juipnppxy) STV.IOL
§19SSY SULUIBLISY JO aN[BA SSOIN
vd 1EvTr'e V/IN umowyun (n) susodaqq 1sa101u] UOnBRJ-1S0
ONISVHT ANO
vd 000 va 00°000°S 00°000°s ONVY -dN1d LNV '€
9[qII23[{0OUN JBPUIBIISY
v vd 8S¥T8'81 va OL'E6LY91 0L €6LY91 ATIVAIHOTE SLNNODIOV T
r £ T6610°9¢ 9L’ T8Lvb 91 Z8L vr LISOdHId NO SANNA 1
Aesy ayy uopueqy (pss=vd (s1500 1030 pue sanfeA (A12doug (n) pajnpayosup) pue panpaysg)
§195SY Buiuleway Jo anfeA ssoln Aq paA1a0ay uopueqy (8)ySs=vQ ‘suondwaxy ‘suary ssay panpayssun) uondiosacy 1955y
AVd) parasiwpy A[nyg jassy spunJ,a[es pauopueqy ‘01T, AQ PaurILIga( anjeA) Juonnag
Auadorg AN[BA 19N pIjeuInsy
9 S 14 |3 4 I
86/61/01 ore( Jeq swrer) 66/71/Z1 :Buipuy poudd Joj
86/01/L0 e Funaa (e) e
@ L6/5T/L0 () pausau0) 10 () payid areq "ONI ‘SYFWATOd 1SVOD 41ND ‘owreN 258D
Isjhez - uoydarg ‘3WEN 93ISNI] IV TId 98por 149 68601-L6 "ON 358D
SASYD LASSV

N I = :a8eq

LIOdTT ANV QHODTY ALYAJOUd ALVLST TVNAIAIANI

I WI04




SOV A Nd €0:£0 66/V1/C1 pauld xerniont
12Na0Ud
60°vTS'S9 05°S0L TIVAIZOTE SINNODOV INGWHLVEY ¥ ALHIVS NVORIFWY < 86/20/¢0
%LTT ATHIA HOVINFOHEd
65°818°v9 oe'Lel TVONNY - QAN VA LSTIHINI ANV NOINM 86/1¢€/€0
6T 169°¢9 00°00¢€ FATAVAIEDTE SINNOCDDV INGWALVEY ¥ ALTIVS NVORIEWY T 86/CT1/L0
%ST T ‘G'HIA §OVINADYdd
62 16€V9 TR 101 TVNONNY - QANYVH LSTIHINI JANVE NOINN 86/LT/T0
LY 68TV 00°00T°S FTAVAIZOTT SINNODDV S1ONAO0Yd TVIIW ANOWVIQ < 86/£2/20
LY'680°6S 00°'689 FTAVAIHOTI SINNODDV ST TVIIVAVHD 4 86/60/20
LY POr'8s 00'00¢ HTAVAIZOTA SINNODDOV JINFWALVEY % ALIIVVS VOIMINV [ 86/60/20
%LC°T CATHIA FOVINIDYAd
1 PO6°LS 9C'901 TYANNY - GANIVE LSHIFINT JNVd NOINN 86/0¢/10
J 1ONaodd
17'86L°LS 00°00¢ HTAVAIHOTA SINNODDOV JINFWALVEY ¥ ALTIVS NVOTJHNY 4 86/91/10
%LTT JTALA ADVINADYEd
12'86T°LS 96'S11 TVANNY - GANIVH LSHAFLINI ZINVYA NOINO L6/1¢/C1
12Naodd
STT/ILS 00°00¢ HTAVAIHOTA SINNOIIVY INFWALVEY % ALLIVS NVIRIFNY 4 L6/80/C1
%9CT dTIIA FOVINADYLL
£€7°289‘9¢ 8¥'v6 TVANNY - CEINYVE LSTIFLNI ANVE NOINN L6/8T/LY
LL'LBS'9S 00°005°€ FTEVAIZOTE SINNODOV S1oNA0Ud TV.IIW ANOWVIQ < L6/01/11
LL'LBO'ES 00°00¢ dTIdVAIZDTA SINNODOV INHWHLVEY % ALTAVS NVORIdNY [4 L6/0L/L1
%yT T ATHIA dOVINIDYdd
LLL8S'TS LOV6 TVOANNY - GANIVH LSHIHILNI 2ANVA NOIN( L6/1£/01
OL'E6Y TS 00°0¢s HTAVAIZOTA SINNODDOV ATddNS NOOTIIW [4 £46/0T/01
OL'EL6'1S 00°009°Y FTIVAIHOTA SINNODOV SLONAOEd TVIIN ANOWVIA 4 L6/S1/01
OL'ELE'LY £8°19C°1 HTHVAIHOFA SINNOIDDV "ONI ‘“ONIDVIDVA TVHANTD SYXHL 4 L6/10/01
L8 ILI'OF €TTe ATIVAIIOTE SINNOIOV "ONI ‘SHIDOTONHOAL TVIANTD < L6/10/01
M %IT'7 ‘QTIIA IOVINIONIL
SO‘OF 0L'6¢ TVANNY - @INEVH LSTEEIN ANVE NOINO L6/0€/60
T6'610°9Y 76'610°9Y SLILTOS831# "LOOV d4SOT10 ANO JINVd i L6/S1/60
000 TIAVMIOAT HONVIVE
(g) soue[eg () siaysuer], %) (3) s122yD (§) 1sarmuy ($) susodaq uogoesuer], JO uonduosa Wo1] paAddy / oL pred douaipey aed
MO0V SHusSURSIpy 30 JoayD uonoesuel],
(02 6 8 L 9 S v € Z 1
:(a1qe0Ydde 1) puog Meredag
00°000°00¢  § Gy ased 1ad) puog 1quelg 66/¥1/21 :Buipug pouad 104
LB68LYO9L "oN 1 soAedxe]
19BN ASUON LTSO1E0E1T H2quInN junoddy
- ) MINVH NOINN PwEN yueqg "ONI *SYFIWATOd ISVOD 41ND ‘alueN 35ED
19]Aez ‘1 uaydmg 1ouwIeN 29)snu], 1dg 68601-L6 ‘ON 958D

:aded

QHOOTY SINIWISHNGSIA ANV SLAIZOAY HSVD ALV.LSH

Z NIOA



IXZTWE0LT

GOV A Nd £0°80 66/Y1/T1 :PAUL

0716099  $ 0L
000 uf sysuely, ¢
000 up sywaunsulpy g
0T16099 § JLA
- 0T'160°99 $ [eroqng
0Z°160°99 mQ s1aysuei] |

000 mQ spuounsnlpy o 0L'9PZ 1 sSugsod IsaIoiu] 71
000 SY93YD 0 0S'+HR‘v9 susodaq b1
000 PiemIo] asuejeq LZSOTEOEIT N0V

000 0Z°160°99- JoysueL], spun. jueg TL8SSBESLEH IOV O) IJSUBLY, 86/61/80
0T 16099 vTeL JINVA WOHd A.0TH LSTITLNI HANVI NOINN 86/61/80
96°L10°99 [:3A JINVE WOYA ADTY 1STIAFINI INVE NOINN 86/1¢/L0
%LTT ATIIA HOVINADIEd
£0'268°S9 oL'6Zl TYANNY - INAVH LSHIFINT SINVE NOINN 86/0£/90
w %LTT QTIIA HOVINADIAd
LE79L'S9 ge L1 TVOANNY - GEANIVH LSTIHLIND ANV NOINO 86/6T/50
%LTT ATHIA HDVINIDIEd
$0'Sv9°s9 S6'0Z1 TVANNY - AINIVH LSHTIFINI SINVE NOINN 86/0¢/¥0
($) souereqg (3) ssaysues] ® ($) s’22yqD ($) 5219307 (§) susodacy uonaesuer] O uonduosa wWol,{ PaAIaay [ O pred 30uUIYY aeq
JUNO00Y spuaunsnipy 10 N2aqD) uonoesuel],
ol 6 8 L 9 S v £ (4 I
:(a1qeoridde J1) puog sjeredas
0000000 $ :(nuj| ases 1od) puog 19querg 66/b1/C1 :3utpuyg pouad 104
L868L¥0-9L 10N (] JoAedxe],
1jrepy ABUOIN LZSOIE0E1T HAQUIMN JUN0DY
C- ’ ANVE NOINM ‘owEN yueg ONI ‘SYFIIWATOd LSYOD I1ND PWIEN 35T
1a[Lez 1 usydoyg ‘wEN SN, 1dg 68601-L6 ‘ON 5B
) @IODTY SINHWASINASIA ANV SLAIDATA HSVD HLV.LSA
. - fegq

N304



0y WA W £0:€0 66/P1/T1 :pAUL] Lxernod1
000 61'8EE Y9 a3ysuer], Sunsod [euly £889S8ESLE# 100€ 0} 19suel ], 66/¥1/21
61'8E1°v9 99°¢S JANVE WOId A.0TY LSTIHLNI VORIV 40 JNVE v 66/¥1/21
£6°P80'F9 68°LET JINVE WO A0 ISTHHINT VIORIHWY 40 NV 1 4 66/0€/1Y
$9'256°€9 oL 61t FANVE WOUS 4,099 LSTHILNE VOV 40 JNVY 14 66/6T/01
10652 X1 ‘NIAANT
THTEO 3 TLENL tovl
“66"b7-6 AELVA YHAWO ¥dd vdd
SR'ZER'EY 89'SY6’L SHEA INV INNODIDV VONIWIVL 'S AIAVA £01000 66/0£/60
£SBLL'SS 6921 PINVE WOdd d.03d LSTIILNI VOIIINY 40 INVd 14 66/0¢/60
19°159°59 CI'SET JINVA WO d.DFA LSTIALNI VN “uegsuoueN 14 66/1£/80
AROTS SO otl JINVE WOMA ALOFY LSTYELNI VN uegsuoneN 14 66/0¢€/L0
%m“mw 86'6€1 JINVE WO d.DFYE LSTYALNI VN uegsuoueN 14 66/0£/90
6+°0ST°S9 10°¢T1 JINVE WO ALOFY ISHIALNI VN “uegsuoteN 14 66/87/50 L
8¥'ST1°S9 06'vEl NV WOMA GO LSTIHINT VN HoegsuoueN 14 66/0L/¥0
TOLLL X1 “INOWNVHY
'66-0¢-€ ALV YIAHO ¥dd "TISHILI HIYON Ot1L
8506619 SL'656 SHSNHJXH % SHEL AANYOLLY AVSANIT [ THVHIIW 201000 66/S0/%0
EPLO-ST6SL XL ‘NITANT
2051 X049 O 'd
'66-06-€ QALVA YAAHO ¥dd AV LY AANMOLLY
£L°6V6°S9 6L°STZ'1 SASNAJIXH ANV STdd AGNIOLLVY YHTAVZ '( NHHdALS 101000 66/50/¥0
TS SLILY 99°161 JANVE WO ALOTY 1STUH LN VN YuegsuoueN 14 66/18/€0
98'€70°LY 134141 PINVE WOEd A0 LSTAILNI VN Sjuegsuonen 14 66/97/70
SP'568°99 vLTEL JINVE WOdd ALOT LSHAHINI VN uegsuonenN 14 66/6T/10
1L°79L°99 09°'T¥1 JINVE WOdd ALOFY ISTIALNT VN uegsuoneN 86/1€/C1
11°129°99 ot IF1 JINVA WOd A OFY LSTIdLNT 'V'N SuegsuonenN 86/0¢/11
18'6.1°99 £9°PS1 JINVE WOAA A.OFY ISTAALNI JINVASNOILVN 86/0€/01
\Vdew £€E91 SINVE WOAA A0 LSTAALNI JINVASNOILVN 86/0¢/60
i 19199 $9°0L PINVE WOYMS A.OTY LSTIHLNL YINVASNOILYN 86/1€/80
0Z'160°99 0T' 16099 i3ysuei], spung jueg LTSOTEOE 1T WOV UI0L] IDJSUBLY 86/61/80
000 MAVMAAOL HONVIVE
(3) aouereg ($) smysuel], ) (8) s¥23yD (8) 3saauy () susodaQq uoyoesuel] JO uonduasaq WOl PIALdY / OL Pred 30U aed
UNOIDY sjusunsnipy 30 §924D) uonosesueyy,
ol 6 8 L 9 < t € z 1 _
:(a1qeaydde 1) puog sjeredag
00°000°00€  § -(yuumj 3seo 1od) puoyg 1euejg 66/%1/21 :Buspus poudd 104
L868LYO-9L :oN (1 3afedxey,
SuLeag 1SUANU] - JIBN ASUON [L8SSBESLE IoqUIMN] JUNOSOY
T i VORIFNY 20 JNVd :dWeN yuegq NI ‘SYTAKXTOd LSVOD J1NO :JWEN ISED
19[he7 1 uaydals ureN S9SN 1dd 68601-L6 10N 358D
; _ @HOOAY SINHWISHNLASIA ANV SLdIFOHAY HSVD ALVISH
S € :a8ed

ZINIOA



%0V A Wd £0°€0 66/P1/Z1 :pawLY Euéos

18'89Z°89 § 180
0T 16099 uJ sioysuei] |
000 U s;uaunsnipy
18'89Z°89 ¢ =L
e 19°LL1'c $ [moqng
61°8E1°b9 mQ sisgsuel]. |
000 mo swaunsnpy g 19°LL1°T s3unsod 3saxsnay 4|
v 9°0€1'y SH2YD € 000 susodaqg o
000 premioq souereq [LBSSBESLE JUNOODY
() soueeg ($) sioysuer] ) (8) sposud ($) 159199u1 ($) susodaqq uonoesuei], jO uondussaq WOL] PaAIaoay / 01 preg 30Uy aed
N0y syusunsnipy 10523 uonoesuRIy
o1 6 8 L 9 S + t 4 I —
‘(31qeaydde 1) puog sjeredsg
00°000°00€  § :(run ased 32d) puogy 1oyueg 66/41/21 :3utpuy pouad 104
L868L10-9L *ON a1 1aAedxey,
Sunresg 1s2109u] - jadueN ASUOIN 118558€5/ € QNN JUNOIOY
- B VOREANWY 40 ANVE “auwreN yueg "ONI "SYAWATOd LSVOD 411D ‘owEN 258D
13[AeZ -1 usydayg EL NS 1dg 68601-L6 0N 358D

HOOTA SLNAWASHNGSIA ANV SLAIADTY HSVD ALVLSHA

. t  :afeq I INYOA



0P A d PO:€0 66/P1/Z1 :pAruLyg

(44t (e X |

LXZTIWIOAT
6I8EI'P9  § soue[eq [2I10], 19N 0T'86¥°861 $ i g
GE6ZT0ET uj sIysuely ¢
000 uf sjusugsnpy o
V 1009EbEL  § 7oL
-_— 18'89Z°89 § Ieoiqng
6€°6ZT0EL NQ siapsuer], 7
000 mo siwaunsnlpy o 1€bTh'e s3upsod 1sa1eiu] 67
9°0¢1P S¥9YD ¢ 05" tb8po spsodag 1
000 plemIo] souefeg simel poday
6I'8EIb9 § [e101
61°8E149 U SIgysuel] |
000 u] sjusugsnfpy g
0070 $ =mo1
- 00°0 Iwoqng
000 QO sIysuel] o e
000 O swaunsnfpy o 000 sSunsod 1sa1ouy ¢
000 934D o 000 susodsq ¢
000 Plemio] aouereg €889S8ESLE JUNOADY
61'8€1°9 61'BEI't9 WMoY VN WO uf Jajsuel], IL2SSBESL €4 100V wioY Jojsues], 66/71/T1
000 QIVMIOT FONVIVE
($) souejeg ($) s1ysuery ) ($) syoayD () 15019901 ($) snsodag uonoesuer] JO uoudussacy WOL PIAISOIY / O, preg U] aed
unoIoy spusunsnpy 10 Y23y uopoersuRLy
o1 6 8 L 9 S v £ z I
:(aqeondde 1) puog eiedsg
00°000°00t  § :Qmuy ases 1ad) puog 3ajue;g 66/b1/21 :utpug pousd 104
L868LPO9L "ON aJ 1akedxe]
IS3IDYUT UON - BUINIYD £88958ES/ ¢ Jaqump Junoory
- ) VORAINWY 40 JINVd DUWEN yueg "ONI "S¥FWATOd LSVOD 11ND ‘9WEN e
1ojhez -t uoydmg ‘UIEN 29ISTU] 149 68601-L6 0N 958D
) THOOTY SINAWASANGSIA ANV SLAIIDTY HSVD ALVLISH
B s a8eq




' wpdocu."[eeapp.ox:d
IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT,4o-i' " 7 «iws

FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION i

IN RE:

Ry

GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. CASE NO. 97-10989

TAX I.D. 76-0478987

DEBTOR ,qQ CHAPTER 7

N

E§3§BER APPROVING APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR COUNSEL FOR TRUSTEE

CAME ON this day to. be considered the Application for
Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed by STEPHEN J.
ZAYLER, Trustee, on'behalf of Stephen J. Zayler, Counsel for the
Trustee and it appearing to the Court that the Application is well
taken and should be granted pursuant to 11 U. S. C. Section 330, it
is therefore

ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Trustee be authorized
to pay to STEPHEN J. ZAYLER, as compensation for legal services
rendered as Counsel for the Trustee, the sum and amount of $983.00,
and reimbursement of Qut—of—chket expenses in the sum and amount
of $242.79 for a total of fees and expenses of $1225.79 and that

the same be paid from the funds of this estate upon execution

hereof.

DATED this the ,ﬁ day of %ﬂ{éﬁo , 1999,

{ A,
BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

2
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EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

A

~

IN RE:

LN e

fra e

GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC.
TAX I.D. 76-0478587
DEBTOR

PR " ' \?/\J

CASE NO. 97-10989
CHAPTER 7

w1 W ;1 P

‘h DER APPROVING APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND
‘agj() REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR ATTORNEY FOR TRUSTEE

AS AN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES

CAME ON this day to be considered the Application for
Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses filed by STEPHEN J. ZAYLER,
Trustee, on behalf of MICHAEL.J. LINDSAY, Attorney for the Bankruptcy
Estate, and'it appearing to the Court that the Application is well
taken and should be granted pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Section 330, it is
therefore

ORDERED, ADJUDGED AND DECREED that the Trustee be authorized to
pay to MICHAEL J. LINDSAY, as an administrative expense, compensation
for leQal éervices rendered as Attorney for the Bankruptcy Estate, the
sum of $§740.00, and reimbursement of expenses in the sum and amount
of $219.i5 for a total of fees and expenses of $959.15 and that the

same be paid from the funds of this estate upon execution thereof.

DATED thisﬂday of ﬁ%ﬁf% 1999.

ITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

PPLICATION F NSAT, NT
QF EXPENSES PURSUANT 70 11 U.5.C. SECTION 330
c:\law\bankrupt\trustee\richards\spec-cou.pay Page 11
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5 e U TON COoUldr
, LASHLRM ST OF TEXAS

SEP 2 41999 AM

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRURTCY COURT b M

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS T T BANKRUP TG COURT

BEAUNONT DIVISION Y
IN RE: ] DrEG e
GULP COAST POLYMBRS, INC. g CASR NO. 97-10589
1 CHAPTBR 7
DEBTOR 3 EO '
ON TQ AL D 5tP2 499

On or about August 25, 1999, the Motion for Allowanca of Compensation to
Accountant (the “*Motion*} was filed by Stephen J. Zayler (the “Movant™) on
behalf of DAVID S. TAMMINGA, Certified Public Accountant, in the above-
referenced casne. The Court finds that the Motion was properly saerved
pursuant to the Pederal and Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it
contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice language, pursuant
to lLocal Rule of Bankruptcy Procedurs $007, which directed any party opposed
to the grancing of the relief sought by the Motion to file a written response
within twenty days or the Motion would be deemed by the Court ro bhe

unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or other written responee to

the Motion has been timely filed by ar;y& party. &Wa&n&

adw) rewdde awdne ) ,
- finds that good cause exists
for the entry of the following order.

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that cChe Trustee be authorized ro pay DAVID S.

TAMMINGA, Certified Public Accountant, the sum and amount @f S$1.945.68 for
services rendered ro the Trustee in connection with the Bankruptcy Estats of

GULF COAST PCLYMERS,INC., and that the same shall be taxed aB an

administrative expense ip this proceeding.
DATED this m.ay of oL

[ il [enfl

UNITRD STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE




SCHEDULE B
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION

COMPUTATION OF COMMISSIONS

Receipts $68,268.81 25% of First $5,000
Less -$5,000 ($1,250.00 Max)
Balance $45,000.00 10% of Next $45,000
Less -$45,000 ($4,500.00 Max)
Balance $18,268.81 5% of Next $950,000
Less -$950,000 ($47,500.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 3% of Balance

TOTAL COMPENSATION REQUESTED

TRUSTEE EXPENSES:

Premium on Trustee's Bond

Travel (497.00 mile at 0.35cents per mile)

Copies (1,319.00 page at 0.25 cents per copy)

Postage

Telephone Charges & Facsimile

Clerical/Secretarial (21.40 hrs. at 15.00 per hour)  SEE ATTACHED

Paralegal/Assistance (4.70 hrs. at 35.00 per hour)  SEE ATTACHED
(30.00 hrs. at 50.00 per hour)

Supplies/Stationary

Distribution Expenses

Miscellaneous

TOTAL EXPENSES

$1,250.00
$4,500.00
$913.44

$0.00

$6,663.44

$0.00
$173.95
$329.75
$145.34
$24.00
$321.00
$1,664.50

$7.56
$0.00
$0.00

$2,666.10

Records: Trustee did not take possession of
business or personal records of Debtor.

Notice given debtor on
to pick up business or personal records
in hands of Trustee.
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THE STATE OF TEXAS )
COUNTY OF ANGELINA )

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority on this date personally appeared Stephen J.
Zayler, and under oath stated the following:

“I, Stephen J. Zayler, am the duly appointed Trustee in the GULF COAST POLYMERS,
INC. bankruptcy proceeding. I am hereby making application for the maximum amount of
Trustee fees, as it is my opinion that the maximum amount was earned by me in carrying out my
duties as Trustee. This was an involuntary proceeding of a corporation. I held the initial 341a
meeting and held a subsequent 341a hearing because all creditors were not originally noticed
because of involuntary filing, collected accounts receivable and funds on deposit, reviewed books
and records of the debtor, had numerous conferences with accounts receivable, the principal of the
debtor corporation, the attorneys for creditors and attorney for the involuntary debtor, assisted
special counsel in investigating pre-petition transfer of property by debtor, filed appropriate
applications for professional fees and filed necessary payroll reports and fiduciary tax returns.
Furtber, I performed all other numerous duties of a Trustee, including, but not limited to,
preparing Trustee’s Final Report, will make disbursements and will prepare the Supplemental
Final Report.

(777

AL
Stephetd Zayler

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED TO before/me on this the 15th day of December, 1999.

) ()

NOTARY PUBLIC, THE STATE OF TEXAS

Notary Public !
STATE OF TEXAS




ITEMIZATION OF SECRETARIAL AND CLERICAL TIME

July 25, 1997 - Setting up file;
(EG - .10)

July 25, 19897 - Telephone conference with Bankruptcy Clerk’s Office regarding
not receiving inveoluntary petition or schedules;

(EG - .10)
July 29, 1997 - Telephone conference with Bhavani in Pete Steele’s office
regarding schedules;

(RA - .10)

September 2, 1997 - Telephone conference with Pete Steele regarding schedules
just being filed and request for re-set for 341la and discuss with the Trustee;
(RA - .10)

September §, 1997 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance of Lamm & Smith on
behalf of York Industries;
(RA - .10)

September 15, 1997 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

September 15, 1997 - Telephone conference with Union Bank opening new account
with and load bank account information into computer;
(RA - .20)

September 15, 1997 - Prepare W-9 form for transmittal to Union Bank;
(RA - .10)

September 15, 1997 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union
Bank;

(RA - .20)
September 18, 1987 - Receipt of and calendar bar date;
(RA - .10)
September 18, 1997 - Organize file;
(sC - .20)
October 1, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Texas General

Packaging and General Technologies, Inc. regarding accounts receivable owed to
debtor;

{RA - .10)
October 1, 1997 - Prepare receipt of two (2) checks;

(EG - .10)
October 1, 1997 - Prepare two (2) deposits, post deposits and transmit to
Union Bank;

(RA - .30)
Octeober 1, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Calame, Linebarger,
et al regarding delinquent personal property tax;

(RA - .10)

Itemization of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page 1



October 8, 1999 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Employing
Accountant;
{(RA - .10)

October 10, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

October 15, 1997 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG ~ .10)

October 15, 1997 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

October 20, 1997 - Receive and review Notice of Entry c¢f Order Employing
Attorney for Trustee;

(RA - .10)
October 20, 1997 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)
October 20, 1997 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
{(RA - .20)
October 24, 1997 - Organize accounts receivable file and update accounts
receivable list;
(SC - .40)

November 10, 1997 - Prepare receipt of two (2) checks;
(EG - .10)

November 10, 1997 - Prepare two (2) deposits, post deposits and transmit to
Union Bank;
(RA - .30)

November 10, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA - .20)
December 8, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence frcom Orange County
Appraisal District al regarding delinquent personal property tax;

(RA - .10)

December 8, 1997 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

December 8, 1997
(RA - .20)

Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;

December 9, 1997
(RA - .20)

Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

January 9, 1998 -~ Review and change address on W-2 of Eric Thomas and remail;
(8C - .10)

January 12, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)
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January 14, 1998 - Review and change address on W-2 of Delois Kirkman and
remail;
(sC - .10)

January 16, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

January 16, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(Ra - .20)

January 22, 1998 - Recelve and correct new addresses for employees’ W-2 forms
and remail;

(SC - .10)
February 2, 1998 - Receive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(RA ~ .10)
February 9, 1998 - Prepare receipt of two (2) checks;
(EG - .10)
February 9, 1998 - Prepare two (2) deposits, post deposits and transmit to
Union Bank;
(RA - .30)
February 9, 1998 - Organize file;
(SC - .20)
February 9, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RB - .20)
February 12, 13998 -~ Locate new address for Michael Graham and remail W-2 form;
(8C - .10)
February 13, 1998 - Receive and 1list Notice of Appearance of Calame,
Linebarger on behalf of Orange County Appraisal District;
(RA - .10)
February 23, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)
February 23, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)
February 23, 1998 - Locate new address for David Bishop and remail W-2 form;
(SC - .10)
February 26, 1998 - Locate new address for David Rodriguez and remail W-2
form;
{sC - .10)

March 10, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

March 12, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

Itemization of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page 3



March 12, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

March 27, 1998 - Telephone conference with Craig Moak regarding W-2 of Randall
Moak;
{8C - .10)

April 2, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;

(EG - .10)
April 2, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post depesit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)
April 8, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)
April 14, 1998 - Locate new address for Randall Moak and remail W-2 form;
(8C - .10)
April 30, 1998 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Employing Mike
Lindsay;
(RA -~ .10)
May 8, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

May 19, 1898 - Receive and review ’'97 tax statement from Orange County;
(RA - .10)

May 21, 1998 - Receive and review correspondence from debtor’s attorney, Pete
Steele, regarding necessity for holding another 34l1a hearing because all
creditors were not notices of the original hearing because of involuntary
filing and discuss with the Trustee;

(RA - .10)
May 26, 1998 - Receive and review correspondence from Pro-Plastics regarding
outstanding invoice;

(sC - .10)
May 29, 1998 - Telephone conference with Bonnie at Pete Steele’s office
regarding setting 2" 341a hearing;

(RA - .10)

June 5, 1998 -~ Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

June 9, 1998 - Prepare Motion to Fix New Bar Date for filing Claims since re-
set of 34la hearing and proposed Order;

(RA - .60)
June 10, 1998 - Telephone conference with Gary Coker, attorney for wvarious
creditors, regarding re-set of 34la hearing;

(RA - .10)
June 10, 1998 - Correspondence to Court returning claims folder to clerk
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because new bar date to be set;

(RA - .20)
June 10, 1998 - Organize file;

{SC - .10)
June 10, 1998 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance of George R. Diaz-
Arrastia on behalf of TMRE;

(RA - .10)
June 15, 1998 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance of Gary Coker for
Southern Polymer, Inc.;

(RA - .10)
July 16, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA - .20)
July 27, 1998 - Receive and calendar Order Fixing 2™ Bar Date for Claims;

(RA - .10)
August 12, 1998 - Receive and review correspondence from Internal Revenue
Service regarding request for tax return;

(RA - .10)

August 18, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

August 18, 1998 - Post transfer of funds from Union Bank to NationsBank;
(RA - .30)

August 18, 1998 - Verify tax identification number for NationsBank’s W-9 form;
(RA - .10)

September 21, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

October 20, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

November 11, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

December 2, 1998 - Service of objection to c¢laims on interested parties;
(BH - .50)

December 2, 1998 - Organize file;
(EG - .20)

December 14, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

January 13, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

January 19, 1999 - Receipt and review of Notice of Entry of Order Granting
Claim Objections;
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(RA - ,10)
February 3, 1999 - Receive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(RA - .10)
February 3, 1999 - Receive and review billing draft of time and expenses
incurred by Michael J,. Lindsay;
(RA - .10)
February 12, 1999 - Correspondence to Court request updated mailing matrix;
(BH - .20)
February 17, 1999 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of OQrder Abating

Court’s correspondence on Application of Compensation for Attorney for Trustee
and discuss with the Trustee;
(RA - .10)

February 16, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10}

February 22, 1999 - Copying, folding and stapling of Summary of Application
for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses to Michael J. Lindsay, and
stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes for mailing to all
creditors and interested parties;

(BH - .80)

February 23, 1999 - Copying, folding and stapling of Summary of Application
for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses to Stephen J. Zayler, and
stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes for mailing to all
creditors and interested parties;

(BH - .80)

March 11, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

April 5, 1999 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order to Pay Michael
Lindsay and Stephen J. Zayler;

(RA - .10)
April 5, 1999 - Telephone conference with Sheree’ with Bankruptcy Court
verifying contents of actual Order;

(RA - .10)
April 5, 1999 - Prepare disbursement checks to Steve Zayler and Michael
Lindsay for attorney fees and post disbursements;

(RA - .30)

April 5, 1999 - Correspondence to Mike Lindsay regarding his employment and
transmitting check;
(8C - .20)

April 12, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

May 5, 1999 - Organize file;
(RA - .20)
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May 6, 1992 - Trip to and from David Tamminga’s office delivering information
fer preparation of fiduciary returns;

(RA - .50)
May 11, 1999 - Correspondence to Court returning claims folder;
(RA - .20)
May 18, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
June 16, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
{BH - .10)
July 14, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
July 26, 1999 - Copy and return employment contract to David Tamminga;
(BH - .10)
July 26, 1999 - Prepare tax returns for mailing to District Director and IRS;
{(BH - .20)
August 3, 1999 - Review of file to locate previous statement from David
Tamminga for services performed other than preparation of tax returns;
(BH - .10)
August 6, 1999 -~ Receive and review correspondence from Internal Revenue
Service regarding request for fiduciary tax returns;
(RA - .10)

August 16, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

August 24, 1999 - Copying, folding and stapling of Motion for Allowance of
Compensation to Accountant, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping
envelopes for mailing to all creditors and interested parties;

(BH - 1.30)
September 14, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;

(BH - .10)
September 20, 1999 - Receive and review correspondence from Internal Revenue
Service regarding approval of fiduciary tax returns;

(RA - .10)

September 30, 1999 - Receipt and review of Notice of Entry of Order Granting
Compensation to Accountant;

(RA - .10)
September 30, 1999 - Prepare disbursement check to David Tamminga, post
disbursement and transmit;

(RA - .20)

October 14, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
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October 18, 1999 - Organize file;

(RA - .10)
October 18, 1999 - Correspondence to Court requesting Court costs and docket;
(RA - .20)
October 27, 1999 - Receive and review Bill of Court costs and docket;
(RA - ,10)
October 28, 1999 - Receive and review correspondence form State Comptroller
regarding franchise tax return;
(RA - .10}

November 15, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)

December 13, 1899 - Organize file;
(RA - .20)

December 13, 1989 - Copy all bank statements, deposit slips and checks for
delivery of originals to U. S. Trustee's office;
(RA -.70)

December 14, 1999 - Transfer funds from MMA to checking account at NationsBank
and post accrued interest;
(RA - .20)

December 14, 1999 - Prepare and assemble Trustee's Final Report for U. S.

Trustee approval;
(RA - .30)

RECAP OF SECRETARIAL & CLERICAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN - 12.40 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = § 186.00
BEVERLY HATCHER - 5.50 hrs @ 515.00/per hr. = 82.50
ELIZABETH GORMAN - 1.50 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = 22.50
SHERRY CARNLEY - 2.00 hrs €@ 515.00/per hr. = 30.00
TOTAL: 21.40 hrs € 515.00/per hr. = $ 321.00
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RESUMES OF THE PARALEGAL ASSISTANTS TO THE TRUSTEE

Rebecca Allen

Employed by the Trustee September 1, 1990. Has 22 years bankruptcy and other
legal experience and was formerly employed by another Chapter 7 Trustee.

Her duties performed for the Trustee include loading information into the case
management system when files are received, preparation of Trustee's Report of
No Distribution, preparation of various correspondence between Trustee and
interested parties, answer telephone calls regarding routine questions,
assisting with the location, collection and disposition of assets, assisting
in the collection of sale proceeds and accounts receivable, answering
questions from Creditors, opening bank accounts, securing Tax 1ID Nos.,
Preparing deposits and disbursement checks, posting deposits and disbursements
into computer, reconciling bank statements, organizing files, preparation of
objections to claims, pPreparation of various pleadings including applications
and motions in contested matters, preparation of semi-annual reports,
preparation of Trustee's Final Reports and Reguest for Compensation and
preparation of Trustee's Supplemental Final Reports.

Sherry Carnley

Employed by the Trustee December 1, 1994. Has 17 years broad legal experience
in all areas of law.

Her duties performed for the Trustee include organizing files, preparation of
various pleadings including applications and motions in contested matters,
principal assistant to the attorney for the Trustee in the preparation of
adversary proceeding complaints, discovery, pre-trial and post-trial
pleadings, preparing monthly reports in operating Chapter 7's, principally
responsible for assisting with the locaticn, collection, and disposition of
assets, assisting in the collection of sale proceeds and accounts receivable,
answering general questions from creditors, preparation of correspondence,
preparation of cbjections to claims, preparation of various miscellaneous and
other legal documents.

Beverly Hatcher

Employed by the Trustee June 1, 1998. Formerly employed by an attorney, but
had no bankruptcy experience prior to coming to work for the Trustee.

Her duties include assisting in the set-up of files, filing, occasionally
preparing receipts of checks, assisting in the mailing of notices, assisting
in posting to ledger and reconciling bank statements, occasionally preparing
deposits for mailing to NationsBank by Airborne Express, preparation of
general correspondence and answering various telephone calls between the
Trustee and interested parties regarding routine questions, verifying receipts
against bank Statements, assisting in the copying and mailing of notices,
pleadings and general correspondence, preparation of objections to claims,
preparation of various pleadings, assisting in the preparation of semi-annual
reports, and preparation of Trustee’s Supplemental Final Reports.




bankrupt.trustee.paraleg.sel

ITEMIZATION OF PARALEGAL TIME

September 8, 1997 - Conference with the Trustee regarding the results of 34la
hearing and possible assets of case;

(RA - .20)
September 8, 1997 - Telephone conference with Sue Smith, employee of involuntary
debtor, regarding examination of books and records and discuss with the Trustee;
(sC - .20)

September 8, 1997 - Review of Schedules and Statement of Financial Affairs filed
by Pete Steele, attorney for involuntary debtor, after 34la hearing;
(RA - .20)

September 12, 1997 - Trip to and from Beaumont for conference with Sue Smith,
bookkeeper for debtor, and pickup books and records;
{8C - 2.00 %% of travel time)

September 12, 1997 - Review of books and records at facility of debtor with
accountant;
{sC - 1.30)

September 15, 1997 - Conference with the Trustee regarding possible assets, review
of books and records and procedure in administration of case;
(SC - .80)

September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Itocha Building Products regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Cameron & Ashley regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(8C - .20)

September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to American Safety & Abateman Products
regarding outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 -~ Prepare correspondence to Barron Enterprises regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 -~ Prepare correspondence to Chaparral Films regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(SC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Diamond Metal Products regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Dovex International regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

{sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Express Supply regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(8C - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to General Technologies, Inc.
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regarding outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to G.0.B. regarding outstanding
accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Texas General Packaging regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(SC - .20)

September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Industrial Safety Supply regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Millicon Supply regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(sC - .20)
September 18, 1997 - Prepare correspondence to Strand Services regarding
outstanding accounts receivable;

(SC - .20)
September 15, 1997 - Review of file and load asset and 1lien information into
computer;

(RA - .40)

September 22, 1997 - Prepare Motion to Employ Attorney for Trustee, Affidavit of
Disinterestedness and proposed Order;

{SC - .8Q)
September 22, 1997 - Prepare Motion to Employ Accountant, Affidavit of
Disinterestedness and proposed Order;

(SC - .80)

September 22, 1997 - Telephone conference with Murphy Burch with Express Supply
Company regarding dispute of accounts receivable;
{sC - .10)

September 24, 1997 - Telephone conference with Rufus Menchaca with Diamond Metal
Products regarding request to pay accounts receivable in installments and discuss
with the Trustee;

{SC - .10)

September 24, 1997 - Telephone conference with Sue Smith, bookkeeper for debtor,
regarding debt of Cameron Ashley;
(sC ~ .10)

September 26, 1997 - Telephone conference with Rufus Menchaca with Diamond Metal
Products regarding Trustee’s position on request to pay accounts receivable in
installments;

(8C - .10)
October 6, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Gulf Systems, Inc.
regarding dispute of debt;

(SC - .10)

October 8, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Itochu Building Products
regarding dispute of debt;
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(sC - .10)
October 15, 1997 - Correspondence +to TItochu Building Products regarding
outstanding accounts receivable and request for documentation that its paid;

(SC ~ .20)
October 15, 1997 - Correspondence to Gulf Systems regarding outstanding accounts
receivable and request for documentation that its paid;

(sC - .20)
October 17, 1997 - Correspondence to Cameron and Ashley clarifying accounts
receivable that is owed to debtor;

(sC - .30)
October 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with Sue Smith gathering additional
information on accounts receivable, etc., and discuss with the Trustee;

(SC - .30)
October 24, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Baron Enterprises
regarding dispute of accounts receivable because material was rejected;

(SC - .10)
November 7, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence and records from Sue Smith
for assistance in preparing W-2's;

(SC - .20)

November 7, 1997 - Conference with the Trustee and Sherry Carnley regarding status
of administration;

(RA - .20)
November 17, 1997 - Telephone conference with Dave Philbrick regarding status of
case and necessity of filing proof of claim;

(sC - .10)
December 30, 1997 - Telephone conference with Sue Smith regarding preparation of
W-2's;

(SC - .20)

January 15, 1998 - Review of books and records of debtor to gather information for
preparing W-2's for employees of debtor corporation;

(SC - 4.70)
January 19, 1998 - Begin work on preparing W-3 form and seventy-seven (77) W-2
forms;

(sC - 3.70)

January 21, 1998 - Complete work on preparing W-3 form and seventy-seven (77) W-2
forms;

(SC - 1.80)
January 21, 1998 - Gather information and prepare 1096 and five (5) 1099’'s;

(sC - .70)
January 30, 1998 - Review books and records for information to properly prepare
FUTA return for debtor corporation;

(sC - .70)

January 30, 1998 - Prepare FUTA return for debtor corporation;
(SC - .40)
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February 23, 1998 - Telephone conference with Sue Smith regarding statement
received by Trustee from accountants for post-petition work;
(sc - .10)

March 25, 1998 - Prepare Motion to Employ Michael Lindsay as Attorney for Trustee,
Affidavit of Disinterestedness and proposed Order;

(sC - .80)
June 2, 1998 - Conference with Trustee regarding status of administration;
(RA - .10)
June 2, 1998 =~ Telephone conference with Pete Steele, attorney for involuntary

debtor, regarding renoticing of 34la hearing and obtaining copies of documents on
sale of assets by debtor pre-petition to Rkrotex, Inc.;
(sC - .20)

July 6, 1998 - Telephone conference with Louise LeBlanc with Controlled Fluids
regarding status of administration and filing of proof of claim;

{sC - .20)
October 14, 1898 - Telephone conference with Rick Brass, attorney for Quality
Intermodel Corporation regarding status and filing proof of claim;

{sC - .10)

October 30, 1998 - Receive and review correspondence from Internal Revenue Service
regarding 1099-MISC filed and request additional information;

(sC - .10)
November 3, 1998 - Correspondence to Mike Lindsay regarding his inquiry of
transactions of debtor;

(SC - .30)
November 13, 1998 - Correspondence to Mike Lindsay regarding his fees for
services rendered;

(sC - .20)
Decempber 7, 1998 - Prepare Withdrawal of Trustee’s Objection to Claim No. 17;

(BH - .30)
February 3, 1999 - Prepare 2Application for Compensation and Reimbursement of
Expenses for Michael J. Lindsay and proposed Order;

(BH - 2.40)

February 4, 13899 - Conference with Trustee regarding status of administration;
(RA - .10)

February 4, 1999 - Telephone conference with Lee Gordon, attorney for Orange CAD
regarding basis of Trustee’s objection;

(RA - .20)
February 22, 1999 - Prepare Summary of BApplication for Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenses to Michael J. Lindsay for service on all creditors;

(BH -~ .60)
February 23, 1999 - Prepare Summary of Application for Compensation and
Reimbursement of Expenses to Stephen J. Zayler for service on all creditors;

(BH - .60)
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March 3, 1989 - Telephone conference with Lee Gordon, attorney for Orange CAD,
regarding Trustee’s objection to claim;

(8C - .10)
March 3, 1999 - Telephone conference with Lee Gordon, attorney for Orange CAD
regarding sale of equipment by debtor pre-petition to Akrotex Films;

(sC - .20)

March 3, 1999 - Correspondence to Lee Gordon, attorney for Orange CAD, regarding
sale by debtor pre-petition of equipment and Trustee’s objection to claim;

(8C ~ .30)
May 5, 1999 - Review file for status of administration;
(RA - .20)
May 6, 1999 - Load claim information into computer;
(RA - 1.70)
May 6, 1999 - Gather tax information for accountant to prepare fiduciary tax
return;
(RA - .40)

May 6, 1999 - Office conference with accountant regarding federal tax returns;
(RA - .20)

July 26, 1999 - Review fiduciary taxz returns for 1997, 1998 and short year 1999;

(RA - .20)
October 10, 1999 - Correspondence to the District Director requesting quick
determination;

(RA - .30)
August 24, 1999 - Preparation of Motion for Allowance of Compensation to
Accountant and proposed Order;

(BH - .80)
October 28, 1999 - Conference with the Trustee regarding status of
administration;

(RA - .10)

RECAP OF PARALEGAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN (RA) - 4.5 hrs. @ $50.00/per hr. = $§ 225.00
SHERRY CARNLEY (SC) - 25.5 hrs. @ $50.00/per hr. = 1,275.00
BEVERLY HATCHER (BH)- 4.7 hrs. @ $35.00/per hr. = 164.50
TOTAL; $1,664.50
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SCHEDULE C
EXPENSES OF ADMINISTRATION
(1) Amount (2) Amount (3) Previously {(4) Due
Claimed Allowed Paid
1. 11U.S.CSec. 507(a)(1)
_Court Costs andFees 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. 11US.C. Sec. 503(b)(1)a)
_Preservation of Estate 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3. 11US.C. Sec. 503(b)(2)
Post-Petition taxes and related 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
__ pemalties
4. 11US.C. Sec. 503(b)2)
Compensation and
_Reimbursements _________
A. Trustee - Compensation 6,663.44 6,603.44 0.00 6,663.44
B. Trustee - Expense 2,666.10 2,666.10 0.00 2,666.10
C. ACCOUNTANT FEES 1,945.68 1,945.68 1,945.68 0.00
D. TRUSTEE ATTORNEY 461.94 46194 461.94 0.00
EXPENSES
E. TRUSTEE ATTORNEY 1,723.00 1,723.00 1,723.00 0.00
FEES
5. Court Special Charges (Excess 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Noties)
6. _United States Trustee Fees 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BkMk6

TOTALS: $13,460.16 $13,460.16 $4,130.62

$9,329.54



Claim no.

TOTALS

SCHEDULE D
SECURED CLAIMS
Amount Amount Not Amount Previously
Claimed Determined Allowed Paid
60,683.60 0.00 0.00

Due

0.00

10

IDENTIFICATION OF SECURED PARTIES AFFECTED:

Claim No, Name of Creditor Claim No. Name of Creditor

ORANGE CAD



. . form.bill
IN THE UN \etD STATES BANKRUPTC" «OURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
InRe: Case No: 97-10989 bp
Gulf Coast Polymers, Inc. Chapter: 7
CEE MG
Debtor(s)
BILL OF COURT COSTS I e

To:  Stephen J. Zayler

123 E. Lufkin Ave.

P.O.Box 150743

Lufkin, TX 75915-0743

Notice is hereby given that court costs (and deferred adversary filing fees, if applicable) are due
and owing, pursuant to 28 USC Section 1930, in the above case in the amount of $0.

These costs are itemized as follows:

NOTICES
$.25 per notice in excess of 50 notices mailed prior to 1/1/87. $0
$.50 per notice for all notices mailed 1/1/87 between 1/1/98. $0

NOTE: For Chapter 7 cases filed after 12/1/92, there will be NO NOTICE FEES.
(Do Not Bill for $.50 per notice)

NOTE: For all other chapters filed after 1/ 1/98, there will be NO NOTICE FEES. (Do Not Bill for $.50 per notice)
PROCESSING CLAIMS

NOTE: Eliminated is the fee of $.25 for clerical processing of each claim in excess of 10 in cases filed
under the Act or Code.

DEFERRED ADVERSARY FILING FEES
0 Chapter 7 Adversary Proceeding filed @ $120.00/150.00 each.

$0
NOTE: For all Adversary Proceedings filed after 12/18/96 the filing fee is $150.00.

TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $0

Check to be made payable to Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court

Date: 10/26/99
JAMES D. TOKOPH
Clerk of Court

2/

/7 / ; /% L

By: < 0 UM A e
Z/Deputy Clerk //

NOTE: For Chapter 11 Cases Only: Court costs are due on or before the confirmation hearing. The
Judge will confirm that these cases have been paid at the hearing.



Coo. SCHEDULE E

PRIORITY CLAIMS OTHER THAN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES
IN THE FOLLOWING ORDER OF PRIORITY

(1) Amount (2) Amount (3) Amount {(4) Due
Claimed Allowed Paid

1. For Credit extended - Sec. 364(e)(1) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. Claims from failure of adequate protection - 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Sec. 307(a)(b)
3. "Gap Claims" - Sec. 507(a)(2) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4.  Wages, etc. - Sec. 507(a)(3) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5. Contibutions to benefit plans - Sec. 507(a)(4) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6.  Consumer deposits - Sec. 507(a)(6) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7.  Taxes - Sec. 507(a)(7) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8.  Other (No Basis): 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TOTALS: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

SCHEDULE E
PARTIES AFFECTED:
Priority No. Name of Creditor Priority No. Name of Creditor

FILED UNSECURED CLAIMS TOTAL: 1,231,679.11 1,231,679.11 0.00 1,231,679.11

SUBORDINATED UNSECURED CLAIMS
TOTAL: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00



EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER

Case Number: 97-10989 Page 2 Date: December 15, 1999
Debtor Name: GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. Claim Type Sequence
Code # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
16 ENVIROCONTROL PRODUCTS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $438,131.60 $438,131.60
070 C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
ucC 1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH, SUITE 2000
HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259

17 QUALITY INTERMODAL CORP. Unsecured $0.00 $25,245.25 $25,245.25

070 C/0 HUB GROUP
uc 427 W. 20TH STREET, SUITE 300
HOUSTON, TX 77008

2 SOUTHERN POLYMER, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $99,044.00 $0.00
000 6151 POWERS FERRY RD. NW Duplicate of Claim #5. Claim disallowed per Order dated 1-5-99.
uc SUITE 590

ATLANTA, GA 30339
3 GST CORPORATION Unsecured $0.00 $3,109.50 $3,109.50
070 2600 THOUSAND OAKS BLVD. #3420
uc MEMPHIS, TN 38118
3 CAL THERMOPLASTICS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $362,183.26 $362,183.26
070 C/O GARY W. COKER
uc 835 PARK STREET

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
5 SOUTHERN POLYMER, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $99,044.00 $99,042.00
070 C/O GARY W. COKER
uc 835 PARK STREET

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
6 STAR PAPER TUBE, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $31,040.29 $31,040.29
070 C/O GARY W. COKER
uc 835 PARK ST.

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
7 ABATIX ENVIRONMENTAL COREP. Unsecured $0.00 $36,100.00 $0.00
000 C/0 JACK J. SCHESKE CLAIM DISALLOWED PER ORDER DATED 1-5-99.

ucC P. 0. BOX 380307
DUNCANVILLE, TX 75138-0307

8 INTS CORPORATION Unsecured $0.00 $16,127.50 $0.00
000 C/O JONATHAN D. SYKES CLAIM DISALLOWED PER ORDER DATED 1-5-99.
uc 9601 JONES RD., SUITE 134
HOUSTON, TX 77065
9 ALLIANCE SHIPPERS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $4,017.00 $4,017.00
070 C/O CHARLES A. VERNON
uc 3120 SOUTHWEST FREEWAY, SUITE
214
HOUSTON, TX 77098-4510
Subtotal For Claim Type UC UNSECURED CLAIMS $0.00 $1,382,950.61 $1,231,679.11
Case Totals: $0.00 $1,447,764.83 $1,235,809.73

Code #: Trustee's Claim Number, Priority Code, Claim Type

CREGIS2 Printed: 12/15/99 04:32PM  Ver: 4.05¢




S PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

N

4

Cage Nurhbe¥: 97-10989 Page 3
Debtor Name: GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC.

Date: December 15, 1999

Claim#  Payee Name Class  Priority Amount

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

Proposed Pymt  Funds Remaining

BEAUMONT, TX 77701

9 ALLIANCE SHIPPERS, INC. Unsec 070 $4,017.00
C/O CHARLES A. VERNON
3120 SOUTHWEST FREEWAY,
SUITE 214
HOUSTON, TX 77098-4510

$0.00

$4,017.00

$178.74 $0.00

<< Totals >> $1,245,139.27

$4,130.62

$1,241,008.65

$64,138.19 $0.00

Proposed distribution is dependent on the Court's rulings on administrative expenses, contest of claims, and/or objections made to this

proposed distribution.

PROPDIST

Printed: 12/15/99 04:32PM  Ver: 4.05¢
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EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER
Case Number: 97-10989 Page 1 Date: December 15, 1999
Debtor Name: GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. Claim Type Sequence
Code # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
DAVID S. TAMMINGA Administrative $0.00 $1,945.68 $1,945.68
025 CPA PER ORDER DATED 9-24-99.
AF 1403 TURTLE CREEK
LUFKIN, TX 75901
Subtotal For Claim Type AF ACCOUNTANT FEES $0.00 $1,945.68 $1,945.68
10 ORANGE CAD Secured $0.00 $60,683.60 $0.00
000 P.0Q. BOX 457 CLAIM DISALLOWED PER ORDER DATED 1-5-99.
sC ORANGE, TX 77631-0457
Subtotal For Claim Type SC SECURED CLAIMS $0.00 $60,683.60 $0.00
MICHAEL J. LINDSAY Administrative $0.00 $319.15 — $219.15
025 ATTORNEY AT LAW PER ORDER DATED 3-29-99.
TAE 710 NORTH 11TH STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77702
STEPHEN J. ZAYLER Administrative $0.00 $242.79 $242.79
025 ATTORNEY AT LAW PER ORDER DATED 3-29-99.
TAE P. 0. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
Subtotal For Claim Type TAE TRUSTEE ATTORNEY EXPENSES $0.00 $461.94 $461.94
MICHAEL J. LINDSAY Administrative $0.00 $740.00 $740.00
025 ATTORNEY AT LAW PER ORDER DATED 3-29-99.
TAF 710 NORTH 11TH STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77702
STEPHEN J. ZAYLER Administrative $0.00 $983.00 $983.00
025 ATTORNEY AT LAW PER ORDER DATED 3-29-99.
TAF P. 0. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
Subtotal For Claim Type TAF TRUSTEE ATTORNEY FEES $0.00 $1,723.00 $1,723.00
1 YORK INTERNATIONAL Unsecured $0.00 $30,973.84 $30,973.84
070 CORPORATION
uc dba NATKIN SERVICE COMPANY
1415 LOUISIANA, SUITE 1415
HOUSTON, TX 77002
11 MOUNTAIN WEST Unsecured $0.00 $1,089.19 $1,089.19
070 DBA OFFICE DEPOT CREDIT PLAN
uc P. 0. BOX 7004
SIOUX FALLS, SD 57117
12 CONTROLLED FLUIDS Unsecured $0.00 $2,835.27 $2,835.27
070 P. 0. DRAWE 1914
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77704
13 INTS CORPORATION Unsecured $0.00 $16,127.50 $16,127.50
070 C/O JONATHAN D. SYKES
uc 9601 JONES RD., SUITE 134
HOUSTON, TX 77065
14 TMRE INTERESTS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $26,623.00 $26,623.00
070 C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
uc 1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH, SUITE 2000
HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259
15 PREMIER PLASTICS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 $191,259.41 $191,259.41
070 C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
uc 1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH, SUITE 2000

HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259

CREGIS2

Printed: 12/15/99 04:32PM  Ver: 4.05¢
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s UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: )
GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. ) CASE NO. 97-10989
)
)  CHAPTER7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE’S REPORT OF
PROPOSED FINAL DISTRIBUTIONS

The undersigned trustee of the estate hereby submits to the Court and to the United States Trustee
this Report of Proposed Final Distributions.

1. The Court has entered orders which have become final, and which dispose of all objections to
claims, all objections to the trustee’s Final Report, all applications for compensation, and all other matters
which must be determined by the Court before final distribution can be made.

2. The trustee proposes to make final distribution of the funds of the estate as follows, and will
make such distribution unless written objection thereto is made, filed and served on the trustee and on the
United States trustee.

1. BALANCE ON HAND $64,138.19
2. ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES TO BE PAID * (note) $9,329.54
3. SECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note) $0.00
4. PRIORITY CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note) $0.00
5. UNSECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note) $54,808.65
6. OTHER DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE PAID * (note) $0.00
7. TOTAL DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE $64,138.19
(Sum of lines 2 through 6)
8. ZERO BALANCE AFTER ALL DISTRIBUTIONS $0.00

(Line 1 less line 7)

* (See attached schedule of payees and amounts)

(Trustee)



PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

o

e

Case Nuthber* 97-10989
Debtor Name: GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC.

Page 1

Date: December 15, 1999

Claim #

Payee Name

Class

Priority

Amount

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

Proposed Pymt

Funds Remaining

Beginning Balance

11

12

Stephen J. Zayler - Fees
COMPENSATION

Stephen J. Zayler - Exp
EXPENSES

DAVID S. TAMMINGA
CPA

1403 TURTLE CREEK
LUFKIN, TX 75901

MICHAEL J. LINDSAY
ATTORNEY AT LAW

710 NORTH 11TH STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77702

MICHAEL J. LINDSAY
ATTORNEY AT LAW

710 NORTH 11TH STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77702

STEPHEN J. ZAYLER
ATTORNEY AT LAW

P. 0. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743

STEPHEN J. ZAYLER
ATTORNEY AT LAW

P. 0. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743

YORK INTERNATIONAL
CORPORATION

dba NATKIN SERVICE
COMPANY

1415 LOUISIANA, SUITE 1415
HOUSTON, TX 77002

MOUNTAIN WEST

DBA OFFICE DEPOT CREDIT
PLAN

P. 0. BOX 7004

SIOUX FALLS, SD 57117

CONTROLLED FLUIDS
P.O. DRAWE 1914
BEAUMONT, TX 77704

Admin

Admin

Admin

Admin

Admin

Admin

Admin

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

025

025

025

025

025

070

070

070

$6,663.44

$2,666.10

$1,945.68

$740.00

$219.15

$983.00

$242.79

$30,973.84

$1,089.19

$2,835.27

$0.00

$0.00

$1,945.68

$740.00

$219.15

$983.00

$242.79

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$6,663.44

$2,666.10

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$30,973.84

$1,089.19

$2,835.27

$6,663.44

$2,666.10

$0.00

£0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$1,378.31

$48.47

$126.17

$64,138.19
$57,474.75

$54,808.65

$54,808.65

$54,808.65

$54,808.65

$54,808.65

$54,808.65

$53,430.34

$53,381.87

$53,255.70

PROPDIST

Printed: 12/15/99 04:32PM  Ver: 4.05¢



PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION
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Cas Nurhbet: 97-10989
Debtor Name: GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC.

Page 2

Date: December 15, 1999

Claim #

Payee Name

Class

Priority

Amount

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

Proposed Pymt

Funds Remaining

13

15

16

17

INTS CORPORATION

C/O JONATHAN D. SYKES
9601 JONES RD., SUITE 134
HOUSTON, TX 77065

TMRE INTERESTS, INC.
C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH,

SUITE 2000

HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259

PREMIER PLASTICS, INC.
C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH,

SUITE 2000

HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259

ENVIROCONTROL
PRODUCTS, INC.

C/O GEORGE DIAZ-ARRASTIA
1900 WEST LOOP SOUTH,

SUITE 2000

HOUSTON, TX 77027-3259

QUALITY INTERMODAL

CORP.

C/O HUB GROUP
427 W. 20TH STREET, SUITE

300

HOUSTON, TX 77008

GST CORPORATION
2600 THOUSAND OAKS BLVD.

#3420

MEMPHIS, TN 38118

CAL THERMOPLASTICS, INC.
C/O GARY W. COKER

835 PARK STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

SOUTHERN POLYMER, INC.
C/O GARY W. COKER

835 PARK STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

STAR PAPER TUBE, INC.
C/O GARY W. COKER

835 PARK ST.

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

070

070

070

070

070

070

070

070

070

$16,127.50

$26,623.00

$191,259.41

$438,131.60

$25,245.25

$3,109.50

$362,183.26

$99,044.00

$31,040.29

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$16,127.50

$26,623.00

$191,259.41

$438,131.60

$25,245.25

$3,109.50

$362,183.26

$99,044.00

$31,040.29

$717.66

$1,184.70

$8,510.88

$19,496.48

$1,123.39

$138.37

$16,116.84

$4,407.37

$1,381.27

$52,538.04

$51,353.34

$42,842.46

$23,345.98

$22,222.59

$22,084.22

$5,967.38

$1,560.01

$178.74

PROPDIST

Printed: 12/15/9904:32PM  Ver: 4.05¢



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

IN RE:

GULF COAST POLYMERS, INC. CASE NO. 97-10989

CHAPTER 7

N N N N N

DEBTOR(S)

ORDER ALLOWING TRUSTEE'S FINAIL, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPROVING TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

ON THIS DAY came on for consideration the Trustee's Final Report filed by Stephen J.
Zayler, the duly appointed Chapter 7 Trustee. The Court finds that notice of this hearing has
been given as required by the Bankruptcy Rules. Upon due consideration, the Court finds that
cause exists which justifies the entry of the following order:

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee's final application for
compensation in the amount of $6,663.44 and for reimbursement of expenses in the amount
$2,666.10 is Granted.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Trustee's Final Report is approved as submitted
by the Chapter 7 Trustee, including approval of the payment of the following fees and charges

assessed against the Estate under Chapter 123 of title 28 of the United States Code.

FEES/CHARGES PROPOSED PAYMENT
Clerk Noticing/Claim Fees $0.00
Unpaid Adversary Filing Fees $0.00
Unpaid Quarterly Fees $0.00

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee shall make final distribution of
the amounts set forth in the Trustee's Final Report as approved by this Court and shall file a
Supplemental Final Report and Account together with such bank statements as are necessary to

document a zero balance in all Estate accounts, following compliance with Section 347(a) of the
Bankruptcy Code and Bankruptcy Rule 3011, if applicable.

SIGNED this the day of , 1999,

BANKRUPTCY JUDGE



