IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS o SRR L,
TYLER DIVISION I L N
C;;{i’fnJWTC,
IN RE: § CASE NQ.. 96-6006
§ CHAPTERT—=_/.} UTY
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Jointly Administered Under
§ Case No. 96-60060)
DEBTORS §

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION,
AND REPORT OF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Bob Anderson, Trustee of the estate of the above-named Debtor(s), certifies to the Court and
United States Trustee that the trustee has faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties of the office of the
trustee, that the trustee has examined all proofs of claim as appropriate under the proposed distribution,
and that the proposed distribution attached hereto is proper and consistent with the law and rules of the
court. The trustee applies for commissions and expenses set forth herein and states that they are
reasonable and proper.

Therefore, the trustee requests that the Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report

of Proposed Distribution be approved.
Date: ?’ é - (0 (,/// %/W

Trustee
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REVIEWED BY THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE

I have reviewed the Trustee's Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of
Proposed Distribution.

United States Trustee

Date: q ,ZD/W By: /j%




SCHEDULE A-1

FINAL ACCOUNT AS OF: 09/06/00

A.  RECEIPTS $79,965.22

B. DISBURSEMENTS

(1)  Secured Creditors 19,560.82
(2)  Administrative Expenses 33,541.18
(3)  Priority Creditors 0.00
(4)  Other (refund of earnest money) 5,000.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $58,102.00

C. BALANCE ON HAND $21,863.22



%05

%000

a3dNO3ASNN HO4

J3Y3A0D3Y LN3DH3d

%0

%0¢

%0¢

‘SANIWWOD

| %000
m %000
%€9'S
%E8 0¥
%000
%¥l €
%000
%680
%92°L)
%0592
%L9'P1
%LS'S
%.Lv'8

%00°001

000

divd

SWIVID d3dNO3ISNN

000

000
00'9.2's
LE°GET'8E
000
00°00S't
000
L6'veg
6222991
8y’ 8EE’C
00 ovL'EL
€2'5G1°S
66 L€6°L

£2°6£9'c6$

85°899°8.

aamo1iv
SWIVIO d3UNO3IASNN

(013 'HO1893A0 O1L NYNLIH)HIHLO

divd SWIV1D a3dnd3snNN

aivd SWIV1D ALINOIYd

aivd SWIV1D Q34no3s

S1S00 dILdVHD HOlHd

(013 'SaIXVL)SISNIAXI I1V1ISI

S1S0D 1H¥N0D

S334 T¥YNOISSI40¥d ¥3H10

S334 AGNHOLLY ¥3HI0

S3ISNIdX3 IVNOISSIH0OHd S.NHIS

S334 IVNOISSIJOHd S.WHI4

SIASNICX3 S.331SNHL

NOISSINWOD S,33.1SNyL
'SASNIAIXI ALVIST

‘§1d1303d 1vi101
-3AWOONI 31v1S3

00-SZ-60 :@3aA0UddY 1SN 31va
09009-96 ‘HIGWNN 3SVD
319934 ‘HHVON :ANVN 3SVD
NOSY3ANVY -331SNYL

AYVARNS 3SVO LHOd3Y TVNI4d S.331SN¥l



ZZS'A WY 80:01 000Z/90/60 :pajuLd
"86/8/0L QO3 9EZ# 19PIO
'S9XE} WaJo|eA pB U0} Udl| painses
v4 00'956'61 00'956°61 00'005'6 sexs| ‘"0 bbaio) ‘sysaleju| AjleAoy snouep 8
vd 000 000 58'22. « 8Ieyg awi| sueslO maN L
vd 000 000 00°000‘8 « MaInBuon ‘Buuog ‘s 90Z ‘10| pue asnoH 9
'86/8/01 QO3 9£T# JopIO
'S9Xe) WaJojeA pe 1o} usl| paindasg
P uonoag ‘gF 1oB1] 981L-V AoAINg zayoues g
v4d 00°€EL'L) 00°€EL'LL 00°00€'S X1 ‘meiabuon “'py Asyory abioan ‘suoy | S
‘g 8|Npayos uo pajsi| Alsjesedas Jou s| swoy
8|Iqow 8y '8Z'G8.L‘LT$ JO USY B SBY Ydiym 000'0Z$
je panjeA swoy ajiqow e suiejuod os|e peajsawoy syl
‘pesjsawoy Jo saloe G/ 0) 821y Buuo puke ey Aq
Play sI GE'€16'0Z$ 4O JUNOWE U] Udl| JBYJoUY 'S8INPayos
Jod L2°021'v$ 4O Junowe Ul Pn| euses) O} ual)
B upm (U1 Z/L) 00S'Z$ e panfea s uoluod aioe gy'Z v
vd 000 000 00°0s.'cE « X1 0D 66219 ‘peoy ueupy ‘saioy Lo 0L ¥
'86/2/6 Q03 L-¥ZZ # 19p10
‘SaXe) LWAIO|BA PE 10} Ui} painosg
I 00|19 ‘L€ 107
v4d 68'veL'ce 68rvE.L'ce 0009121 09 BBs19 ‘Arg uosxoer (9v GB'L) W PUN YL L/L €
v £8°€06'L umouzun 000 (n) sapadoid feisuIn Woy awoou| Z
sjessy Bujuteway ‘uopueqe (2)y558=va (s1s09 180 pue #yod
JO anjeA ssoug aje)s3y ayy ‘uopueqe (e)yss8=v0 ‘suondwox3g ‘sual sson sonje;a
© - 4) passysiujwpy Aq pealesay pauopueqy ‘easna) Ag paujuusiag anjep) pajnpayossun (Auadoud (n) pejnpayasun puy psinpsyss)
AjIng jJassy spuniejes Ausdoud anjeA 19N pajewnsy jonnad uopduosaq Jossy
9 S v € r A 3
66/6L/1L0 :9)eQg Jeg swie|n 00/90/60 :Buipu3z pouad
86//1/¥0 :ajeq Buneay (e)Lyes§
(9) 86/92/10 :(9) paydAUO) Jo (3) pajid INTTHVIN VNNY 8 AGOVLS 093 ‘NHVOY :awe\ ased
uosiapuy qog (06¥1€9) :@9ISNIL dd 09009-96 :4aqwinN ased
SoOs®e)) Jassy
ya10day pue pa0oday Kjaadoag ajeysy enpiaipug
.1 abed I Wwaoy




CCGA

WV 80:01 0002/90/60 -pajuld

v4d 000 va 00°000'E 00000 » dmiold epzep €661 oz
v4 000 000 00°69¢°9 « UeqIngng oo €661 6l
v4d 000 000 00°005'2 dnyjoid uoy | piod 1861 8l
vd 000 000 0585 » Mjamap | 7y
v4 000 000 00°0SL « Bulgon | 9L
v4 000 000 00°000'L « sbBuiysiuing pue spoog pioyasnoH St
v4d 000 000 05°/8 » OMO9|g |eany unysdn ‘psodaq Ajunoesg 14!
v4d 000 000 000 » Jueg [}eN malabuor - 1oy Buppsyd |euosiad €1
000 000 00°S » queg |JeN ABT 100y Bunjoay) ssauisng ZL
'66/GL/€ AO3 8GZ# 9pIO
"SaXEe} WaIoeA pe lo) usl paindag
vd 00°005'2 00°005'2 00005'2 ABT-pY 8ulliy-0B0G-1 1 UOSISPUSH - JU| pun L
"86/8/01 QO 9E€Z# J9pIO
“S@XE)} WaI0jeA pe Jo usi| paIinoag
V4 00'LLY'Y 00’ L'y 00°00L'Z XL 00 6Ba1n-Arg zayoues "g-same g ul uj "pun ol
'86/62/01 QO3 LyZ# 19pIO ,IS8I9I Z/L,,
8] o9yl pajels sanjeA ||y  ISalajul Ayunwwod gy,
‘pAog 1e3] JO UK BY) 0} UCHPPE Ul ‘Junowe
umowun ui sanfua Buixe] wWaiojea pe jo uall paindag
vd 00'056'S2 0£'SYS'PL 00°000'GZ « X1 0D uosiueH “bpig g Auadoid |eay 6
sjassy Bujurewsy ‘uopueqe (9)¥55§=va (s1809 Ja30 pue # "jod
JO anjeA ssoi9 ajelsy ayy ‘uopueqe (e)pssS§=vo ‘suondwaxg ‘sus sso91] senjeAn
© +4) pasgysiuiwpy Aq peateocey psuopueqy ‘@9sni) Ag paunuaajaqg anjep) pajnpayoasun (Auadoug (n) pajnpayasun puy psinpayss)
AlIn4 jessy spungjejes Aadouagd anjeA 9N pajewnsy ronnsd uonduosaq jassy
9 S 14 € z I
66/61/L0 :9jeq Jeg swe|n 00/90/60 :Buipu3z pouad
86/.L/v0 :9jeq Bunoow (e)Lye§
(0) 86/92/10 :(9) papaAuo9 Jo (3) pajid INITIVN VNNV 8 AOVLS JID93Y MYV ‘aweN ase)
uosJapuy qog (06¥1LE9) :@9ISNIL dg 09009-96 :dequinN ese)
$3se)) Jossy
u..cmom pue paoddy Ajradouag Jje)sy [enplaipug
.¢ abed [ w10y




¢Z'S°’A NV 80:01 0002/90/60 -paluLd

v4d 000 000 0000} ) » ©OSIOH 6¢
vd 000 00°0 (0] 2rd B . mmm:x_w:n Jo} swey Aedsip pue ssjdwesg 8z
uoslepn ilg :Aq pajonpuo)  86/92/6 -91eq 9es
(‘painpayos Ajejesedas Jou sa|0IUaA sapnoul)
‘PalY SjeS 2lqnd pasodold jo 920N
vd 05'829'2 068292 00'005'2 » Juswdinbg yueineisay meinbuo jo Aiojuanuj e
A\ £ | 000 000 00°001 » S88ulsnq ul pasn s|00 e74
vd 000 000 0g°291 « "0} 'sjoo} uofesabLyey *T4
~ opeomeg puewdinby | |
jueine)say mainbuon Jo ssauisng ay) ul pasn
B 000 000 00'052 « Solddns g juswdinba ‘sainixy ‘Assuiyoep ¥Z
V4 000 000 00002 » SYSSpom| £C
‘0D 921M88 @ Juswdinb3 Jueine}say maiabuoT Jjo
vd 000 000 00°0s¢ » S9lddng @ sBuiysiuing ‘Juswdinbg soy0 Zc
V4 000 000 oo'scl » SWB9}| Jeuolssajold "osiin Le
) ‘@jels3 sy} 0} anjea _mmm ou saulwis)ap
aslsnt| -ale)s3g Jay o) anjea 00g¢ Buiaes| ‘uondwaxse
00t%'2$ e swieo jieoy euuy asnods sJojgsq ‘g/1L
Bulurewal ay) JO "21eIS3 2y} 0} anjeA 0p0'cg & Buines)
‘Jdwaxe }saisjul 2y} WIED Jou S80p Jojgqe( Sy} pue ‘uay|
ou sy a18y] Isassiul Ajunuiuod g/| sJoiqaq st sty
sjessy Buluieway ‘uopueqe (3)pss§=va (s35s09 18y pue # 39
JO anjeA ssoug) ajeys3y ey ‘uopueqe (e)yss§=v0 ‘suondwax3 ‘sual sso sanjep
, ' *q) pasgisiujwipy Aq pealesey pauopueqy ‘@oysna | Ag peulwuejag anjep) panpayasun (Auedoud (n) pejnpayosun puy painpayss)
' AjIng jessy spuni/ajes Apadouy anjeA 18N pajewnysy juonned uonduassaq jessy
9 S 1 4 € rA b
66/6L/L0 i9)eQ Jeg swie|n 00/90/60 :Buipu3 pouad
86/LL/v0  :eyeq Buneep (e)Lpyc§
() 86/92/L0 :(9) paraAU0D 40 (3) papi3 INITHVIN VNNV 2 AFOVLS 319938 ‘MYVOY :aweN ased
uosiepuy gog (06v1£9) :@aysnaL d€ 09009-96 :equnp ased
S9SE) JOSSY
310day pue pa0oday L)aadoad Iyejsy [enpiaipuy
.£ abey [ uLIOy




CZ'S'A WV 80:01 0002/90/60 -pajuld

(lenoy) 0002 ‘9 1equsidag  :(¥d41) Hoday |eul] JO sreq pajosfold Juaiiny

0002 ‘L€ uote :(¥d1) podey jeuld JO s1eQ pajosfold feniu)

} Wio4 Yum saouejeq yoiym 'z wio4 ‘sjdisoay sjejs3 [enjoy  ZZ'S96'v. $

apainoy 961089 0] Asuow Jsaulea Jo punjal s 00°000'S -
2 Wio4 jad sysodap |enjoy  22'596'6Z ¢

| wio4 10} sid1eoay pasnipy  2Z'G96'vL ¢

spasooid sajes woy piayypm sesuadxa/susl| sse  66'4/9'8L -
| wiod 1ad ajeisy Aq panledsy spund/eles L/°6£9'C6 $

1z wio4 pue | wio4 aduejeq [im sjuawnsnipe Buimoloy sy

sjessy Bujuieway ‘uopueqe (2)y55§=va {s1s09 Jayio pue # jou
JO anjeA ssouo aje)s3] ayl ‘uopueqe (e)pss§=vo ‘suondwexg ‘sual ssan sanjeA
* *4) pasosiujwipy Aq panieoay pauopueqy ‘@aysnu] Ag peuljuuaiag enjep) pa|npayosun (Aadoud (n) peinpayosun puy pejnpeyoss)
Ajing jassy spundjojes fAadoig anjeA )}aN pajewysy juonnad uonduosaq jassy
9 1 v € Z }
66/6L/1L0 :9jeQq Jeg swiep 00/90/60 :Buipuz pouad
86/L1L/¥0 :9yeq Bunssn (e)Lye§
() 86/92/10 :(3) pauaAuo) 0 (3) popd IANTTHIVIN VNNV 8 AOVLS JI993Y ‘WHV0OY :aweN ased
uosispuy qog (o6r1€9) :easniy dd 09009-96 :aqunpn ased
S9SE) )JoSssy
31oday pue pioday Ayaadoad djeysy fenpiarpug
.G :abed I wioyg




(s)souaiayel Jossy

ZZTSA WV 0L:0} 0002/90/60 :PolULY
00°0$ LPES0°LS : sjejoqng
LP'€G0'L N £€°18 86/9 '8 86/€ '0SE8T Y 8PAIOIN 'O’ - sanjeioy Buluyay ung 7 ooouns {zt | 860180
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>
80°C.L6 ¥8'€TL ~ 86/9 - L6/T) SPAIDIN - sapjehoy Auedwo) 110 Yooy {c} 86/01/80
<@3INYVY3 LSIHILNI>
¥Z'8v8 851 %.€"2 Je Bunsod jsateju| MNVE NVLIVYHNYW 3SYHO THL wi 86/1€/20
<AWOINI ALTVAOH>
99'9v8 95°0.L 86/G ybnoJy) Jepuexaly "H'r uo saleloy 'ou| ‘Auedwo uononpoid Ae) {2} 86/£2/L0
<@3IN¥V3 1STHIINI>
01’922 <A %.€"2 e Bunysod ysaseyu| HNVE NVLLYHNYW 3ISYHD 3HL | 86/0€/90
<3IANOINI ALTVAOY>
98'vLL £2°99 86/G pue 86/Z senjehoy Bunaspepy  Buiuyey ung {z} 86/92/90
<INWOONI ALTIVAOY>
€980/ 90°€e 86/G PUe g6/¢ saljeAoy uelwIad ¥OouUnNog {2} 86/92/90
<3IWOON! ALTVAOY>
15'G19 8601 86/ - 26/Z1 Ajehoy oooung {2z} 86/10/90
<3IWODNI ALTVAOY>
65 05 €L12 86/€ - /6/¥ AeAoy uelwiad 001y {a} 86/10/90
<3IWOINI ALTVAOY>
9828y Z6'ELL 86/% - L6/2) Aehoy "ou| ‘ooexa) {2 |serto/90
<A3aANYVZ 1SIYIINI>
¥6°89¢ P20 %.€'2 ¥e Bupsod jsaio)uj MNVE NVLLVHNYW 3SYHOIHL| i | 86/62/50 |
<IWOOINI ALTIVAOY>
0Z'89¢ 411" 86°094 'L SPBIDDN SBNUBASY 99isniL ‘'yoeoy uoihg y| {2z} 86/0€/¥0
B o <AWOONI ALTVAOY>
'86/¢ 03 Joud uononpoud ‘spaioop
RAZLT e 4 rd 4oBOY UOJAg ¥ WOl p,23I SSIUOLWL JO JOAOUIN | Jojgaq {2} 86/0€/+0
dejeq junodoy $ $ <Miobaje) 1abpa1> Wwo.i4 paAIaday / 0] pied #>o9yn ajyeq
JoXepy Asuowy sjuswasingsiqg sydiaoay uonoesueuy jo uonduosaqg 1 {# 304} ‘sues]
L 9 g v £ 4 i
V/N :puog djesedag 00/90/60 :Buipug pouad
(hw sseo 1ad) 00°000'00€$ :puog jajuelg 0260SL-€L  :# Ql 4@Kedxe]
JUNODY 1axJe ASUOW - So-FLYS8.9-CLE Junoldy
MNVYE NVLLYHNYIN 3SVYHO 3HL :aweN jueg INTTIHVYIN VNNV 2 AFOVLS 3I993H 'MHvOoH ‘dweN ased
(06¥71L€9) uosiepuy qog easna d9 09009-96 :laqunp ased

| .8bey

PI023Y spudwdsIngsi(q puy s3diaday yse)H)

7 WLIOY




CZS'A WV 0L:0L 000Z/90/60 P

(s)aouasser jessy {§

00'0$ ze'selL'ss : sjejoyqns
€L°L6L'6 6595 SONUSASL # SIABQ 'G# SINeQ 86/6 - L6/E "0u] 's80IN0saY M O {c} 86/¥2/1L 1L |

<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>

8L'GEL'S €5'¥2 saljeAoy 3p3IDO 86/0L 86/6 Auedwo 10 Yooy {z} 86/b2/L1L
<03NYV3 1SIHILINI>

G90LL'6 6511 %0'¢ Je Bunsod jsassyu| MNVE NV.LLVYHNYW 3SYHO 3HL uj 86/0€/01L
<AHOL1N3ANI-SA3300¥d I1vS>

90'660'6 05'829'C Spaadoid uonony Jo z/| MO10ST AMVS {22} 86/62/01
<3NWOONI ALTVAOY>

EEvA 4 B 1262 86/6 SP3IDIN - sanehoy Auedwo) 10 yooy {z}  |ser6z/0L
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>

6Lv¥'9 €2°101 (sosea) snouten) g6/2 - £6/L1 ‘senjekoy Auedwog uoyeioldx3 3003 {g} | sersom0L
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>

[90'EPE'D 1022 9seoT 9PAIOON 86/ :sonjeloy ‘ oooung {2} 86/80/01
<3IWOOINI ALTVAOY>

S0'9LEQ 86'L¥ 8se87 8p8IOIN 86/8 B 86/L :salnjeloy Auedwo) 10 Yooy {2} 86/80/01
<Q3INYV3 1SIHILINI>

20'892'9 68 %ET T 1e Bunsod Jsaiaiu) MNVE NVLLYHNVYIN 3SVYHD IHL Ju 86/0£/60
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>

81'592'9 96'92 86/t 10} V., BPAUIDON (Buluyay ung) oooung {2} 86/£2/60
[ ‘ ‘sjdigoay ssoig

zz'8ee'9 ~_|ooo00's Ul papnoul Jou - papuryas saje| - ABUO Isauses apa19o| abiosn 86/€2/60
<3WOONI ALTVAOY>

zZZ'8ee'L i S6Z81 ) 86/9 UBnoIY) G661 WOl UolONPOId Auedwo9 uopesojdx3 %009 {zt  [se/czre0
<Q3INYV3 LSIAYILINI>

L2'SG0'L 98'L %€2 2 1e Buisod jsausju MNVE NVLIVHNYW 3SVHO 3HL i 86/1€/80
<3INOONI ALTIVAOY>

-ugjeg juno2dy $ $ <fiobajes Jobpa> wo.4 paAladay [ o) pled #>399Yo a)edg
19Mde Asuop sjuawasungsiq s)disosay uonoesuel] jo uonduosaq 1 {# 1o} ‘sued]
L 9 S 4 € 4 3
V/N :puog sjesedag 00/90/60 :Buipug pouad
(nwy eseo sod) 00°000'00€$ :puog jajuelg 0.60SL2-€L  :# Q) 1ofkedxe]

JUNoddY Jaxey ASUON - Go-PLYS8.9-CLE
YMNVYG NVLIVHNVN 3SVYHO 3HL
(06¥1€£9) uosiepuy qog

2 .abed

JUNoJIY
:awieN yueg
:@aysni|

ANTTIVIN VNNV 8 ASOVLS J1993Y MIvod
d9 09009-96

P1023Y syudwdsingsiq puy s3dioddy yse)

T W0

:9weN ased
:laquinp ased




22°SA NV 0L:01 0002/90/60 PajuLd (s)eouaiojal jossy )

2L896°LS 00°'P¥o‘oLS : sjeyouqns
: _ <3WOONI ALIVACY> : S .
L0£98'LL 1G'26 sallieAo. ouj‘ooexal |  {z} | 66/81/10]
<AWOOINI ALIVAOY>
0569421 1 8/°6Z sanjefol uogesoidxg yoog |  {e} 66/81/10
<3IWODNI ALTVAOY>
ZL6EL'LL 18've sayjeos 077 velwad 3oounds {2} 66/81/10 |
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>
G8'p0LLL 0612 salefos B Auedwogpoyood| {2} | 66/8L/10
<3WOONI ALIVAOY>
$6'289°21 99°LV - sefjefol __ oQbupesedp Bueysniy | {2} | 66/8L/10
<AWOONI ALTVAOY>
€941 8z've seleol uononpold Aey {2} 66/81/10
<3IWOONI ALTVAOY>
LO'LL9ZL 9,62 sanjehoy Auedwog uopesojdx3 yooo [ {2} 66/81/10
§2'S8S'L1L TL'896') $H98Y2 8jm 0} BuIO3Yo 0} Joysued 99¥1$G8LOTIEH WUNODY 0L | 66/L/L0
<Q3INYVI 1SIHYILINI>
LB'ESS'6L oL'se %0000°2 1e Bunsod jsaiau) MNVE NVLLVHNYW 3SVHO 3HL Wl [ge/LErEL
o 00°0S6'SZ S| JuUNowy ssSoJD
<AL¥3d0O¥d TvIY-SAIID0Nd ITVS>
86/62/01 QO3 Lye#
18'525'61 . ob'Liz'oL 18pI0 *"0J uoslIeH 'saidy £1°G Spasdoud safes g/| - monszamvs | {8 | 86/20/21
<3WOONI ALTVAOY>
L1.'vS2'6  |eesp ‘ ] ] ~ 86/.2 86/9 SPaIOIN _ Bunosueny g Buiuyoy ocoung | {2} | 86/€0/2L
<@3NYV3 1SIHILNI>
v1°'902'6 bL Pl %0°2Z ¥e Bunsod jsasau) YNVE NVLLVHNVIN 3SVHO IHL| i 86/0€/L 1
<3AWOOINI ALTVAON>
Jejeg junoaoy $ $ <hliobayes Jabpa1> wol4 PaAIa23y / 0] pled #29yn ajeqg
Joely Asuopy sjuawasingsiq sydiaoay uonoesues] jo uonduossag 1 {# 304} ‘sued]
L 9 S 14 € 4 b
V/N :puog 9jesedog 00/90/60 :Buipu3z pouad
(ywy ssed sad) 00°000'00€$  :puog juelg 0.60S12-€l  # QI 1ehedxel
JunoooY 19%Je ASUO - G9-PLYS8LI-TLE 3Unod2dy
MNVE NVLLYHNYIN ISVHO JHL :aweN yueg INTTIVIN VNNV 8 ASOVLS 319934 ‘NHvOoy ‘aweN 8sed
(06¥1€9) uosispuy gog :P9ysnIL dd9 09009-96 :JaquinN 9sed

PI023Y SHudwIsINgsI(q puy s3di1aady yse)H)
€ ebed oy



(s)aouaiojos yossy

ZC'SA WV 0L:0l 0002/90/60 :peluld
CTAI R 44 ov'€10°'659$ : sjejoyqng
L2°6E9'ES 600 86/1 1 W0y uoyonpold dnoi9 wnajosad Yooy {e} 66/£0/90
<Q3INYVYI LSTHIINI> TR
creeoes | 88'28 %0000°Z Je bunsod jsaiepy| MNVE NV.LLVHNYW ISYHO JHL wi | e6/82/50
<ALH3dO¥d TVIH-SA3300¥d F1vS>
¥2 1GS'€S 00°005'2 66/SL/€ QO3 852Z# 19p1O Jod AED B IIH sueqoy {L1} 66/61/50
<Q3IN¥VY3 1SIFHIINI>
¥2°160'LS GL'69 %0000°2 e Bunsod jsaseu| MNVE NYLLYHNYA 3SYHO IHL Juj 66/0€/¥0
‘ 68'vEL'EC ISt junowy ssoi9
<ALY3dO¥d TVaY-SA3300Yd VS>>
86/2/6 Q03 J9p10 18d X1 0D
60'286'0S ~_|vzeeLioz 66219 ""Arg uosyoer T oV 4E6'L Ul ISBiRM| ‘puUn Auedwog api) "s'N {e} 66/60/+0 |
<Q3INYVI 1STHUIINI>
s8'zreoe . €e'Lg %0000'Z e Bunsod jsassju| MNVE NVLLYHNYW 3SYHO 3HL ) 66/LE/£0
<@3aNYV3 1SIYILINI>
25 16L0€ ‘ 8€'GE %0000°Z 1e Buisod jsaisju| MNVE NVLLYHNVYIN 3SYHO IHL ) 66/92/20
¥1°961'0¢ 9z L+z'8l Buppoay 0} Joyx 99¥ L $S8LIZLEH# JUNOJDY O] 66/52/20
<ALl¥3d0O¥d Tv3Y-SA3AID0Nd IIvS>
LLY'vS - OL# '9G6'61 - 8#
‘€EL'LLS - G# paledojte 'g6/80/01L A0 9EZ# 19PIO
ov/iec'sy | ooo0g'se ‘Aeay Aening zayoues % sjessuln ‘0D Bbaio ~ yoeoy uolhg 'y | {01 '8'S} [66/5L/20
<3IWOINI ALTVAOY>
Ov'268'C) 1980 sanjedo. wINSjoLad Yooy {z} 66/60/20
<@3INYV3 LSIHILINI>
¥8°968'21L ~ |es62 - %0000°Z e Buisod jsaisju| YNYE NVLIVHNVIN 3SVHO 3HL By 66/62/10
<'1S1Q OL ONINIV.LYId LON ANN4TH>
1"°298'C1 00°'000'S ‘doid "09 66315 - usodag Asuop iseure3 jo punjey apai5oW ablosg LOL 66/12/10
Jgjeg junoooy $ $ <Aiobajen Jabpa> Wol4 paAladay f 0] pled #3929YH ajeq
3oje Asuopw sjuawasingsig sydiaoay uonoesued] jo uondussaqg 1 {# 104} ‘suel]
L 9 S 1 4 € 4 l
V/N :puog ajesedag 00/90/60 :Buipu3 pouad
(nuy aseo sad) 00°000'00€$ :puog jaxuelg 0.60GLZ-€L :# Q) 4okedxel

JUNoodY }3x e ASUON - GOV LYS8.9-CLE
MNVE NVLLVHNVYN 3SVYHO 3HL
(06¥1£9) uosiapuy gog

¢ abey

;UNo2oY
rowepN yueg
:99Isnd]

P1023Y syudwasingsiq puy s3diaday yseH

7 WwIoyq

ANTTIAVIN VNNV 8 ATOVLS JI993H MHVYOH

dd 09009-96

:owieN ased
:laquinN ased



22°'S°’A WV 0101l 0002/90/60 :PajulLd (s)eousiayel jossy §
2Z'902'2¢$ SZ'e28% : sjejoiqng
61°'96.°L2 84'820'91 dxa/sasy Aswione Aed 0y Bupiosyd o} Jajsuel ], 991 L ¥SRL9C L E# JUNOODY O 00/0€/€0
<(LIHO) ALLY SHO1833-S334> o]
29°¥€8°2E 61°L29'01L 66/62/6 Q0T Lye# 19pIO Jad J0iqaq Joj Asulony Apueg "IN peqoy Zol 00/91/€0
<@3NYVY3 LSIYALINI>
oY Zor'vS ve 98 %0001 ¢ e Buisod jsaisju) MNVE NVY11VYHNYW 3SYHO 3HL wi 00/62/20
<@3aNYV3I 1S3HIINI>
TTOLE'YS €06 %0000°Z e Bupsod jsaisju) MNVE NV1LYHNYW 3SVYHD 3HL Wi 00/L€/10
<@3aNYVYZ 1STHILNI>
61v8TvS . €126 %0000°Z 1e Bupsod isaiaju MNVE NVLLYHNVYIN 3SVYHO IHL W | e6/LErRL
<Q3INYV3I 1SIYIINI>
90261 'vS L0'68 %0000°'Z e Bupsod jsassy MNVE NYLLIVYHNVYIW 3SVYHO JHL w 66/0€/L 1
<@3NYV3A 1SIHJINI>
S0'€0L'bS 91°68 %0000°Z 1e bugsod jsassy| YNVE NVLLYHNYN 3SVHO 3HL w 66/62/01
<@3aNYv3 1SIYIINI>
68°EL0'PS 8C'¥8 %0006 ¥e Bunsod isaisy| MNVE NVLLYHNYIN ISYHD IHL wi 66/0£/60
<d3NYV3 1STYIINI>
L9'6Z6°ES ¥6°98 %0006°| Je Buysod jsalaju) MNVE NYLLYHNYIN 3SVHD IHL w 66/1L£/80
<3WOINI ALTVAOY>
L9ZP8'Es 88'vl Rjefol 1103 {2} 66/61/80
<@3INYV3 1STHILINI>
62°228'eS B 8,08 : o %0006 L e Buisod 1sasau MNVE NVLIVHNYIN 3SYHO IHL| Wl | 66/0€/20
<JWOONI ALTVAOH>
L0 Lb2'ES - 281 B - ) sapjelol - ABiouz 1103| {2} | 66/51L/L0)|
<Q3INYVY3 1SIHILINI>
€1°922'eS 26'98 %0006'} e Bunsod jsessiy| MNVE NVLLYHNYW 3SVYHO JHL | 66/0£/90
<IWOINI ALTVAOY>
Jejeg junoooy $ $ <fiofeyen 196pa> WoJ4 PaA1823y | 0] pled #9%9Yyo ajeq
e Aauol sjuawasingsiq sydisoay uonoesueu] jo uondussaqg 1 {# Jou} ‘sued]
L 9 ] 4 g z L
V/N :puog 9jesedag 00/90/60 :Buipu3 pouad
(hwy eseo yad) 00°000'00€$ :puog jajuelg 0.60GL/-€L  :# Qj 4oKedxel
JUNO2DY Jax.ey ASUON - G911 ¥S8/9-ZLE Junoddy
MNVE NVLLYHNYW 3SYHD JHL ‘aweN jueg ANTTHVIN VNNV 2 ATOVLS F1993Y 'MHvOd :oweN ased
(06¥71€£9) Uosiepuy qog :e9)snaL d9 09009-96 :doqunN ased
PI023Y] sHudWISINGSI(J puy s3didddy yse)
G :obed 7 wIoyg




ZZ'SA WV O0LI0L 000Z/90/60 pPajund (s)eousioal Jossy
6229428 2Z'S96'6.$ sjuswasingsiq / sidi9oay 13N
000 S101g9g 0} sjuswAied :sso
64°129°)b 2 22°696°6. jeyoyqgns
e¥'LE€'8S 000 si9jsuel] ueg :$sa
00°0% Z2'S96°6L 22'696'61 SIVLOL LNNOJOV
000 22'¢98'1Le Hoday |eutq s,@a)sn1| o) Bunosys o) Ja)-x O9FL¥S8L92 L €# JUNODDY OL 00/90/60
<@3INYv3 LSIHIUNI>
22€98'12 16'9 %000€ T S! 918y 1saIa)u| Jusny Buysod ysaseiuj Ul | 00/90/60 |
L€ 958'Le ~|el'g8l JawAed pasapio Lnod 1oy Bunjosys o} Jaysuer) Q9L G892 | €# IUNOIDY O] 00/50/60
<d3INYVY3 LSIYIINI>
90°2v0'ce 06'¢cr %000€°2 e Buysod jsasoyu) MNVE NV LLVHNVYIA 3SYHD JHL w 00/1€/80
<@3INdvd 1SIAHILINI>
9166612 182 %000€'Z e Bunsod jsaieiu MNVE NVLLYHNYW 3SYHO 3HL ] 00/L€/L0 |
<@3IANAVI LSIHILNI>
5€'956'L2 B SE' LY ‘ %000€'Z e Bunsod ysaseiu) MNVE NVLLYHNY 3SVYHO 3HL | 00/0€/90 |
<d3NYV3 1LSIYALNI>
0051612 260y o %000€ "¢ 1e Bunsod )1sasauj MNVE NVLLYHNYN 3SYHO 3HL Wi 00/1€/50 |
<d3aNYV3 LSTHIALNI>
8o'vi8'Llz 2z8e o %0002 e Buysod jsasaju| YNVE NV LLYHNYIN 3SVYHO 3HL w 00/82/+0
<@3NAV3 LSIYTILNI>
on'Geg'Le 1961 %0001 "2 e Bunsod 1saso) HNVE NV LLIVHNYN FSVYHO 3HL J| 00/L€/€0
Jdejeq junoddy $ $ Aaomwuuo ._OOUNJV Wiol4 PaAIaSJaY / O] pled #8/Yo ajeq
Joye Asuop sjuswasIngsia sydieoay uonoesued} jo uondussag ] {# Joul} “suesl
L 9 ] ¥ € Z 4
V/N :puog 9jesedeg 00/90/60 :Buipu3 pouad
(nuun aseo Jad) 00°000'00€$ :puog jaquelg 0.60SLL-€L  :# Ql19Aedxel
JUNO2Y Joxel ASUON - GO-¥LPS8.9-ZLE SUNOJAIY
MNVE NVLIVHNVYIN 3SYHO 3HL :9WweN jueg ANTTHVIN VNNV 8 AFOVLS 19934 HUvOH ‘dweN oese)
{06¥1L£9) uosispuy qog o9sna] dg 03009-96 :19qunn ased
PI033Y sjuduwIdIsAngsi(q puy s3diaddy yse)H
m ‘abey ¢ uioyqg




2Z°'S°’\N WV 01:0l 0002/90/60 :pajuud (s)eoususyal Jossy {§
86°676'cES 9t'88z°'9¢e$ : sfejoqng
<(£ HO) WHId-ALLY S.331SNY1-S334>
8y 8EEC 00°0¥LEL 00/62/€ AO3 0.LE# JapJQ Jod ses4 @alsnu | Joj Asusony ‘uosispuy qog oLl 00/0€/€0
8'8L00L 8¥°820'9) dxe/ses) Asusoye Aed o) Bujosyo 0 Jeysuel | S9Y1L¥S8.92 | £# JUN0OOY Woi4 00/0£/£0
<g3yno3s>
9ETH# 49PIO
000 2z0 - Sjessuly funog 66219 - saxe] wWaloleA Py aSI asi malabuoT 601 66/52/20
<a3a¥No3s>
A S1'699'S 9ET# I8PIO - S[eIBUIN - SaXe ] WaloleA PY ASIHS ‘a’s’l InH Buuds 80l 66/52/20
<@3yno3as>
[LE'699'G  |6L'SSL'Y 9ETH# 19PIO - Ajjeay- soxe] WaloleA PY gSIHS ‘ass’iiH buuds | oL 66/52/20
<a3dno3s>
9€T# JapIO - 0D
95'¥ZP'0L 9zZ'€8s'y B6o1g ‘AAg Zoayoues ‘Ajjesy - sexe| waloleA py 1010810 Xe ] ‘SPIRIYS HIH 90} 66/52/20
<a3¥No3as>
oteH
Z8°200'Sl vy EeeT'e 18pIQ0 ‘sjessulin Ajunog BB uo sexe ) walojeA py 10109)|0D Xe | ‘SpIRIYS M SOl 66/52/20
92" L¥2'81 oz Lrz'slL Bunioayo o} sgpx SOV L #G8L9ZLEH JUNODOY WOIS 66/52/20
<a3yNo3s> MoJosy
joo00 [82699 Spaad0.d s39leg Jo uolod senpu3 xey - uung '@ X0D|IAA ‘UOSIBpUY ‘peawS ¥0L 66/¥L/10
<a3y¥nNo3s>
82669 182689 i 20N0N %@ Waw=aaiby Jed ua jo Juswied 1yied Aplew | €01 66/%1/10
<(Z HO) ¥33NOILONV-"'dX3>
95°6LE'L |eLzeE o 86/1€/Z) O3 9pZ# 18p10 sod sasuadx3 g/i iosuonony ‘uosiepm g | ZoL | 66/FL/LO
<(Z HO) ¥33NOILONY-S3T4>
622ZLL'L £v'952 86/1€/21 QO3 9¥2# JapJO Jod uoissiwwo) g/ Jesuonony ‘uosiem g 101 66/71/10
2/°896'L 2L'896'L $309Yd 3jum 0} Buryoayd o} Jsysuel) SOt ¥G8.L9Z L E# JUNOODY Wl 66/¥L/10
Jejeg junooay $ $ <AioBajen 10bpa> woJ4 paAladay / 01 pied #o9Yyn ajeq
Bunjosyn sjuawasingsig sydisoay uonoesuel] jo uonduasag 1 {# 304} ‘sued}
L 9 S | 4 € 4 I
V/N :puog ajesedeg 00/90/60 :Buipu3 pouad
(G aseo yad) 00°000'00€$  :puog jajuelg 0.60SL2-€L  # QI 1okedxe)
JUNO22Y BuBOBYD - 99-PL¥S8.9-CLE JUno2JYy
MNVE NVLLYHNVYIN 3SYHO 3HL ‘aweN ueg IANITHVIN VNNV 2 AFOVLS FI1993H MHEVOY ‘dweN aseD
(06v1€9) Uosispuy gog :99ISnIL d9 09009-96 :4@quinN ased
P1023Y sjudwadsingsi(q puy s3diaday yse)
L :obed c waoyq

-




¢Z'S°'A WV O0L:0L 0002/90/60 :pajund (s)oouassyel Jessy
z2°£98°12% 00°Z01°85$ ZT'596'6.%
z2'e981e bT¥LY'9E 000 99-v115829-ZL¢ # Bupjoayo
00°0 61712912 ZT'6596'6.L S9-VI¥S8L9-ZLE # VINW
Juejeg sjuawasings|q sidivosay SLNNODOVY 11V - 1IV.LOL
Junosoy JaN 19N
VTrivioes 00°0% sjusweasingsiq / s)diadsy 13N
000 sJoygaq o) sjuswihed :ssa
L2 rLiv'og 000 jejognsg
000 €V LEC'8S sigjsuel] ueg :ssa7
ze'e98'Les b2 YLP'9E £p°1£2'8G SIVLOL LNNOJOV
cZ'eo8’le cceosic __Modey |euld s,eeisni) 10) Budosuo ol 1d)-X |  GOvLPGRLoZIEH Junoooy woiy | oorg0/60
<(ZHO) WYI4 NON-LNVL1O0V S, 331SNy1-S334>
000 G168l - i B 00/G1/8 Q03 6.£# JopIO Jod ) vdO ‘'sieboy ‘o uegqoy [ zii 00/50/60
G168l i SL681 - juswAed paispio UNoo 1o} Buioayd o} Joysuely SOPLYG8L0ZLE# JUNODY wold [ 00/50/60
<(ZHD) WHIZ-ALLY S331SNYL-dX3I>
0n'o 8¥'8€€'C 00/62/€ QO3 0.£# JopIO sod sasuadxy a9jsni 10} Aauioyy ‘uosispuy qog LLL 00/0€/E0
Jdejeqg Junoaoy $ $ <fioBaje) 1abpat> wou4 paAIa2ay / 0] pled #>o9YynH ajeq
Bupjosyn sjuswasingsiqg sydiaosay uonoesuel] jo uonduasaqg 1 {# Jou) ‘suel]
L 9 ] 4 £ (4 L
V/N :puog ajeredag 00/90/60 :Buipu3z pouad
(uuy ases Jad) 00°000'00€$ :puog javue|g 0.60G12-€1  :# Qi 4okedxel
N2y BunidayD - 99-v L ¥S8.9-2LE JUNoAY
MNVE NVLIVHNVYW ISYHD IHL ‘SWweN yueg ANITTHVIN VNNV 2 ATOVLS JI1993H MIVON :dweN ased
(06¥1.£9) UOsIEpUY qog Pasnu] d9 09009-96 :9qunn ased
PI023Y SjuduISINgsy(q puy s3dreoaayg yse)H
8 :obed T W10




Orders and Closing
Statements Supporting
Gross Proceeds
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
Eastern District of Texas

Tyler Division
IN RE: Case No.: 96 - 60060
Reggie Stacey Roark and Anna Marlene Roark
Debtor(s). Chapter: 7
Notice of Entry of Order
Please Take Notice that an Order (document 224-1) was entered on the docket on September 2,
1998.
Order Granting [216-1] Application To Sell Free Clear of
Lien In that certain lot, tract or parcel of land being
1.934 acre of land in the John Jackson Survey, Abstract
113, City of Longview, Gregg County, Texas, being more
particularly described in Exhibit A attached. by Bob
Anderson .
Dated: 09/02/98 James D. Tokoph

Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court

NOTICE
Please be informed that noticing procedures have changed for this court. This
notice is being served in lieu of the actual order. Should any further action be
contemplated on this matter, the actual order should be referenced.

Copies of the actual order may be obtained by contacting one of the following:

Compex Legal Services, Inc. (800)597-1832
Grace Document Service (800)561-5405
Intranet, Inc. (800)333-8818
Metro Courier (800)569-0518

204199731 53361



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION
IN RE: §
§ CASE NO. 96-60060
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
§ CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR §

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET
OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS
(Interest in 1.934 Acres, Gregg County, TX)

Trustee's Motion for Authorization to Sell Asset having been presented to the Court, and
the Court finding that notice having been properly given and that no objection having been timely
made, and it further appearing that the Motion should be granted,;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED that Trustee, Bob Anderson, is authorized
to sell the following described property:

All of the Estate’s interest (believed to be a 1/11th undivided interest) in that

certain lot, tract or parcel of land being 1.934 acre of land in the John Jackson

Survey, Abstract 113, City of Longview, Gregg County, Texas, being more

particularly described in Exhibit "A" attached hereto;
for a gross sales price of $25,000 to be paid at closing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED AND DECREED that Trustee is authorized to pay from the

closing proceeds (or have deducted from the proceeds) the closing expenses that are reasonable

and customary in a real estate transfer,

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE - Page 1
FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS

(Interest in 1.934 Acres, Gregg County)

8449\P 1,934 M&O\ci



IT IS FURTHER ORDERED AND DECREED that the sale shall be made free and clear
of liens, except for ad valorem taxes by any taxing authority for the current year, which liens shall
attach to the sales proceeds.

SIGNED this the day of , 1998.

JUDGE PRESIDING

Prepared and Submitted By:

Bob Anderson

Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, Texas 75606-3343
(903) 757-2868

(903) 757-4612 (facsimile)

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE - Page 2
FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS

(Interest in 1,934 Acres, Gregg County)

8449\P 1.934 M&O\ci
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A. U.S. DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND Ut

1 DEVELOPMENT

SETTLEMENT STATEMENT

Form Approved OMB No. 25020265

1.___FHA

3.____CONV. UNINS.

2.__ B
4.__VA 5. COn..INS. CASH
6. File Number 7. Loan Number
970923

8. Mortgage Ins. Case No.

C. NOTE:  This form is furnished to give you a statement of actual settlement costs. Amounts paid 1o and by the settlement agent are shown.
ltems marked *(P.0.C.)"were paid outside the closing; they are shown here Jor informational purposes and are not included in the totals.

D. NAME AND ADDRESS OF BORROWER:
, Longview

E. NAME, ADDRESS AND TIN OF SELLER:

F. NAME AND ADDRESS OF LENDER: CASH
G. PROPERTY LOCATION:
LOT: metes and bounds BLOCK :

D Property or Services Recelved
H. SETTLEMENT AGENT:
PLACE OF SETTLEMENT:

03-31-99
2.1

I SETTLEMENT DATE:

1

00. GROSS AMOUNT DUE FROM BORROWER:

see attached

Thomas A. Sweeny, Trustee

Estate of J. G. McGrede

TRACT:

10995 Contact # :
U. 8. Title Company, Inc.
1000 NORTH HIGH STREET
LONGVIEW, TEXAS 75601

1.934

TIN #751874538

COPY

We certiy that this js 5
True and correct £opy of
The original instrument"

US.Title Co., fnc.

PR R ANAQEIE AT
400. GROSS AMOUNT DUE TO SELLER:

Gross amouﬁt due from borrower(line {20)

€01

101. Contract sales price 275,000.00] | 401. Contract sales price 275,000.00
|~ ersonal Property 402. Personal property
t... Settlement charges to borrower(line 1400) 5,253.00] [403.
104. 404.
105. 405,
Adjustments for items paid by seller in advance Adj! for items paid by seller in advance
106. City/town taxes to 406. City/town taxes to
107. County taxes to 407. County taxes [}
108. Assessments o 408. Assessments to
109. 409,
110 410.
1. 411,
112. 412.
113. 413,
114. 414,
I1s. 415,
i16. 416.
120. GROSS AMOUNT DUE FROM BORROWER 280,253.00( | 420. GROSS AMOUNT DUE TO SELLER 75,000.00
200, AMOY! i DUERONSZIN 2B 10, SELLER:
201. Deposit or eamest money 501. Excess deposit(see instructions)
202. Principal amount of new loan(s) 502. Settlement charges to sellerfline 1400) 13,344.00
203. Existing loan(s) taken subject to 503. Existing foan(s) taken subject to
204. 504. Payoff of first mortgage loan
205. 505. Payoff of second mortgage loan
206. 506.
207. 507.
508.
509.
Adjustments for items unpaid by seller Adji Jor items unpaid by seller
210. City/town taxes to 510. City/town taxes to
211. County taxes 01-01-99 1t 03-31-99 572.21| | 511 County taxes 01-01-99 0 03-31-99 572.21
212. Assessments to 512. Assessments to
213, 513,
214, 514,
21s. 515,
216. 516.
217 517.
218, 518.
219. 519,
TOTAL PAID BY/FOR TOTAL REDUCTION AMOUNT
220. BORROWER DUE SELLER

7

. Gross amount due to seller(line 420)

v:(w- N
275,000.00

13,916.21

280,253.00
302. Less amounts paid by/for borrowcr'(line 220) . 572,21 | | 602. Less reductions in amount due seller(line 520) 13,916.21
303.CASH { X FROM) ( T0) BORROWER 279,680.79| |603. CASH ( X TO) ( FROM) SELLER 261.083.79




SETTLEMENT CHARGES

BAJED ON PRICE $ 275,000.00 @ %

10,000.00
Division of Commission (line 700) as follows:
701 8 10,000.00to Thomas A. Sweeney & Associates
: H to

70s. Commission pald at Settlement

PAID FROM PAID FROM
BORROWER'S SELLER'S
FUNDS AT FUNDS AT
SETTLEMENT SETTLEMENT
10,000.00

802. Loan Discount %

803. Appraisal Fec w0

804. Credit Report to

805. Lender's Inspection Fee to

806. Mortgage Insurance Application Fee to

807. Assumption Fee to

808.

809.

810.

811.

812,

813.

814,

901. Interest from to @S Iday ( - days)
902. Morgage Insurence Premium for months to
903. Hazdrd Insurance Premium for year to

$
(.. Mortgage Insurance months @ $ per month
1003. City property taxes months @ § per_month
1004. County property taxes months @ $ per month
1005. Annual assessments months @ $ per month
1006. months @ $ per month
1007. months @ $ per month
1008. months @ $ month

PRI 00 X s kS figbhanbin,
1101. Settfenent or closing fee o U.S. TITLE COMPANY, INC.

100.00

(ESCROW FEE) 100.00
1102. Abstract or title scarch to
1103. Title examination to
1104. Title insurance binder to
1105. Document preparation to  STEPHEN W. MCDANIEL, ATTY. 150.00
1106. Notary fee to L
1107. Attorney's fee to Erskine & McMahon 504.00
(includes above items numbers; )
1108. Title insurance to U.S. TITLE COMPANY, INC. 2,091.00
(includes above items numbers; )
1109. Lender's coverage $
1110. Owner's coverage 2,091.00 8 275,000.00
1111. Attorney Fees to A. Chris Heinrichs 1,321.00
1112. TAX CERTIFICATES to U.S. TITLE COMPANY, INC. 40.00
1113,
Recording fees: Deed $ 153.00 Mortgage $ : Release $ 153.00
.. .. City/county tax/stamps: Deed $ : Mortgage $
1203. State tax/stamps Deed $ : Mortgage §
1204.
1205. Recording Certified Copies to COUNTY CLERK 213.00
1301.
1302.
1303. COURIER FEE to U.S. TITLE COMPANY, INC. 350.00
1304. .
1305. Reimburse Attorney Fees to R. McGrede, D. McGrede, & J.G.McGre '3,175.00.
1306. Reimburse Appraisal Fee to George McGrede 400.00
1307.
1308.
1400. TOTAL SETTLEMENT CHARGES (enter on lines 103, Section J and 502, Section K) 5,253.00 13,344.00

carefully reviewed the HUD-1 Settlement Statement and, to the best of my knowledge and belief, it Is @ troe and accurate statement of all receipts and dishursements made on my sceount or by me in tNis

tra. ction. 1 forther certify that 1 have!received a copy of 'HUD.1 Setlement Staternent.

SELLER 1

SELLER 2 SELLER 3
BUVER 1 BUVER 3 BUYER 3

To the best of my knowledge, the HUD-1 Settlement Statement which | have prepared is a troe and accurate account of the funds which were received and have been or will

of the settlement of this transaction.

be disbursed by the undersigred s pant

WARNING: | is 2 crime to knowingly make false statement to the Unlied States on this or any other similar form. Pemalifes upon conviction can Inchude a fine and Imprisonment,

For details see: Title 18 U.S. Code Sections 1001 and Section 1010.




ADDENDUM TO HUD-1 SETTLEMENT STATEMENT

The undersigned has carefully reviewed the HUD-1 Settlement Statement and to the best of the
undersigned’s knowledge and belief, it is a true and accurate statement of all receipts and
disbursements made on the undersigned’s account or by the undersigned in this transaction. The
undersigned further certifies that they have received a copy of the HUD-1 Settlement Statement.

SELLER:
. 2
%’2 (ZWv;Z:—p %f - /7/1//—/4/
ROY/COVING?ON McGREDE EVA JO McGREDE LUPTON
Ll Wk S
IMMIE A% McGREDE REGINAL STACY ROARK by:

BOB ANDERSON, Bankruptcy Trustee for

% 2 Py g the interest of Reginal Stacy Roark

GEORGE ERNEST McGREDE, JR. MELANIE COURSEY
ROBERT DON McGR’Ei;E MELINDA SIMPSON

OHN ROBERT McGREDE MELISSA SIMMONS

JOYDEL McGREDE MEREDITH MELYDIA EDGE

%/M Lgdlth Shathn Uol!

MARYZALIZABETH STRATTON VESTALL.  MARTHA BASS

To the best of my knowledge, the HUD-1 Settlement Statement which I have prepared is a true
and accurate account of the funds which were received and have been or will be disbursed by
the undersigned as part of the settlement of this transaction.

U. S. TITLE COMPANY, INC.

Pty L Sk

Escrow Officer
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T 1Net Proceeds

Roy C. McGrede
Jimmie G. McGrede
George E. McGrede
Don McGrede

John Robert McGrede

Joydel McGrede Meredith

Mary Elizabeth Vestal
Eva Jo McGrede Lupton
Reginal Roark

Melanie Coursey
Melinda Simpson
Melissa Simmons
Melydia Edge

Martha Bass

D¢-*ribution:

Roy C. McGrede
Percent of Net Proceeds
Add:

Survey, ete (Roark)
Survey, etc (Hester)
Legal Fees

Total Reimbursements
Total Due

Jimmie G. McGrede
Percent of Net Proceeds
Add:

1995 Taxes (Roark)
Legal Fees

Total Reimbursements
Total Due

George E. McGrede
Percent of Net Proceeds

Appraisal Fee
Total Reimbursements
Total Due

Net
Proceeds

$261,083.79

Percentage Percentage
Ownership Net Proceeds

0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.18181818 $47,469.78  $50,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.09090909 $23,734.89  $25,000.00
0.01818182 $4,746.98  $5,000.00
0.01818182 $4,746.98  $5,000.00
0.01818182 $4,746.98  $5,000.00
0.01818182 $4,746.98  $5,000.00
0.01818182 $4,746.98  $5,000.00

$261,083.79 $275,000.00
$23,734.89
$147.28
110.15
$1,375.00
$1,632.43
' $25,367.32
$23,734.89
$261.50
$800.00
$1,061.50
$24,796.39
$23,734.89
$400.00
$400.00

$24,134.89
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Legal Fees
Tctal Reimbursements
T-*al Due

John Robert McGrede
Percent of Net Proceeds
Total Due

Joydel McGrede Meredith
Total Due

Mary Elizabeth Vestal
Total Due

Eva Jo Lupton
Total Due

Reginald Roark
Net Proceeds
Less Expenses:

1995 Taxes to J G McGrede
Copies of Bkr Orders(USTC)

Survey, etc (R.McGrede)
1. & Del Taxes

Total Reductions

Total Due

Hester Estate

Net Proceeds

Less Expenses

Survey, etc (R.McGrede)
Bal. Atty Fees to Heinrichs

Total Due (1/5) each:

Melanie Coursey
Melinda Simpson
Melissa Simmons
Melydia Edge
Martha Bass

/.

$2,563.60

1,000.00

$1,000.00

$261.50
$23.27
$147.28

$2,995.65

$110.15

$130.34
$240.49

<
$23,734.89 <<

341,409, /8

$48,469.78
$23,734.89

$23,734.89
$23,734.89

$23,734.89
$23,734.89

$23,734.89
$23,734.89

$23,734.89

$20,739.24

$23,734.89

$4,698.88
$4,698.88
$4,698.88
$4,698.88
$4,698.88

261083.79  261941.58

BOB ANDERSON, Bankruptcy Trustee for the

interest of Reginal Stacy Roark

Gnoss
OQapet #3
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT ~ OCT 29 1998
EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS N o
TYLER DIVISION m;Sé%uw
IN RE: § CASE NO. 96-60060
§ - CHAPTER 7
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK ?9 '08 Jointly Administered Under
g0D 00 Case No.96-60060)
DEBTORS § < S g o
- 3 2 o
- =5 & o
ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET ~ [*<32 © ©
OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS =% & o
(5.13 Acres, Richard Hooper Survey, Harrison County, TX) ;35? o X

. =
3

i

Trustee's Motion for Authorization to Sell Asset of Bankruptcy Egtjateéree amd Clear
of Liens having been presented to the Court, and the Court finding that notice having been
properly given and that no objection having been timely made, and it further appearing that the
Motion s-hould be granted;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED that Trustee, Bob Anderson, is
authorized to sell all that certain lot, tract or parcel of land consisting of approximately 5.13 acres

in two tracts, one of approximately 4.13 acres and one of approximately 1.00 acre, situated on
Waldron’s Ferry Road and Highway 450, both of said tracts being located in the Richard Hooper
Survey, A-304, Harrison County, Texas, said 5.13 acres being more specifically described by the

. ¢
field notes attached hereto, for a sales price of $51,900 to be paid at closing. X vy = 25,950

Groess §

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED AND DECREED that the sale shall be made free and 0‘02;5%

clear of liens, except for ad valorem taxes by any.taxing authority for the current year, which liens

rem'fax liens for the current tax year are hereby

CF T T A True Copy 1 Cerlify
ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET OF BANKRYPTCYESTATE - Page | ...~ James D. Tokoph, Clerk

FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS (Interest in 50.33 Acr’e§;*Harrison,County) -
8449\P 5.13 Harrison M&O\ci ceter e e UJS, Bankrupley Court

shall attach to the sales proceeds T—hé
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expressly retained until the payment by the purchaser of the 1998 ad valorem taxes and any
penalties or interest which may ultimately accrue to those 1998 taxes, in the ordinary course of

business.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED AND DECREED that Trustee is authorized to pay from
the closing proceeds (or have deducted from the proceeds) the lien payoff owing to Earl Boyd, the
realtor's commission, delinquent and the Estate’s portion of 1998 ad valorem taxes, premium for
title policy, cost of survey, and other incidertal closing expenses that are reasonable and

customary in real estate transactions.

SIGNED this the 20/ day of (L ZoZop , 1998,

JUDGE PRESIDING %

Prepared and Submitted By:

Bob Anderson

Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, Texas 75606-3343
(903) 757-2868

(903) 757-4612 (facsimile)

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE - Page 2
FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS (Interest in 50.33 Acres, Gregg County)
8449\P 5.13 Harrison M&O\ci
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TRACT ONE:

All that certain lot, tract or parcel of land, situated in Harrison
County, Texas; being a part of the RICHARD HOOPER SURVEY A-304; being a part
of that certain 9.211 acre tract described in a deed from Southwestern
Electric Power Co. to Earl H. Boyd, dated June 17, 1983, recorded in Vol.
1006, page €47, Deed Records, Harrison County, Texas; being 4.13 acres of
land, more or less, more particularly described as follows:

BEGINNING at a 3/4" iron pipe found on the East side of Farm tr Market
Highway 45 ("FM 450") at the Northwest cormer of said 9.211 acre trac:;

TIENCE North 88 deg.55'S5" East, along the North line of sai:t 9 211 acre
tract, 227.25 feet, to the occupied Northwest corner of the 1.08 acra tract
described in the deed from Earl E. Boyd, et ux, to Jessie Williams, et ux,
dated Oct. 30, 1935, recorded in Vol. 1447, page 188, Official Public Records,
Harrison County, Texas, from which a ¥" iron rod found bears North 88
deg.55'55" Bast, 200.60 feet, and a steel spike found bears South 01
deg.26'01" East, 0.86 feet;

THENCE South 01 deg.26'01" East, 225.75 feet, with the West line of said
1.08 acre tract, to the occupied Southwest cormer of said 1.08 acre tract,
from wiich a %" iron rod found bears South 85 deg.18'25" East, 200.20 feet,
and a steel spike found bears South 01 deg.26'01" East, 2.96 feet, said conrer
being in the North margin of Interstate Highway 20 ("IE 20"):

THENCE along the South line of said 9.211 acre tract, and said North

margin ‘of IH 20, as follows:

(1) - North 85 deg.1B8'25" West, 629.14 feet, to a concrete
monument found;

(2) . South 77 deg.06'01" West, 266.76 feet, to a %" irru. rod set;
and

(3). North 50 deg.S57'07" West, 62.07 feet, to a concrete morument
found o1 the Baszt =ide of said FM 450;

THENCE North 00 deg.48'52" East, with said East side of FM 450, 177.3%
feer, to the place of beginning, and containing 4.13 aeres of land, nore or
less.

TRACT TWO:

All that certain lot, tract or parcel of land, situated in Harrisen
County, Texas; being a part of the RICHARD EOOPER SURVEY A-304; being a part
of that certain 9.211 acre tract described in a deed from Southwestern
Electric Power Co. to Earl H. Boyd, dated Junme 17, 1983, recorded in Vol.
1006, page 647, Deed Records, Harrison County, Texas; being 1.00 acre of land,
more or less, more particularly described as follows:

BEGINNING at a %" iron rod at the Northwest corner of a 1 acre tract
described in a deed from Earl H. Boyd to Nelson Cowles, et ux, dated March |,
1993, recorded in Vol. 1373, page 518, of said Deed Records; said beginning
corner be:ng South 88 deg.43'55" West, 128.29 feet, and South 88 deg.55'55"
West, 294.94 feet, from a %" iron rod found at the Northwest cormer of a 1

A ) ’

EXHTIBIT . PAGE 1 _OF 2 PAGES



AFTER RECORDING RETURN TO:
BOB ANDERSON, TRUSTEE
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acre tract described in a deed from Earl H. Boyd to Virginia Moore, et al,
dated May 18, 1987, recorded in Vol. 1145, page 833, of said Deed Records;

THENCE South 07 deg.37'38" East, with the West line of said Cowles
tract, 232.05 feet, to a ¥" iron rod set in the South lime of said %.211 cre
tract, and the North right of way line of Interstate Highway 20, and at the
Southwest corner of said Cowles tract; :

THENCE with sald North right of way line of Interstate Highway 20:

(1). BSouth 77 deg.03'37" West, 114.04 feet, to a concrete highway
monume.t and

(2) . North 85 deg.14'57" West, 78.72 feet, to a %" iron rod set
for corner at the Southeast cormer of a 1.08 acre tract described in i. Geed
from Earl H. Boyd, et ux, to Jessie Williams, et ux, dated Oct. 30, 1995,
recorded in Vol. 1447, page 188, Official Public Records, Harrisen County,
Texas;

THENCE North 01 deg.04'05" West, with the East line of said 1.08 acre
tract, 246.01 feet, to a %" iron rod set in the North line of gaid $.211 acre
tract;

THENCE North 88 deg.55'55" East, with said North line, 163.41 feet. to
the place of beginning, and containing 1.00 acze of land, more or less.

Being the same twe tracts of land conveyed by Earl H. Boyd, et ux, Betty
J. Boyd, to Reginald Roark, et ux, Anna M. Roark, by deed dated Dec. 11, 198s,
recorded in Vol. 1465, page 218, Official Public Records, Harrison County,
Texas. °

STHTE OF TEXRS COURTY 0F HARRISON
T hereby certify that this instrument was

filed on the cate and tise staaped hereon by s

and was duly recorded in the voluse and page

P.0. BOX 3343
LONGVIEW TEXAS 75606

RECORDED BY USTC-GF#982249

&f the nased vecords of:
Harrison County
a stanped herenn by me.
Dec 16,1998

Rartha B, Dieste, County Clerk
Harrison County

EXRTBIT ‘A‘, PAGE 2 OF 2 PAGES



Pae ot o g vy 1 age o N Form_Approved UMB No. 25020265
7. U.E DEPARTMENT OF HOUSING AND URBAN DEVELOPMENT : : :

IL__FHA 2. FV 3. _X_CONV. UNINS.
4. VA 5.__COi . INS.
6. File Number 7. Loan Number
982249
B. Mortgage Ins. Case No.
SETTLEMENT STATEMENT
C. NOTE:  This form is furnished to give you a statement of actual setth costs. Amounts paid to and by the settlement agent are shown.

ltems marked "(P.0.C.)"were paid outside the closing; they are shown here for informational purposes and are not included in the rotals.
D. NAME AND ADDRESS OF BORROWER:  Mark Churchill Investments , L.L.C.
140 Foxglove Ln., Longview TX 75605

E. NAME, ADDRESS AND TIN OF SELLER:  Bob Anderson, Trustee/ Ty /‘ o D500 o S
P. 0. Box 3343, Longview TX 75606

r e G2y oo hilA

-]

F. NAME AND ADDRESS OF LENDER: Joan Churchill
727 Yorktown Court
Longview, TX 75601

(-’é/-u_,\ (772 Y S VAR /?/a/j/
\

éc.l/' rw o€ ron/’)

G. PROPERTY LOCATION: TX

LOT: METES AND BOUNDS TRACT: 5.13

DProperly or Services Recelved 10995 Contact #
H. SETTLEMENT AGENT: U. S. Title Company, Inc. TIN #751874538

PLACE OF SETTLEMENT: 1000 NORTH HIGH STREET

LONGVIEW, TEXAS 75601

| SETTLEMENT DATE 11-25-98
). UMM RROWERE ]

100. GROSS AMOUNT DUE FROM BORROWE

101. Contract sales price 51,900.00 | | 401 Contract sates price 51,900.00
102. Personal Property 402. Personal property
T “ettlement charges to borrower(line 1400) 369.00| |403.
. 404.
105. 405.
Adjustments for items paid by seller in advance Adjustments for items paid by seller in advance
106. City/town taxes to 406. City/town taxes to
107. County taxes 11-25-981t12-31-98 28,67 1407. County taxes 11-25-981012-31-98 28.67
108. Assessments to 408. Assessments to
109. Hallsville ISD Taxes 126.45] [409. Hallsville ISD Taxes 126.45
110. 410.
111, 411,
112, 412.
113. 413.
114. 414,
115. 415.
116. 416.
120. GROSS AMOUNT DUE FROM BORROWER 52,424.12 {420. GROSS AMOUNT DUE TO SELLER 52,055.12
. 300, AMOURIS - PAI BY/OR INBRHA SWCHIONS . 1N AMDUNT: DUE 70 SELLER: .
201. Deposit or earnest money 1,000.00 ] | 501. Excess deposit(see instructions)
202. Principal amount of new loan(s) 51,024.12] | 502. Setlement charges to sellergline 1400) 8,303.52
203. Existing loan(s) taken subject o 503. Existing loan(s) taken subject to
204, 504. Payoff of first mortgage loan 22,809.40
205. 505. Payoff of second mortgage loan
206. 506.
207. 507.
208. 508.
- 509.
' Adjustments for items unpaid by seller Adjustments for items unpaid by seller
210. City/town taxes to 510. City/town taxes to
211. County taxes to 511. County taxes to
212. Assessments to 512. Assessments 1 to
213, 513. .
214. Cleanup Credit 400.00[ |514. Cleanup Credit 400.00
215. 515.
2i6. 518,
217. 517.
218. 518.
219. 519.
TOTAL PAID BY/FOR TOTAL REDUCTION AMOUNT
220. BORROWER 52,424.12] | 520. DUE SELLER 31,512.92
TLEMENT . FROMPTO BORROWER . " | I 000, CASH. AT SETTLEMENT JO/FROM SELLER .
Gross amount due from borrowerfline 120) 52,424.12| | 601. Gross amount due to sellerline 420) 52,055.12
. Less amounts paid by/for borrower(line 220) 52,424.12 [602. Less reductions in amount due seller(line 520 31,512.92

303.CASH (X FROM) ( T0) BORROWER o.00|[603.casH ¢ X 1O ¢ FROM) SELLER

20,542.20




e

Te=

SETTLEMENT CHARGES

BASED ON PRICE 51,900.00 @ 6.0008 3,114.00

701.
702

4.

Division of Commission (line 700) as follows:
$ 3,114.00t0 Zack Williams Commercial Real Estate

*AID FROM
BORROWER'S
FUNDS AT
SETTLEMENT

PAID FROM
SELLER'S
FUNDS AT

SETTLEMENT

3,114.00

801.

fiz

Loan Origination Fee ‘ %

802.

Loan Discount %

803.

Appraisal Fee to

804,

Credit Report to

805.

Lender’s Inspection Fee to

. Mortgage Insurance Application Fee to

807.

Assumption Fee to

808.

809.

810.

811,

812.

813.

814,

900. ITEMS REQUIRED. BY LENDER 10 BE PAID IN ADVANGE . _

. Interest from to @S

Iday ( - Adays)

. Morntgage | Premium for

months to

. Hazard Insurance Premium for

year to

. Hazard Insurance

Mottgage Insurance per_month

. City property taxes

per month

. County property taxes per month

. Annua! assessments

per month

101,

Settement or closing fee to U.S. TITLE COMPANY, INC. (ESCROW FEE)

75.00

75.00

1102

Abstract or tile search to

1103.

Title examination to

1104.

Title i binder to

1105.

Document preparation to

1106.

Notary fee to

1107. Attorney’s fee to

Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn

185.00

(includes above items numbers; }

1108. Tide insurance to

Moseley Abstract Company

246.00

606.00

(includes above items numbers; )

1109. Lender's coverage

246.00 $ 70,000.00

1110. Owner’s coverage

606.00 $ 51,900.00

1111,

1112.

TAX CERTIFICATES to Moseley Abstract Company

15.00

1113.

1200. GOVERNMENT. . RECDRDING. ' AND TRANSFER. GHARGE

. Recording fees: Deed $ 23.00 : Mortgage § 25.00 :Release $ 17.00

48.00

17.00

1201

1. .. Statc tax/stamps

City/county tax/stamps: Deed $ : Mortgage $

Deed § : Martgage $

1204.

1205.

R tc COUNTY CLERK

rd CC Bank

SURVEY to Hart Engineering Company

59.00

1302.

1303.

1304.

1305.

1998 & Del. Taxes to Harrison Central Appraisal District

1,925.57

1306.

1998 & Del. Taxes to Harrison County Tax Collector

454.04

1307.

1308.

1400. TOTAL SETTLEMENT CHARGES fenter on lines 103, Section J and 502, Section K)

369.00

8,303.52

carefully reviewed the HUD-1 Setifement Statement and, to the best of my knowledge and belief, it Is 2 true and accurste starement of all receipts and disbursements made on my account or by me in this

on. | further centify that | have received s copy of HUD-1 Settlement Statement.

SELLER 1 Bob Anderson, Trustee SELLER 2 SELLER 3

BUYER 1 ar urchi nvestimen BUYER 2 BUYER 3
To the best of my knowledge, the HUD-1 Settlement Ststement which ] have prepared is a true and accurste account of the funds which were received and have been or willbe disbursed by the undersigned as part
of the settlement of this transaction.

U. §S. Title Company, Inc.
WARNING: It is 2 crime to knowingly false statement (o the United States on this or any other similar form. Penahies upon conviction can include a fine and imprisonment.
For details see: Title 18 US. Code Sections 1001 and Section 1010.



Orders Supporting
Disbursements *

* with the exception of Check #101 to George McGrede,
which represents refund of earnest money paid in
connection with a sale of realty which was ultimately
sold to another party.
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. IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT Ve Yy
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS 9957 59 1
TYLER DIVISION #7onted bt 309
SR ARy Tey
IN RE: § Case No. 96-60060 and ¥ o
§ Casc No. 96-62679 -
REGGIE STACY ROARK and § (Jointly Administered under
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Case No. 96-60060)
§
Debtors § Chapter 7

Eop 35,329,99

ORDER GRANTING IN PART AND DENYING IN PART
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND EXPENSES FOR
ROBERT M. BANDY, P.C. AS ATTORNEY FOR DEBTORS

ON THIS DATE the Court considered the "Amended Application of Counsel for Debtors
for Allowance of Final Compensation of Attorneys' Fees (sic) and Reimbursement of Expenses
Pursuant to 11 USC §330" filed by Robert M. Bandy, P.C., ("Applicant") attorneys for the

‘ Debtors, Reggie and Anna Roark, in the above-referenced jointly-administered cases, both of
which were originally filed as Chapter 13 cases, but were ultimately converted to Chapter 7. The
Application requests an award of compensation in the amount of $21,254.75 and expense
reimbursement in the amount of $4,848.43 for the period preceding the conversion of this case to
Chapter 7, as well as an award of compensation in the amount of $6,920.00 and expense
reimbursement in the amount of $1,055.20 for the post-conversion period. An objection to the
Application was filed by the United States Trustce and, following a hearing conducted with
proper notice to all parties, the Court took the matter under advisement.

As for the request pertaining to post-conversion services and expenses, under the Fifth
Circuit's interpretation of §330 of the Bankruptcy Code expressed in Andrews & Kurth, L.L.P. v.
Family Snacks, Inc. (Matter of Pro-Snax Distributors, Inc.), 157 F.3d 414 (5th Cir. 1998),

~ compensation awards for services rendered by an attorney for a debtor who has not been retained \J\\
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.

. hy an estate and who does not (or no Jonger) fits within the compensation exceplion for debtors’
attorneys in Chapter 12 or Chapter 13 cases under §330(a)(4)(B) are statutorily precluded. Thus,
the Court is compelled to conclude that no compensation may be awarded from this Estate for

posi-conversion seryices rendered by the debtors' attorney in this case, save and except for the
awarding of compensation and expensc reimbursement for reasonable and necessary services

pertaining to the preparation of the fee application for the Applicant's pre-corversion services,
which the Court finds to be §1,100.00.

As for pre-conversion services, the Court, having reviewed the Application and
determined whether the services and expenses as outlined in the application were actual,
reasonable and necessary, finds that a reduction of 22.90 hours in senior attorney time ($160/hr)
js justified for excessive time having been billed for the work described, as well as a reduction of

. 1.20 hours in that rate category [or services which did not confer a benefit upon the debtor and 2
reduction of .60 hours in that re;te category for services which were insufficiently described.

The Court further finds that a reduclioﬁ of 9.40 hours in junior attorney time ($75/hr) is
justified for excessive time having been billed for the work described, as well as a reduction of
.60 hours in that rate category for services which did not confer a benefit upon the debtor; a
reduction of .55 hours in that rate category for services which were insufficiently described; and
a reduction of .30 hours in that rate catcgory for charges made for clerical-lype services which
are properly characterized as an overhead item.

The Court further finds that a rcdﬁction 0of 5.30 hou_rs in paralcgal time ($40/hr) is
justified for excessive time having been billed for the work described, as well as a reduction of

8.30 hours in that rate category for services which did not confer a benefit upon the debtor; and a

o 2
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. reduction of 5.90 hours in that rate category for charges made for clerical-type services which are

properly characterized as an overhead item.

As for expenses, the Application fails to disclose the aggregate amount and per page cost
of the reimbursement requested for copying expense in violation of the guidelines set forth in
Local Rule Appendix 2016. Tn comparing the requested photocopy reimbursement with the
compensable services rendered by the Applicant, the Court will reduce the award in this area
from the requested $3,600.35 to $2,329.24. All other pre-copversion expenses are allowed as
requested.

Therefore, the Court finds that good cause exists for the entry of the following order.

IT 1S THEREFORE ORDERED that Robert M. Bandy, P.C. is hereby awarded the
sum of $16,807.00 as reasonable compensation for actual and necessary services rendered to the

. individual Debtors in their respective Chapter 13 cases, together with reimbursement for actual

and necessary expenses in the amount of $3,577.32, for a total award of $20,384.32; which,

following the application of the $3,756.53 previously paid to the Applicant by the Debtors,

Icaves ajbalance of $16,627.79 which shall be paid as a Chapter 13 administrative expense in the

priority prescribed for pre-conversion administrative expenses by §726(E)]of the Bankruptcy

Code. ?o@oL 3 /"’/oo

' #
SIGNED thisﬁ/dkay of M’ 1999. Chl(\_/i mk’fi '8

e 65)

BILL PARKER
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 9/~

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS ~ ~ ‘9,
TYLER DIVISION o i
3 po AN
N ‘. L i 'JUQ
IN RE: § CASE N@ 96-60060
§ CHAPTER7 -
REGGIE STACEY ROARK 5
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Jointly Administered Under
§ ~ Case No. 96-60060)
DEBTORS y EODDEC 3198

ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES
OF TRUSTEE’S AUCTIONEER, BILL. WATSON AUCTION SERVICE

Trustee’s Application for Compensaion of Auctioneer and for Reimbursement of Expenses
previously filed in this case, having been presented to the Court, and it appearing that notice has
been properly given and no objections have been filed: and that the Application should be
approved and the compensation and expenses allowed;

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED that compensation in the amount of $512.85

and reimbursement of expenses in the amount of $785.46 incurréd‘by Bill Watson Auction

S¥rvice, for a total amount of $1,298.31, is approved; and the same shall be paid from available
funds in each of the two Estate accounts, in the proportion of one-half from each, upon the

execution hereof.

SIGNED this the._ 3/ day of _ L Jerember 1978

AL,

JUDGE PRESIDING
//2_ Pocd. ///4/‘7‘7

Prepared and Submitted by:

h #1001~ Joo - 9 g1, 43
Bob Anderson, #01211300 ¢ Pi < 13
P.O. Box 3343 Ch.# 102 - 4p - T392 1
Longview, Texas 75606
(903) 757-2868

Fax (903) 757-4612

ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF AUCTIONEER - Page |
8449\ Auction Docs\ci



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: §

§ f ~ CASE NO. 96-60060
REGGIE STACEY ROARK § TP GG 1908
AND § LR S BARR e
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § evoepury

§ CHAPTER 7
DEBTORS §

NOTICE OF PROPOSED PUBLIC SALE

NOTICE

TO THE HONORABLE COURT:

Bob Anderson, Trustee, files this Notice of Proposed Public Sale and would show the

Court the following:

. Jurisdiction. This court has jurisdiction under 28 U.S.C. Section 1334 and

Section 157. This Notice is given pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Section 363, Bankruptey Rule 2002 and

6004.

NOTICE OF PROPQSED PUBLIC SALE - Page 1
8449'P Public Sale Noticeic



2. Parties and Case Commencement. Debtor, Reggie Stacy Roark, filed his petition

commencing this case under Chapter 13 of the Bankruptcy Code on January 11, 1996. The case
Wwas converted to one under Chapter 7 on J anuary 26, 1998. Bob Anderson was appointed Interim
Trustee and is presently serving as Trustee.
3. Property. The Estate owns a 2 community interest in various personalty
consisting of restaurant equipment and certain vehicles.
4. Liens. The following liens exist against the Property:
a)  Lien of Mardy Parker in the amount of $7,500 plus accrued interest since
August 28, 1996.
b)  Lien of ad valorem taxing entities in an amount to be determined.
5. Sale. Trustee Proposes to sell the property at public auction to the highest bidder
for cash at a public sale on September 26, 1998, at 10:00 o’clock a.m., at Debtor’s former shop
located at the intersection of Interstate 20 and Highway 450, Hallsville, Harrison County, Texas.

6.  Agreement with Lienholders. Trustee has entered Into an agreement with the

lienholders to distribute the proceeds of sale as follows: Mardy Parker shall receive one-third
(1/3) of the net proceeds, not to exceed the actual amount of his lien; the taxing entities shall as
a group receive one-third (1/3) of the net proceeds, not to exceed the actual amount of their lien,
to be divided amongst the entities as they shall determine; and the balance of the net proceeds shall

be retained by the Estate to be distributed to the creditors in accordance with Bankruptcy Code.

Paol Hlag
Ch. #1103 ~ma,ul.j Poka - ¥ 59 78
Ch. *# 104 - Joumg Entitian~ 765 7%

NOTICE OF PROPOSED PUBLIC SALE - Page 2
8449\P Public Sale Notice\ci



DATED: September Y . 1908

RESPECTFULLY SUBMITTED,

SMEAD, ANDERSON, WILCOX & DUNN
P. O. Box 3343

Longview, Texas 75606

(903) 757-2868

(903) 757-4612 (fax)

Bob Anderson, #01211300

CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I certify that a true and correct copy of the foregoing Notice of Proposed Public Sale
was mailed by First Class United States Mail to a]] parties in interest as set out on the attached

matrix onthisthe 4 day of September, 1998,

Bob Anderson

NOTICE OF PROPOSED PUBLIC SALE - Page 3
844NP Public Sale Notice\ci
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT -
EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS ~ 980CT-8 4y o: 25

TYLER DIVISION CLRE
“LLRTL L '-;-‘J:fz!;\:.:\,:." ! \.l/
IN RE- § CCUR;
BYCASE.NO. 96:60060
REGGIE STACEY ROBRK Copy | Certify
James D. Tokoph, Cler CHAPTER 7

DEBTOR U.S. Bankruptcf ourt§
oy {5 peputy EOD 0T 0898

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET
OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS
(Real Property and Mineral Property, Gregg County, Texas)

Trustee's Motion for Authorization to Sell Asset of Bankruptcy Estate Free and Clear of
Liens having been presented to the Court, and the Court finding that notice having been properly
given and that no objection having been timely made, and it further appearing that the Motion
should be granted;
IT IS HEREBY ORDERED AND DECREED that Trustee, Bob Anderson, is authorized
to sell the Estate’s interest in the following property:
(@) The surface estate to all of Debtor’s interest in any land that is a part
of that certain 220 acre tract described in Deed recorded in Volume 37, Page
183, Deed Records of Gregg County, Texés; and,
(b) All of the Estate’s interest in royalty and mineral interests in Gregg
County, Texas, including, but not limited to, the royalty interests described by the

printout from the Gregg County Appraisal District attached hereto as Exhibit "A";

ORDER AUTHORIZING SALE OF ASSET OF BANKRUPTCY ESTATE - Page 1
FREE AND CLEAR OF LIENS (Real Property and Mineral Property, Gregg County, Texas)
8449\P Gregg County M&O\ci




for a sales price of $35,500 to be paid at closing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED AND DECREED that the sale shall be made free and clear

of liens, except for ad valorem taxes by any taxing authority for the current year, which liens shall

attach to the sales proceeds. The ad valorem tax liens for the current tax year are hereby expressly

retained until the payment by the purchaser of the 1998 ad valorem taxes and any pénalties or

interest which may ultimately accrue to those 1998 taxes, in the ordinary course of business.

SIGNED this the 5 /A _ day of ﬁg/ % , 1998,

Prepared and Submitted By:

Bob Anderson

Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, Texas 75606-3343
(903) 757-2868

(903) 757-4612 (facsimile)

JUDGE PRESIDING
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FILED
SRS ey
. IN TLIE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT co e RT R Ty
FOR THE EASTERN DISIRICT OF TEXAS 00 MiR 29 py ¥
TYLER DIVISION
LAMLLT b h HRUPTCY
IN RE: - § Case No. 96-60060 v “U‘
§ Chaptcr 7 DERYTY
REGGIE S. ROARK and §
ANNA M. ROARK § (Case No. 96-60660 & 96-62679
§ Jointly Administered under
Debtors § Case No. 96-60660)

ORDFER GRANTING APPLICATION OF
SMEAD, ANDERSON, WILCOX & DUNN AS COUNSEL FOR

ON THIS DATE the Court considered the "Application of Smead, Anderson, Wilcox &
Dunn as Counsel for Trustee for Allowance of Attomey Fees and Expenses” filed by the law firm
of Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn (" Applicant") attorneys for the Chapter 7 Trustce, Bob
Anderson, in the above-referenced Chapter 7 casc. The Court finds that the Application was
properly served pursuant to the chéral and [.ocal Rulcs of Bankruptey Procedure and that no

. objection or other written response Lo the Motion has been timely filed by any party. The Court,

having reviewcd the Application and determined whether the services and cxpenses as outlined
in the application werc actual, reasonable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the cntry
of the following order. |

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the law [irm of Smead, Andcrson, Wilcox &
Dunn, as attorneys for the Chapter 7 Trustee in the above-referenced case, is hereby awarded the
sum of $13,740.00 as reasonablc compensation for actual and necessary services rendercd to the
Chapter 7 Estatc and reimbursement for actual and necessary expenses in the amount of
$2,338.48 for a total award of $16,078.48 which the Chapter 7 Trustee shall pay from available

3
funds to Smead, Anderson, Wilcox & Dunn upon the cxecution hercof. P acd 30/ @
%ﬁ Ch.# 110 - #o0 -%13,740. &1
SIGNED (hi day of 2000 11 -Cxp. -9 2,339.9%
, BILLL PARKER
. (JNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY NNIDGE

cc:  Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee Fax: 903-295-2808 -7 O
EOD iR 300 3
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UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

Eastern District of Texas
Tyler Division

IN RE: Case No.: 96 - 60060
Reggie Stacey Roark and Anna Marlene Roark
Debtor(s). Chapter: 7

Notice of Entry of Order

Please Take Notice that an Order (document 379) was entered on the docket on August 15, 2000,
Order Granting [378-1] Application For Compensation: $
185.75 1o Accountant, Robert Rogers, CPA by Bob Anderson.

Dated: 08/15/00 James D. Tokoph
Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court

NOTICE

This notice is being served in lieu of the actual order. Should any further action be
contemplated on this matter, the actual order should be referenced,

PACER (Public Access to Court Electronic Documents) subscribers can obtain a copy of
this Order directly from the Court’s PACER web site at pacer.txeb.uscourts.gov or
through the Court’s own web site at www.txeb.uscourts.gov. There is a fee of $.07 per
page charged to your PACER account.

You must be registered with the PACER Service Center to access the PACER system.

You may register at their web site at pacer.psc.uscourts.gov or by calling them at
(800)676-6856.

A copy of this Order may also be obtained by contacting a copy service. An up to date
list of the copy services which do business with the Court is available on the Court’s
own web site or by calling the Court directly. The fees charged by each copy service
may vary greatly,

/DO.L:OL 1/5'/00
Cho ¥ 1% - du - 1185

000192



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: § CASE NO. 96-60060

§ CHAPTER 7
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Jointly Administered Under

§ . Case No. 96-60060)
DEBTORS §

ORDER GRANTING APPLICATION FOR ALLOWANCE OF ACCOUNTANT'S FEES
FILED BY BOB ANDERSON, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE

On or about July 7, 2000, Trustee’s Application for Allowance of Accountant’s Fees (the
"Application") was filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, (the "Movant") in the above-referenced
case. The Court finds that the Application was properly served pursuant to the Federal and Local Rules
of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice language,
pursuant to Local Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which directed any party opposed to the granting
of the relief sought by the Application to file a written response within twenty days or the Application
would be deemed by the Court to be unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or other written
response to the Application has been timely filed by any party. Due to the failure of any party to file a
timely written response, the allegations contained in the Motion stand unopposed and, therefore, the Court, -
having reviewed the Application and having determined that the services and expenses outlined in the
application were actual, reasonable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the entry of the
following order:

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the Application for Allowance of Accountant’s Fees Filed
by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, on or about July 7, 2000, is hereby GRANTED so as to authorize
the Trustee to pay to Robert G. Rogers, C.P.A., to the extent that funds are available, the sum of $185.75
as payment for his professional fees in connection with the representation of Trustee in this case.

SIGNED this the day of , 2000.

BILL PARKER
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

Prepared and Submitted by:
Bob Anderson

Smead, Anderson & Dunn
911 W Loop 281, Suite 412
Longview, TX 75604
903.295.2830 (telephone)
903.295.2808 (facsimile)



SCHEDULE B

APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION

COMPUTATION OF COMMISSIONS (cases filed after 10/22/94)

1,250.00

Total Receipts $93.639.77 25% of First $5,000 §$

Less (5,000.00)

Balance 88.639.77 10% of next $45,000 § 4,500.00
Less (45,000.00)

Balance 43.639.77 5% of next $950,000 § 2.181.99
Less (950,000.00)

Balance 0.00 3% of Remaining Balance $ 0.00
See Exhibit of Trustee’s Time Attached TOTAL COMMISSIONS  § 7.931.99
UNREIMBURSED EXPENSES

Recording Fees (3/31/98 Harrison Co. Clerk, record Notice of Bankruptcy) $ - 9.00
Premium on Trustee's Bond $ 0.00
Necessary Travel (@ .35/mile) (see detail attached) $ 58.15
Paraprofessional $ 0.00
Clerical and Stenographic (exhibit attached) $ 4,338.00
Photocopy (1,644 @ .25 each) $ 411.00
Supplies/Stationery $ -0.00
Delivery Costs (actual postage) $ 94.72
Distribution Expenses $ 0.00
Long Distance Telephone Charges $ 71.89
Other Expenses (see detail attached) $ 172.47
TOTAL UNREIMBURSED EXPENSES $ 5.155.23




Trustee's Time Exhibit in Support of Compensation

Asset Analysis and Recovery

2/13/1998

950

Detailed letter to Tom Sweeney setting out problems and possible
solutions to selling Roark's interest in the 1.934 acres

2/19/1998

.50

Receipt of letter from Dennis McKinney regarding possible sale of real
property and providing information on attempts to sell Gregg County
property and events during Chapter 13 bankruptcy and review of file
in light of same

2/27/1998

30

Receipt of letter from James Calk regarding his representation of
George Taylor Henderson Family Trust and potential purchase of
Estate’s interest in 50-1/3 acres

3/20/1998

20

Receipt and review of letter and supporting documentation from

Gregory Fraser, attorney for Earl Boyd, regarding Harrison County realty
and his request for abandonment based on lack of equity and possible -
filing of motion to lift stay

3/23/1998

Letter to Gregory Fraser, attorney for Earl Boyd, regarding equity in the
Harrison County property

3/25/1998

.10

Receipt and review of letter from Gregory Fraser, attorney for Earl
Boyd, regarding possible sale of Harrison County realty and Earl Boyd's
lien payoff

3/25/1998

2.00

Meeting with Reggie Roark in Hallsville, review of realty and
improvements, review of assets located in building

3/26/1998

4.00

Travel to Halisville and review of inventory; Telephone conference with
Reggie Roark; Telephone conference with Steve McDaniel

3/26/1998

.10

Letter to Charles Keasler, regarding property listed by Debtor with his
agency, Zack Williams Real Estate, and advising of appointment as
Trustee

3/27/1998

.30

Letter to two tenants requesting future rentals be paid directly to
Trustee

4/3/1998

10

Receipt and review of letter from Bandy regarding property at 206 S.
Boring and Hibernia's request for deed in lieu of foreclosure

4/4/1998

20

Receipt and review of letter and other documents from Charles
Keasler, realtor, regarding Harrison County acreage, addressing values
and menftioning specific problems associated with the tract

4/6/1998

10

Receipt of letter from Stephen McDaniel confirming his review of
documentation for sale of Gregg County realty for U.S. Title and
advising no additions or revisions required

Trustee's Time Exhibit in Support of Compensation - Page 1
F:\Documents\TCLIENTS\8449\R Trustee Time by Categories.wpd




4/8/1998 .20 | Lefter to Roark regarding Trustee's decision to not administer property
at 206 S. Boring and position of formal notice of abandonment of same

4/8/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of letter and supporting documents from Roark
regarding property at 206 S. Boring

4/14/1998 .50 | Review of records at tax office

4/14/1998 .50 | Office conference with Reggie Roark to review his property

4/15/1998 .50 | Travel to Reggie Roark's home to review contents in storage

4/16/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Capital Commerce Reporter's UCC Search
results

4/20/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Mike Gazette

4/21/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Reggie Roark to Carlene Tutt
regarding Adrian Road property

4/22/1998 .30 | Office conference with Reggie Roark

4/23/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of correspondence from Greg Fraser, attorney for
Earl Boyd, first lienholder on Harrison County real property

4/24/1998 .30 | Review of file regarding liens

4/28/1998 .30 | Receipt and review of information regarding Arkansas mineral interests
and memo to file that there does not appear to be sufficient value to
the Estate to administer

4/28/1998 .30 | Receive and review pleading regarding J. Wade

4/28/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of letter from Glen Phillips; Telephone conference
with Glen Phillips regarding settlement of Wade case

412971998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Roark regarding property at 206 S.
Boring and claim of Hibernia Bank

5/1/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of letter and information from Reggie Roark
regarding his estimation of liquidated asset values and priority claims

5/1/1998 30 | Receipt and review of various information on Adrian Road property
{value, condition, taxes owed, costs to repair, etc.) provided by Reggie
Roark

5/14/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of 1998 Notice of Appraised Value pertaining to
Gregg County realty

5/27/1998 .30 | Receipt and review of letter from Reggie Roark and enclosed
documentation and exhibits pertaining to mineral interests

5/28/1998 .50 [ Review of various information in file and notes regarding the assets,
values, homestead and property descriptions

Trustee's Time Exhibit In Support of Compensation - Page 2
F:\Documenis\TCLIENTS\8449\R Trustee Time by Categories.wpd




6/1/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of information provided by Reggie Roark on Spring
Hill (Gregg County) properties (realty and minerals), and ad valorem
taxes

6/1/1998 50 | Telephone conference with Jimmie Calk

6/2/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of various documents and information delivered
by Debtor pertaining to ad valorem taxes and other information on
various assets

6/2/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of information provided by Reggie Roark on
Homestead 10.01 Acres, including appraisal district values, property
taxes and other adjustments to value

6/3/1998 .50 | Receipt and review of documents provided by James Calk pertaining
to the ownership of fractional interests in the 50 acre tract, P.P. Rains
Survey, and Partition Deed of R.T. Henderson Estate, and other
ownership notes and records

7/10/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Reggie Roark regarding oil royalties
and Spring Hill properties and possible abandonment of same

712911998 .40 | Receipt and review of Amended Schedules

8/3/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Charles Keasler regarding Harrison County
acreage, values, appraisal, and other aspects of marketing the
property

8/4/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of letter and appraisal report from Charles Keasler
on Harrison County property

8/12/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with M. Gazette

8/12/1998 20 | Telephone conference with M. Reed regarding sale of personalty

8/18/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding sale of
property

8/27/1998 .50 | Review of various information on Debtor's interests in various properties
and attempting to determine exactly what Debtor owns

8/28/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with auctioneer regarding personalty

8/28/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with realtor regarding Hallsville property

9/22/1998 30 | Office conference with Tom Sweeney regarding sale of Inner Loop
property

10/20/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Dave Mordy, attorney for J & |
Manufacturing regarding sale of Harrison County acreage

1172971998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and documents from Roark regarding
George McGrede, the Edith Roark and Velma Bonner Estates and
interest in Spring Hill properties
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12/14/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of Order Modifying Conditions of Probation
referencing closing proceeds from sale of property

12/29/1998 .10 | Receipt of letter from Mike Gazette regarding sale of personalty

1/23/1999 .10 | Receipt of letter from James Calk regarding Reggie Roark's receipt of
discharge and request to move forward with sale of interest in the
Henderson Estate property

3/1/1999 .10 | Telephone conference with Michael Reed, attorney, regarding
Henderson Estate sale

4/8/1999 .20 | Telephone conference with Glen Phillips regarding cause of action
against Wade

511111999 1.00 } Review of schedules, other documents and information relating to
Gregg County realty in effort to determine whether to sell and
estimation of net proceeds available to Estate, including discussion
with Mardy Parker, abstract of judgment lienholder

5/13/1999 .10 | Telephone conference regarding C.W. Kendall, Jr., abstract of
judgment lienholder against Gregg County property

05/13/1999 30 | Additional investigation intfo Gregg County realty and claims against to
determine whether to administer

TOTAL 20.40 | Hours Asset Analysis and Recovery

Asset Disposition

6/5/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of initial closing statement on sale of 1.934 acres,
Gregg County

8/6/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Charles Keasler regarding Harrison County
property and letter o Keasler confirming telephone agreement on
sales price

8/24/1998 .20 | Letter to Byron Roach regarding sale of properties

8/24/1998 20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding property
descriptions

8/24/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Byron Roach regarding purchase of
properties

8/26/1998 20 | Letter to potential purchaser, Dennis Bowles, regarding Spring Hill area
properties (ultimately not sent)

8/27/1998 .60 | Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede, and letter to Wanda
McGrede regarding Gregg County properties and requesting bids on
both the realty and minerals
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8/27/1998 .20 | Lefter to Byron Roach regarding sale of Debtor's interests in various
properties

8/27/1998 .10 | Receipt of letter from Mike Gazette regarding Mardy Parker's interest in
property to be auctioned

9/2/1998 20 | Letter to Wanda McGrede and Byron Roach regarding “bid-off" on
Gregg County realty and minerals

9/2/1998 .30 | Preparation of notice letter setting out bidding procedures

9/2/1998 .20 | Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding offer to purchase

9/3/1998 .80 | Preparation of Notice of Public Sale

9/21/1998 .10 | Telephone conference with Pam Luker of U.S. Title regarding Inner Loop
property

9/24/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Ben Grant at U.S. Title

9/24/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Pam Luker at U.S. Title

9/25/1998 .50 | Attend auction

10/1/1998 .10 | Telephone conference with realtor

10/14/1998 .20 | Communication with Charles Keasler, realtor, regarding closing and
other details concerning Harrison County acreage

10/15/1998 30 | Letter to U.S. Title Company regarding sale of inner loop property,
existence of judgment liens against same, and pending suit objecting
to Debtor's discharge

10/20/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of correspondence from Charles Keasler regarding
Titte Commitment issued by Moseley Abstract on sale of Harrison
County acreage

11/25/1998 .50 | Receipt and review of various documents from U.S. Title Company on
sale of Harrison County acreage, including Closing Statement;
Telephone conference with Title Company; Revisions to Affidavit as to
Debts and Liens

11/27/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of comrespondence and enclosures from Charles
W. Keasler, reattor, regarding cleanup of Harrison County acreage

1/5/1999 20 | Letter to McGredes and Byron Roach, proposed purchasers, regarding
sale of Gregg County realty and mineradls, effective date of sale, ad
valorem taxes and legal description

1/19/1999 30 | Telephone conference and letter to Pam Luker of U.S. Title regarding
sale of Loop property and Order Modifying Conditions of Probation
referencing Loop property;

3/22/1999 .10 | Provide copy of Discharge of Debtor to Pam Luker of U.S. Title
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3/23/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of faxed documents from James Calk setting out
the purchasers for the Henderson Estate property

4/3/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of proposed Closing Statement on 1.934 Acres to
Thomas Sweeney, Trustee

4/8/1999 .20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding abandonment of
cause of action against Wade

4/8/1999 .10 | Letter to Glenn Phillips regarding Noftice of Trustee's Intention to
Abandon Estate's Interest in pending justice court litigation in Gregg
County

5/6/1999 .10 | Receipt of $2,500 check from James Calk to close sale of undivided
interest in 50-1/3 acres, P.P. Rains Survey, Gregg County

5/14/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of Division Order from EOTT Energy and execute
same

6/9/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of Division Order from Amoco and execute same

TOTAL 8.30 | Hours Asset Disposition

Case Administration

3/18/1998 .50 | Office conference with Tony McNamara regarding assets and his
opinions and concerns regarding same

3/26/1998 .50 | Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding her concerns
about records, mineral income, banking accounts and records, etc.

3/26/1998 50 | Office conference with Wanda McGrede; Telephone conference with
Bob Jones;

3/27/1998 1.00 | Office conference with Bob Jones; Office conference with Reggie
Roark; Review of file

3/27/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Wanda McGrede,
interested party, regarding possible secretion of equipment and sales
of equipment

3/31/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of documents delivered by Roark regarding Bob
Jones and George and Wanda McGrede and district court litigation

5/19/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of McGrede and Jones Motion to Extend
Deadlines for Filing Objections to Exemptions

5/20/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of McNamara's Original Complaint Objecting to
Discharge

5/22/1998 20 | Receipt and review of various 1099s and income tax information

provided by Debtor
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6/3/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Order Denying McGrede's Motion 1o Extend
Time for Objections to Discharge

6/9/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Debtor's Objection to Motion of George
McGrede and Bob Jones o Extend Deadlines

7/11/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Roark regarding Bob Jcnes and
George and Wanda McGrede

7/27/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Bob Jones regarding
Debtor’s assets

7/27/1998 .60 | Office conference and settlement negotiations with Bob Bandy
pertaining to exemptions

8/4/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark

8/4/1998 .30 | Telephone conference with Bob Jones regarding equipment sales

8/4/1998 .20 | Telephone conference with Bob Jones, creditor

8/11/1998 .50 | Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding various properties
owned by Debtor o be sold

8/12/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Notice of Violation from City of Longview
pertaining to Gregg Tex Road property

8/13/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of pre-lien nofification from City of Longview
pertaining to Gregg Tex Road property

8/18/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Reggie Roark
regarding City of Longview and Spring Hill property

8/18/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Reggie Roark
regarding code violation at Spring Hill property

8/21/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Reggie Roark
regarding Bob Jones

8/25/1998 .20 | Office conference with Reggie Roark

8/31/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Roark's Objection to Motion of MCN to joinin
the McNamara adversary complaint re: discharge and Bandy's
request that Trustee join in the objection

9/4/1998 10 | Receipt of letter from Roark regarding his possession of exempt items of
personalty currently located on Harrison County property and auction
at same premises

9/14/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Roark regarding Bob Jones

9/14/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of second letter from Roark regarding Bob Jones
and McGrede litigation
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9/23/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of pleadings filed by McGrede regarding
discharge forwarded by Debtor along with Debtor's comments on
same

9/29/1998 .10 | Receipt of letter and enclosures from Roark regarding auction of
equipment

10/1/1998 .10 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark

10/22/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and enclosures from Roark regarding
Adrian Road property, and also regarding Tony McNamara

11/5/1998 .10 | Discussion with Wanda McGrede regarding discharge issue and sale of
Gregg County properties

12/21/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of Agreed Order of Dismissal from Debtor in
connection with the McNamara adversary proceeding

3/23/1999 .10 | Response to Wanda McGrede's inquiry regarding sales proceeds of
Inner Loop / Judson Road property

3/25/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of letter and Quitclaim Deed from attorney for
Avenue Plaza L.L.C. pertaining to time share

4/12/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Reggie Roark to Bob Bandy
regarding taxes owed to State of Texas

411411999 .20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Comptroller's
claim

6/24/1999 .10 | Receipt of Status Request from Bankruptcy Court Clerk

8/18/1999 .10 | Receipt and review of letter from Reggie Roark to Attorney General'’s
office regarding payment of taxes by Trustee

9/23/1999 .20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark

9/29/1999 .20 | Telephone conference with Reggie Roark

11/8/1999 .80 | Office conference with Reggie Roark regarding review of legal claims
of bankruptcy estate to lawsuit filed in District Court against George
McGrede

9/7/2000 1.00 | Input in preparation of Trustee's Final Report and review of same

TOTAL 9.90 | Hours Case Administration

Claims Administration and Objections

5/4/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of information from Roark regarding Johnny Wade,
MCN, Tony McNamara and Bob Jones
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5/13/1998 .10 | Correspondence with Reggie Roark regarding State Comptroller's
priority claim and attorney general's office

5/13/1998 1.50 | Office conference with Reggie Roark; Letter to M. Gazette and State
of Texas

5/14/1998 .30 | Letter to Mike Gazette regarding Mardy Parker's Abstract of Judgment
Liens, Trustee's decision whether or not to administer certain assets in
light of same, and offer to accept $7,500 if Gregg County realty was
administered

512271998 .10 | Letter to John Stern of Attorney General's office regarding prior
correspondence with William Frazell on Comptroller's claim

5/27/1998 .10 | Receipt and review of letter form John Stern, Attorney General's office,
regarding Agreed Order on Texas Comptroller’s claim

5/29/1998 .20 | Receipt and review of acceptance of settlement offer with Mardy
Parker regarding abstract judgment against Gregg County realty

9/15/1998 .10 | Receipt of executed agreement letter from Michae! Gazette
regarding Mardy Parker's agreement to 1/3 of auction proceeds

10/8/1999 .20 | Receive and review of response to claim objection by Manly's and
letter responding to Manly's

TOTAL 2.70 | Hours Claims Administration and Objections

Fee/Employment Applications

9/6/2000 1.00 | Review of Trustee's time and category codes in preparation of
Trustee's Final Report

TOTAL 1.00 | Hours Fee/Employment Applications

Fee/Employment Objections

6/2/1999 30 | Receipt and review of Amended Fee Application of Robert Bandy,
Attorney for Debtor
TOTAL 30 | Hours Fee/Employment Objections

Meetings of Creditors

2/10/1998

50

Initial review of file and pre-conversion schedules and other
information
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3/13/1998 .50 | Review of schedules and file in preparation for first meeting of creditors
3/18/1998 .10 | Letter to Robert Bandy requesting updated schedules and other
information required prior to conducting 341 meeting
3/20/1998 .50 | Conducting First Meeting
4/1/1998 .20 | Letter to interested parties in appearance at first meeting of creditors
notifying of rescheduling of continued first meeting to Tyler rather than
Longview @s previously announced
4/15/1998 .50 | Review of documents and file in preparation for continued 341
meeting, notes in preparation for meeting
4/17/1998 .50 | Conducting continued First Meeting
7/28/1998 .30 | Receipt and review of transcript of first meeting conducted on
4/17/1998 provided by MCN Investments
TOTAL 3.10 | Hours Meetings of Creditors
Tax Issues
4/15/1999 1.50 | Preparation of tax return
6/9/1999 1.00 | Review of various documents and information to determine basis in
assets; Preparation of 1998 tax return
3/16/2000 .50 | Letter to Bob Rogers regarding Estate’s tax return
TOTAL 3.00 | Hours Tax Issues
RECAP
Category Total Time
Asset Analysis and Recovery 20.40
Asset Disposition 8.30
Case Administration 9.90
Claims Administration and Objections 2.70
Fee/Employment Application 1.00
Fee/Employment Objections .30
Meetings of Creditors 3.10
Tax Issues 3.00
Total Trustee Hours 48.70
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Detail of Unreimbursed Expenses

Mileage (@ .35 per mile):

3/25/98
3/26/98
3/27/98

9/25/98

Other Expenses:

Mileage to Hallsville, view property (38 miles)  $ 13.30
Mileage to Hallsville, view inventry/prop. (38 mi)  13.30
Mileage to Marshall, research at County Clerk

(50 miles, + .75 parking) 18.25
Mileage to Hallsville, attend sale (38 miles) 13.30
Total Mileage

Fee for Obtaining Documents/Clerk’s Copy Charges:

3/31/98
4/14/98

8/21/98
9/3/98

11/23/98

3/29/99

1/5/99

Other Advances:
4/29/98
6/10/98
1/26/99

4/29/99

Miscellaneous:
3/25/98

Obtain copies of real estate documents from

Harrison County Clerk $21.00
Copies from Appraisal District 6.00
Copies from Gregg County Clerk 3.00

Grace Document Service, obtain certified

copy of Order #224 regarding sale of

1.934 acres 20.00
Grace Document Service, obtain copy of

Order #241 ($32.50 less $25.00 reimbursed

at closing) 7.50

Grace Document Service, obtain certified

copy of Order #258 21.00

Grace Document Service, obtain certified

copy of Order #236 22.50
Subtotal

Capitol Commerce Reporter (UCC Search) 42.90

Pacer fees, downloading matrix and other

case information 8.40

Pacer fees, various charges incurred during

10/98, 11/98 and 12/98 9.60

Pacer fees, various charges incurred during

1/99, 2/99 and 3/99 3.00
Subtotal

Disposable Camera to photograph inventory 1.57
Subtotal

Total Other Expenses

$ 58.15

$ 101.00

63.90

7.57

$172.47



Records:

Trustee did not take possession of business or personal
records of the debtor.

Notice given debtor on to pick up business
or personal records in hands of Trustee.



Clerical Exhibit

Date Service Time
2/23/1998 Obtain property information and plats from Appraisal District on Gregg 40
County property
2/25/1998 Telephone conference with Jimmy Calk regarding his client’s interest in .30
purchasing Estate’s interest in 50 acre tract and court authorization to
make sale; Memo to Trustee regarding same
3/12/1998 Telephone conference with A.W. McNamara regarding various aspects 20
of case, history of Debtor’s business and other post-petition activity
3/13/1998 Telephone conference with Anthony McNamara regarding Debtor’s 20
current business activity as Superior Restaurant Equipment and
advertising of items for sale; Memo to file and Trustee regarding same
3/24/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding schedules and 20
financial records of Debtor, and regarding royalty interests owned by
Debtor and resulting income from royalties
3/26/1998 Letter to Zack Williams realty 20
3/26/1998 Letter to 14 oil companies regarding revenues payable to Trustee .50
3/26/1998 Telephone conference with Zack Williams realty 10
3/30/1998 Telephone conference with EOTT Energy regarding suspended royalties 10
and releasing same for payment to Estate
3/31/1998 Telephone conference with Gwen Ward and memo to file 20
3/31/1998 Telephone conferences with post office department to obtain better 20
address to send letter to renter Bowman and re-send letter
4/1/1998 Letter to 5 additional producers requesting turnover of future revenues 50
4/1/1998 Telephone conference with Tony McNamara .10
4/1/1998 Telephone conference with Gwendolyn Ward, tenant of house on 10
Boring, regarding payment of rent and other issues with property
4/1/1998 Organization of file information pertaining to Estate’s mineral interests 1.50
and setting up file, segregating information and correspondence into
separate interests; tracking responses and other documentation received
from various operators
4/2/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding royalties, 1099s, .10
ledger sheets kept by Debtor, and other items
4/3/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding oil revenues, and 10

regarding his request for copy of 341 recording




Date Service Time

4/4/1998 Review of file, schedules, and other documents and post assets and other 1.80
case information to management system

4/6/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Boring Street .10
property

4/7/1998 Telephone conference with auctioneer regarding sale .10

4/8/1998 Telephone conference with Bill Watson regarding sale of personalty and .30
expenses of sale; Discussion regarding sale dates and notice

4/13/1998 Discussion with Trustee regarding auction sale of equipment 10

4/13/1998 Telephone conference with Bill Watson, auctioneer, regarding sale .10

4/14/1998 Office conference with Bob Jones 20

4/14/1998 Telephone conference with Bill Watson 20

4/16/1998 Additional work on organizing file and numerous documents 1.00

4/16/1998 Telephone conference with Capital Commerce Reporter to request UCC 20
search under each of Reggie Roark, Anna Roark and dba names

4/20/1998 Letter to Petroleum Systems regarding royalties .20

4/20/1998 Memo to Texaco providing Taxpayer ID # per their request 10

4/21/1998 Telephone conference with Cook Exploration regarding division order 20
for payment to Trustee

4/22/1998 Calculate and calendar objection to exemption deadline .10

4/22/1998 Telephone conference with Linebarger firm, attorney for Gregg County .10
and LISD, and review of file regarding ad valorem taxes

4/24/1998 Telephone conference with Bill Watson 10

4/28/1998 Telephone conference with Gardner’s office regarding documents 10
received by Reggie Roark pertaining to Motion to Extend Deadlines for
discharge

4/28/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede 10

4/30/1998 Set up bank account file; Open bank account; Preparation of deposits (2) .80
and post same; Obtain Federal ID# and provide same to Bank

5/1/1998 Receipt of taxpayer id number and preparation of form W-9 for bank 20

5/1/1998 Letter to Byron Roach forwarding information on royalties 10

5/4/1998 Mailout of Objection to Exemptions per certificate of service 30




Date Service Time

5/5/1998 Telephone conference with Gwen Ward regarding house on Boring and 10
rentals on same

5/6/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark 10

5/6/1998 Office conference with Tom Sweeney and review of file 30

5/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement 20

5/13/1998 Mailout of First Amended Objection to Exemptions per certificate of 30
service

5/18/1998 Telephone conference with Mark White, abstract of judgment lienholder 10
against Gregg County realty

5/18/1998 Telephone conference with Vickie Dillard of Arco Permian regarding 10
royalties

52071998 Telephone conference with Doris Mallory 10

5/22/1998 Telephone conference with Mark White 20

5/29/1998 Telephone conference with Tax Assessor/Collector of Gregg County 20

5/29/1998 Telephone conference with Tax Assessor/Collector of Harrison County 10

5/29/1998 Telephone conference with Scurlock Permian regarding taxpayer ID# 10

6/1/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20

6/1/1998 Telephone conference with C.W. Kendall, holder of judgment 10

6/2/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark .10

6/2/1998 Telephone conference with Julie of Scurlock Permian regarding taxpayer 10
ID#

6/5/1998 Telephone conference with Tom Sweeney regarding receipt of closing .10
statement from Pam Luker at U.S. Title

6/5/1998 Organize files, especially regarding ad valorem taxes and various 2.00
mineral interests; Review and organize numerous documents delivered
by Reggie Roark

6/10/1998 Download matrix via Pacer and revise for label mailout (over 70 parties) .20

6/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement 20

6/11/1998 Follow up with Clerk regarding hearing on Trustee’s objection to 10
exemption

6/26/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20

7/2/1998 Mailout to approximately 100 parties .60




Date Service Time
7/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement 20
7/23/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
7/28/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding hearing on .10
discharge issue
7/28/1998 Mailout of Withdrawal of Objection to Exemption per certificate of 20
service
8/10/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same .20
8/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement 20
8/13/1998 Telephone conference with secured creditor on time share property 20
8/21/1998 Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding royalties 20
8/21/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding current year 10
1099s received by Trustee on Estate’s mineral interests and memo to file
and trustee regarding same
8/25/1998 Update royalty revenue information by operator 20
8/26/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding 1099s on 10
royalties
8/26/1998 Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding royalties 20
8/27/1998 Review of numerous, voluminous ad valorem tax statements; Perform 1.00
calculations on taxes attributable to various realties and minerals
8/28/1998 Telephone conference with Andrea of Bob Bandy’s office regarding .10
McGrede’s objection to discharge
9/2/1998 Download updated matrix via Pacer .10
9/2/1998 Office conference with Wanda McGrede 10
9/3/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede re: equipment in storage 20
9/3/1998 Request to Grace Document Service to provide certified copy of Order 10
Authorizing Sale (#224) pertaining to 1.934 acres, John Jackson Survey,
Gregg County, Texas
9/4/1998 Mailout of Notice of Public Sale to over 100 parties .80
9/4/1998 Preparation of exhibits and matrix for motion to sell Harrison County 1.00
realty and mailout of same to all parties
9/9/1998 Telephone conference with Greg Fraser and with Mr. Boyd regarding 20

Motion to Sell Harrison County property




Date Service Time

9/10/1998 Office conference with Mr. Boyd regarding payoff of lien on Harrison 40
County realty; Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding
business records to be produced

9/10/1998 Telephone conference with Earl Boyd regarding payoff of his lien on 20
Harrison County acreage and memo to file and trustee regarding same

9/10/1998 Telephone conferences with Wanda McGrede regarding records 30
produced by Reggie Roark and memo to file and Trustee

9/10/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding ledger and business 10
records

9/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement 20

9/10/1998 Receipt and review of fax from Reggie Roark regarding exempt .50
personalty from Harrison County location; Telephone conferences with
Reggie Roark regarding same Memo to file and Trustee regarding same

9/10/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding varous issues, 50
including upcoming sale, agreement with Parker and taxing entities,
documents requested by Wanda McGrede, priority claim for restitution,
titles and keys to vehicles, etc.

9/11/1998 Preparation of exhibit and matrix for Amended Motion to Sell and .60
mailout of same

9/15/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Notice of 10
Abandonment

9/15/1998 Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding tax returns .10

9/17/1998 Provide form Notice of Trustee’s Intention to Abandon to Debtor 20

9/17/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Notice of Trustee’s 10
Intention to Abandon

9/18/1998 Telephone conferences (2) with Tracy of J.P. Court .20

9/21/1998 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding Abandonment of 10
J.P. Court litigation

9/21/1998 Office conference with B. Jones regarding J.P. Court litigation 20

9/22/1998 Review schedules and pleadings; Post assets, liens, exemptions and 2.00
memos to reflect current condition of Estate

9/22/1998 Cursory review of matrices in both Roark cases for duplicate creditors .50

9/23/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20




Date Service Time
9/28/1998 Review docket entries via Pacer for information on joint case .30
administration; Discussion with Trustee regarding same; E-mail to Sam
Baker of UST’s office regarding joint administration
9/28/1998 Receipt and review of documents from Roark regarding Trustee’s 10
abandonment of estate’s interest in pending justice court litigation
involving Bob Jones
9/30/1998 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Notice of 10
Abandonment
10/1/1998 Merge, cleanup and alphabetize complete matrices via Pacer for both 3.20
Reggie and Anna Roark case and Anna Roark case, comparing and
deleting duplicate creditors; Telephone conference with Bankruptcy
Clerk regarding Motion to Sell and Amended Motion to Sell on 5.13
Acres, Harrison County
10/2/1998 Revision of matrix for Motion to Sell Harrison County property, .50
preparation of Exhibits, and mailout of Motion to Sell
10/05/1998 Telephone conference with United States Trustee office regarding joint 20
administration and segregation of funds and memo to Trustee regarding
same
10/6/1998 Receipt of check from Bill Watson; Deposit to SAWD escrow and cut .30
checks for one-half of sales proceeds to each of Anna Roark and Reggie
Roark Estates
10/08/1998 Update royalty information with latest revenues 10
10/08/1998 Telephone call from creditor Equipment Service Company regarding .10
status of case
10/08/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
10/12/1998 Reconciliation of bank statement .10
10/15/1998 Review case status; Update Form 1 and Form 2 and confirm balance 20
10/16/1998 Check docket via Pacer; Telephone conference with Tracy of J.P. Court 20
confirming no responses were filed to Notice of Trustee’s Intention to
abandon Estate’s interest in causes of action;
10/20/1998 Preparation of Request for Bar Date and forward to Clerk for filing 20
10/21/1998 Telephone conference with Earl Boyd regarding status of motion to sell 10
10/29/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
10/30/1998 Office conference with Wanda McGrede regarding status of sale of real 20

property and minerals




Date

Service

Time

11/3/1998

Obtain docket sheet via Pacer to confirm / evidence that no objection or
response was filed to Trustee’s Notice of Intention to Abandon Estate’s
Interest in litigation; Fax same to Reggie Roark per his request

.50

11/10/1998

Reconcile bank statement

20

11/10/1998

Provide copy of Trustee’s 10/15/1998 letter addressed to U.S. Title to
Wanda McGrede

10

11/13/1998

Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding Order Authorizing
Sale of Harrison County property

10

11/13/1998

Telephone conference with Terrie of Bob Brewer’s office regarding
Order on Harrison County property; Receipt of certified copy of Order
from Bob Brewer’s office; Memo to Trustee regarding providing copy of
Order to U.S. Title and Mosley Abstract;

.20

11/16/1998

Telephone conference with Pam Luker of U.S. Title regarding Order
Authorizing Sale of 5.1 Acres, Harrison County, and title company’s
requirements on motion and order

20

11/17/1998

Telephone conference with Kathy Hanifan of Bankruptcy Clerk’s office
regarding correction of caption only of Order pertaining to the 5 acres in
Harrison County. Prepare corrected Order and letter to Kathy Hanifan
forwarding same

40

11/20/1998

Receipt of certified copy of corrected Order from Bankruptcy Clerk;
Telephone calls notify Pam Luker of U.S. Title and Bob Brewer of our
receipt of same; Fax certified copy of corrected Order to Haywood
Mosley;

.50

11/20/1998

Telephone conferences with title company tegarding closing on sale of
Harrison County acreage and memo to file regarding closing date,
document preparation and deed

20

11/20/1998

Receipt of certified copy of corrected Order from Bankruptcy Clerk;
Telephone calls notify Pam Luker of U.S. Title and Bob Brewer of our
receipt of same; Fax certified copy of corrected Order to Haywood
Mosley

.50

11/23/1998

Telephone conference with Pam Luker regarding closing; Telephone
conference with Mr. Boyd regarding closing;

20

11/24/1998

Telephone conferences with Pam Luker regarding closing; Hand deliver
document package to U.S. Title for closing;

.50

11/24/1998

Preparation of deposit and post same

20

11/25/1998

Telephone conferences with Reggie Roark and Earl Boyd regarding
closing and other issues;

.30




Date Service Time
11/25/1998 Telephone conference with Pam Luker regarding closing statement and 20
revision of Deed to reflect LLC as purchaser; Revision of closing
statemnent
11/25/1998 Telephone conferences with Pam Luker regarding closing, including .50
change of purchaser and whether or not our motion/order would allow
for that (which it did), and clean up of property and allowance of
deduction at closing for same, and payoff to Earl Boyd; Telephone
conference with Earl Boyd regarding closing
11/30/1998 Telephone conferences and office conferences with Bill Watson, .50
auctioneer, and review of Auctioneer’s Report of Sale;
12/2/1998 Preparation of Report of Sale and attached exhibits .80
12/2/1998 Preparation of Exhibits for attachment to Application for Auctioneer’s .50
Compensation
12/3/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
12/5/1998 Draft of Trustee’s Deed to George McGrede covering D. Sanchez .30
realty, Gregg County, and Gregg County minerals
12/5/1998 Review file for ad valorem tax information; Draft letter for Trustee’s .30
signature requesting current ad valorem tax figures for all Gregg County
taxing entities
12/5/1998 Review file for legal descriptions and other information on the Gregg .50
County Real Property and Mineral Properties that are to be sold to
George McGrede; Memo to Trustee regarding same
12/7/1998 Receipt of request from Reggie Roark for copy of fee application for .20
Auctioneer and exhibits to same and provide same to him
12/7/1998 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
12/10/1998 Reconcile bank statement .20
1/5/1999 Memo to Trustee regarding Motion and Order to sell Gregg County .30
realty and minerals to McGredes and other details of transaction,
including legal description, obtaining title policy, expenses of sale,
closing, and abstract of judgment liens
1/6/1999 Telephone conference with Scott Novy regarding taxes owed on mineral .10
property,
1/8/1999 Receipt of letter from Roark regarding Trustee’s Intention to Abandon 10
Estate’s interest in pending justice court litigation
1/10/1999 Reconcile bank statement .20




Date Service Time
1/13/1999 Review of Order Authorizing Sale, gross sales proceeds, and calculation 50
of payments due to auctioneer, taxing entities and Mardy Parker;
Discussion with Trustee regarding same
1/14/1999 Open checking account; transfer funds and preparation of checks to pay 20
auctioneer, Mardy Parker, and to place ad valorem taxing entities
portion in SAWD escrow until division is agreed upon
1/14/1999 Letter to Mike Gazette, attorney for Mardy Parker, forwarding .50
accounting and check; Letter to attorneys for taxing entities forwarding
accounting and requesting their agreement on allocation
1/15/1999 Review of numerous ad valorem tax statements and calculation of taxes 2.00
due on Gregg County mineral interests, and real estate out of the S.
Sanchez Survey, Gregg County
1/18/1999 Preparation of multiple item (7) deposit and post royalties to royalty .80
receipts log;
1/19/1999 Fax copy of Trustee’s letter to Bill Jennings to Pam Luker at U.S. Title .10
1/19/1999 Telephone conference with Parkway Pawn (Wanda McGrede); 20
Telephone conference with George McGrede, advising they wished to
withdraw on the Gregg County closing and requested refund of earnest
money
1/21/1999 Preparation of refund check payable to George McGrede for earnest 10
money deposit on Gregg County properties;
1/26/1999 Written communication with Byron Roach regarding Gregg County .20
closing; Revision of Trustee’s Deed;
1/28/1999 Receipt and calendar hearing on Bandy’s fee application .10
2/9/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
2/10/1999 Revision of Deed into Byron Roach and preparation of Exhibits for .30
attachment to Deed;
2/12/1999 Receipt and review of file regarding conveyance of Gregg County .30
royalties and minerals to Byron Roach; Discussion with Trustee
regarding recordation of Deed into Byron Roach, regarding division
orders on minerals, and regarding notification to producers of change in
ownership
2/15/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20
2/15/1999 Telephone conference with Donna Blackstone regarding taxes on Gregg 10
County minerals and Sanches realty
2/15/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same 20




Date Service Time
2/25/1999 Calculations on February figures for ad valorem taxes; Preparation of .60
checks for payment of ad valorem taxes on Gregg County minerals and
on real property in Sanchez Survey, to each of Longview ISD, Spring
Hill ISD, and Gregg County (City and Special)
3/4/1999 Letter to R. Byron Roach providing original, recorded Trustee’s Deed 20
covering Sanches Survey real property and Gregg County minerals, and
advising of information on transfer orders for minerals, and payment of
ad valorem taxes
3/5/1999 Receipt and review of Notice of Entry of Interim Order on Robert .10
Bandy’s fee application; Telephone call with Clerk to determine content
of Interim Order (continuing hearing on fee application)
3/19/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20
3/22/1999 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding restitution on 20
Judson Road property;
3/22/1999 Fax copy of Discharge to Pam Luker at U.S. Title; 10
3/23/1999 Telephone conference with Linda George of Crawford & Associates .20
regarding the time share property
3/26/1999 Telephone conference with Wanda McGrede regarding restitution on 10
Judson Road property
3/29/1999 Request copy of Order authorizing sale of undivided interest in 50.33 10
Acres via Grace Document Service
4/8/1999 Fax copy of Notice of Trustee’s Intention to Abandon Estate’s Interest in 10
Case Nos. C-791-98 and C-3994-98, Justice #3, Gregg County, Texas;
4/9/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same .20
4/10/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20
4/14/1999 Revise Deed on 50 1/3 acres and cover letter to James Calk forwarding 20
same;
4/14/1999 Letter to Tom Sweeney regarding original, recorded Trustee’s Deed on 10
1.934 acres, Gregg County, which was returned by Clerk to Trustee
after recording rather than to Tom Sweeney
4/15/1999 Review case status; Update Form 1 and Form 2 and confirm balance .20
4/15/1999 Post interest; Update Form 1 and Form 2; Confirm balance 20
4/15/1999 Compile and provide to Trustee information, data and forms required for .80

preparation of tax return




Date Service Time
4/16/1999 Telephone conference with Calame Linebarger firm regarding 10
distribution of funds held in escrow to the ad valorem taxing entities,
requesting a copy of their 2/19 letter which sets out the agreed division;
4/19/1999 Letter to Longview ISD attorney and Gregg County/City of Longview 20
attorney forwarding prorata division of ad valorem taxes on personalty
4/21/1999 Preparation of Requests for Clerk to Release Claim Files in each case, .30
and letter to Clerk forwarding same;
5/12/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20
5/12/1999 Receipt and review of documents from R. Byron Roach pertaining to 10
transfer of Texlan interest and Trustee’s execution and return of same to
Roach
5/13/1999 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark; Memo to file; .30
5/14/1999 Witness and return Division Order to EOTT Energy after Trustee’s .10
execution
5/14/1999 Telephone conference with George McGrede .10
5/17/1999 Receipt and review of documents on Arkansas minerals faxed by George .10
McGrede
5/19/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same; .20
5/22/1999 Review of asset status and discussion with Trustee regarding 20
6/3/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
6/9/1999 Witness and return Division Order to Amoco after Trustee’s execution .10
6/11/1999 Preparation of Trustee’s disclosure to attach to tax return; Process and .50
mail tax return; Preparation of Request for Prompt Determination Letter
to IRS in connection with 1998 tax return
6/11/1999 Reconcile bank statement .20
6/26/1999 Fax to R. Byron Roach regarding refund of George McGrede’s earnest .20
money on minerals and revision of Trustee’s Deed and legal description
for same
6/28/1999 Telephone and office conference with Reggie Roark regarding tax 20
returns and claim files
7/1/1999 Review of case status and discussion with Trustee in response to Clerk’s 20
request for Final Report
7/6/1999 Telephone conference with EOTT Energy regarding production dates 10

covered by royalty check




Date Service Time
7/08/1999 Reconciliation of bank statement .10
7/13/1999 Telephone conference with Gregg Appraisal District; Review file; Fax 30
title information to Jean Green with Gregg Appraisal District
7/15/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same 20
8/3/1999 Preparation of objections to 17 claims pursuant to Trustee’s instructions, 5.00
and proposed Order for each, including research file on various ad
valorem tax claims and comparison to assets administered and terms to
determine status of ad valorem taxes;
8/4/1999 Post claims to management system; post adjustments based on objections 1.00
to claim anticipated and review of projected distributions;
8/10/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20
8/19/1999 Preparation of deposit and post same .20
8/24/1999 Update case status information; Memo to file that no tax return required .50
in Estate of Anna Roark; Memo to Trustee regarding telephone response
from Gregg Co. Probation Department’s claim to our objection to same;
Memo to file regarding Gregg Co. Probation’s claim;
8/27/1999 Lengthy telephone conference with Lee Gordon, attorney for Gregg 20
County and other taxing entities regarding Trustee’s objections to
various proofs of claim; Review of file for various assets administered
and not administered and identify same for Lee Gordon based on their
property descriptions
9/2/1999 Telephone conference with A.W. McNamara regarding Trustee’s 30
objection to MCN Investment’s proof of claim; Review of docket via
Pacer regarding Manly’s response to claim and calendar hearing on
same; Telephone conference with Clerk and request for copy of Manly’s
response;
9/7/1999 Telephone conference with Tony McNamara re: Trustee’s objection to 10
proof of claim;
9/8/1999 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding MCN’s proof of 10
claim
9/10/1999 Reconcile bank statement .20
9/15/1999 Telephone conference with Clerk regarding withdrawal of objection to .20
Claim #34 and fax same to Clerk
10/5/1999 Telephone conference with Bob Bandy’s office regarding order on 10
Bandy’s fee application and status of case
10/11/1999 Reconcile bank statement .20




Date Service Time

10/15/1999 Update Form 1 and Form 2; Confirm balance 20

11/8/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20

12/5/1999 Review file for legal descriptions and other information on the Gregg .50
County Real Property and Mineral Properties that are to be sold to
George McGrede; Memo to Trustee regarding same;

12/5/1999 Draft of Trustee’s Deed to George McGrede covering D. Sanchez .30
realty, Gregg County, and Gregg County minerals;

12/5/1999 Review file for ad valorem tax information; Draft letter for Trustee’s .30
signature requesting current ad valorem tax figures for all Gregg County
taxing entities;

12/5/1999 Request copy of Order Authorizing Sale of Assets to George McGrede 10
(Gregg County realty and minerals);

12/10/1999 Reconcile bank statement 20

12/30/1999 Telephone conference with Bankruptcy Clerk to obtain bankruptcy case 20
information on Blakley in preparation for hearing on Trustee’s Objection
to POC #34 filed by MCN;

1/10/2000 Reconcile bank statement 20

2/10/2000 Reconcile bank statement 10

2/17/2000 Preparation of exhibit for attorney’s fee application, preparation of detail 8.00
of Trustee’s time and services and preparation of clerical exhibit of time
and services

3/7/2000 Review file and gather information and form required for 1999 tax .50
return; Memo to file and Trustee regarding same

3/10/2000 Reconcile bank statement 10

3/16/2000 Prepare check to Robert Bandy in payment of attorney fees in .10
accordance with Court order

3/16/2000 Preparation of Application to Employ Robert Rogers, Declaration and .50
proposed Order for Trustee’s review and signature

3/16/2000 Review file and compile information required by Bob Rogers, 30
accountant, for 1999 tax return

3/23/2000 Deliver tax return information to Bob Rogers, allow him to review .20
schedules and execute Affidavit

3/24/2000 Telephone conference with Reggie Roark regarding status of cases and 10

payment to Comptroller




Date

Service

Time

9/1/2000

Preparation of Trustee’s Fee Application consisting of itemization of all
Trustee’s time by category for inclusion in Final Report

2.00

9/1/2000

Preparation of Exhibit in support of Clerical and Stenographic

2.00

9/5/2000

Preparation of check for payment of accountant’s fee; Initial work on
Final Report and Proposed Distribution and attached schedules,
including revision of Trustee’s time exhibit; revision of clerical and
stenographic exhibit; posting of claimant entries for disbursements made
during pendency of the case; posting expenses

3.00

9/6/2000

Finalize Final Report and Proposed Distribution and attached schedules
and exhibits, including: post final interest to money market account and
transfer to deposit account; update property record and cash receipts and
disbursements and confirm balance; calculation of Trustee's
compensation and post same; preparation of Order approving proposed
distribution; letter for Trustee's signature to United States Trustee

3.00

Anticipated time in preparation of checks for final distribution;
transmittal letter to payees; monitoring file for all checks to clear;
possible calculation of redistribution and motion to redistribute and
possible preparation of motion to deposit unclaimed funds in registry of
the court; preparation of final report and report of distribution;
preparation of itemization of distributions; letter for Trustee's signature
to United States Trustee; monitor file for payment of fee and archive file
after closing.

2.00

Total

96.40

Total of 96.40 Hours @ $45.00 per Hour = $ 4,338.00




SCHEDULE C
EXPENSES OF ADMINISTRATION

(1) (2) (3) (4)

Amount Amount Previously
Claimed Allowed Paid Due
1. 11 U.S.C. Sec. 507(a) (1)
Court Costs and Fees S 0.00 $ 0.00 $ 0.00 S 0.00
2. 11 U.S.C Sec. 503(b) (1) (a)
Preservation of Estate
A. Transportation 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
B. Storage 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
C. Wages 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
D. Estates share FICA 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
E. Insurance 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
F. Upkeep 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
G. Other (itemize) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3. 11 U.S.C. Sec. 503(b)(2)
Post-Petition taxes and
related penalties 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4. 11 U.S.C. Sec. 503(b) (2)
Compensation and
Reimbursement
A. Compensation of Trustee 7,931.99 7,931.99 0.00 7,931.99
B. Expenses of Trustee 5,155.23 5,155.23 0.00 5,155.23
C. Compensation of
Attorney to Trustee 13,740.00 13,740.00 13,740.00 0.00
D. Expenses of Attorney
to Trustee 2,338.48 2,338.48 2,338.48 0.00
E. Compensation of
Trustee's Accountant 185.75 185.75 185.75 0.00
F. Compensation of
Auctioneer 256.43 256.43 256.43 0.00
G. Expenses of Auctioneer 392.73 392.73 392.73 . 0.00
H. Compensation of
Debtor's Attorney (Ch 13) 31,414.75 16,627.79 16,627.79 0.00
5. Court Special Charges
(Excess Notices) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6. U.S. Trustee fees 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7. Other (itemize) 21,377.34 3,500.00 0.00 3,500.00

(MCN Investments,
Agreed Order #363)

Totals: $82,792.70 $50,128.40 $33,541.18 $16,587.22



SCHEDULE D

SECURED CLAIMS
Claim Amount Amount Not Amount Previously

No. Claimed Determined Allowed Paid Due
2 4,035.18 4,035.18 0.00 0.00 0.00
8 9,235.02 9,235.02 0.00 0.00 0.00
9 19,615.60 19,615.60 0.00 0.00 0.00
10 83,675.35 83,675.35 0.00 0.00 0.00
11 275.52 275.52 0.00 0.00 0.00
14 10,670.92 10,670.92 0.00 0.00 0.00
15 83,675.35 83,675.35 0.00 0.00 0.00
16 14,832.07 14,832.07 0.00 0.00 0.00
19 108,052.00 108,052.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
20 44.78 44.78 0.00 0.00 0.00
21 11,500.00 11,500.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
24 11,178.92 11,178.92 0.00 0.00 0.00
25 11,500.00 11,500.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
26 10,173.15 10,173.15 0.00 0.00 0.00
27 3,647.02 3,647.02 0.00 0.00 0.00
28 13,385.60 13,385.60 0.00 0.00 0.00
SEC 19,560.82 0.00 19,560.82 19,560.82 0.00
415.057.30 395.496.48 19,560.82 19,560.82 0.00

IDENTIFICATION OF SECURED PARTIES AFFECTED:

Claim Claim
No. Name of Creditor No. Name of Creditor
2 Charlene M. Tutt 25 MCN Investments, Inc.
8 Gregg County, et al 26 Longview ISD
9 Longview ISD 27 Longview ISD
10 Betty Lewis 28 Hibernia National Bank
11 Springhill ISD SEC Various Secured Claims Paid
14 Springhill ISD During Pendency )
15 Betty Lewis
16 Gregg County, et al
19 Mardy Parker
20 City of Longview
21 MCN Investments, Inc.

24 Longview ISD, et al



SCHEDULE E

PRIORITY CLAIMS OTHER THAN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES IN THE

FOLLOWING ORDER OF PRIORITY

(D) () (3) 4
Amount Amount Amount
Claimed Allowed Paid Due

1. For Credit extended

Sec. 364(e)(1) $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2. Claims for failure of "adequate

protection”

Sec. 307(a)(b) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3. "Gap Claims" |

Sec. 507(a)(2) 0.00 0.00 0.00 "0.00
4. Wages, etc.

Sec. 507(a)(3) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5. Contributions to benefit plans

Sec. 507(a)(4) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6. Consumer deposits :

Sec. 507(a)(6) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7.  Alimony

Sec. 507(a)(7) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8. Taxes

Sec. 507(a)(8) 51,519.99 36,215.99 0.00 36,215.99
9. Depository Institutions

Sec. 507(a)(9) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
10. Other: No Basis 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Totals: 51,519.99 36,215.99 0.00 36,215.99
PARTIES AFFECTED:
Claim Claim
No. Name of Creditor No. Name of Creditor

1 Office of the Attorney General 18 L.R.S. Special Procedures -

13 Internal Revenue Service



FILED UNSECURED CLAIMS TOTAL: $ 78.668.58

SUBORDINATED UNSECURED CLAIMS: $ 0.00




Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM

Case: 96-60060

Claim Date
Number Filed

ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claim
Type

Claims Register

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Claimant Name /
(Category, Priority)

Amount
Filed

Page: 1

Amount
Allowed

1 01/29/96

Priority

Claim Memo:

Office of the Attorney General
Collection Div.-Bankruptcy Sec
P. O. Box 12548

Austin, TX 78711-2548

(PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS, 560)

$36,215.99

$36,215.99

Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured PRIORITY claim per Order #296 EOD 9/20/99

2 02/13/96

Secured

Claim Memo:

Charlene M. Tutt
cl/o Jason R. Searcy
P. O. Box 3929
Longview, TX 75605

(SECURED, 100)

Disallowed per Order #298 EOD 9/20/99

$4,035.18 «

$0.00

3 02/21/96

Unsecured

Harry Fox
DBA/American Star
Rt. 2 Box 480
Gilmer, TX 75644

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

4 02/23/96

Unsecured

Midwest Folding Products
1414 South Western Ave.
Chicago, IL 60608

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$5,286.97

$5,286.97

5 03/04/96

Unsecured

Capital One, an Affiliate of Signet
Bank/Virginia

P. O. Box 85167

Richmond, VA 23285

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$2,603.97

$2,603.97

6 03/11/96

Unsecured

Bonnie Griffin

c/o Mark Strachan
P. 0. Box 3343
Longview, TX 75606

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$2,754.00

$2,754.00

7 03/07/96

Admin Ch. 11

Claim Memo:

Don E. Williams
P. 0. Box 10089
Longview, TX 75608

(FEES-DEBTOR'S ATTY (CH11), 300)

Disallowed per Order #317 EOD 9/20/99

$3,240.00+

$0.00

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM

Claims Register
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claim Date Claim
Number Filed Type

Claimant Name /
{(Category, Priority)

8 03/21/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Gregg County, et al
c/o Craig F. Young
P. O. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

(SECURED, 100)

Amended by #16.

Amount
Filed

Page: 2

Amount
Allowed

$9,235.02

$0.00

9 03/27/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Longview ISD
¢/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755

(SECURED, 100)

Amended by #24.

$19,615.60

$0.00

10 03/28/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Betty Lewis

¢/o Jerry S. Harris

P. O. Box 2072

Longview, TX 75606-2072

(SECURED, 100)

Duplicated by #15.
Disallowed by Order #297 EOD 9/20/99

$83,675.35*

$0.00

11 03/22/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Springhill 1ISD
¢/o Craig Young
PO Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

(SECURED, 100)

Amended by #14,

$275.52

$0.00

12 04/11/96 Unsecured

Southwestern Bell Yellow Pages, Inc.
1430 Empire Central, 4th Floor
Dallas, TX 75247

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$3,926.04

$3,926.04

13 04/05/96 Priority

Claim Memo:

Internal Revenue Service

1100 Commerce St., Rm. 9A20
Stop 5024 DAL

Dallas, TX 75242

(PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS, 560)

Amended by #18

$11,478.00

$0.00

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM

Case: 96-60060

Claim
Number

Date Claim
Filed Type

Claims Register

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claimant Name / Amount
{Category, Priority) Filed

Page: 3

Amount
Allowed

14

04/25/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Springhill ISD $10,670.92
c/o Craig Young

PO Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

(SECURED, 100)

Amends #11.
Claim withdrawn 8/30/99 and disallowed per Order #307 EOD 9/20/99

$0.00

156

04/02/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Betty Lewis $83,675.35
cl/o Jerry S. Harris

P. O. Box 2072

Longview, TX 75606-2072

(SECURED, 100)

Exact duplicate of #10 which was disallowed.

$0.00

16

04/26/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Gregg County, et al $14,832.07+
c/o Craig F. Young

P. O. Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

(SECURED, 100)

Amendment of #8.
Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #306 EOD 9/20/99.

$0.00

17

05/09/96 Unsecured

Carrier Bock Co. $1,351.00
P. O. Box 88147
Dallas, TX 75888

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

$1,351.00

18

05/15/96  Priority

Claim Memo:

I.R.S. Special Procedures $3,826.00
(PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS, 560)

Amendment of 13. Claim withdrawn 6/20/96. See Legal #65.

$0.00

19

05/21/96 Secured

Claim Memo:

Mardy Parker $108,052.00+
c¢/o Michael E. Gazette

1000 First Place

Tyler, TX 75702

(SECURED, 100)

Disallowed per Order #305 EQD 9/20/99.

$0.00

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM Claims Register Page: 4
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Claim Date Claim Claimant Name / Amount Amount
Number Filed Type (Category, Priority) Filed Allowed
20 11/15/96 Secured City of Longview $44.78+ $0.00
c/o Craig Young
P.O. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760
(SECURED, 100)
Claim Memo:  Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #304 EOD 9/20/99.
21 07/14/97 Secured MCN Investments, Inc. $11,500.00 $0.00
P. O. Box 7207
Longview, TX 75607-7207
(SECURED, 100)
Claim Memo:  Amended by #25.
22 08/07/97 Unsecured  Bob Jones $500.00+ $500.00
P. O. Box 973
Big Sandy, TX 75755
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
Claim Memo:  Allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #303 EOD 9/20/99.
23 09/24/97 Unsecured  George McGrede $20,000.00 $20,000.00
618 Omega Drive
Longview, TX 75601
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
24 10/08/97 Secured Longview ISD, et al $11,178.92 $0.00
c/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755
(SECURED, 100)
Claim Memo:  Amendment of #9.
Amended by #26.
25 11/25/97 Secured MCN Investments, Inc. $11,500.00 $0.00

Claim Memo:

P. 0. Box 7207

Longview, TX 75607-7207
(SECURED, 100)

Amendment of #21.
Amended by Claim #34.

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM

Case: 96-60060

Claim
Number

Date Claim
Filed Type

Claims Register Page: 5

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claimant Name / Amount "~ Amount
(Category, Priority) Filed Allowed

26

02/13/98 Secured

Claim Memo:

Longview ISD $10,173.15+ $0.00
c/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755

(SECURED, 100)

Amendment of #24.
Disallowed per Order #302 EOD 9/20/99

27

02/13/98 Secured

Claim Memo:

Longview ISD $3,647.02+ $0.00
¢/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755

(SECURED, 100)

Disallowed per Order #301 EOD 9/20/99

28

04/06/98 Secured

Claim Memo:

Hibernia National Bank $13,385.60* $0.00
Bankruptcy Division

PO Box 481

Baton Rouge, LA 70821

(SECURED, 100)

Disallowed per Order #300 EOD 9/20/99

29

10/30/98 Unsecured

Claim Memo:

Yong Lee $2,000.00+ $2,000.00
1605 South Austin
Dennison, TX 75020

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

Disallowed as priority, allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order #299 EOD 9/20/99.

30

11/13/98 Unsecured

Claim Memo:

Myla Mayberry $702.46 $702.46
3400 W. Marshall #307
Longview, TX 75606

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

Note: Claim has Anna's case #96-62676 on it, appears that Clerk changed the number to the
Reggie & Anna case.

3

12/09/98 Unsecured

Max Recovery Trust Successor to $4,981.52 $4,981.52
American Express Travel

PO box 10228

Newark, NJ 07193

(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM Claims Register Page: 6
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Claim Date Claim Claimant Name / Amount Amount
Number Filed Type (Category, Priority) Filed Allowed
32 12/09/98 Unsecured Reggie Roark $3,850.00 * $3,850.00
PO Box 8
Judson, TX 75660
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
Claim Memo:  Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #316 EOD 9/20/99
33 12/22/98 Unsecured  Gregg Co. CSCD $9,712.62+ $9,712.62
Attn: Quin Tillery
P. O. Box 3226
Longview, TX 75606
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
Claim Memo:  Disallowed as priority claim, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #315 EOD
9/20/99
34A 01/19/99 Admin Ch. MCN Investments, Inc. $21,377.34+ $3,500.00
P. 0. Box 7207
Longview, TX 75607-7207
(MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES (CH 7), 200)
Claim Memo:  Agreed Order #363 1/21/00
"Priority" portion of Claim #34. See 34B for unsecured, non-priority portion.
34B 01/26/98 Unsecured  MCN $0.00+ $8,000.00
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
Claim Memo:  Agreed Order #363 EOD 1/21/00.
This is "unsecured" portion. See 34A for administrative portion.
35 01/19/99 Unsecured Reggie Roark $11,000.00 * $11,000.00
P. O.Box 8
Judson, TX 75660
(UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS, 610)
Claim Memo:  Disallowed as secured; allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order #314 EQD 9/20/99.
SEC 01/26/98 Secured Various Secured Claims Paid During Pendency $19,560.82 $19,560.82

Claim Memo:

(SECURED, 100)

Various Secured Creditors paid during pendency of case pursuant to Court's Order:

#103 Mardy Parker - $659.78
#104 SAWD as Escrow for taxing authorities - $659.78
Per Notice of Proposed Public Sale filed 9/9/08

#105 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on minerals - $3,233.44
#106 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on realty, - $4,583.26

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:47 AM Claims Register Page: 7
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Claim Date Claim Claimant Name / Amount Amount
Number Filed Type (Category, Priority) Filed Allowed
#107 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on realty - $4,755.19
#108 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on minerals - $5,669.15
#109 Longview ISD, taxes on minerals - $0.22
Per Order #236 EOD 10/8/98
AUC-E 12/31/98 Admin Ch. 7 Bill Watson, Auctioneer $392.73 $392.73
(EXP.-AUCTIONEER (CH 7), 200)
Claim Memo:  Order #246 EOD 12/31/98
AUC-F 12/31/98 Admin Ch. 7 Bill Watson, Auctioneer $256.43 $256.43
(FEES-AUCTIONEER (CH 7), 200)
Claim Memo:  Order #246 EOD 12/31/98
ACCT-F 07/06/00 Admin Ch. 7 Robert G. Rogers, CPA $185.75 $185.75
(FEES-TRUSTEE'S ACCTANT-NON FIRM (CH7), 200)
Claim Memo: Order #379 EOD 8/15/2000
ATTY-E 03/29/00 Admin Ch. 7 Bob Anderson, Attorney $2,338.48 $2,338.48
(EXP.-TRUSTEE'S ATTY-FIRM (CH7), 200)
Claim Memo:  Order #370 EOD 3/29/00
ATTY-F 03/29/00 Admin Ch. 7 Bob Anderson, Attorney $13,740.00 $13,740.00
(FEES-TRUSTEE'S ATTY-FIRM (CH 7), 200)
Claim Memo:  Order #370 EOD 3/29/00. ,
TTEE-E 01/26/98 Admin Ch. 7 Bob Anderson $5,155.23 $5,155.23
Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604
(EXP.-TRUSTEE (CH7), 200)
TTEE-F 01/26/98 AdminCh. 7 Bob Anderson $7,931.99 $7,931.99

Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604

(FEES-TRUSTEE (CH7), 200)

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed
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Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claim Date Claim Claimant Name / Amount Amount
Number Filed Type (Category, Priority) Filed Allowed
D-ATTY-F 09/29/99 Admin Ch. 11 Robert M. Bandy, P.C. $28,174.75 $16,627.79

(FEES-DEBTOR'S ATTY (CH11), 300)

Claim Memo:  Order #341 EOD 9/29/99 for total of $16,807.00 for fees and $3,577.32 for expenses, for a total
of $20,384.32. Debtors previously paid $3,756.53, leaving a balance of $16,627.79 to be paid
as a Chapter 13 Administrative Expense.

Paid by Trustee's Check #102 on 3/16/00.

Case Total: $628,038.57 $192,573.79

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER  Claims Bar Date: January 19, 1999

Case Number: 96-60060 Page: 1 Date: September 6, 2000

Debtor Name: ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE Time: 12:54:45 PM

Claim# Creditor Name & Address Claim Type Claim Ref. No. / Notes Amount Allowed Paid to Date Claim Balance

34A MCN Investments, Inc. Admin Ch. 7 $3,500.00 $0.00 3,500.00
200 P.O. Box 7207 Agreed Order #363 1/21/00

Longview, TX 75607-7207 "Priority" portion of Claim #34. See 34B for unsecured, non-priority portion.

AUC-E Bill Watson, Auctioneer Admin Ch. 7 $392.73 $392.73 0.00
200 Order #246 EOD 12/31/98

AUC-F Bill Watson, Auctioneer Admin Ch. 7 $256.43 $256.43 - 0.00
200 Order #246 EOD 12/31/98

ACCT-F  Robert G. Rogers, CPA Admin Ch. 7 $185.75 $185.75 0.00
200 Order #379 EOD 8/15/2000

ATTY-E  Bob Anderson, Attorney Admin Ch. 7 $2,338.48 $2,338.48 0.00
200 Order #370 EOD 3/29/00

ATTY-F  Bob Anderson, Attorney AdminCh. 7 9449 $13,740.00 $13,740.00 0.00
200 Order #370 EOD 3/29/00.

TTEE-E  Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 $5,155.23 $0.00 - 5,155.23

200 Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604

TTEE-F Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 $7,931.99 $0.00 7,931.99
200 Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604

7 Don E. Williams Admin Ch. 11 $0.00 $0.00 - 0.00
300 P.0.Box 10089 Disallowed per Order #317 EQD 9/20/99 v
Longview, TX 75608 .
D-ATTY-F Robert M. Bandy, P.C. Admin Ch. 11 $16,627.79 $16,627.79 0.00
300 Order #341 EOD 9/29/99 for tota! of $16,807.00 for fees and $3,577.32 for expenses,

for a total of $20,384.32. Debtors previously paid $3,756.53, leaving a balance of
$16,627.79 to be paid as a Chapter 13 Administrative Expense.
Paid by Trustee's Check #102 on 3/16/00.

1 Office of the Attorney General Priority $36,215.99 $0.00 36,215.99
560 Collection Div.-Bankruptcy Sec Disallowed as secured, aliowed as unsecured PRIORITY claim per Order #296 EOD
P. 0. Box 12548 9120199 h

Austin, TX 78711-2548

13 Internal Revenue Service Priority $0.00 $0.00 0.00
560 1100 Commerce St., Rm. 9A20 Amended by #18
Stop 5024 DAL
Dallas, TX 75242
18 I.R.S. Special Procedures Priority $0.00 $0.00 0.00
560 Amendment of 13. Claim withdrawn 6/20/96. See Legal #65.
2 Charlene M. Tutt Secured $0.00 $0.00 0.00
100 cl/o Jason R. Searcy Disallowed per Order #298 EQOD 9/20/99
P. O. Box 3929

Longview, TX 75605




ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER

EXHIBIT A

Claims Bar Date: Januar;f 19, 1999

Case Number: 96-60060
Debtor Name: ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Page: 2

Date: Septerhber 6, 2000
Time: 12:54:45 PM

Claim #

Creditor Name & Address

Claim Type Claim Ref. No. / Notes Amount Allowed

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

8

100

Gregg County, et al
c/o Craig F. Young
P. O. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

Secured $0.00

Amended by #16.

$0.00

0.00

100

Longview ISD

¢/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755

Secured $0.00

Amended by #24.

$0.00

0.00

10

100

Betty Lewis

¢/o Jerry S. Harris

P. 0. Box 2072

Longview, TX 75606-2072

Secured $0.00
Duplicated by #15.

Disallowed by Order #297 EOD 9/20/99

$0.00

0.00

11

100

Springhill ISD
¢/o Craig Young
PO Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

Secured $0.00

Amended by #14.

$0.00

0.00

14

100

Springhill ISD
¢/o Craig Young
PO Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

Secured $0.00

Amends #11.

$0.00

Claim withdrawn 8/30/99 and disallowed per Order #307 EOD 9/20/99

0.00

15

100

Betty Lewis

¢/o Jerry S. Harris

P. O. Box 2072

Longview, TX 75606-2072

$0.00
Exact duplicate of #10 which was disallowed.

Secured

$0.00

0.00

16

100

Gregg County, et al
¢/o Craig F. Young
P. 0. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

Secured $0.00

Amendment of #8.

$0.00

Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #306 EOD 9/20/99.

:

0.00

19

100

Mardy Parker

¢/o Michael E. Gazette
1000 First Place

Tyler, TX 75702

Secured $0.00

Disallowed per Order #305 EOD 9/20/99.

$0.00 -

0.00

20

100

City of Longview
¢/o Craig Young

P. O. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

Secured $0.00

$0.00

Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #304 EOD 9/20/99.

0.00

21

100

MCN Investments, Inc.
P. O. Box 7207

Longview, TX 75607-7207

Secured $0.00

Amended by #25.

$0.00

0.00

24

100

Longview ISD, et al
c/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755

Secured $0.00
Amendment of #9.

Amended by #26.

$0.00

0.00




EXHIBIT A

ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER  Claims Bar Date: January 19, 1999

Case Number: 96-60060 Page: 3 Date: September 6, 2000
Debtor Name: ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE Time: 12:54:46 PM
Claim# Creditor Name & Address Claim Type Claim Ref. No. / Notes Amount Allowed Paid to Date Claim Balance
25 MCN Investments, Inc. Secured $0.00 $0.00 0.00
100 P. O. Box 7207 Amendment of #21.
Longview, TX 75607-7207 Amended by Claim #34.
26 Longview I1ISD Secured $0.00 $0.00 0.00
100 ¢/o Michael Reed Amendment of #24.
P. O. Box 26990 Disallowed per Order #302 EOD 9/20/99
Austin, TX 78755
27 Longview ISD Secured $0.00 $0.00 0.00
100 c/o Michael Reed Disallowed per Order #301 EOD 9/20/99
P. O. Box 26930
Austin, TX 78755
28 Hibemia National Bank Secured $0.00 $0.00 0.00
100 Bankruptcy Division Disallowed per Order #300 EOD 9/20/99
PO Box 481
Baton Rouge, LA 70821
SEC Various Secured Claims Paid During Secured $19,560.82 $19,560.82 0.00
100 Pendency Various Secured Creditors paid during pendency of case pursuant to Court's Order:
#103 Mardy Parker - $659.78
#104 SAWD as Escrow for taxing authorities - $659.78
Per Notice of Proposed Public Sale filed 9/9/98
#1065 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on minerals - $3,233.44
#106 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on realty, - $4,583.26
#107 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on realty - $4,755.19
#108 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on minerals - $5,669.15
#1009 Longview ISD, taxes on minerals - $0.22
Per Order #236 EOD 10/8/98
3 Harry Fox Unsecured $10,000.00 $0.00 10,000.00
610 DBA/American Star
Rt. 2 Box 480 .
Gilmer, TX 75644
4 Midwest Folding Products Unsecured $5,286.97 $0.00 5,286.97
610 1414 South Western Ave.
Chicago, IL 60608
5 Capital One, an Affiliate of Signet Unsecured $2,603.97 $0.00 2,603.97
610 Bank/Virginia
P. O. Box 85167
Richmond, VA 23285
6 Bonnie Griffin Unsecured $2,754.00 $0.00 - 2,754.00
610 c/o Mark Strachan .
P. 0. Box 3343

Longview, TX 75606




EXHIBIT A

ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER  Claims Bar Date: January 19, 1999

Case Number: 96-60060
Debtor Name: ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Date: September 6, 2000
Time: 12:54:46 PM

Page: 4

Claim# Creditor Name & Address Claim Type Claim Ref. No. / Notes Amount Allowed Paid to Date - Claim Balance
12 Southwestern Bell Yellow Pages, Inc. Unsecured $3,926.04 $0.00 3,926.04
610 1430 Empire Central, 4th Floor
Dallas, TX 75247
17 Carrier Bock Co. Unsecured $1,351.00 $0.00 1,351.00
610 P. O. Box 88147
Dallas, TX 75888
22 Bob Jones Unsecured $500.00 $0.00 500.00
610 P.O.Box 973 Allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #303 EQD 9/20/99.
Big Sandy, TX 75755 .
23 George McGrede Unsecured $20,000.00 $0.00 20,000.00
610 618 Omega Drive
Longview, TX 75601
29 Yong Lee Unsecured $2,000.00 $0.00 2,000.00
610 1605 South Austin Disallowed as priority, allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order 299 EOD
Dennison, TX 75020 9/20/99.
30 Myla Mayberry Unsecured $702.46 $0.00 702.46
610 3400 W. Marshall #307 Note: Claim has Anna's case #96-62676 on it, appears that Clerk chénged the
Longview, TX 75606 number to the Reggie & Anna case.
31 Max Recovery Trust Successor to Unsecured $4,981.52 $0.00 4,981.52
610 American Express Travel
PO box 10228
Newark, NJ 07193
32 Reggie Roark Unsecured $3,850.00 $0.00 3,850.00
610 PO Box 8 Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #316
Judson, TX 75660 EOD 9/20/99
33 Gregg Co. CSCD Unsecured $9,712.62 $0.00 9,712.62
610 Attn: Quin Tillery Disallowed as priority claim, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #315
P. O. Box 3226 EOD 9/20/99 4
Longview, TX 75606 '
34B MCN Unsecured $8,000.00 $0.00 - 8,000.00
610 Agreed Order #363 EOD 1/21/00. )
This is "unsecured" portion. See 34A for administrative portion.
35 Reggie Roark Unsecured $11,000.00 $0.00 '_ 11,000.00
610 P.0O.Box 8 Disallowed as secured; allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order #314 EOD
Judson, TX 75660 9/20/99.
<< Totals >>

192,573.79 53,102.00 . 139,471.79




IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: § CASE NO. 96-60060

$ CHAPTER 7
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Jointly Administered Under

§ Case No. 96-60060)
DEBTORS §

TRUSTEE'S REPORT OF PROPOSED FINAL DISTRIBUTIONS

The undersigned Trustee of the estate hereby submits to the Court and to the United States Trustee
this Report of Proposed Final Distributions.

1. The Court has entered orders which have become final, and which dispose of all objections to
claims, all objections to the Trustee's Final Report, all applications for compensation, and all other
matters which must be determined by the Court before final distribution can be made.

2. The Trustee proposes to make final distribution of the funds of the estate as follows, and will make
such distribution unless written objection thereto is made, filed and served on the Trustee and on the
United States Trustee.

1. BALANCE ON HAND $  21,863.22
2. ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES $  16,587.22
TO BE PAID * (NOTE)
3. SECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID 0.00
* (NOTE)
4. PRIORITY CLAIMS TO BE PAID 5,276.00
* (NOTE)
5. UNSECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID 0.00
* (NOTE)
6. OTHER DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE 0.00

PAID * (NOTE)



7. TOTAL DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE $ 21,863.22
(SUM OF LINES 2 THROUGH 6)

8. ZERO BALANCE AFTER ALL DISTRIBUTIONS -0-
(LINE 1 LESS LINE 7)

* (SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE OF PAYEES AND AMOUNTS)

Date: 4.0 co /%/7/ z/ /L./-

Bob ,/Anderson, Trustee



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM Claims Distribution Register

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Amount Amount
Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed

Paid
to Date

Claim
Balance

Page: 1

Proposed
Payment

Claim Type: Secured

Priority: 100 Percent Paid: 100.00000

2 02/13/96 Charlene M. Tutt 4,035.18 0.00
¢/o Jason R. Searcy
P. O. Box 3929
Longview, TX 75605
Category:  SECURED
Memo: Disallowed per Order #298 EOD 9/20/99

8 03/21/96 Gregg County, et al 9,235.02 0.00
c/o Craig F. Young
P.O. Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760
amended
Category: SECURED
Memo: Amended by #16.

9 03/27/96 Longview ISD 19,615.60 0.00
¢/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755
amended
Category: SECURED
Memo: Amended by #24.

10 03/28/96 Betty Lewis 83,675.35 0.00
c/o Jerry S. Harris
P. 0. Box 2072
Longview, TX 75606-2072
Category:  SECURED
Memo: Duplicated by #15.
Disallowed by Order #297 EOD 9/20/99

11 03/22/96 Springhill ISD 275.52 0.00
c/o Craig Young
PO Box 17428
Austin, TX 78760

amended
Category:  SECURED
Memo: Amended by #14,

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM

Claims Distribution Register

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claim #

Date

Amount Amount

Paid

Claimant Filed Allowed to Date

Claim
Balance

Page: 2

Proposed
Payment

14

15

16

19

20

21

04/25/96

04/02/96

04/26/96

05/21/06

11/15/96

07/14/97

Springhill ISD 10,670.92 0.00
c/o Craig Young *
PO Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

Category:  SECURED

Memo: Amends #11.

Claim withdrawn 8/30/99 and disallowed per Order #307 EOD 9/20/99

Betty Lewis 83,675.35 0.00
c/o Jerry S. Harris

P. O. Box 2072

Longview, TX 75606-2072

duplicate

Category: SECURED

Memo: Exact duplicate of #10 which was disallowed.

Gregg County, et al 14,832.07 0.00
c/o Craig F. Young

P. O. Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

Category: SECURED

Memo: Amendment of #8.

Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #306 EOD 9/20/99.

Mardy Parker 108,052.00 0.00
c/o Michael E. Gazette *
1000 First Place

Tyler, TX 75702

Category: SECURED

Memo: Disallowed per Order #305 EOD 9/20/99.

City of Longview 44.78 0.00
¢/o Craig Young *

P. O. Box 17428

Austin, TX 78760

Category: SECURED

Memo: Withdrawn 8/30/99; disallowed per Order #304 EOD 9/20/99.

MCN Investments, Inc. 11,500.00 0.00
P. 0. Box 7207

Longview, TX 75607-7207

amended

Category: SECURED

Memo: Amended by #25.

(") Denotes objection to Amount Filed

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Claims Distribution Register

Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Claim #

Date

Amount
Claimant Filed

Amount
Allowed

Paid
to Date

Claim
Balance

Page: 3

Proposed
Payment

24

25

26

27

28

10/08/97

11125/97

02/13/98

02/13/98

04/06/98

Longview ISD, et al 11,178.92
¢/o Michael Reed
P. O. Box 26990
Austin, TX 78755
amended
Category: SECURED
Memo: Amendment of #9.
Amended by #26.

MCN Investments, Inc. 11,500.00
P. O. Box 7207
Longview, TX 75607-7207
amended
Category:  SECURED
Memo: Amendment of #21.
Amended by Claim #34.

Longview ISD 10,173.15
¢/o Michael Reed

P. O. Box 26990

Austin, TX 78755

Category: SECURED

Memo: Amendment of #24.

Disallowed per Order #302 EQD 9/20/99

Longview ISD 3,647.02
¢/o Michael Reed

P. O. Box 26990

Austin, TX 78755

Category: SECURED

Memo: Disallowed per Order #301 EQD 9/20/99

Hibernia National Bank 13,385.60
Bankruptcy Division

PO Box 481

Baton Rouge, LA 70821

Category: SECURED

Memo: Disallowed per Order #300 EOD 9/20/99

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed
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0.00

0.00
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0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00

0.00



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM Claims Distribution Register Page: 4
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed
Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
SEC  01/26/98 Various Secured Claims Paid 19,560.82 19,560.82 19,560.82 0.00 0.00
During Pendency
Category: SECURED
Memo: Various Secured Creditors paid during pendency of case pursuant to Court's Order:
#103 Mardy Parker - $659.78
#104 SAWD as Escrow for taxing authorities - $659.78
Per Notice of Proposed Public Sale filed 9/9/98
#105 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on minerals - $3,233.44
#106 Kirk Shields, Gregg Co. Tax A/C, taxes on realty, - $4,583.26
#107 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on realty - $4,755.19
#108 Spring Hill ISD, taxes on minerals - $5,669.15
#109 Longview ISD, taxes on minerals - $0.22
Per Order #236 EOD 10/8/98
Total for Priority 100 : $415,057.30 $19,560.82 $19,560.82 $0.00 $0.00
Total for Type Secured : $415,057.30 $19,560.82 $19,560.82 $0.00 $0.00
Claim Type: Admin Ch. 7
Priority: 200 Percent Paid: 100.00000
34A 01/19/99 MCN Investments, Inc. 21,377.34 3,500.00 0.00 3,500.00 3,500.00
P. 0. Box 7207 *
Longview, TX 75607-7207
Category:  MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES (CH 7)
Memo: Agreed Order #363 1/21/00
"Priority" portion of Claim #34. See 34B for unsecured, non-priority portion.
AUC-E  12/31/98 Bill Watson, Auctioneer 392.73 392.73 392.73 0.00 0.00
Category:  EXP.-AUCTIONEER (CH 7)
Memo: Order #246 EOD 12/31/98
AUC-F  12/31/98 Bill Watson, Auctioneer 256.43 256.43 256.43 0.00 0.00

Category:  FEES-AUCTIONEER (CH 7)
Memo: Order #246 EOD 12/31/98

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM Claims Distribution Register Page: 5

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed
Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
ACCT-F 07/06/00 Robert G. Rogers, CPA 185.75 185.75 185.75 0.00 0.00

Category:  FEES-TRUSTEE'S ACCTANT-NON FIRM (CH?7)
Memo: Order #379 EOD 8/15/2000

ATTY-E 03/29/00 Bob Anderson, Attorney 2,338.48 2,338.48 2,338.48 0.00 0.00

Category:  EXP.-TRUSTEE'S ATTY-FIRM (CH7)
Memo: Order #370 EOD 3/29/00

ATTY-F  03/29/00 Bob Anderson, Attorney 13,740.00 13,740.00 13,740.00 0.00 0.00

Category:  FEES-TRUSTEE'S ATTY-FIRM (CH 7)
Memo: Order #370 EOD 3/29/00.

TTEE-E 01/26/98 Bob Anderson 5,155.23 5,155.23 0.00 5,155.23 5,155.23
Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604
Category:  EXP.-TRUSTEE (CH7)

TTEE-F  01/26/98 Bob Anderson 7,931.99 7,931.99 0.00 7,931.99 7,931.99
Century Plaza, Suite 412
911 N.W. Loop 281
Longview, TX 75604
Category:  FEES-TRUSTEE (CH7)

Total for Priority 200 : $51,377.95 $33,500.61 $16,913.39 $16,587.22  $16,587.22
Total for Type AdminCh. 7: $51,377.95 $33,500.61 $16,913.39 $16,687.22  $16,587.22
Claim Type: Admin Ch. 11
Priority: 300 Percent Paid: 100.00000
7 03/07/96 Don E. Williams 3,240.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
P. 0. Box 10089 "

Longview, TX 75608
Category:  FEES-DEBTOR'S ATTY (CH11)
Memo: Disallowed per Order #317 EOD 9/20/99

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM Claims Distribution Register Page: 6
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed

Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
D-ATTY-F 09/29/99 Robert M. Bandy, P.C. 28,174.75 16,627.79 16,627.79 0.00 0.00

Category:  FEES-DEBTOR'S ATTY (CH11)

Memo: Order #341 EOD 9/29/99 for total of $16,807.00 for fees and $3,577.32 for expenses, for a total of

$20,384.32. Debtors previously paid $3,756.53, leaving a balance of $16,627.79 to be paid as a

Chapter 13 Administrative Expense.
Paid by Trustee's Check #102 on 3/16/00.

Total for Priority 300 : $31,414.75 $16,627.79  $16,627.79 $0.00 $0.00
Total for Type Admin Ch. 11: $31,414.75 $16,627.79  $16,627.79 $0.00 $0.00
Claim Type: Priority
Priority: 560 Percent Paid: 14.56815
1 01/29/96 Office of the Attorney General 36,215.99 36,215.99 0.00 36,215.99 5,276.00

Collection Div.-Bankruptcy Sec

P. O. Box 12548

Austin, TX 78711-2548

Category:  PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS

Memo: Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured PRIORITY claim per Order #296 EOD 9/20/99
13 04/05/96 Internal Revenue Service 11,478.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
1100 Commerce St., Rm. 9A20
Stop 5024 DAL
Dallas, TX 75242
amended
Category:  PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS
Memo: Amended by #18
18 05/15/96 |.R.S. Special Procedures 3,826.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
withdrawn
Category:  PRIOR. TAX CLAIMS
Memo: Amendment of 13. Claim withdrawn 6/20/96. See Legal #65.
Total for Priority 560 : $51,519.99 $36,215.99 $0.00 $36,215.99 $5,276.00
Total for Type Priority : $51,519.99 $36,215.99 $0.00 $36,215.99 $5,276.00

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:52 AM Claims Distribution Register Page: 7
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed
Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
Claim Type: Unsecured
Priority: 610 Percent Paid:  0.00000
3 02/21/96 Harry Fox 10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 10,000.00 0'.,00
DBA/American Star
Rt. 2 Box 480
Gilmer, TX 75644
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
4 02/23/96 Midwest Folding Products 5,286.97 5,286.97 0.00 5,286.97 0.00
1414 South Western Ave.
Chicago, IL 60608
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
5 03/04/96 Capital One, an Affiliate of Signet 2,603.97 2,603.97 0.00 2,603.97 0.00
Bank/Virginia
P. 0. Box 85167
Richmond, VA 23285
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
6 03/11/96 Bonnie Griffin 2,754.00 2,754.00 0.00 2,754.00 0.00
c/o Mark Strachan
P. 0. Box 3343
Longview, TX 75606
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
12 04/11/96 Southwestern Bell Yellow Pages, 3,926.04 3,926.04 0.00 3,926.04 .0.00
Inc. ’
1430 Empire Central, 4th Floor
Dallas, TX 75247
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
17 05/09/96 Carrier Bock Co. 1,351.00 1,351.00 0.00 1,351.00 0.00

P. O. Box 88147

Dallas, TX 75888

approved

Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed
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Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE
Amount Amount Paid Claim Propased
Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
22 08/07/97 Bob Jones 500.00 500.00 0.00 500.00 0.00
P. 0. Box 973 >
Big Sandy, TX 75755
Category: UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo: Allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #303 EOD 9/20/99.
23 09/24/97 George McGrede 20,000.00 20,000.00 0.00 20,000.00 0.00
618 Omega Drive
Longview, TX 75601
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
29 10/30/98 Yong Lee 2,000.00 2,000.00 0.00 2,000.00 0.00
1605 South Austin *
Dennison, TX 75020
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo: Disallowed as priority, allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order #299 EOD 9/20/99.
30 11/13/98 Myla Mayberry 702.46 702.46 0.00 702.46 0.00

3400 W. Marshall #307
Longview, TX 75606

approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo:
Reggie & Anna case.
31 12/09/98 Max Recovery Trust Successor 4,981.52 4,981.52
to
American Express Travel
PO box 10228
Newark, NJ 07193
approved
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
32 12/09/98 Reggie Roark 3,850.00 3,850.00
PO Box 8 *
Judson, TX 75660
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo:

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed

0.00

0.00

4,981.52

3,850.00

Note: Claim has Anna's case #96-62676 on it, appears that Clerk changed the number to the

0.00

0.00

Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #316 EQOD 9/20/99
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Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case: 96-60060 - ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed

Claim # Date Claimant Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
33 12/22/98 Gregg Co. CSCD 9,712.62 9,712.62 0.00 9,712.62 0.00
Attn: Quin Tillery *
P. O. Box 3226
Longview, TX 75606
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo: Disallowed as priority claim, allowed as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order #315 EOD 9/20/99
34B 01/26/98 MCN 0.00 8,000.00 0.00 8,000.00 0.00
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS
Memo: Agreed Order #363 EOD 1/21/00.
This is "unsecured" portion. See 34A for administrative portion.
35 01/19/99 Reggie Roark 11,000.00 11,000.00 0.00 11,000.00 0.00
P.0O.Box 8 *

Judson, TX 75660
Category:  UNSEC. TIMELY FILED CLAIMS

Memo: Disallowed as secured; allowed as unsecured, non-priority per Order #314 EOD 9/20/99.
Total for Priority 610 : $78,668.58 $86,668.58 $0.00 $86,668.58 $0.00
Total for Type Unsecured : $78,668.58 $86,668.58 $0.00 $86,668.58 $0.00
Total for Case : $628,038.57 $192,573.79 $53,102.00 $139,471.79  $21,863.22

(") Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 09/06/00 11:53 AM
Claims Proposed Distribution
Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)
Report Includes ONLY Claims with a Proposed Distribution

Case: 96-60060 ROARK, REGGIE STACEY & ANNA MARLENE

Page: 1

Case Balance:  $21,863.22 Total Proposed Payment: $21,863.22 Remaining Balance: $0.00
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed  Remaining
Claim# Claimant Name Type Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment Funds
34A  MCN Investments, Inc. Admin Ch. 7 21,377.34 3,500.00* 0.00 3,500.00 3,500.00 18,363.22

MISCELLANEOUS EXPENSES (CH 7)
Claim Memo: Agreed Order #363 1/21/00
"Priority" portion of Claim #34. See 34B for unsecured, non-priority portion.

'13,207.99

TTEE-E Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 5,165.23 5,155.23 0.00 5,155.23 5,155.23
EXP.-TRUSTEE (CH7)
TTEE-F Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 7,931.99 7,931.99 0.00 7,931.99 7,931.99 5,276.00
FEES-TRUSTEE (CH7)
1 Office of the Attorney General  Priority 36,215.99 36,215.99* 0.00 36,215.99 5,276.00 0.00
Claim Memo: Disallowed as secured, allowed as unsecured PRIORITY claim per Order #296 EOD 9/20/99
Total for Case 96-60060 : $70,680.55 $52,803.21* $0.00 $52,803.21 $21,863.22 $0.00
CASE SUMMARY
Amount Amount Paid Proposed
Filed Allowed to Date Payment
Total Administrative Claims : $82,792.70 $50,128.40 $33,541.18 $16,587.22
Total Priority Claims : $51,519.99 $36,215.99 $0.00 $5,276.00
Total Secured Claims : $415,057.30 $19,560.82 $19,560.82 $0.00
Total Unsecured Claims : $78,668.58 $86,668.58 $0.00 $0.00

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: REGGIE S. ROARK / BANKRUPTCY CASE: 96-60060
/

/ CHAPTER 7

NOTICE OF FILING OF FINAL REPORT OF TRUSTEE.
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTIONS

NOTICE IS GIVEN that the Trustee's Final Report and Account, report of Proposed Final Distribution
and Applications for Compensation have been filed. These documents are available for public inspection
at the office of the Bankruptcy Clerk, 200 E. Ferguson, Tyler, Texas 75702, or at the trustee’s office
whose name and address is as follows:

BOB ANDERSON 911 N.W.LOOP 281. SUITE 412 LONGVIEW, TEXAS 75604

The following Applications for Compensation have been filed:

Applicants Fees Requested Expenses Requested
BOB ANDERSON 7931.99 5155.23

Trustee

BOB ANDERSON 0.00 0.00

Attorney for Trustee

U.S. Bankruptcy Court 0.00

The trustee’s account shows:
Total Receipts Total Disbursements Balance

$93639.77 $ 71776.55 $21863.22

In addition to the commissions and fees that may be allowed by the Court, liens and priority claims
which must be paid in advance of general creditors have been allowed in the total amount of
$74451.36 ; general unsecured claims have been allowed in the amount of $ 78668.58

The debtor has/has not been discharged.

Written objections to the Final Report, Application for Compensation and/or proposed Distributions
must be filed with the Clerk of the Court and served on the trustee at the above mentioned address within
30 days from the date of this notice. If no objections are filed, the Court may consider the Report and
Applications without hearing. If objections are filed, a hearing will be held on

at

Date: JAMES D. TOKOPH, Clerk of Court

By:

Deputy Clerk



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: REGGIE S. ROARK / BANKRUPTCY CASE: 96-60{(}46:“(.), S

/ N ol Lo “'; o, ,
/ CHAPTER 7 LRy Y

NOTICE OF FILING OF FINAL REPORT OF TRUST
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND PROPOSED DISTRIBHFION

*\UE‘DUT}/
NOTICE IS GIVEN that the Trustee’s Final Report and Account, report of Proposed Final Distribution
and Applications for Compensation have been filed. These documents are available for public inspection
at the office of the Bankruptcy Clerk, 200 E. Ferguson, Tyler, Texas 75702, or at the trustee’s office
whose name and address is as follows:

BOB ANDERSON 911 N.W. LOOP 281. SUITE 412 LONGVIEW. TEXAS 75604

The following Applications for Compensation have been filed:

Applicants Fees Requested Expenses Requested
BOB ANDERSON 7931.99 5155.23

Trustee

BOB ANDERSON 0.00 0.00

Attorney for Trustee

U. S. Bankruptcy Court 0.00

The trustee’s account shows:
Total Receipts Total Disbursements Balance

$ 93639.77 $71776.55 $21863.22

In addition to the commissions and fees that may be allowed by the Court, liens and priority claims
which must be paid in advance of general creditors have been allowed in the total amount of
$.74451.36 ; general unsecured claims have been allowed in the amount of § 78668.58

The debtor has/has not been discharged.

Written objections to the Final Report, Application for Compensation and/or proposed Distributions
must be filed with the Clerk of the Court and served on the trustee at the above mentioned address within
30 days from the date of this notice. If no objections are filed, the Court may consider the Report and
Applications without hearing. If objections are filed, a hearing will be held on

at

Date: JAMES D. TOKOPH, Clerk of Court

By:

Deputy Clerk



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: § CASE NO. 96-60060

§ CHAPTER 7
REGGIE STACEY ROARK §
AND § (Case Nos. 96-60060 and 96-62679
ANNA MARLENE ROARK § Jointly Administered Under

§ Case No. 96-60060)
DEBTORS §

ORDER APPROVING TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT
AND ALLOWING COMPENSATION

The Trustee has filed a Final Report along with applications for compensation and a Report of
Proposed Distribution. Notice of the filing of such report and applications were given to the creditors in
this proceeding and any objections, if filed, have been resolved. After having reviewed said report and
applications, it is hereby ordered that:

1.

2.

The Trustee's Final Report and Account is approved.

Bill Watson, Auctioneer, the Auctioneer is allowed reimbursement of expenses of $392.73
of which $392.73 has previously been paid.

Bill Watson, Auctioneer, the Auctioneer is allowed compensation of $256.43 of which
$256.43 has previously been paid.

Robert G. Rogers, CPA, the Accountant for Trustee is allowed compensation of $185.75
of which $185.75 has previously been paid.

Bob Anderson, the Attorney for Trustee is allowed reimbursement of expenses of
$2,338.48 of which $2,338.48 has previously been paid.

Bob Anderson, the Attorney for Trustee is allowed compensation of $13,740.00 of which
$13,740.00 has previously been paid.

Bob Anderson, the Trustee is allowed reimbursement of expenses of $5,155.23 of which
$0.00 has previously been paid.

Bob Anderson, the Trustee is allowed compensation of $7,931.99 of which $0.00 has
previously been paid.



9. Robert M. Bandy, P.C., the Attorney for Debtor is allowed compensation of $16,627.79
of which $16,627.79 has previously been paid.

Date:

Bill Parker
United States Bankruptcy Judge



