o -

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: )
SIRMONS, KENNETH D. ) CASE NO. 95-10634
)
) CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR(S) }

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION,
AND REPORT OF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Stephen J. Zayler, trustee of the estate of the ahove-named Debtor(s), certifies to the Court and
the United States Trustee, that the trustee has faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties of the
office of the trustee, that the trustee has examined all proofs of claims as appropriate under the
proposed distribution, and that the proposed distribution, attached hereto, is proper and consistent
with the law and rules of the court. The trustee applies for commission and expenses sct forth
heren and states that they are reasonable and proper.

Therefore, the trustee requests that the Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report
of Proposed Distribution be approved.

DATE: June 15, 1999 cf%@/

Stephien J. Zayler

Trustee
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REVIEWED BY THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE:

I have reviewed the Trustee's Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of
Proposed Distribution and have no objection.

United States Trustee

Date: “ \ ’/ By: . o




UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: )
SIRMONS, KENNETH D. ) CASE NO. 95-10634
)
) CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE’S FINAL REPORT, APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPLICATION TO CLOSE CASE AND DISCHARGE TRUSTEE

The Trustce of the estate presents the following final report:

1. The Trustee applies for commissions and expenses set forth herein: That they are
reasonable and proper; that in the course of the performance of duties, the Trustee has advanced
monies from personal funds for expenses, and that the Trustee has not been reimbursed or
indemnified.

2. The Trustec submits Schedule F as a summary of the assets and an cstate property
record. Any property scheduled under 11 U.S.C. Sec. 521(1) and not administered shall be
deemed abandoned pursuant to 11 U.S.C. Sec. 554(c).

3. The Trustee has reduced all assets of this estate to cash or otherwise lawfully
disposed of them, and the estate is ready to be closed.

4. The Trustee submts Schedule A as the account of estate cash receipts and
disbursements.
5. There is no agreement or understanding between the Trustee and any other person

for a division of the compensation sought by this application except as permitted by the
Bankruptcy Code.

6. The Trustee requests approval of this final report.

7. The Trustee has examined each and every claim filed and noted his approval of
claims as filed, or he has filed objections to allowance or requests for reclassification.

8. The Trustee further requests that after final distribution of all monies in
accordance with the Trustee’s Report of Final Distribution, and upon filing of A Supplemental
Final Report and Account and certification by the U.S. Trustee the trustee be discharged from
office and that the case be closed.

I declare under penalty of perjury that this Report and attached Schedules are true and
correct to the best of my knowledge and belief, .

Dated: June 15, 1999 e

Step#en . Zayler Trusteg’



SCHEDULE A-1
FINAL ACCOUNT AS OF June 15, 1999

A. RECEIPTS

B. DISBURSEMENTS

(1) Secured creditors
{2) Administrative
(3) Priority

(4) Other

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

BALANCE OF FUNDS

0.00
8,459.87
0.00
0.00

$26,798.75

$8,459.87

$18,338.88
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FILED
U.S. BANKRUPTCY COURT
EASTERM DISTRICT OF TX
IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

FOR THE EASTERN D@Rﬁ'r Oﬁ1 TEXAS
BEAUMONH'U FS

RE:
@EPK. .S, BANSRUPTGY
KENNETH SIRMONS, Bé CLURT AﬁS ,li‘lp 895-106348%
D/B/A SIRMONS’ HOMES T —(CHAPTER 7) . (3
Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264 § 105(5
§
§ W

ORDER AUTHORIZING TRUSTEE TO PAY STORAG EES
TO PAYNE & SONS WRECKER SERVICE
AS AN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE

CAME ON TO BE HEARD on this date, the Trustee’s Motion to Pay
Storage Fees to Payne & Sons Wrecker Service as an Administrative
Expense, and the Court, having considered same and no objections
having been filed, finds that such Motion is meritorious and should
be granted. It is therefore,

ORDERED, ADJUDGED AND DECREED that the Trustee pay to Payne &
Sons Wrecker Service, the sum of $640.00, in payment of the agreed
sum for post-petition fees for the storage of the assets of the

Bankruptcy Estate, from the proceeds of the sale of such assets.

SIGNED this the Q?/%day of November, 1995.

ORDER AUTHORIZING TRUSTEE TO PAY STORAGE FEE TO
PAYNE & SONS WRECKER SERVICE AS AN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSE
c:\law\bankrupt\trustee\sirmons\ind\payne.pay




bt ~—

; IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION Fy
us;&w,( L’/;L‘D
/57'-| )’
RE: g Coye
§ ; TP 41 o 55:23

KENNETH SIRMONS, § CASE NO. oﬁé §

D/B/A SIRMONS' HOMES § (CHAPTEE 7 3

Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264 § 8y ,5“ -
DEBTOR g \\\‘~iff’ o

ORDER AUTHORIZING ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION TO AUCTIONEER

On this day came on to be considered the Trustee’s Motion for
Allowance of Compensation to Auctioneer filed by Stephen J. Zayler,
the Trustee in the above captioned proceeding, for allowance of
compensation to HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC., for services rendered
to the Trustee as set out in said Motion; and the Court being of
the opinion the same was a necessary expense of this debtor estate,
it is therefore;

ORDERED that the Trustee pay to HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC.,
the sum and amount of $550.00 as commission plus the sum of
$120.90, for expenses, for a total sum and amount of $670.90, for
services rendered to the Trustee, and that the same shall be taxed
as an administration exp ;7§e in this gCeeding.

SIGNED this the ,‘ day of o LEC — , 1995.

;
y
//
/A /m/ et

JUDGE 'PRESIDING

c:\law\bankrupt\trustee\sirmons\ind\auct.pay

ORDER AUTHORIZING ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION TO AUCTIONEER 45



- “—
IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

o ! 6
EO@REQRW o
KENNETH SIRMONS,

D/B/A SIRMONS’' HOMES
Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264

CASE NO. 95-106345
(CHAPTER N

2 1 1 W wn n i

DEBTOR

ORDER AUTHORIZING ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION TO AUCTIONEER

On this day came on to be considered the Trustee’s Motion for
Allowance of Compensation to Auctioneer filed by Stephen J. Zayler,
the Trustee in the above captiocned proceeding, for allowance of
compensation to HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC., for services rendered
£0 the Trustee as set out in said Motion; and the Court being of
the opinion the same was a necessary expense of this debtor estate,
it is therefore; |

ORDERED that the Trustee pay to HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC.,
the sum and amount of $137.50 as commission plus the sum of
$150.00, for expenses, for a total sum and amount of $287.50, for

services rendered to the Trustee, and that the same shall be taxed

od

is rgceediﬁ%./,
SIGNED this the 422 day of422§§;22¢¢
,"’ bal L 24

-

as an administration expegéggin th

ORDER AUTHORIZING ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION TO AUCTIONEER Vs
c:\law\bankruptitrustee\sirmons\ind\auct.pay




A

IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

J 9 BANK};ILED

a : UPTCY COUR
EAS !
cnst ROCTEE OB TEXAS

(CHRPTERy 1Y 5 ¢ 1995

RE:

KENNETH SIRMONS,
D/B/A SIRMONS' HOMES
Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264

1 W W wn W

A M

- i . F bt
CLERK.Ub.BANKRUPTCYCOUF;

8
"EODHAY 2098 Srur_

ORDER ALLOWING PAYMENT OF INSURANCE PREMIUM

DEBTOR

CAMZ ON TO BE HEARD thig date the Trustee’s Motion to Pay
Insurance Premium, and the Court after considering such motion
requesting rhat the Trustee be z3llowed tO pay the sum of $651.00
(plus any premium increase which may become effective pricx to the
entry of the Court'’s Order authorizing payment) to Bartlett,
Baggett & Shands Insurance Company as payment ©I the premium cue
for insurance coverage for a period of rwelve months; and the Ccurt
;18 of the opinion that rhe same is in the pest interast of the
estate. It is, therefore

CROERED that the Trustee pay as an administrative eXpense,
from tnhe funds in this estate, O partlett, Baggett & Shands
Insurance Company the sum of $651.00 plus any increase in premium
which may have bscome effective prior to rne entry of this Order,
as payment for the insurance ccverage for the period of twelve (12)
months.

7y
SIGNED this the / da

MAY 301996 \J['\O\

ORDER AUTHORIZING PAYMENT OF INSURANCE PREMIUM

c:\lawibankrupt\t rustee\sirmons\ind\pay.ins BARTLETT BASGET
A




I. ~wtE UNITED STATES BANKRUPT.wrCOURT vf)
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS b

BEAUMONT DIVISION
D/B/A SIRMONS’ HOMES

F
gV
el ICT OF TEXAS

Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264

eon piz9e s
' CLERK. U.5. BANKRUPTCY COURT

ORDER ALLOWING TRUSTEE TO ENTER INTO®> CONTRACT FOR REPAIRS
AND FOR PAYMENT TO HINSON’S ROOF HOME REPATIRS —

RE:

KENNETH SIRMONS,

A o w1 W Wi

CAME ON TO BE HEARD this date the Trustee’'s Application to
Enter Into Contract for Repairs and for Payment to Hinson's Roofing
& Home Repairs, and the Court, after considering such Application,
is of the opinion that the replacement of the roof as requested by
Trustee is in the best interest of the Estate to prevent further
damage to the premises. It is, therefore

ORDERED that the Trustee is hereby authorized to entered into
the Contract with HINSON’S ROOFING & HOME REPAIRS for the
replacement of the roof on the premises, and that upon completion
of the repairs to the satisfaction of Trustee, that he is hereby
authorized to pay as an administrative expense, from the funds in
this estate, the sum of ONE THCUSAND TWO HUNDRED FORTY AND NO/100
{$1,240.00) DOLLARS to HINSON‘S ROOFING & HOME REPAIRS for
replacement cf the roof on the premises, and up to THREE HUNDRED
FIFTY AND NC/100 ($350.00) DOLLARS, for repair to the ceiling of

the premises. /s /

SIGNED this the Ei day of /QZ{;%} , 1996.

HOUSTON ABEL

f\\
\
ORDER ALLOWING TRUSTEE TO ENTER INTO CONTRACT FOR REPAIRS (&J
AND FOR PAYMENT TO HINSON'S ROOFING & HOME REPAIRS
ci\law\bankrupt\trustee\sirmons\ind\roof-rep




IN weE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCIT™TOURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

RE: —
U.S. BANKRUPTOY SOUR,

CASE BOTFRg5-=T D63 B r=xAL

(CHAPTER:@C )

FEB% 81997

KENNETH SIRMONS,
D/B/A SIRMONS’' HOMES
Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264

A
DEBTOR Y SLEAR, U8 BANKAUSTEY CauRT
FEB z% nERTTY —

0D .

ORDER AUTHORIZING TRUSTEE TO PAY FOR REPAIRS TO REAL PROPERTY

[P W R R R WA W

(Heating Unit)

CAME ON TO BE HEARD this date the Trustee’s Application to Pay
for Repairs to Real Property, and the Court, after considering such
Application, is of the opinion that the repair of the heating unit
at the premises is necessary and in the best interest of the
Estate. It is, therefore

ORDERED that the Trustee is hereby authorized to pay to OLEN
HICKS AIR CONDITIONING SERVICE for the repairs to the heating unit
at the premises in the amount of $276.68, as an administrative

expense, from the funds in this estate.

SIGNED this the _2%£Zzéay of ﬁfigigikéii”ffléév.
%W/

AOUSTON ABEL, UNITED STATES
BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

ORDER AUTHORIZING TRUSTEE TO PAY FOR

REPAIRS TO REAL PROPERTY (Heating Unit)

c:\law\bankrupt\trustee\sirmons\ind\heat-rep




IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION

RL

CASE NO. 95-10634S
(CHAPTER 7)

KENNETH SIRMONS,
D/B/A SIRMONS’ HOMES
Soc.Sec.No. 465-76-7264

R e N N e N e

DEBTOR

BOD 2097

ORDER ALLOWING PAYMENT OF INSURANCE PREMIUM

CAME ON TO BE HEARD this date the Trustee’s Motion to Pay
Insurance Premium, and the Court after considering such motion
requesting that the Trustee be allowed to pay the sum of $651.00 to
Delta Lloyds Insurance Company through its agent, Bartlett, Baggett
& Shands Insurance Agency as payment of the renewal premium due for
insurance coverage for a period from May 30, 1997 to May 30, 1998;
and the Court is of the opinion that the same is in the best
interest of the estate. It is, therefore

ORDERED that the Trustee pay as an administrative expense,
from the funds in this estate, to Delta Lloyds Insurance Company
through its agent, Bartlett, Baggett & Shands Insurance Agency the
sum of $651.00 for the renewal of the fire and hazard insurance
covering the real property located at 3555 North 11th Street in
Silsbee, Hardin County, Texas, and being further described in

Trustee’s Motion to pay this premium.

77 7
SIGNED this the [7 ' ‘day of //;?/Clx“/ , 1997.

ORDER AUTEORIZING PAYMENT OF INSURANCE PREMIUM ’ \
c:\law\bankrupt\trustee\sirmons\ind\pay.ins \\ \
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wpdacs.fazapp. ord \(-’T v
IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUBTCY COURT
FOQR THE EASTERN DISTRICT CF TEXAS
BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: ]
] .
KENNETH D. SIRMONS ] CASE NO. 95-1063«<
SSN 465-76-7264 ] (AN
] e
] | EODAUG 1098
DEBTOR ] CHAPTER 7

ORDER APPROVING APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND
RETMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FOR COUNSEL FOR TRUSTEE

CAME ICN this day to be considered the ZApplication Zfor
Compersation and Reimbursement of FExpenses filed by STEPHEN J.
ZAYLER, Trustee, on behalf of Stephen J. Zayler, Counsel for the
Trustee and 1t appeating to the Court that the Rpplication is well
taken and should be ¢ranted pursuant to 11 U. S. C. Section 330, it
1s therefore

ORDERED, ADJUDGED and DECREED that the Trustee be authorized
to pay to STEPHEN J. ZAYLER, as compensation for legal services
rendered as Counsel for the Trustee, the sum and amount of
$2,964.00, and reimbursement of out-of-pocket expenses in the sum

and amount of $328.79 for a total of fees and expenses of $3,282.79

and that the same be paid from the funds of this estare uporn
execution hereof. = 1998
AU G LV
DATED this the day of , 1998.

\\&SHA—A—‘QE Qtsgg:i;i\\

BANKRUPTCY JUDGQ\




~— '
- : IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT :;Jq;__,-;;‘:.:j,_}.-'. .
' EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS ‘
BEAUMONT DIVISION MAT o 1577
IN RE: § —t( e
8§
KENNETH SIRMONS, IND. & g
D/B/A SIRMONS' HOMES . §
§ CASE NO. 95-10634

CHAPTER 7

DEBTOR _goD SMR 2(1'09

ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION TO ACCCUNTANT

On this day came on to be considered the Motion of STEPHEN J.
ZAYLER, the Trustee in the above capticned proceeding, pursuant to
11 U.s.C. Section 330: for the allowance of compensation to DAVID S.
TAMMINGA, Certified Public Accountant, for services rendered to the
Trustee herein for the Bankruptcy Estate of KENNETH SIRMONS, as set
out in said Moticn; and the Court being of the opinion that the same
was a neéesséry expense of this debtor estate, it is therefore;

ORDERED that the Trustee herein pay to DAVID §. TAMMINGA,
Certified ﬁublic Accountant, the sum and amount of §750.00, for
services rendered to thé Trustee in connection with the Bankruptcy
Estate of KENNETH SIRMONS, and that the same shall bhe taxed asg an

administrative expense in this proceeding.

SIGNED this the QEE day of W , 1859.
\574

U.S. BANKRUPTCY JUDGE




SCHEDULE B

APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION

COMPUTATION OF COMMISSIONS

Receipts $35,248.73 25% of First $5,000
Less -$5,000 ($1,250.00 Max)
Balance $30,248.73 10% of Next $45,000
Less -$45,000 ($4,500.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 5% of Next $950,000
Less -$950,000 ($47,500.00 Max)
Balance $0.00 3% of Balance

TOTAL COMPENSATION REQUESTED

TRUSTEE EXPENSES:

Premium on Trustee's Bond

Travel (251.00 mile at 0.29cents per mile)
Copies (7,425.00 page at 0.25 cents per copy)
Postage

Telephone Charges

Clerical/Secretarial (81.00 at 15.00 per hour)
Paralegal/Assistance (77.70 at 50.00 per hour)
Supplies/Stationary

Distribution Expenses

Miscellaneous
Beaumont Locksmith ~ $46.55
Duplicate Key 1.50
TX Dept. of Transport 545
Photo Copies 3.18

Recording Fee-Hardin Co. 8.00

TOTAL EXPENSES

$1,250.00
$3,024.87
$0.00

$0.00

$4,274 87

$0.00
$72.79
$1,856.25
$1,191.97
$338.00
$1,215.00
$3,885.00
$4.54
$0.00
$64.68

$8,628.23

Records :  Trustee did not take possession of
business or personal records of Debtor.

Notice given debtor on
to pick up business or personal records
in hands of Trustee.




THE STATE OF TEXAS )
COUNTY OF ANGELINA )

BEFORE ME, the undersigned authority on this date personally appeared Stephen J.
Zayler, and under oath stated the following:

“, Stephen J. Zayler, am the duly appointed Trustee in the KENNETH D. SIRMONS
bankruptcy proceeding. I am hereby making application for the maximum amount of Trustee
fees, as it is my opinion that the maximum amount was earned by me in carrying out my duties as
Trustee. [ held the 341a meeting, collected and sold numerous assets (many of which were held
by third parties), located and sold unscheduled assets including a rent house which was transferred
pre-petition by the debtor to his brother-in-law which the Trustcc was successful in recovering for
the estate and collected rental payments. This was a companion case with four (4) other Chapter 7
companion cases with numerous creditors. I had to sort out which estate had an interest in which
assets with very little cooperation from the debtor or the debtor’s attorney. 1 had numerous
conferences and correspondence with the debtor, the debtor’s attorney, third parties holding
property belonging to the debtor and creditors. Further, I performed all other numerous duties of
a Trustee, including, but not limited to, preparing Trustee’s Final Report, will make
disbursements and will prepare the Supplemental Final Report.

SWORN TO AND SUBSCRIBED TO before n)e on this the 15th da;,f, of June, 1999.

I/ )
- e o (L’(_,LL .

NOTARY PUBLIC, THE STATE OF TEXAS

QEBECCAALLEN

Notary Public
STATE OF TEXAS
My Comm. EXp. 3.256-2001



ITEMIZATICON OF SECRETARIAL AND CLERICAL TIME

July 10, 1995 - Setting up file;

(EG - .10)
August 1, 1995 - Reccive and list Notice of Appearance of R. Christopher
Naylor on behalf of btord Motor Credit;

(RA - .10)

September 13, 1995 - Receive and list Notice of Appearance of Gary Coker for
Bank One, Texas;
(RA - .10)

September 20, 1995 - Receipt of and calendar bar date;

(RA - .20}
Octobker 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding scheduling
auction;

(3C - .10)
October 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding looklng at
cattle for approximate value;

(s¢ -~ .10)

Octoper 11, 1985 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Application to
Sell Property at Public Auction, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and
stamping envelopes for mailing teo 227 creditors and interested parties;

{(EG - 3.90)
October 13, 7995 - Telephone conference with Hoke Peacock regarding reguest
for copies of Exhibits;

{sC - .10)

October 18, 1995 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to Sell
Cattle, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelcpes for mailing
to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(G - 3.8C}

Qctcher 23, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding auction;
(sC - .20)

Octaober 24, 1995 - Telephone contference with Susan Horn regarding picking up
horse trailer;
(8C - .10}

November 1, 1895 - Copving, folding and stapling of Trustce's Motion te Pay
Storage Fees, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelcpes for
mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(EG - 3.70)

Noverber 2, 1995 — Telephone conference with Bankruptcy Court as Lo status of
Order authorizing auction;
{sC - .140)

November 6, 1995 - Correspondence to Hern Aucticn regarding title on horse
trailer and van;

“vomizarien of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page



(5C - .30}
November 9, 1995 - Telephone conference with Payne and Sons Wrecker Service
regarding payment of stcrage fees;

(s¢c - .10}

November 9, 1995 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to Pay
Auctioneer, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes for
railing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

{EG - 3.90}

November 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Sirmens regquesting bank
statements;
(3C - .10)

November 15, 1995 - Copying, foiding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to 3ell
1977 Chevrolet Truck, and stuffing, seallng, addressing and stamping envelopes
for mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

{(EG - 3.70]
November 20, 1995 - Prepare recelpt of two (2) checks;

(2G - .1C)
November 20, 1995 - Telephone conference with Union Bank opening new account
with and load bank account informaticn into computer;

{(RA - .20)
November 20, 1990 - Prepare Lwo (2) deposits, post deposits and transmit to
Union Bank:

(R - .30}

November 24, 1995 - Review and list Notice of Rppearance filed by Michael Reed
for Hardin County;
(RA - .10}

November 27, 1995 - Review correspondence from TRS regarding tax
identification number;

(Ra - .10Q)
November 27, 1995 - Telephone conference with Payne and Sons regarding status
of payment of storage fees;

{sC - .10}

November 28, 1995 - Prepare recelpt of check;
(EG - .10}

November 28, 1995 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

Noverher 29, 1995 - Prepare W-9 form for transmittal to Union Bank:
(RA - .10)

December 4, 1995 - Review correspondence from IRS;
(RA - .10}

NDecemrber 5, 1995 - Prepare disbursement c¢heck to Payne and Sons Wrecker

Ttemizatior of Secretarial & Clerical Time - Page 2



Service and posl disbursement;

(RA -

December 11,
{RA -

December

12,

.20)

1985 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement:
.20)

1995 Recelve from Mike Lindsay

and review correspondence

advising that thc rent house in Silshee is occupled;

(SC -
December 12,

(SC -

L10)
1995 - Telephone ccnference with Mike Lindsay regarding name of
tenants in rent house in Silsbeeg;
L10)
1995 - Prepare disbursement check to Horn Auctien Company and

Decerber 18,

post disbursement;

(RA -

Decemper 20,
for Robert &
(RA -

December 27,
Preperty and
{(RA -

January 15,

.20)

1995 - Review and list Notice of Appearance filed by Bill Richey
Vickey Gray;
.10)

1995 - Review Noticec of hearing on Debtor’s Motion to Sell Real
calendar;

L10)

1696 - Correspondence to Department of Motor Vehicles regarding

duplicate title;

{(sC -

. 30)

January 19, 1896 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA -

January 29,
Wagon,

and stuffing,

L20)

1996 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to Sell
sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes for mailing to

227 creditors and interested parties;

{(EG - 3.70)
Canuary 30, 1996 - Receive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(RA - .10)
February 5, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)
February 5, 1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20}
February 8, 1996 - Review Notice of hearing on Trustee's Objection to Debtor’s

Exempticns and calendar;

(RA -

February 14,
(EG -

February 14,
(RA -

.10)

1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
.10)

1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
.20)

Itemication of Secretarial & Cierical Time - Page 3



February 14, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

February 14, 1936 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding wagon;
(5C - .10)

February 20, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn verifying that rent
check was received;
{RA - .10}

February 29, 1396 - Telephone conference with Robert Barron’s office regarding
Crder concerning wagomn;
(sCc - .10)

March 1, 1996 - Recelve and review correspondence from Robert Barron regarding
change of address of debtor and update records;
(RA - .10}

March 1, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding delinguent rent

paymenss;

(SC - .10)
March 13, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding delinquent
rent payments;

(sc - .10)

March 14, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

March 18, 1996 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to Pay
Auctioneer for selling wagon, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping
envelopes for mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(EG - 3.70)
March 21, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;

(EG - .10}
March 21, 1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;

(RA - .20}
March 26, 1996 - Receive and review tax statement on Silsbee house received
from Nelson Campbell;

(sc - .10)
March 29, 1996 - Receive and review auction report from Horn Auction onrn sale
of wagon;

(SC - .10}

March 29, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

March 29, 1996 - Prepare deposit, past deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

April 9, 1936 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement:
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(RA - .20}

mpril 9, 1996 - Telephone conference with Bill Bartlett with Bartlett, Baggett
§ Shands regarding insurance premium on Silsbee house;

(sC - .10)
April 11, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Bill Bartlett
regarding guote on insurance on Silsbee house and discuss with the Trustee;
(RA - .10)

mpril 11, 1996 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion tc Fay
Insurance Premium, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes
for mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(EG - 3.80)
April 26, 1996 - Prepare disbursement check to Horn Aucticn and post;

(RA - .20)
april 26, 1996 - Correspondence to Horn Auction regarding commission for
selling wagon;

(sC - .20)

May 2, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding rent on house in
Silsbee;

{RA - .10}
May 6, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Mobil Oil regarding
Trustee's Motien to Pay Insurance Premium;

(RA - ,10)
May 7, 1996 - Receive and review tax receipt from Silsbee ISD regarding
payment of taxes;

(sCc - .10}

May 10, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

May 10, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding delinguent rent

payments;

(sC - .10)
May 10, 1996 - Service of objection to fifteen (13) claim on interested
parties;

(EG - 1.860)

May 16, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding delinguent rent
payrents;
(5C - .10}

May 22, 1996 - Prepare disbursement check to Bartlett, Baggett & Shands, post
disbursement and transmit;
(RA - .20)

May 28, 1996 - Correspondence to Mike Lindsay regarding client’s execution of

Special Warranty Deed;
(8C - .30)
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May 30, 1996 - Telephone conference with Bill Bartlett regarding completion of
appiication for insurance on rent house;
(sC - .20)

June 10, 1996 - Post interest and reconclile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

June 21, 1996- Receipt of and calendar hearing on Trustee’s Objection to
Claims;
(RA - .10}

July 9, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

July 9, 1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

July 12, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

August 1, 1896 - Telephone conference with Lynn at Bank One advising Trustee
tnat Elizabeth Hollins is now rcpresenting them;
(sc - .10)

august 12, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

August 12, 1986 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .Z20)

August 19, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(Rn - .20)

August 26, 1996 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn regarding leaking
roof and discuss with the Trustee;
(sC - .10)

September 11, 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

September 11, 1996 — Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

September 12, 1986 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

October 2, 1996 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Application to
Tnter into Contract for Repairs, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and
stamping envelopes for mailing to 297 creditors and interested parties;

(EG - 3.90)

October 8§, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

October 9, 1996 - Prepare recelipt of check;
(EG - .10)
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October 9, 1946 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union DBank;

(RA - .20)
Octoper 24, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Jim Wimberly
regarding status of case;

(RA - .10)

November 8, 193¢ - Post interest and roconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20}

November 8, 1996 - Telephone conference with Mrs. Osburn regarding replacement
of roof on rent house;

(sc - .10}
November 1., 1996 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)
November 11, 1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)
November 18, 1996 - Prepare disbursement check to Henson Roofing and post
disbursement;
(RA - .20)
November 18, 1996 - Correspondence to Henson Roofing regarding payment for
services;
(5C - .20)

December 10, 19%6 - Prepare rececipt of check;
(EG - .10)

December 10, 1996 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit Lo Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

Decemper 11, 1996 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA - .20)
December 17, 1996 - Telephone confercnce with Mrs. Osborn regarding heating
unit in rent house;

{SC - .20)
December 18, 1996 - Telephone conference with Mrs. Osborn advising her that
heating unit will be repaired;

(sc - .10}
January 10, 1997 - Receive and review statement from Olen Hicks regarding
repair of air/heating unit on rent house and discuss with the Trustee;

(Ra - .10)

January 14, 1997 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Application for
Authcrity to Pay for Repairs to Real Property, and stuffing, sealing,
addressing and stamping envelopes for mailing to 227 creditors and interested
parties;

(EG - 3.70)

January 16, 1997 - PFost interest and reconcile bank statement;
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(kA - .20)

January 27, 1997 - Prepare 1099 and 1096 for transmittal to proper parties;
(sC - .30)

February 3, 1997 - keceive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(RA - .10)

February 11, 1937 - Post interest and reconcile bank statenment;
(RA - .20)

February 12, 19897 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

February 12, 1997 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20)

February 28, 1997 - Receive and review statement from Olen Hicks Air
Conditioning;
(RA - .10)

March 5, 1997 - Receive and review Notlce of Entry of Order to Pay Repairs to

Real Property;
(RA - .10)

March 5, 1997 - Prepare disbursement check to Olen Hicks Air Conditioning and

oost disbursement;
(Ra - .20)

March 5, 1997 - Correspondence to Olen Hicks Air Conditioning regarding
payment for services;
{5C - .20)

March 12, 1997 - Prepare receipt of check;
(EG - .10)

March 12, 1997 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(R - .20)

March 31, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA - .20)
Rpril 7, 1997 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Granting
Application to BRbandon Property;

(RA - .10)

April 8, 1997 - Post intcrest and reconcile kank statement;
{(RA -.20)

April 14, 1997 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Motion to Pay
Insurance Premium, and stuffing, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes
for mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(EG - 3.80)
May 6, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA —.20)
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May 23, 1997 - Telephene conference with Bankruptcy Court inquiring about
status ot Order to pay insurance premium;
(3¢ - .10}

May 27, 1997 - Receive and review notice from Bartlett, Baggett and Shands
regarding expiration of insurance premuim;
(sC - .10)

May 29, 1997 - Telephone conference with Teshia at Bankruptcy Court regarding
Qrder to pay insurance premium;
{(sC - .10)

May 29, 1997 - Prepare disbursement check to Bartlett, Baggett & Shands and
post disbursement;
(RA - .20)

May 29, 1997 - Correspondence to Bartlett, Baggett & Shands regarding paymert
of insurance premium;
(sC - .20Q)

June 2, 1997 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Granting Authority
to Pay Insurance Premium;

{(RA - .10}
June 10, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA -.20)
June 17, 1997 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn regarding delinguent
rent;

(3C - .10)

July 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn regarding delinguent
rent;

(5C - .10}
July 24, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA -.20)
July 24, 1997 - Receive and review tax notice sent to Trustee by Nelson
Campbell from Silsbees ISD;

(5C - .10)

July 30, 1997 - Trip to and from locksmith to get key made to Silsbee rent
hecuse;

{(sC - .60)
Zugust 11, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA -.20)

September 9, 18987 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA -.20)

October 10, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .Z20)
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Receive and review tax statement on Silsbee rent house;

October 20, 1997
(sC - .10)

November 10, 1997 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

December 9, 1997 Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RE - .20)

January 12, 1998 Post interest and reconcile bank statement;

(RA - .20)
February 2, 1998 Receive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(RA - .10}

February 9, 1998 - Post interest and reccncile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

March 10, 1998 - Post interest and raconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

March 10,1 998 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Emplcying Real
Estate Agent;

(RA - .10)
March 12, 1998 - Receive and calendar confirmation hearing in Chapter 13
proceeding of Alfreddie Whitaker & crediter of Kenneth Sirmons;

(RA - .10)

March 31, 1998 - Receive and review delinguent tax notice from Silsbhee IS3D;
{(sC - .10}

April 6, 1998 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Application for
Authority to Sell Real Property, sealing, addressing and stamping envelopes
for mailing to 227 creditors and intercsted parties;

(RA - 3.60)

April 8, 1998 - Post interest and rececncile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

May §, 1998 - Post interest and recencile bank statement;
{(RA - .20)

May 11, 1998 - Telephone conference with Bankruptcy Court regarding status of
Order approving sale of real estate;
(sC - .10}

May 11, 19%8 - Receive and review disconnect notice from Entex on Silshee rent
house;

(SC - .10)
May 13, 1998 - Receive and calendar notice of hearing on Trustee’s Application
to Sell Real Estate;

(RA - .10}

May 18, 1998 - Receive and review tax statement from Hardin County;
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(3C - .10)

May 20, 1998 - Telephone conference with Chere’ at Bankruptcy Court
status of Order approving sale of real estate;
(sC - .10}

May 28, 1998 - Telephone conference with Bankruptcy Court regarding
Crder approving sale of real estale;

(sC - .10)
June 1, 1998 - Receive and review delinguent tax notice from City of
(sc - .10)

June 2, 1998 - Telephone conference with Judge Kelly’'s law clerk
status of entry of order on sale of real estate;
(SC - .10)

June 4, 1998 - Telephone conference with Hocks Title confirming that
Deed was sent by express mail;
(sc - .10)

regarding

status of

Silsbee;

regarding

Trustee’s

June 5, 1998 - Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order to Sell Real

Estate;
(sC - .10)

June 5, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .Z20)

June 9, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;

(FG - .10)
SJune 9, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;
(RA - .20}
June 10, 1998 - Receive and review Entex bill on rent housc which was to be

paid at closing;
{sc - .10)

June 18, 1998 - Prepare receipt of check;
(RA - .10)

June 18, 1998 - Prepare deposit, post deposit and transmit to Union Bank;

(R& - .20)

July 16, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

August 18, 1998 - Post interest and reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .20)

August 18, 1998 - Post transfer of funds from Unien Bank to NationsBanlk;

(R - .30}

August 18, 1998 - Verify tax identification number for NationsBank's
(RA - .10)
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Zugust 19,
fees;
{RA -

1998 -

109

Receive and review Notice of Entry of Order Lo pay attorney

Augutst 19, 1998 - Prepare disbursement check to Stephen J. Zayler as attorney
for Trustee and post disbursement;

(RA -

Septemper 8,

.20]

1698 - Review and list Notice of BAppearance filed by Clayton
Mayfield Zor Jefferson County;

(RA - .10}
September 21, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BE - .10}
October 20, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
November 11, 1998 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
Nevember 17, 1998 - Correspondence to Court returning claims folder;
(RAa - .20)
November 17, 1998 - Organize file;
(RA - .40)
December 14, 1988 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10}
January 13, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
February 2, 1999 - Prepare 1099's and 1096’s for transmittal to proper
parties;
(ST - .30)
February 3, 1999 - Receive and review 1099 from Union Bank;
(BH - .10)
February l&, 1999 - Reconcile bank statement;
(BH - .10)
February 16, 1999 - Copy and return cmployment contract to David Tamminga;
{BH - .10}
February 16, 1999 - Prepare 1995 and 1998 fiduciary tax returns for mailing to
District Directer and IRS;
(BH - .30)

rebruary 18,

Compensation to Accountant,

1999 - Copying, folding and stapling of Trustee's Application for

sealing, addressing

mailing to 227 creditors and interested parties;

(BH -

March 11,

3.80)

1999 - Recconcile bank statement;
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(Bl - .10}
March 11, 1999 - Review of file for account nunper for Mobil 0il;

(RA - .10)
april 5, 1999 - Receipt and review of Notice of Entry of Order Granting
Compensation to Accountant;

(RA - .10)
April 5, 1999 - Prepare disbursement check to David Tamminga, post
disbursement and transmit;

‘RA - .20)

April 6, 1999 - Review correspondence from IRS regarding fiduciary tax return;
(RA - .10)

April 12, 1989 - Reconcile bank statement;
(RA - .10)

May 3, 1999 - Organize files;
(RA - .90}

May 4, 1999 - Ccrrespondence to Court requesting Court costs and docket;
(RA - .20)

May 12, 1939 - Receive and review Bill of Court costs and docket;
(RA - .10)

June 11, 1999 - Transfer funds from MMA Lo checking account at NaticonsBank and
post accrued interest;

(RA - .Z20)
June 11, 1999 - Copy all bank statements, deposit slips and checks for
delivery of originals to U. S. Trustee's office;

(BH - 1.60)

June 11, 1999 - Prepare and assemble Trustee's Final Report Zor U. 5. Trustee
approval;
(RA - .50)

RECAP OF SECRETARIAL & CLERICAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN - 21.90 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = § 328.50
BEVERLY HATCHER - 6.60 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = 99.00
SHERRY CARNLEY - 7.70 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = 115.50
ELIZABETH GORMAN- 44.80 hrs @ $15.00/per hr. = 672.00
TOTAL: 81.00 hrs ¢ $15.00/per hr. = $1,215.00
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RESUMES OF THE PARALEGAL ASSTSTANTS TO THE TRUSTEE

Rebecca Allen

Employed by the [rustee September 1, 1990, Has 27 years bankruptcy and otlier
legal experience and was formerly employed by another Chapter 7 Trustee.

Her duties performed for the Trustee include loading infermation into the case
management system when files are received, preparation of Trustee's Report of
No Distribution, preparation of variocus correspondence between Trustee and
interested parties, answer telephone calls regarding routine guestions,
assisting with the location, collection and disposition of assets, assisting
in the collection of sale proceeds and accounts receivable, answering
questions from creditors, opening bank accounts, securing Tax ID MNos.,
preparing deposits and disbursement checks, posting deposits and disbursements
inte coemputer, reconciling bank statements, organizing files, preparation of
objeclicns to claims, preparation of various pleadings including applications
and motions in contested matters, preparation of semi=annual reports,
preparation of Trustee's Final Reports and Request for Compensaticn and
preparation of Trustee's Supplemental Final Reports.

Sherry Carnley

Employed by the Trustee Decembcr 1, 1934, Has 17 years broad legal experience
in all areas of law.

Her duties perfermed for the Trustee include organizing files, preparation of
various plcadings including applications and motions in contested matters,
principal assistant to the attorney for the Trustee in the preparation of
adversary proceeding complaints, discovery, pre-trial and post-trial
pleadings, preparing monthly reports in operating Chapter 7's, principally
respensible for assisting with the locatilon, collection, and disposition of
assets, assisting in the collection of sale proceeds and accounts receivable,
answering general gquestions from creditors, preparation of correspondence,
preparation of objections to claims, preparation of various miscellaneous and
other legal documents.
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TTEMIZATION QOF PARALEGAL TIME

™

July 10, 1995 - Ceorrespondence to debtor's attorney, Robert E. Barron, requesting
additional information for the Trustee to review prior to 34la hearing;
(R& - .40)

July 21, 1995 - Correspondence to Beaumont Locksmith granting him authorizy to
change the locks and post Notice of Bankruptcy on deors of Dbuilding at 7041
Phelan, Beaumont, TX;

(8C - .40)

July 25, 1995 - Telephone confercnce with Susan Horn regarding possible employment
to sell assets;
(sC - .20

July 25, 1995 - Correspondence to Horn Auclion regarding possible employment;
(sC - .20}

Bugust 12, 1995 - Conference with the Trustee regarding suit for sequestration;
(sC¢ - .10)

August 12, 1985 - Correspondence to Hon. Britten Plunk regarding pending suil for
sequestration, advising of Chapter 7 filing and request for release of items;
(3C - .30)

August 14, 1995 - Telephone conference wilh Richard Brooks with Silsbee Sate Bank
regarding horse trailcr repossession and discuss with the Trustee;

(sCc - .30)
August 15, 1995 - Telephone conference with Horn Buctioneer’s regarding horse
trailer repossession;

(SC - .10)

August 18, 1995 - Review Schedules and Statement of Financial ARffairs to determine
whether or not anything needs to be taken care of prior to 34la hearing and
discuss with the Trustee possible assets;

{(RR - .20)
August 18, 19%5 - Telephone conference with Hardin County Sheriff’s Department
regarding release of horse trailer;

{sC - .20)

August 18, 1995 - Telephone conference with Constable Arthur Gay regarding release
of horse Lrailer;
(8C - .20

September 11, 1995 - Conference wilh the Trustee regarding possible assets of case
and the results of the 34la hearing and review cf file as Lo assets and things to
be done with the Trustee;

(SC - .60)
September 12, 1995 - Telephone conference with Judge FPlunk’s office regarding
release of horse trailer;

(sC - .10}

Septemper 13, 1995 - Telephone conference with Lisa Sirmons regarding property of
estate;
(5C - .40)
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September 13, 1995 - Correspondence to Jimmy Butler regarding property of estate;
(sC - .30)

September 13, 1995 - Correspondence to Cordell Deleon regarding 12 cows and 1 bull
in his possessicn and request for turnover to the Trustee;
(8C - .40)

September 20, 1995 - Telephone conference with Stuart Horn regarding equipment;
(SC - .20)

September 25, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding auction;
{SC - .30)

September 26, 1995 - Recelve and review correspondence from Charles Deleon
regarding claim for administrative expenses for [feeding and boarding cattle and
discuss with the Trustee;

(sC - .20)

September 27, 18%5 - Review of file and compiling list for auctioneer as to assets
to sell and locaticn of various assets;
{(sC - .40)

September 27, 1995 - Correspendence to Horn Auction regarding auction of assets;
{sC - .30)

September 28, 1995 - Receive and review correspondence from Jim Winberley,
attorney for Silsbee State Bank concerning abandonment of collateral, review of
file and discuss with the Trustee;

(8C - .20)
Cctober 3, 1995 - Review of file and calculation of amount due to Charles Deleon
for boarding cattle;
(sC - .20)
October 3, 1995 - Correspondence to Charles DeLeon acknowledging receipt of
expenses regarding cattle and Trustee’s position on setoff and bidding procedure;
(SC - .40}
Qctober 3, 1995 - Prepare Motion to Employ Attorney for Trustee, Affidavit of
Disinterestedness and proposed Order;
{sC - .80)
October 5, 1995 - Correspondence to Carl Tynes regarding demanding turnover of
corporate reccrds in his possession;
(sC - .30)
Cctober 5, 1895 - Telephone conference witn Paul Geboski with FBI in Beaumont
regarding bank fraud charge against Kenneth Sirmons and prepare mcmo to Trustec;
{(sC - .40}
Jctober 6, 19395 - Prepare Motion to Employ Horn BAuction, affidavit of
Disinterestedness and proposed Order;
{(sc - .90)
October 6, 1995- Prepare Motion to  Employ Accountant, Affidavit  of
Disinterecstedness and proposed order;
(5C - .80)
October 8, 1995 - Telephane confererce with Mr. Curry with North Shore regarding
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filing by Kenneth Sirmons;

(3¢ - .10)
October 9, 1995 - Tclephone conference wilh Cordell Deleon regarding cattle
kelonging to debtor estate;

{(sC - .20}
Ccteober 9, 1995 - Additional telephone conference with Cordell Deleon regarding
Trustee’s requirements on his purchase of cattle;

{(sc - .12)
Cctober 9, 1995 - Telephone confcrence with Carl Tynes regarding records and
supplies of debtor;

(SC - .20
October 10, 1995 - Office confercnce with the Trustee regarding status of
administration and potential sale;

(R& - .30)
October 10, 1895 - Telephone corference with Susan Horn regarding auction
particulars;

{(§C - .10)

Octoker 10, 1895 - Telephone conference with Charles DelLeon regarding cattle being
held by him and discuss with the Trustee;

(3¢ - .30
October 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Paul Geboski with FBI in Beaumont
regarding Kenneth Sirmons possible criminal;

(sC - .20

October 1., 1995 ~ Prepare Moticn to Sell Inventory at Public Auction and proposed
Order;

(8T - 1.20)
October 11, 192935 - Telephone conference with Cordell DecLeon regarding cattle being
held by him;

(sC - .10}

October 11, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding value of cattle;
(sC - .20)

October 12, 1885 - Telephone conference with Nelson Campbell regarding his pre-
petition purchase of Silsbee house and discuss wit the Trustee;

{SC - .20}
October 12, 1995 = Rcceive and review correspondence [rom Jim Wimberley regarding
abandonment of property and review of file;

(5C - .20}
QOctober 16, 1995 - Telephone conference with Charles Deleon regarding offer to
purchase cattle with setoff for boarding and discuss with thc Trustee;

(3C - .30)

Octeoker 16, 19985 - Prepare Motion to Sell Cattle to Charles Deleon and proposed
Order;
{3C - .%0)

Cctcber 16, 1995 - Review bank statements and tax returns of the debtor Kennsth
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Sirmens and compare to records of related debtor entities;

(3¢ - 1.80)
October 18, 1995 - Receive and review correspondence from Mike Lindsay regarding
Trustee’s letter to Nelson Campbell and value of Silsbee housc:

(8C - .10

October 20, 19%% - Telephone conference with Layne Morris reygarding bid on cattle
and bidding procedure;

{sC - .20)
October 20, 1995 - Telephone conference with Charles Deleon regarding bid on
cattle;

(8C - .10}

October 23, 1995 - Receive and review of correspondence from Ren Legnion regarding
maintenance and insurance on St. Leuis Court;

(8¢ - .10)
October 23, 1995 - Telephone conference with Ron Legnion regarding Trustee’s
position on St. Louis Court property;

(sC - .20)

October 23, 1995 - Receive and review Moticon to Dismiss filed by Jim Winberley on
behalf of Silsbee State Bank sent to Trustee by Judge Begys;

(SC - .10}
October 23, 1895 - Telephone conference with Judge Beggs’ office regarding order
0% dismissal and sequestration on horse trailer;

(sC - .20)

October 23, 1995 - Telephone conference with Arthur Gerry regarding horse trailer;
(sc - .10}

October 23, 1995 - Correspondence to Horn Auction regarding authority to pickup
horse trailer as suit of sequestration was dismissed and advising them of location
of trailer;

(sC - .30)
October 23, 1985 - Telephone conference with Payne and Son Wrecker Service
regarding horse trailer;

(8C - .20)

October 23, 1995 - Load assets, lien information and exemption info into computer;
{(R& - .80)

October 24, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding horse ltrailer;
(3C - .20)

October 23, 1995 - Conference with Sherry and the Trustee regarding status;

(R& - . 10)
October 24, 199% - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding preparing for
auction;

(5C - .20)
Qctaober 24, 1995 - Telephonc conference with Payne and 3Son Wrecker Service

regarding storage fee on trailer and discuss with the Trustee as to what Trustee
would pay;
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(5C - .20)
October 26, 1995 - Receive and review Secured and Unsecured proof cf claim of
Silsbee State Bank tiled by Jim Wimberley;

(5C - .10)
October 27, 1985 - Lengthy correspondence to Charles Delecn regarding coniusion
or. his otffer to purchase and procedures cof sale;

(SC - .€0)
Cctober 30, 1995 - Teclephone conference with Tony Chaveaux regarding his client’s
position on using building for auction;

(5C - .20)

Octeober 30, 1995 - Telephcone conference with Kenneth Sirmons regarding assets;
{(SC - .30)

October 31, 1995 - Telephone conference with Betty with 3t. Louis Courts regarding
irsurance and maintenance payments due;

(5C - .10)
October 31, 1995 - Teleplone conference with Bill Lewis with 8t. Louis Courts
regarding insurance and maintenance fees on condo;

(SC - .10)
October 31, 1995 - Correspondence to Robert Barron regarding amending schedulcs
and items ot property;

(8C - .30}
October 31, 1935 - Conference with Trustee regarding cerrespondence rccelved from
Mike Lindsay and disrepair of Silsbee house;

(sC - .10y
November 1, 1995 - Telephone conference with Darla Sirmons regarding use of her
property for auction and discuss with the Trustee;

(sC - .30)
November 2, 1995 - Prepare Motion to Pay Storage Fees to Payne and Sons Wrecker
and proposed Crder;

(SC - .90)
November 2, 1995 - Telephone conference with Susan Horn regarding preparing for
auction;

(sC - .10)
November 3, 1995 - Telephone conference with Colvin Transmissicns rcgarding Chevy
and Ford trucks that belong to debtor;

(sC - .20)
November 3, 1885 - Telephone conference with ILisa Sirmons regarding mules and
mobile home and discuss with the Trustce;

(SC - .30)
November 7, 1995 - Telephone conference with Roy Legnoen regarding office condo;

(sC - .10)
November 9, 1995 - Prepare Trustee’s Application to Pay Buctioneer and proposed
order;

(3C - .90)
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November 9, 1995 - Telephone conference with Lisa Sirmons regarding Ford pickup;

[8C - .10}
November 9, 1995 - Telephone conference with GCene with Colvin Transmissions
regarding bidding on vehilces;

(SC - .20}

Nevember 9, 1995 - Correspondence to Jim Wimberly regarding his clicnt’s offer to
purchase and bidding procedures;

(SC - .30)
November 9, 1995 - Correspondence to Charles Deleon regarding higher bid and
soliciting higher bid;

(SC - .30)
Novemper 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with J. Hudson, stepfather of Charles
Deleon regarding cffer on cows;

(5C - .20)
November 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Jim Wimberley regarding amount of
highest counter-cffer on purchase of cattle;

(SC - .10)
Novemper 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Charles Deleon regarding cattle;

(3C - .10}
Novempcr 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Stuart Horn regarding cattle;

(SC - .20)
November 10, 1995 - Telephone conference with Joc Eddleman with Winnie Livestock
Auction regarding cattle and discuss with the Trustee;

(sC - .30)
Novemper 13, 1995 - Telephone conference with J. Hudson, potential buyer,
regarding no specific markings or bands on cattle;

(8C - .10}

November 13, 199% - Prepare Trustee’s Report of Sale regarding auction;
(SC - .40)

November 14, 1995 - Prepare Trustee’s Motion for BAuthority to Sell 1377 Chevrolet
Truck and proposed Order;

(5C - .80)
Novermber 17, 1995 - Telephone conference with Charles Deleon regarding his
purchase of cattle;

(5C - .10)
November 20, 1995 - Correspondcnce to Robert Barron regarding “expensive mules”

and wagon, request for accounting, request for information on rental property and
request for tax return;

(SC - .40)
November 20, 1995 - Correspondence to Charles Deleon regarding payment for
purchase of cattle;

(SC - .30}
Noverber 20, 1995 - Telephone confercnce with the Internal Revenue Service
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securing tax identitication number and preparation of 33-4;
(RA - .30)

November 30, 1995 - Prepare Trustee’s Report of Sale of cattle;

{sC - .40)
Novembor 30, 1995 - Correspondence to Charles Deleon regarding his purchase of
cattle;

{3C - .20}
December 6, 1995 - (Correspondence to Payne and Sons Wrecker Service regarding
Trustee’s position on storage fees for cattle trailer;

(sCc - .30}
Decerber 13, 1995 - Telephcone conference with Julie at Mike Lindsay’s office
regarding Silsbee house and computers;

(sC - .20)
December 13, 1995 - Correspondence to Ken Osburn, tenant in Silsbee house, to
forward all rent payments to Trustee;

{(sC - .30}
December 15, 1995 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding our letter to

him and his agreement to purchase from Nelson Campbecll and discuss wilh the
Trustee;

(sC - .30)
December 18, 1995 - Correspondence to Horn BAuction regarding his fees and
expenses;

(SC - .20)
December 20, 1993 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding Silsbee rent
house;

{SC - .20)
December 21, 1995 - Correspondence to Mike Linsday regarding reconveyance of
property to Trustee:

(8C - .30)
December 22, 1995 - (Qffice conference with Trustee regarding status of
administration;

(RA - .20)

December 26, 1995 - Telephone conference with Layne Morris regarding possible Dbid
on wagon;

(sC - .20}
December 27, 1995 - Conference with the Trustee regarding property debtor is
attempting to sell:

(sC - .10}
December 27, 1995 - Receive and review Bmended Schedules 3 & C and compare to
original schedules to determine changes made;

(SC - .30)
December 27, 1995 - Receive and review correspondence from Mike Lindsay regarding
‘nsurance policy on Silsbee house and discuss with the Trustee;

(RA - .10)
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Decemper 28, 19295 - Correspondence to Bob Barron regarding amended schedules, 1988
truck, mobile home and make mules available to sell;

(SC - .40)
December 23, 18385 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn regarding Silsbee
hcuse and his possible purchase;

(8C = .20)
Janvary 8, 1996 - Tclephone conference with Kenneth Sirmens regarding picking up
wagon and Ford Truck and prepare memo to Trustee;

(8C - .30)
January 9, 199 - Receive and review correspondence and documents from Tony
Chauveaux regarding office building and discuss with the Trustee;

(RA - .10}

January 11, 19%6 - Telephone conference with Layne Morris regarding bid on wagon;

(3¢ - .10)
January 11, 1896 - Telephone conference with County Clerk of Hardin County
regarding conveyance to Nelson Campbell;

(SC - .10}

canuary 12, 1996 - Prepare memo to Trustee with correspondence from Mike Lindsay;
(RA - .10}

January 15, 1996 - Prepare Affidavit for Duplicate Title;
(SC - .30)

January 18, 1396 - Receive and review affidavit and correspondence from Department
of Motor Vehicles regarding lien of Ford Motor Credit on 1938 truck;

{3C - .10)
January 19, 1986 - Office conference with the Trustee regarding request of Mike
Lirdsay as to execution of deed;

{(RA - .10)
January 19, 1996 - Telephone conference with Michelle Brovon with Ford Motor
Credit regarding release of lien on 1988 truck;

(RA - .10)

January 22, 1896 - Correspondence to Ford Molor Credit regarding releasing lien on
1988 Ford truck;

{$C - .30}
January 22, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from FEllen Reynard regarding
satus cf case and proof of claim of Weller, Green, et al;

(RA - .10)
January 23, 1996 - Correspondence to Vernon Druden advising of bankruptcy
proceeding and outstanding amount due to debtor for purchase of horse;

(SC - .30}
January 26, 19% - Telephone conference with Bill Bartlett regarding insurance
premium on Silsbee house;

(8C - .10}

January 26, 1996 - Prepare Application to Sell Wagon and proposed Order;
(SC - .BO}
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January 31, 1996 - Telephone conference with Verncon Durden on purchase of horse
pre-petition and amount duc and discuss with Trustee;

(SC - .20}
February 7, 1996 - Telephone conference with Robertson Insurance Agency regarding
insuring Silsbee house;

(8C - .20)
rebruary 8, 1996 - Telephone conference with Bill Bartlett regarding insurirng
Silsbee house;

(5C - .20)
February 8, 19%6 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding rental payments
due;

{SC - .10)
February 12, 19% -~ Receive and review Chapter 13 Plan Summary of Alfreddie
Wnitaker a creditor of Kenneth Sirmons;

{RRh = .1C)
February 12, 1996 - Correspondence to Department of Motor Vechicles requesting
title for 1988 Ford pickup and enclosing necessary documents;

{(sC - .20)
February 14, 1996 - Conference with Trustee as to motor vehicle scld by Trustes
that debtor later tried to claim as exempt and review of file;

(RA - .20)
February 14, 1996 - Update assets, lien information and exemption infco into
conputer;

(RA - . 30}
February 21, 199%¢ - Receive and review of title documents from state regarding
1988 Ford pickup;

(5C - .10}
February 12, 1996 - Correspondence to Robert Barren regarding information on

disposition of mobile home shown on debtor’s tax return as “rent trailer”, and
information on debt on travel trailer;

ra -

(SC .40)

February 21, 19296 - Telephone conference with Davlis lInsurance regarding insuring
Silsbee housc;
{sC - .20}

February 22, 1996 - Correspondence Lo Ford MoLor Credil requesling release on lien
on 1984 Ford pickup:
(SC - .20)

March 1, 1896 - Correspondence to Colvin Transmissions regarding their purchase of
vehicles;

(5¢ - .30)

March 4, 1996 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Sirmons regarding mokile home;
{sCc - .10}

March 13, 1996 - Correspondence to Vernon Durden demanding payment for purchase of
horse;
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{sC - .30}

March 15, 1996 - Prepare Trustee’s Application to Pay Buctioneer for Selling Wagon
and proposed order;

(S5C - .90)
March 21, 1996 - Prepare memo to file as to procedures Lo lake on rent house and
Nelson Campbell’s claim;

(SC - .20)

March 26, 1996 - Prepare Trustee’s Report of Sale of wagon;

(5C - .40)
March Z6, 1996 - TPrepare Trustee’s Report of 8Sale of truck to Colvin
Transmissions;

(SC - .40)
April 3, 1996 - Telephone conference with Farm Bureau regarding insuring Silsbec
rent house;

(8C - .20)
April 3, 1996 - Telephone conference with REMAX in Beaumont regarding possibly
listing Silsbee rent house;

(sC - .20)
April 4, 183%6 - Conference with Trustee and Sherry Carnley regarding status of
administration and remaining assets;

{(RA - .70)

april 4, 1996 - Corresponderce to Robert Barron regarding providing informaticn on
debt on travel trailer;
(sC - .20}

April 5, 19%6 - Receive and review correspondence from Mike Lindsay rgarding
length of time to allow Trustee to sell Silsbee real estate and discuss with
Trustee the time restraints;

(sC - .20

April 11, 1996 - Prepare Application to Pay Insurance Premium to Bartlett, Baggett
& Shands on Silsbee rent house;
(SC - .80)

April 17, 1996 - Telephone conference wilh Mike Lindsay regarding insurance
premium on Silsbee rent house and Trustee’s position on time freme for selling
house;

(5C - .30)
April 29, 1996 - Office conference with Trustee regarding validity of certaln
claims;

(RA - .80)
May 9, 1996 - Telephone conference with Taryn Hebert, realtor in Beaumont,
regarding Silsbee rent house;

(5C - .20)
May 9, 19%6 - Telephone conference with Dorothy Hebert, realtor in Lumberton,
regarcing possibily listing Silsbee rent house;

(8C - .20
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May 13, 1996 - Telephone cenfercnce with Liz Haines regarding rent house in
Silsbee;
(sC - .30)

May 14, 1996 - Telephonc conference with John Moore regarding Trustee’s objecticn
to his wage claim and amcunt allowed as priority and unsecured;

{RA — .20)
May 17, 1996 - Recelve and review proof cf claim of law tirm of Weller, Green,
McGowr. & Toups for legal services rendered;

(RA - .10)

May 30, 1996 - Prepare Agreed Order on Trustee’s Objection to Claim No. 35 of Big
G Dirt Service;
{(RA - .30)

May 30, 1996 - Correspondence to Wilma Guilbeaux with Big D Dirt Service regarding
Trustee’s Objection to Claim;
(RA - .20}

May 21, 1996 - Receive and review insurance binder on Silsbee house from Bartlett,
Baggett & Shands;
{gc - .10}

June 3, 1996 - Office conference with the Trustee regarding the delinquent rent of
Ken Osburn on Silsbee hcuse;

(sC - .10)
June 3, 1996 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding Trustee’s position
on delinguent rent;

(sc - .10}
June &, 1996 - Correspondence to Michael Reed regarding Trustee’s Objection to
Claim of the Hardin County;

(RA - .20}
June 6, 1996 - Correspondence to Ken Osburn regarding agrecement to pay delinguent
rent and future rental payments and notice to vacate if not paid on time;

{(SC - .40)
June 11, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Mike Lindsay, attorney for

Nelson Campbell regarding transferee, HNelson Campbell’s, decision agreeing to
reconvey Silsbee rent house back to estate;

(RA - .10)
July 18, 1996 - Correspondence te Elizabeth Hollins, attorney for Bank One,
regarding Trustee’s Objection to claim;

(5C - .20)

July 24, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Elizabeth Hollins regarding
Trustee’s Objection to Claim No. 4l of Bank One, Texas;

(RA - .10)
July 24, 1996 - Conference with Trustee reqgarding status of administration;

{(Rp - .20)
July 30, 1996 - Correspondence to Wilma Guilbeaux regarding Agreed Crder on
Trustee’s Ubjection to Claim of Big G Dirt Service;

[RA - .20)
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August 1, 1996 - Telephone conference with Jim Wimberly regarding Agreed Order on
Trustee’s Objcction to Silsbee State Bank:
(RA -~ .10}

August 14, 1996 - Correspondence tc Mike Lindsay regarding Special Warranty Deed
from Nelson Campbell to estate;

(sC - .20)
August 30, 1996 - Receive and review correspondence from Mike Lindsay regarding
Special Warranty Deed from Nelson Campbell and discuss with Trustee;

(s¢c - .10)

September 20, 1996 - Telephone conference with Henson Roofing regarding replacing
rocof on Siisbee house and advising him of having to seek Court approval;
(sC - .20)

October 2, 1996 - Prepare Trustee’s Application to Enter Into Contract for Repairs

and proposed Order;
(SC - .80)

October 3, 1996 - Telephone conference with Melvin Shavers with Birttan Cravens
Lumber regarding replacing rocf on Silsbee house and advising him of having to
seek Court approval;

(5C - .20)

October 7, 1996 - Telephone conference with Melvin Shavers regarding bid on roof;

(sC - .10)
October 16, 1996 - Correspondence to County Clerk, Hardin County regarding
conveyance from Nelson Campbell to Trustee;

(3C - .20)
Oczober 24, 1996 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn regarding Silsbee
house;

{sC - .10)

Octoper 24, 1996 - Telephone conference with realtor regarding Silsbee house;

(SC - .10)
October 25, 1996 - Regeive and review correspondence from Charlotte Guilbeaux
regarding canceling lien;

(sC - .10)
October 30, 1936 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding leaky roof on
rent house and Trustee having to obtain Court approval before repairing;

(sC - .10)

October 231, 1996 - Telephone conference with Henson Roofing regarding roof repair
on rent house;

{SC - .10}
November 18, 1996 - Correspondence to Jim Wimberley regarding status and need to
sell Silsbee house;

{sC - .30}
December 17, 1996 - Telephone conference with Olen Bicks Air Conditicning

regarding repairing heating vent and having to obtain Court approval before
payment can be made;
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{3¢ - .20}
December 21, 1996 - Correspondence to Mike Lindsay regarding conveyance from
Nelson Campbell to Trustee by Special Warranty Deed;

(sC - .30}

January 14, 1997 - Prepare Trustee's Application for Ruthority to Pay for Repairs
to Real Property and proposed Order;

(sC - .80)
Jaruary 27, 1997 - Recelve and review correspondence from Nelson Canpbell
regarding delinquent taxes orn 5ilsbee house;

(§C - .10}
January 30, 1997 - Correspondence to Kenneth Sirmons regarding Motion for
Abandonment of cause of action;

(sC - .30}

February 7, 1997 - Correspondence to Jerry Shiever, attorney for City of 35ilsbee,
regarding reconveyance back to estate by Nelson Campbell of Silsbee property;

(SC - .30)
February 7, 1997 - Correspondence to Jack McCreary, attorney for Hardin County,
regarding reconveyance back to estate by Nelson Campbell of Silshee property;

{sc - .30)
February 18, 1997 - Correspondence to Jack McCreary regarding delinguent ad
valorem taxes on Silsbee to rent house in reply to his letter;

{sC - .30)
February 19, 1997 - Review file as to status of administration;

{RA - .10}
February 19, 1997 - Conference with the Trustee regarding status of
administration;

(RA - .10}

March 5, 1997 - Prepare Motion to Abandon Cause of Action and proposed Order;
(§C - .70)

March 19, 1997 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Sirmons regarding lawsult;

(sC - .10)
March 19, 1997 - Correspondence to Kenneth Sirmons regarding Motion to Abandon
cause of action;

(3C - .30}

March 24, 1997 - Correspendence te Elaine Gore with Silshee 1SD regarding transfer
of rent house back to estate;

{sc - .30)
April 7, 1997 - Receive and review correspondence from Bartlett, Baggett & Shands
regarding renewal of hazard insurance celicy;

(sC - .10}
April 11, 1997 - Prepare Application to Pay Insurance Premium on Silsbee rent
house and proposed Qrder;

{sC - .80}
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May 5, 1997 - Receive and review Lax statement from {ardin County Appraisal
District regarding notice of appraised vaius;
{sC - .10)

May 5, 1997 - Trip to and from Silsbee to put “For Sale” sign on house, inspecting
property and taking pictures of property:

(sC - 4.30)
May 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with realtor regarding Silsbee house;
(SC - .20)
May 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with Mrs. Osburn regarding showing house;
(SC - .10}
May 27, 1997 - Telephone conference with Kenneth Osburn demanding delinquent rent
or vacating premises;
(5C - .20)

May 30, 1997 - Review of file to determine delinquent rent due by Osburns and
status of administration;
(SC - .30)

June 9, 1997 - Receive and review hazard insurance policy from Bartlett, Baggett &
Shands;

(8¢ - .10}
June 9, 1997 - Telephone conference with Ken Osburn regarding delinguent rental
payments;

(8C - .10)
Cune 30, 1897 - Correspondence to Ken Osburn regarding delinguent rent and demand
for payment;

(3T - .30)

July 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with Tiffany McFarland with Safety Adjusters
regarding Ken Osburn;

(RA - .10}
July 21, 1997 - Telephone conference with Carla Wright with Leon Bayless Real
Estate regarding Silsbee house;

(sC - .20)
July 24, 1997 - Correspondence to Wells, Peyton, et al regarding transfer of rent
house back to estate;

(8C - .30}
July 30, 1997 - Telephone conference with Carla Wright with Lecn Bayless Real
Estate regarding listing Silsbee house;

(sC - .20)

August 5, 1997 - Telephone conference with Carla Wright regarding Silsbee house;
(sC - .10)

August 20, 1997 - Telephene conference with Bayless Real Estate regarding listing

Siisbee house;

{sCc - .20)

September 4, 1997 - Correspondence to Leon Bayless Real Estate regarding possible
erployment to sell house;

“temization of Paralegal Time - Page 14



law\bankrupt\trustee\uppara.leq
(SC - .20}

September 12, 1997 - Telephcne conference with Leon Bayless Real Estate regarding

employment;

(sC - .10}
Novemper 11, 1997 - Correspendence to Jim Wimberley responding to Ihis request for
status of case;

(5C - .30)
December 17, 1837 - Telephone conference with Lisa at Bayless Real Estate
regarding listing Silsbee house;

(SC - .10)
Jaruary 2, 1998 - Office conference with the Trustee regarding status of
administration;

(RA - .10}
January 9, 1998 - Telephone conference with Lisa at Leon Bayless Real Estate
regarding possible offer to purchase and procedures;

(3C - .20)
January 12, 1998 - Telephone conference with Lisa at Leon Bayless Real Estate
regarding possible offer to purchase;

{(sC - .10)

January 27, 1998 - Prepare Application to Employ Real Estate Agent and proposed
Qrder;

February 25, 1998 - Correspondence fto Bayless Real Estate regarding changes to be
made to Farnest Money Contract;

(8C - .30}
Tebruary 27, 1998 - Discuss status of administration with the Trustee;
(RA - .10)
March 4, 1098 - Telephone conference with Lisa at Bayless Real Estate regarding
conflict with title to property and discuss with the Trustee;
(RA - .20)
March 6, 1998 - Receive and review fax from Bayless Real Lstate regarding
inspectieon report and repairs that need to be made and discuss with the Trustee;
(sC - .20)
March 9, 1998 - Ccrrespondence to Bayless Real Estate authorizing them to cbtain
estimates on lerder required repairs on Silsbee house;
(8C - .20}

March 23, 1998 - Receive and review fax from Bayless Real Estate regarding bids on
irspection report and discuss with the Trustee;

(sC - .10)
March 27, 1998 - Receive and review amendments to Earnest Money Contract and
transmit to 3ayless Real Estate;

{Sc - .40)

April 6, 1998 - Prepare Trustee’s Application for Authority to Sell Real Property
and proposed Crder;
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(8C - 1.10)

May 4, 1998 - Telephone conterence with Tisa at Bayless Real Estate rcgarding sale
0% Silsbee house;

(SC - .10)
May 6, 1998 - Receive and review fax from Leon Bayless Real Estate regarding sale
of 3ilsbee house;

(5C -.10)
May 8, 1998 - Telephone conference with Lisa at Bayless Real FEstate regarding
items necd for closing and handling of clesing;

(sc - .20)
May 11, 1998 - Telephone conference witnh Lisa at Bayless Real Estate regarding
closing of sale of Silsbee house;

(sC - .10)

May 11, 1998 =-Telephone conference with Michael Reed’s office regarding Response
to Application to Sell and discuss with the Trustee;
{RA - .20)

May 12, 1998 - Recelve and review withdrawal of Response to Trustee’s Application
to Sell Real Property by County of Hardin;
(R& - .10)

ray 15, 1998 - Receive and review HUD-1 received from Hooks Title;
(sC - .10)
May 20, 1988 - Review of closing documents on Silsbee house and prepare for
Trustee’s signature;
(sC - .30}

May 20, 1998 - Correspondence to Hooks Title regarding clesing on sale of Silshee
house;
(SC - .30}

May 29, 1998 - Receive and review correspondence from Bartlett, Baggett & Shands
regarding expiration of insurance policy on Silsbee house and discuss with the
Trustee;

{SC - .10
June 23, 1998 - Correspondence to Hooks Title regarding Trustee’s Dced and
agreement to pay Entex bill;

(8C - .30)
June 9, 1998 - Receive and review HUD-1 from Hooks Title and discuss with the
Trustee;

(RA - .20)

June 9, 1998 - Telephone conference with Rhonda at Hooks Title requesting changes
to HUD-1;
(RA - .10)

June 10, 1998 - Load numerous claim information inte computer;
{RA - 2.30)
\

June 11, 1998 - Continue to load numerous claim information into computer;
(RA - 1.80)
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June 11, 1998 - Telephonc conferance with wage claimant regarding procedure for
filing late claim;
[{RA - .20}
September B8, 1998 - Receive and review amended proof of claim of Jefferson County;
(R4 - .10)
December 2, 1998 - Review websites as to property owned by Kenneth Sirmens and
Darla Sirmons, ex-wife, to verify properties and compare to scheduled property;
(RA - .30)
January 5, 1999 - Prepare information for accountant to prepare  fiduciary tax
returns for 1995 and 1998;
(RA - .40)
January 5, 1999 - Qffice conference with David Tamminga regarding fiduciary tax
returns;
{RA - .10)
January 29, 1999 - Telephone conference Wwith Kenneth Sirmons regarding status of
proceeding;
(SC - .10}

Fepruary 16, 1999 - Receive and review fiduciary tax returns for 1995 and 1998;
(RA - .20)

February 18, 1999 - Correspondence to District Director with IRS requesting quick
determination of fiduciary tax returns;

(RA - .30)
Tebruary 18, 1999 - Preparation of Motion for Allowance of Compensation to
Accountant and proposed Order;

{sC - .80)

February 22, 1999 - Telephone conference with John Moore, wage claimant, regarding
status of payment;

(RA - .20)
Tebruary 25, 19%9 - Recelve and review Modification to Chapter 13 plan of
Alfreddie Whitaker a creditor of Kenneth Sirmons;

(RA - .10)
May 4, 1999 - Telephone conference with Robert Johnston with the local Texas

Workforce Commission attempting to determine the correct tax rate to use when
filing payroll reports for wage claimants to he paid;

{(R& - .20)
May 4, L1999 - Telephone conference with Texas Workforce Cormission in BRustin,
Bankruptcy Department, regarding tax rates to be used and correct way to Iile
reporss;

(RA - .30}

June 10, 1999 - Update claim information;
{RA - .60}

June 10, 18995
IRS;

Prepare W-2's for wage claimants to pe paid for transmittal <o

(RA - .40}
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June 10, 1999 - Prepare Form 241 on wage claimants to be paid for filing with IRS;

(RA - .40)
Jupe 10, 1999 - Prepare Form 940 on wage claimants to be paid for filing with IRS;
(RA - .30)
June 10, 1999 - Preparc Texas Workforce Commission Report on wage claimants Lo be
paid for filing with IRS;
(RA - .40)

RECLP OF PARALEGAL TIME:

REBECCA ALLEN - 16.7 hrs. @ $50.00/per hr. = § 835.00
SHERRY CARNLEY - 61.0 hrs. @ $50.00/per hr. = 3,050.00
TOTAL DUE: 77.7 hrs. @ 550.00/per hr. = $ 3,885.00

PLEASE NOTE: These paralegal expenses were not previocusly allowed in Application
for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses of Stephen J. Zayler, as attorney
for Trustee filed on or about July 1, 1998.
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SCHEDULE C
EXPENSES OF ADMINISTRATION

(1) Amount (2) Amount (3) Previously (4) Due
Claimed Allowed Paid
1. 11 U.S.C Sec. 507(a)(1)
_(;“.o_ur_t EO_SLS _arid_F_efE _______ 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. 11 U.S8.C. Sec. 503(b)(1)(a)
_Preservation of Estate 3,458.68 3,458.68 3,458.68 0.00
3. 11 US.C. Sec. 503(b)(2)
Post-Petition taxes and related 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
__penalties _________
4. 11 U.S.C. Sec. 503(b)(2)
Compensation and
_Reimbursements ________
A. Trustee - Compensation 4,274.87 4,274.87 0.00 427487
B. Trustee - Expense 8,628.23 8,628.23 0.00 862823
C. ACCOUNTANT FEES 750.00 750.00 750.00 0.00
D. AUCTIONEER EXPENSES 270.90 270.90 27090 0.00
E. AUCTIONEER FEES 687.50 687.50 687.50 0.00
F. TRUSTEE ATTORNEY 328.79 328.79 328.79 0.00
EXPENSES
G. TRUSTEE ATTORNEY 2,964.00 2,964.00 2,964.00 0.00
FEES
5. Court Special Charges (Excess 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Notiees) .
6. _L_IrlitEd_S_tale_s Ir_us_tt?_e_FSeE_ L 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
BkMko6

TOTALS: £21,362.97 $21,362.97 $8,459.87 $12,903.10
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" FOR ™7TE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEX! _

TLED
In Re: S BAN V}-WI PTCY COURT Case No: 95-10634 by
Kenneth D. Sirmons. {1y ey s TRICT OF T6XAS Chapter: 7
Debtor(s) MAY 10 1999 AN
P .M

RALKRUETCY COURT

P PRI
L e e o

3y
O {ouvIn_BILL OF CQURT COSTS

To:  Stephen Zayler
P.O. box 150743
Lufkin, TX 75915-0743

Notice is hereby given that court costs (and deferred adversary filing fees, if applicable) are due
and owing, pursuant to 28 USC Section 1930, in the above case in the amount of $0.00.

These costs are itemized as follows:

NOTICES
$.25 per notice in excess of 50 notices mailed prior to 1/1/87. $0.00
$.50 per notice for all notices mailed 1/1/87 and after. $0.00

NOTE: For Chapter 7 cases filed after 12/1/92, there will be NO NOTICE FEES.
(Do Not Bill for $.50 per notice)

NOTE: For ali other chapters filed after 1/1/98, there will be NO NOTICE FEES. (Do Not Bill for $.50 per notice)

PROCESSING CLAIMS 7
NOTE: Eliminated is the fee of $.25 for clerical processing of each ¢laim in excess of 10 in cases filed
under the Act or Code.

DEFERRED ADVERSARY FILING FEES
0 Chapter 7 Adversary Proceeding filed @ $120.00/150.00 each.
$0.00

NOTE: For all Adversary Proceedings filed after 12/18/96 the filing fee is $150.00.
TOTAL AMOUNT DUE $0.00

Check to be made payable to Clerk, U.S. Bankruptcy Court

Date: 5/10/99
JAMES D, TOKQPH
Clerk of Court

Ml AT d

Deputy Clerk

NOTE: For Chapter 11 Cases Only: Court costs are due on or before the confirmation hearing. The
Judge will confirm that these cases have been paid at the hearing.



SCHEDUILED
SECURED CLAIMS
Claim no. Amount Amount Not Amount Previously Due
Claimed Determined Allowed Paid
TOTALS $207,062.40 0.00 0.00 0.00
IDENTIFICATION OF SECURED PARTIES AFFECTED:

Claim No. Name of Creditor Claim No. Name of Creditor
1 FIRST NATIONAL BANK 2 FRANKLIN'S SPORTING GOODS
9 TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & MATERIALS 29 SILSBEE STATE BANK

CcO

35 BIG G DIRT SERVICE 43 SILSBEE STATE BANK



SCHEDULE E

PRIORITY CLAIMS OTHER THAN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES
IN THE FOLLOWING ORDER OF PRIORITY

(1) Amount (2) Amount (3) Amount {4) Duc
Claimed Allowed Paid

1. For Credit cxtended - Sec. 364(e)(1) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2. Claims from failure of adequale protection - 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

Sec. 307(a)(b)
3. "Gap Claims" - Sec. 507(a)(2) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4. Wages, etc. - Sec. 507(a)(3) 2,896.27 2,896.27 (.00 2,896.27
5. Contibutions to benefit plans - Sec. 507(a)4) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6.  Consumer deposits - Sec. 507(a)(6) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7. Taxes - Sec. 507(a)(7) 3,554.18 1,118.20 0.00 1,118.20
8. Other (No Basis): 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

TOTALS: $6,450.45 $4,014.47 $0.00 $4,014.47

SCHEDULE E
PARTIES AFFECTED:
Priority No. Name of Creditor Pricrity No. Name of Creditor

6 JOHN S. MOORE 8 MARTIN FIELDER
27 NATHAN L. GATES 33 COUNTY OF HARDIN
39 JEFFERSON COUNTY 45 JEFFERSON COUNTY
FILED UNSECURED CLAIMS TOTAL: 1,022,176.64 1,022,176.64 0.00 1,022,176.64
SUBORDINATED UNSECURED CLAIMS
TOTAL: 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00



e
EXITIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER
Case Number: 95-10634 Page t Date: Jung 15, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D. Claim Type Sequence
Cude # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
DAVID S TAMMINGA Admimistrative $0.00 $750.00 $750.00
025 CPA
AF 1403 TURTLE CREEK
LUFKIN, TX 75901
Subtotal For Claim Type AF ACCOUNTANT FEES $0.00 $750.00 $750.00
§ PAYNE & SONS WRECKER SERVICE _ Administrative § “$0.00 $640.00 "$640.00
025
AR
Subtotal For Claim Type AR ADMINISTRATIVE RENT 30.00 $640.00 S640.00
""""" HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC. Admmistratve ' 5000 512000 512000
025
AUE
HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC. Administrative $0.00 $150.00 $150.00
025
AUE
Subtotal For Claim Type AUE AUCTIONEER EXPENSES $0.00 $270.90 $270.90
TIORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC. _ Administrative — §0.00 555000 $550.00
025
ALF
HORN AUCTION COMPANY, INC. Administrative $0.00 $137.50 $137.50
025
AUF
Subtotal For Claim Type AUF AUCTIONEER FEES $0.00 $687.50 $687.50
EX] COUNTY OF HARDIN Pronty ~50.00 $3.334.74 $R98.76
061 C/0 MICHAEL REED
PTL P.0. BOX 26990
AUSTIN, TX 78755
0 TEFFERSON COUNTY Priority $0.00 $1.333.90 $0.00
000 C/0 CLAYTON E. MAYFIELD
PTL 1148 PARK STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701
3 TEFFERSON COUNTY Priority $0.00 $719.43 $219.44
061 C#O CLAYTON MAYFIELD
PTL 1148 PARK STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701
Subtotal For Claim Type PTL PRIORITY CLAIMS (TAX LIENS) $0.00 $4,888.08 $1,118.20
37 NATHANTI. GATES Prory $0.00 ~ $320.00  $32000
054 RT. 2, BOX 306A
PW BUNA, TX 77612
5 JOHN 5. MOORE Priority $0.00 $3432.07 $2,432.27
054 P. 0. BOX 501
PW EVADALE, TX 77615
g MARTIN FIELDER Prionity $0.00 $144.00 $144.00
054 730 S. 6TH STREET
PW SILSBEE, TX 77656
Subtotal For Claim Type PW PRIORITY WAGE $0.00 $2.896.27 $2,896.27
BARTLLTT, BAGGETT & SIANDS Administraive 3 $0.00 “$651.00 o $651.00
023




e b
EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER
Case Number: 95-10634 Page 2 Date: June 13, 199%
Debtor Name: Q|RMONQ, KENNETH D. Claim Type Sequencc
Code # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
HINSON'S ROOFING & HOME REPAIRS Administrative $0.00 $1,240.00 $1,240.00
023
REE
OLEN HICKS AIR CONDITIONING Administrative $0.00 $276.68 $276.68
023
REE
BARTLETT, BAGGETT & SHANDS Administrative $0.00 $651.00 $651.00
025
REE
Subtotal For Claim Type REE REAL ESTATE EXPENSE $0.00 $2,818.68 $2,818.68
T FIRST NATIONAL BANK Secured 30,00 ~ §4.733.59 — 5000
000 P. 0. BOX 727
SC PT. NECHES, TX 77651
2 FRANKLIN'S SPORTING GOODS Securcd $0.00 $271.53 $0.00
000 1700 DUPONT DRIVE
SC ORANGE, TX 77630
29 SILSBEE STATE BANK Secured $0.00 $95,640.11 $0.00
000 /O JAMES E. WIMBERLEY
S5C P. O. BOX 2307
PT. ARTHUR, TX 77643
33 BIG G DIRT SERVICE Secured 50.00 $990.00 $0.00
000 C/Q WILMA GUILVBEAUX
SC 4483 GUILBEAUX ROAD
LAKE CHARLES, LA 70611
43 SILSBEE STATE BANK Secured $0.00 $97,209.65 $0.00
000 C/O JIM WIMBERLEY
SC P. 0. BOX 2307
PT. ARTHUR, TX 77643
9 TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & Secured $0.00 $8,217.52 $0.00
050 MATERIALS CO.
SC P.O. BOX 5187
P.O. BOX 5187
BEAUMONT, TX 77736
Subtotal For Claim Type SC SECURED CLAIMS $0.00 §207,062.40 $0.00
STEPHEN J. ZAYLER — Admimistrative 50.00 932879 ~ $32879
(25 ATTORNEY AT LAW
TAE P.O. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
Subtotal For Claim Type TAE TRUSTEE ATTORNEY EXPENSES $0.00 $328.79 $328.79
“STEPHEN J. ZAYLER Admmstatve 5000 $2,964.00 $2,964.00
025 ATTORNEY AT LAW
TAF P. 0. BOX 130743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
Subtota! For Claim Type TAF TRUSTEE ATTORNEY FEES $0.00 $2,964.00 $2,964.00
ROUERT & VICKEY GRAY Unscoured - 50.00 $20,578.00 $20,578.00
070 C/O BIL RICHEY
uc 400 NECHES AT CROCKETT
BEAUMONT, TX 77701
3 CARDINAL SHEET METAL Unsecured $0.00 $3,424.70 $0.00
000 2003 TERRELL STREET

uc

BEAUMONT, TX 77701




— —
EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER
Case Number: 95-10634 Page 3 Date: June |5, 1999
Debtar Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH B. Claim Type Sequence
Code # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed

4 HAMILTON LUMBER CO., INC. Unsecured $0.00 $017.22 $0.00
000 KT 9, BOX 1370
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77713
5 BEAUMONT FIRE EXTINGUISHER Unsecured $0.00 $16.24 Sla.24
070 SERVICES
uc P. 0. BOX 3741

BEAUMONT, TX 77704
7 BEAUMONT ELECTRIC, INC. Unsecured 50.00 $2,029.10 $2,029.10
070 826 CHAMBERLIN DR.
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77707
9 TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE & Unsccured $0.00 $384.90 $384.90
070 MATERIALS CO
uc P.0.BOX 5187

BEAUMONT, TX 77736
10 LINDSEY WALKER Unsecured $0.00 $300.00 $300.00
070 2537 CALDER AVENUE
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77702
11 STEPHEN A. DORSHAW Unsecured $0.00 $525.00 $525.00
070 ATTORNEY AT LAW
uc 5177 RICHMOND AVE., SUITE 740

HOUSTON, TX 77056
I2 MASSEY, BALENTINE, EDWARDS & Unsecured $0.00 $2,611.65 $2,611.05
070 PSENCI
uc P. 0. BOX 2809

SAN ANGELO, TX 76902
13 O'NEILL EQUIPMENT Unsceurcd $0.00 $1,502.50 $1,502.50
070 P. 0. BOX 850627
uc HOUSTON, TX 77289-0627
14 LOUIS AND COMPANY Unsecured $0.00 $1,081.88 $1,081.88
070 P. 0. BOX 2253
uC BREA, CA 82622-2253
15 SILSBEE FARM & RANCH CENTER Unsccurcd $0.00 $558.15 $558.15
070 J01 SOUTH 3RD STREET
uc SILSBEE, TX 77656
16 CHEVRON CARWASH Unsecured $0.00 $545.00 $3545.00
070 1050 NORTH 5TH STREET
uc SILSBEE, TX 77656
17 CORNERSTONE MEDIA, INC. Unsceured $0.00 $3,655.20 $3,655.20
470 1640 N. MAIOR DRIVE
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77713
18 THE CADLE COMPANY Unsecured $0.00 $26,221 25 $26,221.25
070 4363 LA FRANCE STREET
uc NEWTON FALLS, O11 44444
19 BRITTON-CRAVENS LUIMBER CO., Unsecured $0.00 $344.82 $344.82
070 INC.
uc P. Q. BOX 307

SILSBEE, TX 77656
20 COBURN SUPPLY CQ., INC. Unsecured $0.00 $5,560.41 $5,560.41
470 P. OB OX 3437
uc BATON ROUGE, LA 70821
2! NATIONAL CONCRETE PRODUCTS Unsecured $0.00 $231.61 $231.61
070 P. 0. BOX 3070

BEAUMONT, TX 77704-3070




EXHIBIT A
ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER

Case Number: 95-10634 Papc 4 Date: June 135, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D. Claim Type Sequence
Code # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Noics Scheduled Claimed Allowed
22 TRI1 SUPPLY COMPANY Unsecured $0.00 $296.37 $296.37
070 P. 0. BOX 5548
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77726
23 CSC CREDIT SERVICE, INC Unsecured $0.00 S188.58 $0.00
000 P. 0. BOX 200620
uc HOUSTON, TX 77721-6062
24 MOORE SUPPLY COMPANY Unsecured $0.00 $2,910.52 $2,910.52
070 P. 0. BOX 448
uc CONROE, TX 77308
25 JAMES B. BUTT.ER Unsecured $0.00 $778.56 $0.00
000 306 FORST HILLS LANE
uc SILSBEE, TX 77636
26 CHEVRON USA PRODUCTS COMPANY  Unsecured $0.00 5146.46 §146.46
070 P. 0. BOX 5010, SECT. 230, RM. 1180
ucC CONCORD, CA 94524
28 COKER'S DOORS & MOULDING CO.,,  Unsecured $0.00 $3,331.86 $3,331.86
070 INC.
uc 4116 NORTH TWIN CITY HWY.
NEDERLAND, TX 77627
30 WELLER, GREEN, McGOWN & 'TOUPS, Unsecured $0.00 $32,822.88 $32,822.88
070 LLP
UC P. 0. BOX 350
BEUAMONT, TX 77704-0350
31 STAR GRAPHICS Unsecured $0.00 $33.08 $0.00
000 P. OB OX 5483
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77726
32 SCALLON CONTROLS, INC. Unsecured $0.00 §7,108.92 $0.00
000 P. 0. BOX 5005
uc BEAUMONT, TX 77726
33 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL Unsecured $0.00 $109.00 $109.00
070 RELATED
uc C/O BECKET & WATKINS

P. 0. BOX 300l DEPT. U
MALVERN, PA 19355-0701

16 WOODARD CARPET, INC. Unsccured $0.00 $7,272.00 $7,272.00
070 2390 N. MAIN
uC VIDOR, TX 77662
37 MATTHEWS & JANET SMITH Unsecured $0.00 £250,000.00 $0.00
000 /0 THOMAS P. ROEBUCK, JR.
uc 1240 ORLEANS STREET

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
I8 FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF NEWTON  Unsecured $0.00 $628,730.39 $628,730.39
070 /0 ORGAN, BELL & TUCKER
uc 470 ORLEANS

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
40 RITTER LUMBER, INC. Unsceured $0.00 $7,541.23 $7,541.23
070 P.C. BOX 1265
uc NEDERLAND, TX 77627
41 MATTHEWS & JANICE SMITH Unsecured $0.00 $171,900.00 $171,900.00
070 C/0O THOMAS P. ROEBUCK, JR.
uc 1240 ORLEANS STREET

BEAUMONT, TX 77701
42 FRANKLIN SPORTING GOODS Unsecured $0.00 $275.60 §275.60
070 1706 DUPONT DR.

uc ORANGE, TX 77662




EXHIBIT A

ANALYSIS OF CLAIMS REGISTER

Case Number: 95-10634
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D.

Page 5
Claim Type Sequence

Date; June 15, 1999

Codc # Creditor Name & Address Claim Class Notes Scheduled Claimed Allowed
44 SILSBEE STATE BANK Unsecurcd $0.00 $95.640.11 £95,640.11
070 C/0O JIM WIMBERLEY
ucC P. Q. BOX 2307
PT. ARTHUR, TX 77643
46 BANK ONE TEXAS, NA. Unsecured $0.00 $5,054.51 $5,054.51
070 (/0 FLIZABETH B. HOLLINS
uc P. Q. DRAWER 2001
LAKE CHARLES, LA 70602-2001
Subtotal For Claim Type UC UNSCCURED CLAIMS $0.00 $1,284,627.70 $1,022,176.64
Case Totals: $0.00 $1,507,934.32 $1,034,650.98

Code #: Trustee's Claim Number, Priority Code, Claim Type



IN RE:

SIRMONS, KENNETH D.

DEBTOR(S)

" “a——

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
)
) CASE NO. 95-10634
)
) CHAPTER 7
)

TRUSTEE’S REPORT OF
PROPOSED FINAL DISTRIBUTIONS

The undersigned trustee of the estate hereby submits to the Court and to the United States Trustee
this Report of Proposed Final Distributions.

1. The Court has entered orders which have become final, and which dispose of all objections to
claims, all objections to the trustee’s Final Report, all applications for compensation, and all other matters
which must be determined by the Court before final distribution can be made.

2. The trustee proposes to make final distribution of the funds of the estate as follows, and will
make such distribution unless wrilten objection thereto is made, filed and served on the trustee and on the
United States trustee.

1.

(O8]

BALANCE ON HAND
ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES TO BE PAID * (note)
SECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)

PRIORITY CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)

. UNSECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * (note)

OTHER DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE PAID * (note)

. TOTAL DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE

(Sum of lines 2 through 6)

ZERQ BALANCE AFTER ALL DISTRIBUTIONS
(Line 1 less line 7)

* (See attached schedule of payees and amounts)

$18,338.88
$12,903.10
$0.00
$4,293.09
$1,142.69
$0.00

$18,338.88

$0.00

(Trustee}

Stephen J. Zayler



PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

~—— '
Case Number: 95-10634 Page 1 Date: June 15, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KEXNETH 1.
Claim#  Payee Name Cluss  Priority Amount Paid to Date Claim Balance Proposed Pymt  Funds Remaining
Beginning Balance $18,338.88
Stephen J. Zayler - Fees Admin $4,274 87 $0.00 $4,274.87 84,274.87 $14,064.01
COMPENSATION
Stephen J. Zayler - Exp Admin $8,628.23 $0.00 $8,628.23 $8,628.23 $5,435.78
EXPENSES
DAVID S. TAMMINGA Admin 025 $750.00 §750.00¢ $0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78
CPA
1403 TURTLE CREEK
LUFKIN, TX 75901
STEPHEN J. ZAYLER Admin 025 $2,964.00 $2,964.00 $0.00 $0.00 §5,435.78
ATTORNEY AT LAW
P. Q. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
STEPHEN J. ZAYLER Admin 025 §328.79 $328.79 £0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78
ATTORNEY AT LAW
P. Q. BOX 150743
LUFKIN, TX 75915-0743
PAYNE & SONS WRECKER Admin 025 $640.00 $640.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5435.78
SERVICE
HORN AUCTION COMPANY,  Admin 025 $550.00 $550.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,43578
INC.
HORN AUCTION COMPANY,  Admin 025 $120.90 $120.90 $0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78
INC.
HORN AUCTION COMPANY,  Admin 025 $150.00 $150.00 $0.00 £0.00 $5,435.78
INC.
HORN AUCTION COMPANY,  Admmn 023 $137.50 $137.50 $0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78
INC.
BARTLETT, BAGGETT & Admin 025 $651.00 $651.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78
SHANDS
HINSON'S ROOFING & HOML  Admin 025 $1,240.00 $1,240.00 $0.00 £0.00 $5,435.78
REPAIRS
QLEN HICKS AIR Admin 025 $276.68 $276.68 $0.00 $6.00 $5,435.78
CONDITIONING
BARTLETT, BAGGETT & Admin 025 $651.00 $651.00 $0.00 $0.00 $5,435.78

SHANDS




PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

— -
Case Number: 93-10634 Page 2 Date: June 15, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D.
Claim#  Payee Name Class  Prionty Amount Paid to Date Claim Balance Proposcd Pymt  Funds Remaining
27 NATHAN L. GATES Priority 054 $320.00 $0.00 $320.00 $320.00
RT. 2, BOX 306A
BUNA, TX 77612
Medicare Tax - Estate £0.00 $4.64
Federal Income Tax $0.00 $32.00
Social Security -Employee $0.00 $19.84
Social Security - Estate $0.00 $19.84
Medicare Tax - Employee $0.00 $4.04
Federal Unemployment Tax $0.00 $2.56
State Unemployment Tax $0.00 $3.74
Net for claim 27 so00~ T 526352 $5.172.26
6 JOHN §. MOORE Priority 054 $2,432.27 $0.00 $2,432.27 $2,432.27
P. 0. BOX 501
EVADALL, TX 77615
Medicare Tax - Estate $0.00 $35.27
Federal Income Tax $0.00 $243.23
Social Security -Employee $0.00 $150.80
Social Security - Estate $0.00 §150.80
Medicare Tax - Employce $0.00 $35.27
Federal Unemployment Tax $0.00 $19.46
State Unemployment Tax $0.00 $28.46
Net for claim 6 —s00 $2,00297 $3,169.29
8 MARTIN FIELDER Priority 054 $144.00 $0.00 $144.00 $144.00
730 8. 6TH STREET
SILSBEE, TX 77656
Medicare Tax - Estate $0.00 $2.09
Federal Income Tax $0.00 $14.40
Social Security -Employce $0.00 $8.93
Social Security - Estate 50.00 $8.03
Medicare Tax - Employee 50.00 $2.09
Federal Unemployment Tax £0.00 $1.15
State Unemployment Tax £0.00 $1.68
Netforclaim8 $0.00 o $118.58 $3,050.71
Auto INTERNAL REVENUE Priority 054 $42.00 $0.00 $42.00 $42.00 $3,008.71
SERVICE
P. 0. BOX §70013
ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013
Auta INTERNAL REVENUE Priority 054 $289.63 $0.00 $289.63 $289.63 $2,719.08
SERVICE

P. 0. BOX 970013




PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Case Number: 95-10634
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D.

Page 3

Date: June 15, 1999

Claim #

Payee Name

Class

Priority

Amount

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

Proposed Pymt

Funds Remaining

Auto

Auto

Auto

Auto

Auto

33

(7S

-3

ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013

INTERNAL REVENUE
SERVICE

P. 0. BOX 970013

ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013

TEXAS WORKFORCE
COMMISSION

P. 0. BOX 149037
AUSTIN, TX 78714-9037

INTERNAL REVENUE
SERVICE

P. 0. BOX 970013

ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013

INTERNAL REVENUE
SERVICE

B. 0. BOX 670013

ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013

INTERNAL REVENUE
SERVICE

P. 0. BOX 970013

ST. LOUIS, MO 63197-0013

COUNTY OF HARDIN
C/O0 MICHAEL REED
P. 0. BOX 26950
AUSTIN, TX 78755

JEFFERSON COUNTY

C/O CLAYTON MAYFIELD
1148 PARK STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

ROBERT & VICKEY GRAY
C/0 BIL RICHEY

400 NECHES AT CROCKETT
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

BEAUMONT FIRE
EXTINGUISHER SERVICES
P. O. BOX 3741
BEAUMONT, TX 77704

BEAUMONT ELECTRIC, INC.

826 CHAMBERLIN DR.

Priority

Priority

Priority

Priority

Priority

Pricrity

Priority

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

054

055

035

053

053

06l

061

070

070

070

$179.57

$313.88

$23.17

$179.57

$42.00

$898.76

$219.44

$20,378.00

$16.24

$2,029.10

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$179.57

$33.88

$23.17

$179.57

$42.00

$898.76

$219.44

$20,578.00

$16.24

$2,029.10

$179.57

$33.88

$23.17

$179.57

§42.00

S898.76

$219.44

$23.00

$0.02

$2.27

$2,539.51

$2,505.63

$2,482.46

$2,302.89

$2,260.89

$1,362.13

$1,142.65

$1,119.69

S1,119.67

$1,117.40




PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Case Number: 95-10634 Page 4 Date: June 13, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETIT D.

Claim#  Payce Name Class  Priority Amount Paid to Date Claim Balance Proposed Pymt  Funds Remaining

BEAUMONT, TX 77707

9 TRANSIT MIX CONCRETE &  Unsec 070 $384.90 $0.00 $384.90 $0.43 $1,116.97
MATERIALS CO
P. 0. BOX 5187
BEAUMONT, TX 77736

10 LINDSEY WALKER Unsec 070 $300.00 50.00 $300.00 $0.34 $1,116.63
2537 CALDER AVENUE
BEAUMONT, TX 77702

11 STEPHEN A. DORSHAW Unsec 070 $525.00 $0.00 $525.00 5059 §1,116.04
ATTORNLY AT LAW
5177 RICHMOND AVE,, SUITE
740
HOUSTON, TX 77056

12 MASSEY, BALENTINE, Unsec 070 $2,611.65 $0.00 $2,611.65 $2.92 $1,113.12
EDWARDS & PSENCI
P. 0. BOX 2809
SAN ANGELO, TX 76902

13 O'NEILL EQUIPMENT Unsec 070 $1,502.50 $0.00 $1,502.50 $1.68 81,111.44
P. 0. BOX 890627
HOUSTON, TX 77289-0627

14 LOUIS AND COMPANY Unsec 070 $1,081.88 $0.00 $1,081.88 $1.21 $1,110.23
P. 0. BOX 2253
BREA, CA 82622-2253

SILSBEE FARM & RANCH Unsec 070 $558.15 $0.00 §558.15 §0.62 $1,109.61
CENTER

101 SOUTH 3RD STREET

SILSBEE, TX 77636

n

16 CHEVRON CARWASH Unsec 070 §545.00 $0.00 $545.00 $0.61 £1,109.00
1050 NORT1I 5TH STREET
SILSBEE, TX 77656

17 CORNERSTONE MEDIA, INC.  Unsce 070 $3,655.20 $0.00 $3,655.20 $4.00 $1,104.91
1640 N. MAJOR DRIVE
BEAUMONT, TX 77713

18 THE CADLE COMPANY Unsec 070 $26,221.25 $0.00 $26,221.25 £29.31 $1,075.60
4363 LA FRANCE STREET
NEWTON FALLS, OH 44444




PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Case Number: 93-10634 Page 5 Date: June 15, 1999
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D.

Claim#  Payee Name Class  Priority Amount Paid o Date Claim Balance Proposed Pymt  Funds Remaining

19 BRITTON-CRAVENS LUMBER  Unsec 070 $344.82 $0.00 $344.82 $0.39 $1,075.21
CO., INC.
P. 0. BOX 307
SILSBEE, TX 77636

20 COBURN SUPPLY CO., INC. Unsee 070 $5,560.41 $0.00 $35,560.41 $6.22 $1,008.99
P. O.B OX 3437
BATON ROUGE, LA 70821

21 NATIONAL CONCRETL Unsec 070 §231.61 $0.00 $231.61 $0.26 $1,008.73
PRODUCTS
P. 0. BOX 3070
BEAUMONT, TX 77704-3070

n TRI SUPPLY COMPANY Unsec 070 $296.37 $0.00 $296.37 $0.33 $1,068.40
P. 0. BOX 5548
BEAUMONT, TX 77726

24 MOORE SUPPLY COMPANY Unsce 070 $2,910.52 $0.00 $2,910.52 $3.25 $1,065.15
P. 0. BOX 448
CONROL, TX 77303

26 CHEVRON USA PRODUCTS Unsec 070 $146.46 $0.00 5146 46 $0.16 $1,064.99
COMPANY
P. 0. BOX 5010, SECT. 230, RM.
1180
CONCORD, A 94524

28 COKER'S DOORS & Unsec 070 $3,331.86 $0.00 $3,331.86 3372 §1,061.27
MOULDING CO., INC.
4116 NORTH TWIN CITY HWY,
NEDERLAND, TX 77627

30 WELLER, GRELN, McGOWN & Unsec 070 $32,822.88 £0.00 §32,822.88 $36.69 $1,024.58
TOUPS, LLP
P. 0. BOX 350
BEUAMONT, TX 77704-0350

34 AMERICAN EXPRESS TRAVEL Unsec 070 $109.00 $0.00 $109.00 $0.12 $1,024.46
RELATED
C/Q BECKET & WATKINS
P. 0. BOX 3001 DEPT. U
MALVERN, PA 19355-0701

36 WOODARD CARPET, INC. Unsec 070 $7,272.00 $0.00 §7,272.00 $8.13 $1,016.33
2390 N. MAIN
VIDOR, TX 77662




PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Case Number: 35-10634
Debtor Name: SIRMONS, KENNETH D.

Page 6

Date: June 15, 1999

Claim#  Payee Name

Class

Priority

Ameount

Paid to Date

Claim Balance

Proposed Pymi

Funds Remaining

33 FIRST NATIONAL BANK OF
NEWTON
C/O ORGAN, BELL & TUCKER
470 ORLEANS
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

40 RITTER LUMBER, INC.
P. O BOX 1265
NEDERLAND, TX 77627

41 MATTHEWS & JANICE SMITH
C/0 THOMAS P. ROEBUCK, JR.
1240 ORLEANS STREET
BEAUMONT, TX 77701

42 FRANKLIN SPORTING GOODS
1706 DUPONT DR,
ORANGE, TX 77662

44 SILSBEE STATE BANK
C/O JIM WIMBERLEY
P. 0. BOX 2307
PT. ARTHUR, TX 77643

46 BANK ONE TEXAS, N.A.
C/O ELIZABETH B. HOLLINS
P. O. DRAWER 2001
LAKE CHARLES, LA
70602-2001

Unsec

Unsec

Unsce

Unsec

Unsec

Unsec

070

070

070

070

070

070

3628,730.30

$7,541.23

$171,900.00

$275.60

$95,640.11

$5,054.51

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

50.00

$0.00

$628,730.39

§7,541.23

$171,900.00

$275.60

$95,640.11

$5,054.51

$702.86

$8.43

$192.17

$0.31

$106.92

$5.04

$313.47

$305.04

5112.87

$112.56

$5.64

$0.00

<< Totals >>

$1,047,832.70

58,459.87

$1,039,372.33

$18,338.88

$0.00

Proposed distribution is dependent on the Court's rulings on administrative expenses, contest of claims, and/or objections made ta this

proposed distribution,



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

BEAUMONT DIVISION
IN RE: )
SIRMONS, KENNETH D. ) CASE NO. 95-10634
)
) CHAPTER7?
DEBTOR(S) )

ORDER ALLLOWING TRUSTEE'S FINAL APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION
AND APPROVING TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

ON THIS DAY came on for consideration the Trustee's Final Report filed by Stephen J.
Zayler, the duly appointed Chapter 7 Trustee. The Court finds that notice of this hearing has
been given as required by the Bankruptcy Rules. Upon due consideration, the Court finds that
cause exists which justifies the entry of the following order:

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee's final application for
compensation in the amount of $4,274.87 and for reimbursement of expenses in the amount
$8,628.23 is Granted.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Trustec's Final Report is approved as submitted
by the Chapter 7 Trustee, including approval of the payment of the following fees and charges
assessed against the Estate under Chapter 123 of title 28 of the United States Code.

FEES/CHARGES PROPOSED PAYMENT
Clerk Noticing/Claim Fees $0.00
Unpaid Adversary Filing Fees $0.00
Unpatd Quarterly Fees $0.00

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that the Chapter 7 Trustee shall make final distribution of
the amounts set forth in the Trustee's Final Report as approved by this Court and shall file a
Supplemental Final Report and Account together with such bank staternents as are necessary {o
document a zero balance in all Estate accounts, following compliance with Section 347(a) of the
Bankrupicy Code and Bankruptey Rule 3011, if applicable.

SIGNED this the day of , 1999.

BANKRUPTCY JUDGE



