

**TIME AND BILLING  
TIME REPORT**

Case No.: 09-10064-BP-7  
Case Name: WARREN, DEBBIE L.

Trustee Name  
Daniel Jacob Goldberg

PROFESSIONAL	DATE	RATE	TIME SPENT (hours)	TOTAL	BILLABLE TIME (hours)	BILLABLE TOTAL	BILLING STATUS
<b>Firm Name: Daniel Jacob Goldberg, Trustee</b>							
<b>Project Category :</b>							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	07/30/2009	\$350.00	0.40	\$140.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Review correspondence from Whitney LaRoche on lot listed for sale and reply.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	08/12/2009	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Correspondence to D. Packard on purchase of lot.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	10/14/2009	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Call from Brandon Steffie on settlement of Vioxx case and procedure for court approval.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	10/30/2009	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Receive settlement funds from Vioxx settlement							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	04/13/2010	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Receipt of funds from Provost Umphrey and correspondence to Kaiser on distributin of funds and amount owed special counsel.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	04/13/2010	\$350.00	0.40	\$140.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Review of claims.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	06/14/2010	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Review tax returns and file with IRS with request for early consideration.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	08/02/2010	\$350.00	0.40	\$140.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Provide property descriptions and informrrrmation to Susan Horn.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	08/09/2010	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Conerence with Susan Horn on sale of lot for \$1,100.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	08/19/2010	\$350.00	0.10	\$35.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Review Notice from IRS on acceptance of tax return.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	11/17/2010	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Correspondence to B. West on filing fee application.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	02/07/2011	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Review Notice from IRS on acceptance of tax return as filed.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	03/18/2011	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Draft correspondence to D. Packard for turnover of non-exempt funds.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	06/13/2011	\$350.00	0.50	\$175.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Conference with Kristi and Bonnie on recalculation of proposed final distribution of funds per TFR.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg	06/13/2011	\$350.00	0.30	\$105.00	0.00	\$0.00	Non Billable
Description: Conference with Bonnie Cone on claim distribution analysis and review revised analysis for TFR.							
Daniel Jacob Goldberg Non billable hours = 4.80 hours at \$350.00 per hour = \$1,680.00							
<b>Project Category Total:</b>			<b>4.80</b>			<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>Firm Name Daniel Jacob Goldberg, Trustee Total:</b>			<b>4.80</b>			<b>\$0.00</b>	