

Exhibit of Trustee's Time

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Period: 01/01/00 - 06/14/10

Case No: 05-60264

Case Name: Stanaland, Vernis J.

Petition Date: 02/07/05

Case Type: Assets

Judge: Bill Parker

341a Meeting: 03/07/05 10:15AM

Staff Name	Category	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total		
Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee	A - ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY	07/05/05	through 1/11/2010: numerous e-mails to and from Scott Ritcheson (attorney for Trustee), Debtor Vernis Stanaland, Debtor's attorney Bill Sheehy, and other parties relating to several adversaries and related discovery, prosecution and settlement of same, review of documents and proposed pleadings, strategy, and related matters	5.00		0.00		
		07/05/05	through 1/11/2010: numerous telephone calls to and from Scott Ritcheson (attorney for Trustee), Debtor Vernis Stanaland, Debtor's attorney Bill Sheehy, and other parties relating to several adversaries and related settlements	5.00		0.00		
		12/22/05	Receipt and review of information relating to mineral assets; prepare letter to Bill Sheehy requesting information on same	0.40		0.00		
		01/07/06	Receipt and review of information from Debtor regarding minerals interests and possibility of re-purchase from estate	0.30		0.00		
		01/11/06	Receipt and review information on Plains Marketing mineral interest; execute division order and return same	0.20		0.00		
		01/22/06	Receipt and review of additional information from Debtors regarding bank accounts	0.20		0.00		
					11.10		\$0.00	
			AD - ASSET DISPOSITION	01/30/06	Work on Motion to Sell Assets	0.20		0.00
				02/22/06	Receipt and review of proposed settlement documents from Scott Ritcheson; execute and return same	0.60		0.00
				03/27/06	Receipt and review of proposed settlement documents from Scott Ritcheson; execute and return of same	0.50		0.00
				05/31/06	Receipt and review of various settlement documents from Scott Ritcheson	0.60		0.00
				02/01/07	Receipt and review of documents regarding tolling agreement with Geaux	0.50		0.00
				04/12/07	Receipt and review of settlement documents with Lowery	0.50		0.00
		11/18/07	Receipt and review of settlement documents from Scott Ritcheson; execute and return of same	0.60		0.00		
			3.50		\$0.00			
	CA - CASE ADMINISTRATION	06/14/10	Review of Trustee's Final Report and attached schedules; anticipated time for review of Trustee's Distribution Report and attached schedules	2.00		0.00		

Exhibit of Trustee's Time

Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Period: 01/01/00 - 06/14/10

Case No: 05-60264

Case Name: Stanaland, Vernis J.

Petition Date: 02/07/05

Case Type: Assets

Judge: Bill Parker

341a Meeting: 03/07/05 10:15AM

Staff Name	Category	Date	Description	Hours	Rate	Total
Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee	FA - FEE/EMPLOYMENT APPLICATIONS	04/06/05	Receipt and review of proposed Employment Contract from Scott Ritcheson	0.30		0.00
		03/05/05	Review petition and schedules in preparation for 341 meeting	0.50		0.00
		03/07/05	Conduct 341 meeting	0.80		0.00
				1.30		\$0.00
	TX - TAX ISSUES	08/29/07	Review 2006 tax return and related documents, and sign tax return for filing	0.40		0.00
		10/15/08	Review 2007 tax return and related documents, and sign tax return for filing	0.40		0.00
		03/17/09	Review tax return and related documents, and sign tax return and PDR for filing	0.40		0.00
		03/19/09	Review 2008 tax return and related documents, and sign tax return for filing	0.40		0.00
		03/17/10	Receipt and review of tax return; e-mails regarding tax treatment of settlement from fraudulent transfer	0.50		0.00
		04/29/10	Telephone conference with Bob Rogers regarding taxability of settlement proceeds	0.20		0.00
		05/12/10	Review and sign tax returns for 2009 and final short year return for 2010	0.50		0.00
		05/12/10	Review 2009 tax return and related documents, and sign tax return for filing	0.40		0.00
	05/14/10	Review 2010 tax return and related documents, and sign tax return for filing	0.40		0.00	
				3.60		\$0.00
	Subtotal for Staff Name: BOB ANDERSON, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE				21.80	
Total for Case: 05-60264				21.80		\$0.00
Total for Trustee: Bob Anderson				21.80		\$0.00

Grand Total:	21.80	\$0.00
---------------------	--------------	---------------