
Trustee:  Bob Anderson  (631490)
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02-63369 09/03/02Allred & Pyron Investments, L.L.C.
Bill Parker 03/07/03    09:00AMAssetsCase Type:

Case Name:
Judge:

Detail of Trustee's TimePrinted:  04/21/10 02:47 PM

Period:  01/01/00 - 04/21/10

Hours Rate TotalDescriptionStaff Name Category
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Date
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of property (.20);
Telephone conference with Susan Diamond with Smith County Title (.20)

0.40 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

A - ASSET ANALYSIS
AND RECOVERY

12/04/02

Telephone conference with Ben Robertson, Smith County Title, and lengthy
discussion regarding various title problems (.50); Telephone conference with
Tom Bradford regarding title problems (.20); Telephone conference with Ben
Robertson regarding title problems (.20)

0.90 0.0001/07/03

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford and Mike McNally regarding Lot 20 0.40 0.0001/09/03
Telephone conferences with Tom Bradford (3 calls) (.30); Telephone
conference with Ben Robertson (.20), all regarding Lot 20

0.50 0.0001/24/03

Telephone conference with Matt Hickman regarding Highway 271 property 0.20 0.0002/11/03
Telephone conference with Jamie at Smith County Abstract 0.30 0.0002/11/03
Telephone conference with Andy Guinn, realtor (.20); Letter to Andy Guinn
sending schedules and other information (.20)

0.40 0.0003/11/03

Receipt and review proposed real estate listings, revisions, review of legal
descriptions

0.60 0.0003/27/03

Office conference with Billy Pyron (.80); Letter to Louie Allred (.20) 1.00 0.0003/28/03
Review documents for basis; Office conference with Louie Allred; Telephone
conference with Louie Allred

0.70 0.0004/10/03

Review of file regarding contracts for deeds with various payors 0.50 0.0005/13/03
Telephone conference with Buyers and Rick Randall regarding title issues
(.20); Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding title issues (.20);
Review of objections and orders via Pacer as they relate to title issues (.20)

0.60 0.0007/15/03

Review of Contracts for Deeds (multiple files) 0.30 0.0008/06/03
Office conference with Billy Pyron regarding title problems 1.00 0.0009/10/03
Office conference with Louie Allred regarding title problems 1.00 0.0009/10/03
Letter to Billy Pyron regarding title problems 0.20 0.0009/10/03
Review of judgment in Sandra Pyron v. Billy Pyron (.20); Review of title
commitment and liens on realty (.30)

0.50 0.0005/26/04

Review of voluminous documents and work on calculation of note balances on
contracts for deeds from poor records provided by Debtor

1.00 0.0011/29/04

Review and organization of land inventory 1.00 0.0012/06/04
Telephone conference with Nicole Horn regarding lot 0.20 0.0002/04/05
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Date
Telephone conference with lienholder 0.20 0.00Bob Anderson,

Chapter 7 Trustee
A - ASSET ANALYSIS
AND RECOVERY

02/04/05

Review of documents on notes receivable and property description 0.50 0.0002/04/05
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of land 0.10 0.0004/26/05
Preparation of revisions to Listing Agreement with Mark Whatley; Letter to
Mark Whatley regarding same

0.40 0.0007/15/05

12.90 $0.00

Telephone conference with Louis Allred (.10); Letter to title companies (.20) 0.30 0.00AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

11/25/02

Telephone conference with Auben Shuttle 0.20 0.0001/21/03
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding abandonment of lot 0.10 0.0001/27/03
Attend closing on Lots 105 and 210 at Smith County Title 1.00 0.0002/12/03
Office conference with Billy Pyron; Review Contract; Letter to Sheehy et al
regarding proposed Contract

1.00 0.0004/14/03

Telephone conferences (2) with Billy Pyron's office 0.20 0.0004/17/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots 0.30 0.0004/22/03
Telephone conference with Andy Guinn, realtor 0.20 0.0004/23/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding lots for sale 0.20 0.0004/29/03
Review various "Contracts for Deeds," liens and other documents; Telephone
conference with Jolene Rogers and letter to Oscar Bonilla regarding title issues

1.50 0.0005/15/03

Telephone conference with Jolene Rogers regarding sale of land (.20);
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.20)

0.40 0.0005/19/03

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding Sandra Pyron's objection to
sale

0.30 0.0005/23/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots (.20); Telephone
conference with Smith County Abstract regarding sale of lots (.20)

0.40 0.0006/09/03

Telephone conference with Pat Wood with Pirtle Realty (.20); Telephone
conference with Tom Bradford regarding purchase of lots (.20); Receipt and
review of title commitment (.20); Telephone conference with Title Company
(.10)

0.70 0.0006/27/03

Telephone conference with Kyle Smith, realtor (.20); Letter to Allred and Pyron 0.80 0.0007/01/03
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regarding sale of property (.20); Letter to Greater Southern, buyer of realty
(.20); Letter to Title Company (.20)

Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

Telephone conference with  Ben Robertson regarding title issues (.30);
Telephone conference with Pat Wood, realtor (.10); Telephone conference with
Billy Pyron regarding sale of realty (.10); Telephone conference with Tom
Bradford regarding sale of realty (.10)

0.60 0.0007/01/03

Telephone conference with Jolene Rogers regarding sale of Highway 14
property

0.20 0.0007/08/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of realty (.20);
Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding sale of realty (.20)

0.40 0.0007/14/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of tracts (.10);
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of tracts (.10);
Telephone conference with Pat Wood regarding sale of tracts (.20); Telephone
conference with R. Randall regarding sale of tracts (.20)

0.60 0.0007/17/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of property 0.20 0.0007/28/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding balances / defaults on
Contract for Deeds

0.30 0.0008/05/03

Letter to County Clerk of Smith County sending Partial Release of Lis Pendens
for recording

0.10 0.0008/08/03

Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding title issues (.20);
Telephone conference with Aubyn Shettle regarding title issues (.20);
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding title issues (.10)

0.50 0.0008/12/03

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots (.10);
Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding sale of land (.20);
Telephone conference with Louie Allred (.10)

0.40 0.0008/20/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots 0.20 0.0008/29/03
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of land 0.10 0.0009/08/03
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots and Contracts
for Deeds (.20); Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale (.10)

0.30 0.0009/22/03

Telephone conference with Rick Randall lregarding sale of land 0.20 0.0009/24/03
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots 0.20 0.0010/02/03
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regaridng sale of lots 0.20 0.0010/03/03
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Date
Receipt and review of letter from Greater Southern and preparation of reply
letter (1.00); Telephone conference with Mike McNally regarding First National
Bank of Winnsboro's collateral (.30)

1.30 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

10/07/03

Review Contract with Greater Southern and other documents; Additional work
on reply letter to Greater Southern regarding demand to close

1.50 0.0010/08/03

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron 0.10 0.0010/20/03
Additional work on letter agreement to Greater Southern for sale of realty 0.40 0.0010/21/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding land sale (.20); Fax to Louie
Allred regarding land sale (.10)

0.30 0.0010/23/03

Letter to Greater Southern regarding land sale 0.20 0.0010/23/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.10); Telephone
conference with Kyle Smith regarding sale of land (.10); Review of Contract
with Greater Southern (.20)

0.40 0.0012/01/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.10); Telephone
conference with Kyle Smith regarding sale of land (.10); Telephone conference
with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.10)

0.30 0.0012/03/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding land sale (.10); Telephone
conference with R. Randall regarding land sale (.10); Telephone conference
with Tom Bradford regarding land sale (.10)

0.30 0.0012/09/03

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford 0.20 0.0001/05/04
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots 0.20 0.0001/12/04
Telephone conference with Dick Capps and Louie Allred regarding sale of land 0.30 0.0002/06/04
Telephone conference with Beverly Hefner regarding lien 0.20 0.0002/10/04
Telephone conference with Howard Britain regarding Oscar Bonilla's Contract
for Deed

0.20 0.0002/10/04

Letter to Howard Britain regarding lot conveyed to Bonilla 0.30 0.0002/12/04
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of realty (.20); Telephone
conference with Doug at Lindalea Realty regarding sale of realty (.20);
Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding sale of realty (.10)

0.50 0.0003/12/04

Receipt and review of title commitment 0.20 0.0003/15/04
Letter to Title Company regarding I-20 property (.20); Letter to Mike McNally
regarding I-20 property (.20)

0.40 0.0003/16/04
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Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of land (.20); Telephone
conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.10)

0.30 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

04/07/04

Telephone conferences (2) with Louie Allred 0.20 0.0004/14/04
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land (.20); Telephone
conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of land (.20)

0.40 0.0004/16/04

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots 0.10 0.0004/28/04
Office conference with Tom Bradford regarding negotiations for sale of lots,
promissory notes

1.50 0.0004/30/04

Telephone conference with Andy Guinn, realtor (.20); Telephone conference
with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots (.10); Review of plats in connection with
sale of lots (.20)

0.50 0.0005/03/04

Meeting with Andy Guinn, realtor 0.50 0.0005/06/04
Telephone conference with Mike McNally to resolve issues set for hearing on
Motion to Sell

0.20 0.0006/30/04

Telephone conference with Smith County Title regarding I-20 land (.10);
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding I-20 land (.10)

0.20 0.0007/07/04

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots (.20); Letter to
Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots (.20)

0.40 0.0007/15/04

Telephone conference with Ben Robertson regarding closing on I-20 property
(.20); Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding closing on I-20 property
(.20)

0.40 0.0007/28/04

Office conference with Jessica Munoz and Luz Loya regarding purchase of lots 0.30 0.0008/04/04
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots (.20); Letter to
Ric Freeman regarding sale of lots (.20)

0.40 0.0008/06/04

Telephone conference with Gillian office regarding Lots 14 et al 0.20 0.0008/16/04
Letter to Andy Guinn, Realtor, regarding expiration of listing agreement and
desire of principals of Debtor to market themselves

0.10 0.0011/17/04

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding land sales 0.10 0.0011/18/04
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding land sales 0.10 0.0011/18/04
Telephone conferences with realtor Andy Guinn regarding land sales 0.30 0.0011/18/04
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding land sales 0.20 0.0011/19/04
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding land sales 0.10 0.0011/19/04
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Date
Receipt and review of title commitment from Gillen & Anderson on Lots 48, 49
and 91 of Harry Albertson

0.40 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

11/22/04

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron and Louie Allred regarding sale of
Highway 271

0.30 0.0011/24/04

Receipt, review and sign HUD-1 closing statement for sale of Lots 48, 49 and
91

0.20 0.0011/29/04

Review Contracts for Deeds and telephone conference with Louie Allred
regarding same

0.30 0.0011/30/04

Telephone conference with Nichole Horn, payer under Contract for Deed,
regarding payment history, balance under Contract

0.30 0.0012/02/04

Receipt, review, and execution of Cancellation of Earnest Money Contract from
Smith County Title Company

0.20 0.0012/06/04

Receipt and review of ad valorem tax information on lots under Contract for
Deeds

0.30 0.0012/06/04

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding ad valorem taxes 0.30 0.0012/07/04
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding land sales 0.20 0.0001/26/05
Letter to Smith County Title Company regarding updated commitment on 393
acre tract, with copy to Pyron regarding earnest money

0.20 0.0001/26/05

Telephone conferences with Gordon Moseley regarding lot intended to be
purchased by Lewis Scales under Contract for Deed; Telephone conference
with Louie Allred regarding sale of lots

0.40 0.0002/01/05

Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding purchase of lots; Review
files and preparation of list of lots and notes to provide to Tom Bradford

0.50 0.0002/07/05

Office conference with Nicole Horn regarding her Contract for Deed 0.50 0.0002/10/05
Letter to Ben Robertson of Smith County Abstract 0.20 0.0002/28/05
Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding sale of lots 0.20 0.0003/03/05
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding Hiway 271 land 0.10 0.0003/03/05
Letter to Ben Robertson of Smith County Title Company requesting updated
title commitment on 393.9 acres

0.20 0.0003/14/05

Receipt and review of updated title commitment and tax information 0.30 0.0003/23/05
Telephone conference with Louie Allred and with title company regarding sale
of properties

0.20 0.0003/24/05
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Date
Receipt and review of additional documents regarding title commitment and
tax information

0.50 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

03/24/05

Letter by certified mail to Arete demanding action or contract will be
terminated, by certified mail, RRR, with copies to Allred and to Pyron

0.20 0.0004/13/05

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of land 0.10 0.0004/26/05
Review of documents relating to sale of land 0.30 0.0004/26/05
Letter to Billy Pyron with copy to Louis Allred giving deadline to May 20 to
close on pending Contract for Sale or will cancel contract and hire realtor to
liquidate

0.20 0.0005/10/05

Telephone conference with Jim Bass regarding Highway 271 property 0.40 0.0005/11/05
Receipt, review and execution of various closing documents 0.50 0.0005/18/05
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of land 0.20 0.0005/19/05
Receipt and review of proposed Contract and letter to prospective purchaser's
representative regarding needed revisions

0.70 0.0005/19/05

Letter to Tom Bradford regarding property recently purchased by ETEX and
involved in Scales Chapter 13 bankruptcy

0.20 0.0005/24/05

Letter to Mark Whatley, potential realtor, regarding Highway 14 and Highway
271 properties providing detailed descriptions, plats and other information

0.60 0.0006/14/05

Review of file for property descriptions for use by realtor; Telephone
conference with Mark Whatley, realtor; Additional work on letter to Mark
Whatley

1.00 0.0006/14/05

Review closing documents; E-mails and telephone conferences with closing
agent

1.00 0.0006/16/05

Telephone conference with Tab Beall regarding taxes (.20); Telephone
conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of 80 acres (.20)

0.40 0.0006/17/05

Letter to Mark Whatley, realtor, providing list of "reserved" purchaser names,
and regarding application to employ realtor

0.20 0.0006/27/05

Additional work on letter to realtor Whatley (.20); Telephone conference with
realtor (.20); Letter to title company and faxes to same (.20); Telephone
conference with First National Bank of Winnsboro (.10)

0.70 0.0006/27/05

Receipt and review of listing agreement with Mark Whatley; work on revisions
to listing agreement

0.40 0.0007/14/05
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Date
Letter to Maverick Mortgage Company regarding Nicole Horn's payoff balance 0.20 0.00Bob Anderson,

Chapter 7 Trustee
AD - ASSET
DISPOSITION

11/01/05

Letter to Mark Whatley regarding Highway 271 property and to provide copy of
Listing Agreement

0.20 0.0011/15/05

Receipt and review of offer on 220 acres; Telephone conference with realtor
(.30); E-mails to and from Billy Pyron (.10) and A. Shuttle (.10); Telephone
conference with Louis Allred (.10)

0.60 0.0011/28/05

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron 0.30 0.0001/19/06
Office conference with Louie Allred and Billy Pyron regarding sale of Highway
271 property

0.50 0.0002/14/06

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding sale of Highway 271
property

0.20 0.0002/15/06

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding Contract on 271 property
(.10); Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding contract on 271
property (.10); Letter to Pat Florence (.20)

0.40 0.0002/17/06

Telephone conference with Carolyn Easton; Telephone conference with Billy
Pyron

0.30 0.0002/20/06

Office conference with Billy Pyron regarding sale of 271 property and other
issues

0.50 0.0004/14/08

Receipt and review information on current ad valorem taxes owed on property
to be sold

0.40 0.0002/10/09

through 10/30/2009 - numerous e-mails and telephone calls regarding closing
on Highway 271 property and liens to be paid with sales proceeds to and from
Billy Pyron, Dale Long, Scott Ritcheson, Title Company, and Farris Renfro

2.00 0.0010/01/09

Letter to Jim Echols regarding release of Sandra Pyron's lien against Highway
271 property to be sold

0.30 0.0012/08/09

44.70 $0.00

Review of file 1.00 0.00CA - CASE
ADMINISTRATION

11/19/02

Telephone conference with A. Settle (.30); Telephone conference with Billy
Pyron (.20); Telehpone conference with Louise Allred (.20); Telephone
conference with Balke Bailey (.20); Review of file (.20)

1.10 0.0011/21/02
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Date
Office conference with Louis Allred and Jim Jenkins regarding motion to
dismiss and other issues

0.70 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

CA - CASE
ADMINISTRATION

12/23/02

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding dismissal 0.10 0.0001/27/03
Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding meeting 0.10 0.0003/27/03
Office conference with Louie Allred 0.50 0.0004/11/03
Office conference with Billy Pyron 1.00 0.0004/11/03
Letter to Billy Pyron and Louie Allred 0.30 0.0004/11/03
Telephone conference with Sandra Pyron regarding information 0.20 0.0004/22/03
Review records at office of Billy Pyron in Tyler and at Smith County Clerk's
office (1.50); Review of various documents regarding disputed liens (1.00);
Office conference with Louie Allred and review of records brought by him
(1.00)

3.50 0.0005/07/03

Telephone conference with Jolene Rogers regarding records 0.20 0.0005/09/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding tax returns 0.20 0.0005/13/03
Office conference with Louie Allred regarding tax returns, records, and other
matters

0.40 0.0005/14/03

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding Sandy Pyron's deposition
(.20); Letter to Smith County Abstract  (.10)

0.30 0.0008/25/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding deposition of Sandy Pyron 0.20 0.0010/02/03
Telephone conference with Howard Britain regarding problems with Bonilla lot 0.30 0.0004/28/04
Receipt and review of inquiry from Smith County Title regarding prior intended
sale of Highway 271 property to Greater Southern Real Estate

0.20 0.0004/26/05

Office conference with Louie Allred and Billy Pyron 0.50 0.0007/19/05
Office conference with Louie Allred and Billy Pyron regarding dismissal 0.50 0.0009/14/05
Review files on Price contracts for deeds and meeting with Mrs. Price 0.50 0.0009/14/05
Telephone conference with Louie Allred 0.10 0.0011/11/05
Telephone conference with Tony Hawes with Maverick Mortgage regarding
Nicole Horn's lot and preparation of payoff letter

0.30 0.0011/11/05

Work on Nicole Horn matter, including review of file and prior documents,
review payments

1.00 0.0011/18/05

Letter to Nicole Cox Horn and Maverick Mortgage regarding lien issues on lot
intended to be purchased by Nicole Cox Horn

0.20 0.0011/21/05
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Date
Telephone conference with Louis Allred regarding Highway 271 and other
issues

0.20 0.00Bob Anderson,
Chapter 7 Trustee

CA - CASE
ADMINISTRATION

12/12/05

Review file to locate plat and field notes requested by Billy Pyron 0.20 0.0012/13/05
Office conference with Billy Pyron 0.70 0.0004/07/08
E-mail letter to M. Gazette regrading Pyron account receivable 0.30 0.0004/08/08
Receipt and review of letter from Buddy Rogers regarding Lanita Price
Contract for Deed and letter to Buddy Rogers regarding same

0.50 0.0005/13/08

15.30 $0.00

Receipt and review of letter from Sheehy regarding lien claims of his client and
response letter to Sheehy

0.50 0.00CL - CLAIMS
ADMINISTRATION AND
OBJECTIONS

04/16/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred 0.20 0.0001/10/06
Telephone conference with Jim Echols 0.20 0.0001/10/06
Review deposition and other documents regarding Sandy Pyron's claims 0.70 0.0001/19/06
Review of file; Letter to Aubyn Shettle and John Freeman regarding claims of
Sandra Pyron

0.50 0.0004/24/07

Telephone conference with Billy Pyron 0.20 0.0003/24/08

2.30 $0.00

Letter to Tom Lyles with copy to Pyron and Allred regarding fee application for
accountant's fees and his failure to file returns

0.20 0.00FA - FEE/EMPLOYMENT
APPLICATIONS

10/01/04

Letter to C. Thomas Lyles regarding his fees and lack of detail provided for fee
application

0.20 0.0010/05/04

Letter to C. Thomas Lyles, Accountant for Trustee, regarding his failure to
prepare tax returns as agreed, and terminating relationship

0.30 0.0011/10/04

0.70 $0.00

Telephone conference with Tom Liles, CPA, regarding tax returns 0.30 0.00TX - TAX ISSUES 05/08/03
Telephone conference with Louie Allred re: tax return (.10); Telephone
conference with Tom Lyles, accountant, regarding tax return (.10)

0.20 0.0007/09/03

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding tax issues 0.10 0.0009/19/03
Review 2000 tax return and prompt determination documents and signing 0.30 0.0009/19/03
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Date
sameBob Anderson,

Chapter 7 Trustee
TX - TAX ISSUES

Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding tax returns (.10); Telephone
conference with Tom Lyles regarding tax returns (.20)

0.30 0.0009/21/04

Review of file; Preparation of letter to Bob Rogers regarding tax returns 0.70 0.0011/24/04
Receipt, review of and execute tax return and request for prompt determination 0.40 0.0008/23/06
Review and execute amended tax return and PDR for year end 3/31/06 0.40 0.0010/05/07
Review and execute tax return and pdr for year end 3/31/07 0.40 0.0010/09/07
Review tax return and related documents; sign tax return for filing 0.40 0.0010/15/08
Review and sign Form 1065 Federal Tax Return for period ending 3/31/09 0.40 0.0006/03/09
Receive, review and sign tax return FYE 3-31-2010 0.50 0.0003/17/10

4.40 $0.00

80.30 $0.00Subtotal for Staff Name: BOB ANDERSON, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE

80.30 $0.00Total for Case:  02-63369

80.30 $0.00Total for Trustee:  Bob Anderson

80.30 $0.00Grand Total:
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Case Number:

Petition Date: 341a Meeting:

02-63369
Assets
09/03/02

Allred & Pyron Investments, L.L.C.

Bill Parker
03/07/03    09:00

Case Type:
Case Name:

Judge:

Expense Worksheet
Printed:  04/21/10 02:34 PM Page:  1

Period:  01/01/00 - 04/21/10

CLERICAL

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

11/22/02 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Jason Searcy requesting turnover of bank account
balance and records, and regarding discrepancies
in Schedule A assets and various motions to sell
realty

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

11/26/02 Set up notebook file; Review schedules and other
documents; Post assets and other case information
to management system; Review motions and case
pleadings in attempt to match up motions to sell
with scheduled assets

1.50 $25.000 $37.50

11/26/02 Obtain Chapter 11 Bond, including telephone
conferences with International Sureties regarding
rates and fax to International Sureties requesting
bond

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

11/27/02 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell real estate
(Highway 271)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/27/02 Electronic filing of Application to Employ Attorney
for Trustee

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/27/02 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Sell Highway 271

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

12/23/02 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell real estate (Lot
105 Dobbs Terrace)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/23/02 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell real estate (210
Dobbs Terrace)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/23/02 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Sell 105 Dobbs Terrace and Motion to Sell 210
Dobbs Terrace

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

12/27/02 Electronic filing of Motion to Convert to Chapter 7 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/27/02 Electronic filing of Objection to Debtor's Motion to
Dismiss

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/27/02 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
convert case to Chapter 7 and Objection to Debtor's
Motion to Dismiss

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

01/27/03 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Notice of
Trustee's Intention to Abandon Property (Lot 20,
Sherwood Forest Subdivision)

0.40 $25.000 $10.00
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01/27/03 Fax to International Sureties requesting cancellation
of Ch. 11 Bond and refund of unearned premium,
and providing copy of conversion order

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/27/03 Electronic filing of Notice of Intention to Abandon
Lot 20, Sherwood Forest

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/19/03 Set up financial file; open money market account;
preparation of deposit and post same; post
adjusting entries for funds distributed at closing

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

03/11/03 Electronic filing of 341 Meeting Held and Concluded 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

03/28/03 Telephone conference with Southside Bank
regarding accounts; Prepare letter for Trustee's
review and signature to Southside Bank requesting
turnover of account balances

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/03/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/15/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/16/03 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Louie Allred returning original bank records

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/17/03 Mailout of Motion to Sell various tracts of real
property to all parties on matrix

0.80 $25.000 $20.00

04/18/03 Organize file, numerous documents; Post notes
receivable and other case information to
management system; Prepare subfiles for various
issues to be administrated, including liens on
various real property tracts and notes receivable
from numerous parties on contracts for sale;
Calculations to allocate earnest money deposit from
Greater Southern Real Estate Acquisitions to
various assets and post payments received on
notes receivable

2.00 $25.000 $50.00

04/28/03 Post adjusting entry for NSF check returned 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/29/03 Receipt of check returned by Chase Bank marked
"insufficient"; Post adjusting entry to money market
account; Prepare letter for Trustee's review and
signature to Patrick McKinney, maker of check,
requesting replacement funds by cashier's check or
money order and requesting future payments by
same

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

05/01/03 Electronic filing of Annual Status Report 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/08/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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05/20/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/22/03 Review file; e-mail to Bootie Farnsworth regarding
bond cancellation and status of premium refund

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/23/03 Electronically file and serve to required parties
Motion for 2004 Exam of Carey Woods

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

05/27/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/28/03 Completion of summons for certified mail service
on Sandra Pyron with copy to Jim Echols;
Telephone conference with Clerk's office regarding
electronic filing of served summons

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/03/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/10/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/11/03 Telephone conference with Bootie Farnsworth with
bonding company regarding refund of unearned
bond premium

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/11/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/08/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/31/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/12/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/03/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/10/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/16/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/22/03 Copy and mailout to all parties of Motion to Sell
Lots 4 and 5 of Sherwood Forest

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

09/22/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/22/03 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell Lots 4 and 5,
Sherwood Forest

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/24/03 Obtain advance from Trustee's firm for payment of
Kittrell & Associates invoice for Sandra Pyron's
deposition

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/06/03 Preparation of deposit and post same; post
adjusting entries for sales proceeds disbursed at
closing

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

11/11/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/17/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/03/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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12/10/03 Telephone conference with Nicole Horn regarding
payments on land contract for deed and status of
case

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/15/03 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/15/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/02/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/04/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/05/04 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell Lot 90, Harry
Albertson and Lot 17, Sherwood Forest

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/05/04 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Sell Lot 90, Harry Albertson and Lot 17 Sherwood
Forest

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

02/17/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/29/04 Preparation of deposit and post same; post
adjusting entries for sales proceeds disbursed at
closing

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

04/08/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/22/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/28/04 Prepare for and electronially file Motion to Convey
Lot 92, H Albertson Survey.

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

04/28/04 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Convey Lot 92, Harry Albertson

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

05/12/04 Electronic filing of Annual Status Report 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

05/20/04 Prepare electronic files and electronically file
Application to Employ Andy Guinn as Realtor

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

05/27/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/01/04 Prepare and electronically file Motion to Sell I-20
Property.

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

06/01/04 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Sell I20 property (393.90 acres)

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

06/03/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/24/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/30/04 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell various lots in
Sherwood Forest

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/30/04 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Sell various lots in Sherwood Forest

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

07/19/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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08/05/04 Prepare, electronically file and mail to interested
parties Motion to Sell Lots 45 and 50 Harry
Albertson Addition Free and Clear of Liens Except
Ad Valorem Tax Liens.

0.80 $25.000 $20.00

08/10/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/19/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/30/04 Preparation of deposit and post same; post
adjusting entries for sales proceeds distributed at
closing

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

09/21/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/12/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/13/04 Transfer funds to checking; prepare check to Smith
County Tax A/C for a.v. taxes on Lot 90, Albertson
Subdivision

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/20/04 Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding
legal description of lots to be sold

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/21/04 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell Lots 48, 49 and 91 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/21/04 Copy and mailout of Motion to Sell Lots 48, 49 and
91 to all parties on matrix

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

10/21/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/22/04 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Gillen & Anderson regarding closing documents for
sale of Lots 48, 49 and 91, Harry Albertson

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/24/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/24/04 Exhaustive review of numerous Motions to Sell
Real Properties and Orders, closing statements,
and lien records, compiling information for Trustee's
review in order to make payment of liens

2.50 $25.000 $62.50

11/29/04 Telephone conference with Smith County Abstract
regarding Ric Freeman's forfeiture of $1,000
earnest money on I-20 property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/29/04 Telephone conference with Beverly of Gillen and
Anderson regarding closing, and mail executed
Settlement Statement to her

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/29/04 Telephone conference with Beverly at Gillen &
Anderson regarding closing

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

11/29/04 Telephone conference with Beverly regarding
$1,000 earnest money

0.10 $25.000 $2.50
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11/29/04 Prepare table of note obligors pursuant to Trustee's
instructions, review of documents for same

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

11/30/04 Review of additional documents and revisions to
summary of note obligors

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/02/04 Electronic filing of Application to Employ
Accountant Bob Rogers

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/02/04 Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding
Nicole Horn

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/02/04 Additional work (formatting) on Amortization
Schedule for Nicole Horn and post payments
received

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/07/04 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Smith County Title Company regarding
Cancellation

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

12/07/04 Preparation of deposits (2) and post same 0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/07/04 Telephone conference with Beverly @ Gillen's
office regarding non-receipt of funds

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

12/09/04 Preparation of deposit and post same, and post
additional information on disbursements, gross v.
net

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/16/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/20/04 Preparation of table of sales information with gross
v. net to document calculation of lien payoff to
Beverly Hefner; Draft letter for Trustee's review and
signature to Beverly Hefner regarding same

0.70 $25.000 $17.50

12/21/04 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/21/04 Additional work on lien payoff information and letter
to Beverly Hefner

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/21/04 Preparation of information sheet for calculation of
payoff to First National Bank of Winnsboro

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

12/21/04 Transfer funds to checking for disbursement;
Prepare check # 102 to Beverly Hefner

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

12/22/04 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Michael McNally regarding lien payoff to First
National Bank of Winnsboro

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/22/04 Transfer funds to checking for disbursement;
Prepare check #103 to First National Bank of
Winnsboro

0.30 $25.000 $7.50
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01/10/05 Telephone conference with Robert Scales regarding
payments on Contract for Deed

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/11/05 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Lewis Scales regarding cancelled Contract for Deed

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/13/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/17/05 Telephone conference with Lynn Jackson, Lewis
Scales' bankruptcy attorney, regarding contract for
deed

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/18/05 Telephone conference with Lynn Jackson in G.
Mosley's office regarding Lewis Scales contract for
deed; Memo file and Trustee regarding same

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

01/24/05 Telephone conference with Robert Scales regarding
cash offer on Scales Contract

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

02/03/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/08/05 Prepare table of payments received on certain
contracts for deed and fax to Tom Bradford

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

02/08/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/10/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/16/05 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Arete Real Estate regarding Contract on 393.9
acres

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/21/05 Fax executed contract on 393.9 acres to Billy Pyron 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

03/03/05 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Tom Bradford of Etex regarding Contract on Lots
39, 40, 51, and 52, H. Albertson

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/04/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/07/05 Electronic filing of Accountant's Fee Application
with exhibit and proposed Order

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/07/05 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Fee
Application for Bob Rogers, accountant for Trustee

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

03/17/05 Telephone conference with Beverly of Gillen &
Anderson regarding earnest money from Tom
Bradford on H Albertson sale

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/21/05 Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding
earnest money

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

03/21/05 Telephone conference with Beverly of Gillen's
office and telephone conference with Tina of
Bradford's office, both regarding earnest money

0.30 $25.000 $7.50
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03/22/05 Prepare exhibits and matrix for Motion to Sell Lots
39, 40, 51 and 52 of H. Albertson

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

03/23/05 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell Lots 39, 40, 51
and 52 of H. Albertson

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/23/05 Mailout of Motion to Sell Lots 39, 40, 51 and 52 to
all parties

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

03/29/05 Telephone conference with Tom Bradford regarding
terminated contracts for sale

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/30/05 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Tom Bradford forwarding copies of default notices
on contracts for sale with Strigger and Scales per
his request

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/11/05 Telephone conference with Melissa of Smith
County Title regarding earnest money

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/12/05 Telephone conference with Melissa at Smith
County Title regarding pending sale of 393 acres to
Arete

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/18/05 Transfer funds to checking for disbursement; post
claim for accountant's fees; Prepare check #104 to
Bob Rogers for same per Order 4/2/05.

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/18/05 Telephone conference with Tina of ETEX
Properties regarding documentation on Lots to be
purchased

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/18/05 Gather documentation requested and fax to Tina of
ETEX Properties on properties to be purchased by
ETEX

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/21/05 Telephone conference with Louie Allred regarding
property sales

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/21/05 Telephone conference with Beverly of Gillen and
Anderson regarding sale to Tom Bradford

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/25/05 Telephone conference with Carol at Smith County
Title Company regarding closing

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/25/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/26/05 Prepare and send fax to Smith County Title
Company confirming that sale to Greater Southern
is no longer pending

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

04/26/05 Telephone conference with Ben Robertson
regarding title commitment requirements on sale of
393 acres to Arete

0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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05/04/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/10/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/12/05 Locate plat of Highway 271 and provide copy to Jim
Bass/Steve Winston per Trustee

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/17/05 Telephone conference with Beverly of Gillen &
Anderson regarding ad valorem taxes on realty to
be sold

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/17/05 Telephone conferences (2) with Beverly of Gillen
office regarding ad valorem taxes

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

05/18/05 E-mail from and reply to Beverly of title company
regarding deed and HUD closing statement;
revision of deed to include statutory confidentiality
language

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

05/18/05 Fax executed closing documents to title company 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/24/05 Post adjusting entries for payment of closing
proceeds to third parties at closing with no net to
estate

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

06/02/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/09/05 Electronic filing of Annual Status Report 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

06/16/05 E-mail petition and schedules to Mark Whatley,
potential realtor, for his review prior to executing
affidavit

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

06/20/05 Review of file and update information on various
lots previously under contracts for deed which are
no longer being paid on; prepare summary of same

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

06/20/05 Preparation of deposit and post same; post
adjusting entries for gross v net, disbursements at
closing

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

06/21/05 Fax executed Disclosure re: 393 acres to Melissa
@ Smith County Title

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/22/05 Review payments on Nicole Horn's contract for
deed; Prepare letter for Trustee's review and
signature to Nicole Horn requesting that payments
be brought current

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

06/28/05 Electronic filing of Application to Employ Mark
Whatley as Realtor

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/28/05 Copy and mailout Application to Employ Mark
Whatley as realtor

0.10 $25.000 $2.50
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06/30/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/05/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/06/05 Telephone conference with Lanita Price regarding
payments on contract for deed

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/11/05 Work on Lajean and Lanita Price contract for deed
file; run amortization schedule and calculate current
balance

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

07/12/05 Fax copy of settlement statement on 393 acres to
Auben Shettle

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/14/05 Additional work on Lanite and Lajean Price
amortization / payment schedule

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

07/14/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/22/05 Electronic filing of Trustee's Second Application for
Allowance of Accountant's Fees and proposed
Order

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/22/05 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Fee
Application for Bob Rogers, accountant for Trustee

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/02/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/09/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/24/05 Transfer funds to checking for disbursement;
Prepare check # 105 to Bob Rogers for
Accountant's fee

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/12/05 Update information on James White payments 0.30 $25.000 $7.50

09/12/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/15/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/15/05 Import claims data and initial review 0.60 $25.000 $15.00

09/26/05 Telephone conference with Billy Pyron regarding
closing statement on 393 acres; locate same and
fax to him per his request

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/06/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/10/05 Fax documents for objections to claims to Jim
Jenkins

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/01/05 Telephone conference with Nicole Horn regarding
payoff on loan

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

11/03/05 (and 11/17/2005) Preparation of deposit and post
same; post adjusting entries for gross v. net and
disbursements made at closing

0.50 $25.000 $12.50
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12/06/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/13/05 Two faxes to Billy Pyron sending requested field
notes on 4.584 acres

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/13/05 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/09/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/02/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/13/06 Electronic filing of Notice of Assignment of Claim
from Debtor to Sandra Pyron

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

02/21/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/23/06 Electronic filing of Motion to Sell Highway 271
property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/23/06 Mailout of Motion to Sell Highway 271 Property to
all parties on matrix

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

03/06/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/04/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/15/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/18/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/02/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/08/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/06/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/12/06 Preparation of deposits (2) and post same 0.30 $25.000 $7.50

08/30/06 Electronic filing and service of Accountant's Third
Fee Application

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

09/07/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/07/06 Preparation of deposit (second) and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/20/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/02/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/09/06 Transfer funds to checking and prepare check #106
to Bob Rogers for accountant's fees per Order
signed 9/21/06.

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/18/06 Receipt and review of fax from Billy Pyron
regarding 2005 tax return; Review file; Fax
complete copy of 2005 tax return to Billy Pyron per
his request

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

11/10/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/10/06 Preparation of deposit and post same (second 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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deposit for the day)

12/21/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/29/06 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/19/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/09/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/11/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/13/07 Review Transfer of Note and Liens from Beverly
Hefner to Jo Allred; notation to case management
of same

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

03/19/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/02/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/08/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

05/08/07 Preparation of deposit (second deposit for the day -
one was regular processing, one was "next day
availability" processing) and post same

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/07/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/18/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/02/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/05/07 Electronic filing of Annual Status Report 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

07/13/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/13/07 Prepare for and electronic filing of Motion to Sell
Highway 14 Property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/13/07 Prepare for and electronic filing of Objections to
Claims #9 and #11 of Sandra Pyron and service of
same

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

07/13/07 Mailout of Motion to Sell to all parties 0.70 $25.000 $17.50

07/23/07 Telephone conference with Devin in Collections
Division of Texas Comptroller regarding notice of
Franchise Taxes Due for 2007 for over $7,000;
Memo to file and Trustee regarding same

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

07/25/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/01/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/11/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/31/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/05/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/08/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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10/20/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/23/07 Electronic filing and service of Objection to Motion
to Lift Stay of Tyler ISD

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/06/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/09/07 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Patricia Florence returning earnest money check
from Starose Development Corporation

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/12/07 Upload Agreed Order signed by Tab Beall and
Trustee in connection with Tyler ISD's Motion to Lift
Stay as to 79.841 Acres

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

11/15/07 Calculations on balances owed on remaining two
contracts for deed that Trustee is still collecting
payments on

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

11/27/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/07/07 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/19/07 Review of file on L. Jean Price Contract for Deed;
Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
L. Jean Price regarding agreed on lifting of stay

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

12/20/07 Review of file on White Contract for Deed; Prepare
letter for Trustee's review and signature to Tanya
White requesting legal description

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

01/02/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/09/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/09/08 Review claims and related documents; udate claim
information in management system; compare
claims to schedules; prepare projected claim
distribution report for Trustee

1.50 $25.000 $37.50

01/09/08 Letter via e-mail to Lanita Price regarding contract
for deed, balance owed, pending foreclosure by
taxing authorities, etc.

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

01/21/08 Prepare numerous documents for electronic filing of
eleven objections to claims; Electronic filing of
eleven objections to claims

2.40 $25.000 $60.00

01/21/08 Mailout of objections to claims to required parties 0.50 $25.000 $12.50

02/04/08 Telephone conference with Louie Allred; Provide
requested copies of proofs of claim via e-mail

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

02/05/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/20/08 Compile information on Price Contract for Sale and 0.40 $25.000 $10.00
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White Contract for Sale and e-mail same to Tab
Beall

02/28/08 Electronic filing of three withdrawals of objections to
proofs of claim (Smith County claims)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/03/08 Upload Agreed Order regarding Claim #2 0.10 $25.000 $2.50

03/18/08 Electronic filing of Amended Objection to Claim #3
(FNB Winnsboro / Louie Allred)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/18/08 Copy and mailout to all required parties of
Objection to Claim #3 (Amended)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/24/08 Electronic filing of Trustee's Second Amended
Objection to Proof of Claim #3

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/24/08 Copy and mailout to all required parties of
Objection to Claim #3 (amended)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/03/08 Receipt and review of Agreed Orders faxed by Dale
Long; Telephone conference with Dale Long's office
regarding one Agreed Order lacking proper
signature

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/04/08 Upload five Agreed Orders to resolve claim
objections on claims #1, 3, 6, 7 and 8

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

04/10/08 through 04/17/08 - e-mails to and from David Long
regarding notice of intent to abandon Highway 14
property

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

04/15/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

04/18/08 Prepare for and electronically file Notice of Intent to
Abandon Highway 14 Property and Motion to Sell
Highway 271 Property Free and Clear of Liens

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

04/18/08 Copy and mailout Notice of Intent to Abandon
Highway 14 and Motion to Sell Highway 271 to all
parties on matrix

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

06/04/08 Electronic filing of Motion to Continue hearing on
motion to sell; and electronic filing of Exhibit and
Witness List in connection with motion to sell

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

06/04/08 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Motion to
Continue Hearing and Exhibit/Witness List re: sale
of Highway 271

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

07/09/08 Electronic filing of Trustee's Reply to Response of
Sandra Pyron to Trustee's Motion for Authorization
to Sell Asset (Highway 271 Property)

0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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07/09/08 Copy and mailout to all required parties of
Response to Objection of Sandra Pyron

0.10 $25.000 $2.50

08/01/08 Electronic filing of Trustee's Brief in Support of
Motion to Sell Highway 271 Property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/01/08 Copy and mailout to all required parties of Brief in
re: Motion to Sell Highway 271

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

08/25/08 Review files on lot sales and prepare same for
mailing to Dale Long per his request (removing
documents pertaining to payments received by
Trustee)

0.80 $25.000 $20.00

09/04/08 Telephone conference with title company regarding
updated title commitment and closing

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/17/08 Various e-mails to and from title company and
Trustee regarding status of closing

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

11/13/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/08/08 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Billy Pyron regarding additional extension of closing
date and modification to Addendum

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/08/08 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/12/08 Telephone conference with Pat Florence regarding
potential purchaser of Highway 271 property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/15/08 Post adjusting entry for check returned - payment
stopped

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/12/09 Telephone conference with Misty of Scott
Ritcheson's office regarding contract on Highway
271 property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/14/09 E-mail to Misty B. of Scott Ritcheson's office
regarding contract on Highway 271 property

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

01/14/09 Telephone conference with Linebarger Goggan firm
regarding ad valorem taxes on Highway 271
property and any other ad valorem taxes owed by
Debtor; Prepare written request for payoff
information and fax to Linebarger firm

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

01/14/09 Prepare updated Contract with Bent Tree Estates
on Highway 271 property based on Trustee's
instructions

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

01/21/09 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/09/09 Fax to Linebarger firm requesting response to 0.20 $25.000 $5.00
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previous fax for ad valorem payoff information

02/10/09 Review file; E-mail to Julie with Title Company
regarding updated commitment and other
information

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

02/11/09 Receipt of e-mail from Julie of Title Company;
Reply e-mail forwarding updated ad valorem tax
information recently provided by attorney for taxing
entities

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

09/16/09 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/01/09 Preparation of exhibit of time detail for attorney's
fee application

1.00 $25.000 $25.00

10/08/09 Prepare for and electronic filing of Fee Application
of Attorney for Trustee (.20) and copy and mailout
of same (or shortened Notice) to all parties on
matrix

0.90 $25.000 $22.50

10/13/09 E-mail to Julie McIntyre with Landmark Title
regarding certified documents required for closing
on sale of Highway 271 property

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

10/14/09 E-mails to and from Julie McIntyre with Landmark
Title regarding documents for closing; Telephone
conference with Bankruptcy Clerk's office to order
certified copy of Order Authorizing Sale (paid for
with personal credit card; $9.00 fee to be
reimbursed to Cindy Irby)

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

10/14/09 E-mails to and from Julie McIntyre with Landmard
Title and Trustee regarding payoffs; perform
calculations of updated payoff figures and update
table with same

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

10/27/09 Prepare for and serve copies of certified demand
letter to Bent Tree via e-mail to Billy Pyron, Scott
Ritcheson and Dale Long

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

11/19/09 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/04/09 E-mail to Julie McIntyre with title company
regarding change in closing date, updated title
commitment and closing statement, and Allred's
option to extend closing.

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

12/04/09 through 12/8/09 - e-mails to and from Julie with
Title Company; drafting closing documents
(Highway 271 property to Louie Allred) for Trustee's
review and approval; calculation of updated payoffs

1.00 $25.000 $25.00
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12/28/09 Revision of proposed Deed (to incorporate Vendor's
Lien) and calculation of updated payoffs; E-mails to
Trustee and to Huey Keeney regarding same and
closing on 12/31

0.60 $25.000 $15.00

01/04/10 Preparation of deposit and post same 0.20 $25.000 $5.00

01/04/10 Review HUD closing statement and post adjusting
entries for net funds

0.40 $25.000 $10.00

01/11/10 Transfer funds to checking for disbursement;
Prepare check #107 to Smead, Anderson & Dunn in
payment of attorney fees for trustee's attorney

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

01/15/10 Review Smith County claims and amounts paid at
closing; Telephone conference with Laurie Spindler
regarding allocation of funds paid to claims of
Smith County

0.50 $25.000 $12.50

01/20/10 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
County Clerk of Smith County forwarding Sandra
Pyron's Release of Lien for recordation

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/18/10 Receipt and review e-mail inquiry from Dale Long;
E-mail to Dale Long regarding timeline for
distribution

0.20 $25.000 $5.00

03/30/10 Review claims register and proposed distribution;
telephone call to Laurie Spindler regarding amounts
still owing to Smith County; telephone conference
with Tab Beall's office regarding claim of Tyler ISD

0.80 $25.000 $20.00

03/30/10 Telephone conference with Laurie regarding unpaid
portions of Smith County ad valorem tax claims and
amending same

0.30 $25.000 $7.50

04/13/10 Reconciliation of bank statement each month (.10
per month) for 85 months (March 2003 through
April 2010)

8.50 $25.000 $212.50

Total for category  CLERICAL: $2,475.0099.00

COPIES

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

11/27/02 Motion to Sell Hwy 271 163.00 $0.250 $40.75

11/27/02 Application to Employ Attorney 7.00 $0.250 $1.75

12/23/02 Motion to Sell 1) 105 Dobbs Terrace and 2) 210
Dobbs Terrace

161.00 $0.250 $40.25

12/27/02 Motion to Convert; Trustee's Reponse to Motion to 46.00 $0.250 $11.50
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Dismiss

01/27/03 Notice of Intent to Abandon Lot 20 Sherwood Forest 42.00 $0.250 $10.50

03/28/03 L Southside 1 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

03/28/03 L Allred Louie 1 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

04/16/03 L Allred Louie 2 44.00 $0.250 $11.00

04/17/03 P Sell Multiple Real Estate 216.00 $0.250 $54.00

04/18/03 file 38.00 $0.250 $9.50

04/29/03 L McKinney 2 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

05/13/03 Letter to William Lively enclosing copy of Proof of
Claim filed in Tanya White Ch. 13

3.00 $0.250 $0.75

05/23/03 2004 Exam of Carey Woods 20.00 $0.250 $5.00

05/28/03 Adv/L Pyron 1 12.00 $0.250 $3.00

06/25/03 TaxRet02 L Lyles 1 8.00 $0.250 $2.00

07/22/03 Notice letters 8.00 $0.250 $2.00

09/22/03 Motion to Sell Lots 4 & 5 Sherwood Forest 150.00 $0.250 $37.50

09/24/03 Kittrell invoice 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

09/24/03 TaxRet, PDR, K-1s FYE 3-31-01 16.00 $0.250 $4.00

02/05/04 Motion to Sell Lot 90 and Lot 17 141.00 $0.250 $35.25

02/10/04 Notice of default letters 10.00 $0.250 $2.50

04/29/04 Copies to mail Motion to Convey Lot 92 (Bonilla) 53.00 $0.250 $13.25

05/20/04 Application to Employ Guinn as Realtor 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

06/01/04 Mailing of Motion to Sell I-20 Property to all on
mailing matrix.

25.00 $0.250 $6.25

06/18/04 TaxRet 3-31-04 L Lyles 16.00 $0.250 $4.00

06/30/04 Motion to Sell Lots in Sherwood Forest 161.00 $0.250 $40.25

08/05/04 Motion to Sell Lots 45 and 50 Harry Albertson
Addition

28.00 $0.250 $7.00

10/01/04 L Lyles 2 6.00 $0.250 $1.50

10/05/04 L Lyles 3 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

10/21/04 Motion to Sell Lots 48, 49 and 91 25.00 $0.250 $6.25

11/09/04 L Lyles 6.00 $0.250 $1.50

11/10/04 L Lyles 4 6.00 $0.250 $1.50

11/17/04 L Guinn 4 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

11/22/04 L Gillen 6 5.00 $0.250 $1.25
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11/24/04 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

11/29/04 TaxRet 03 & 04 L Rogers 1 30.00 $0.250 $7.50

11/29/04 Closing Statement to Gillen & Anderson 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

11/30/04 L Horn 2 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

12/06/04 L Horn 3 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

12/07/04 L Smith Co Title 4 (Peters) 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

12/07/04 Deposit copies 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

12/13/04 Deposit copies 10.00 $0.250 $2.50

12/16/04 Deposit copies 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

12/21/04 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

12/21/04 L Hefner 2 28.00 $0.250 $7.00

12/22/04 L 1st Nat'l Bank Winnsboro 25.00 $0.250 $6.25

01/03/05 RPD FYE 3/31/03 and FYE 3/31/04 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

01/11/05 L Scales 4 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

01/13/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

01/27/05 L Smith Co Title 5 (Robertson) 7.00 $0.250 $1.75

02/03/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

02/08/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

02/10/05 Deposit copies 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

02/16/05 L Arete Real Estate 1 12.00 $0.250 $3.00

03/03/05 L Bradford 5 3.00 $0.250 $0.75

03/04/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

03/07/05 Rogers Fee App 12.00 $0.250 $3.00

03/15/05 L Smith Co Title 6 (Robertson) 3.00 $0.250 $0.75

03/23/05 Motion to Sell Lots 39, 40, 51 & 52 44.00 $0.250 $11.00

03/28/05 L Arete Real Estate 2 16.00 $0.250 $4.00

03/28/05 L Smith Co Title 6 (Robertson) 4.00 $0.250 $1.00

03/30/05 L Bradford 6 14.00 $0.250 $3.50

04/13/05 L Arete Real Estate 3 3.00 $0.250 $0.75

04/18/05 Check #104 3.00 $0.250 $0.75

04/25/05 Deposit copies 3.00 $0.250 $0.75

05/04/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

05/10/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

05/10/05 L Pyron 5 2.00 $0.250 $0.50
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05/12/05 plat 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

05/12/05 L Gillen 7 and deed 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

05/20/05 L Colbert 1 11.00 $0.250 $2.75

05/24/05 L Bradford 7 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

06/15/05 L Whatley 74.00 $0.250 $18.50

06/22/05 L Horn 1.00 $0.250 $0.25

06/27/05 L Whatley 6.00 $0.250 $1.50

06/28/05 App to Emp Whatley 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

07/14/05 L Whatley 3, Listing Agreement 13.00 $0.250 $3.25

07/14/05 L Whatley 5.00 $0.250 $1.25

07/22/05 FeeApp Rogers 2 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

07/22/05 FeeApp Rogers 2 to Debtor 6.00 $0.250 $1.50

08/09/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

08/24/05 Check #105 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

10/06/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.250 $0.50

11/03/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

11/15/05 L Whatley 4 13.00 $0.200 $2.60

11/21/05 L Horn 5 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

12/06/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/13/05 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

01/09/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

02/02/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

02/13/06 Transfer Claim 6.00 $0.200 $1.20

02/23/06 Motion to Sell Highway 271 Property 43.00 $0.200 $8.60

03/06/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/04/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/16/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/18/06 Deposit copies 6.00 $0.200 $1.20

05/02/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

05/08/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

06/06/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

06/15/06 Form 8736 1.00 $0.200 $0.20

07/12/06 Deposit copies 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

07/17/06 TaxRet 3-31-06 L Rogers 1 6.00 $0.200 $1.20
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07/18/06 TaxRet FYE 3-31-06 L Rogers 1 22.00 $0.200 $4.40

07/24/06 L One Tall Oak 1 6.00 $0.200 $1.20

08/23/06 2005 Tax Return 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

08/30/06 Accountant's 3rd Fee Ap 12.00 $0.200 $2.40

09/07/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

09/07/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

09/20/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

10/02/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

10/09/06 Account Invoice paid 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

10/17/06 L One Tall Oak 2 6.00 $0.200 $1.20

11/10/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

11/10/06 Deposit copies 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

12/21/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/29/06 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

01/19/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

02/09/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

03/11/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

03/19/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/02/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/24/07 L Shettle 2 8.00 $0.200 $1.60

05/08/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

05/08/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

06/07/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

06/18/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

07/02/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

07/10/07 TaxRet FYE 3-31-07 L Rogers 1 9.00 $0.200 $1.80

07/13/07 Deposit copies 12.00 $0.200 $2.40

07/13/07 POC Objs #9 and #11 45.00 $0.200 $9.00

07/13/07 Motion to Sell Hwy 14 93.00 $0.200 $18.60

08/01/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

08/11/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

08/31/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

09/05/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

09/07/07 Re:  Hearing on Sandra Pyron objections to claims 112.00 $0.200 $22.40
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09/19/07 L Bradford & Patterson 1 8.00 $0.200 $1.60

10/20/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

10/23/07 P Stay Obj - Tyler ISD 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

11/06/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

11/09/07 L Florence 2 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/07/07 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/20/07 Note Obligor L Price 2 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

12/20/07 Note Obligor L White 1 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

01/02/08 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

01/09/08 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

01/09/08 Proof of Claim documentation 18.00 $0.200 $3.60

01/21/08 Objections to claims 84.00 $0.200 $16.80

02/05/08 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

02/06/08 L White 2 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

02/19/08 L Long 1 1.00 $0.200 $0.20

02/28/08 POC Objs Withdrawals 6.00 $0.200 $1.20

02/29/08 claim resolution L Long 2 15.00 $0.200 $3.00

03/03/08 L Echols 3 8.00 $0.200 $1.60

03/18/08 POC Obj #3 - Amended 12.00 $0.200 $2.40

03/24/08 2nd Amended Obj to Clalim #3 14.00 $0.200 $2.80

04/07/08 Form 7004 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

04/07/08 TaxRet FYE 3/31/08 L Rogers 1 12.00 $0.200 $2.40

04/18/08 Abandon Hwy 14 / Sell Hwy 271 246.00 $0.200 $49.20

05/13/08 L Rogers Buddy 1 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

06/04/08 Motion to Continue / Exhibit and Witness List 5.00 $0.200 $1.00

07/09/08 Reply to Pyron's Response Sell Hwy 271 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

07/11/08 Exhibit & Witness List 75.00 $0.200 $15.00

08/01/08 Brief 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

10/20/08 L Bent Tree 1 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/08/08 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/08/08 L Bent Tree 3 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

03/19/09 L Bent Tree 4 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

05/19/09 TaxRet FYE 3-31-08 L IRS 1 re late filing 24.00 $0.200 $4.80

05/21/09 TaxRet FYE 3-31-09 L Rogers 2 1.00 $0.200 $0.20



Trustee: Bob Anderson (631490)

Case Number:

Petition Date: 341a Meeting:

02-63369
Assets
09/03/02

Allred & Pyron Investments, L.L.C.

Bill Parker
03/07/03    09:00

Case Type:
Case Name:

Judge:

Expense Worksheet
Printed:  04/21/10 02:34 PM Page:  23

Period:  01/01/00 - 04/21/10

09/16/09 Deposit copies 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

10/08/09 Attorney Fee App 104.00 $0.200 $20.80

10/27/09 L Bent Tree 6 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

12/08/09 L Echols 5 18.00 $0.200 $3.60

01/04/10 Deposit copies 8.00 $0.200 $1.60

01/11/10 Check #107 4.00 $0.200 $0.80

01/20/10 L Smith Co Clerk 3 2.00 $0.200 $0.40

02/01/10 TaxRet FYE 3-31-10 L Rogers 1 16.00 $0.200 $3.20

04/13/10 Estimated copies for final bank statements,
distribution letters and Trustee's Distribution Report

36.00 $0.200 $7.20

04/13/10 Copies of checks made on numerous deposits
throughout pendency of case which were not
otherwise posted

136.00 $0.200 $27.20

Total for category  COPIES: $737.053,226.00

OTHER

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

12/27/02 Filing fee paid to Clerk for Motion to Convert to
Chapter 7

1.00 $15.000 $15.00

08/08/03 Recording Fee paid to Smith County Clerk for
recording Partial Release of Lis Pendens

1.00 $11.000 $11.00

11/03/03 Overnight delivery of documents to J. Gillen 1.00 $14.210 $14.21

12/19/03 Paid to Smith County Clerk for Notice of Filing of
Bankruptcy Petition in Public Official Records

1.00 $14.000 $14.00

10/14/09 Certified copy fee paid to Clerk for Order
Authorizing Sale of Highway 271 property (paid by
Cindy Irby; reimbursed to CI by Trustee's firm)

1.00 $9.000 $9.00

01/20/10 Recording Fee paid to Smith County Clerk for
recording Release of Lien from Sandra Pyron to
Allred & Pyron

1.00 $16.000 $16.00

01/26/10 Paid to Lone Star Overnight for delivery of closing
documents to Huey Keeney

1.00 $15.240 $15.24

Total for category  OTHER: $94.457.00

OTHER 2

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

06/24/03 East Texas Court Reporting Service, Inc., for 1.00 $268.400 $268.40
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Original Deposition of Carey Woods, III

09/24/03 Charges paid to Kittrell & Associates for deposition
of Sandra Pyron

1.00 $228.630 $228.63

Total for category  OTHER 2: $497.032.00

PARALEGAL

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

06/25/03 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
accountant Lyles regarding tax return FYE 3-31-03

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

09/24/03 Prepare for Trustee's review and signature Request
for Prompt Determination relating to tax return FYE
3/31/01; Process and mail by certified mail, rrr, tax
return, PDR and K-1s

0.60 $60.000 $36.00

04/25/04 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

06/18/04 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
C. Thomas Lyles regarding tax return FYE 3-31-04

0.80 $60.000 $48.00

11/24/04 Review of file regarding tax returns that are now
due; Prepare initial draft of letter to Bob Rogers for
Trustee's review and revision regarding his taking
over the file from Tom Lyles, including general
history of the case and tax filings, summarizing
taxable transactions FYE 3/31/03 and 3/31/04, and
compiling supporting documentation for
accountant's use

2.50 $60.000 $150.00

01/03/05 Review of completed tax return and processing for
mailing by certified mail, return receipt requested,
both the tax return and the Request for Prompt
Determination of Unpaid Taxes FYE 3/31/03 and
FYE 3/31/04; Mail K-1s to appropriate parties by
certified mail, RRR

0.70 $60.000 $42.00

04/28/05 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.40 $60.000 $24.00

06/08/05 Review file for tax return information, including
information on tax basis; Preparation of Form 8736
for Trustee's review and signature; Work on
amortizations and calculations on interest portion of
payments; Draft letter for Trustee's review and
revision to Bob Rogers, accountant for Trustee,
providing information for preparation of tax return

2.50 $60.000 $150.00
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FYE 3/31/05.

07/18/05 Receipt and review of tax return; discussion with
Bob Rogers regarding balances of notes
receivables; Process and mail both tax return and
prompt determination request by certified mail,
RRR, and mail K-1s to Mandarin Industries and
Billy Pyron by certified mail, RRR

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

09/13/05 Prepare various proposed distributions based on
different scenarios for Trustee's use in discussions
with Louie Allred and Billy Pyron

1.50 $60.000 $90.00

04/26/06 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

06/15/06 Prepare Form 8736 Extension request and mail to
Internal Revenue Service

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

07/17/06 Review file; Work on amortizations and calculations
of interest on contract for deed payments; Prepare
letter for Trustee's review and signature to Bob
Rogers regarding tax return fye 3/31/06

3.00 $60.000 $180.00

08/23/06 Review of completed tax return and processing for
mailing by certified mail, return receipt requested,
both the tax return and the Request for Prompt
Determination of Unpaid Taxes

0.40 $60.000 $24.00

04/25/07 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

05/08/07 Review of payments, update schedule of interest
and principal on contracts; Begin work on letter for
Trustee's review and signature to Bob Rogers
regarding tax return fye 3/31/07

2.50 $60.000 $150.00

07/02/07 Additional work on letter prepared for Trustee's
review and signature to Bob Rogers, accountant,
regarding tax return for year ending 3/31/07.

1.00 $60.000 $60.00

07/10/07 Additional calculations on principal v interest for tax
return; Finalize letter prepared for Trustee's
signature to Bob Rogers for tax return

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

10/08/07 Review of completed tax return (amended) for year
end 3/31/06 and processing for mailing by certified
mail, return receipt requested, both the tax return
and the Request for Prompt Determination of
Unpaid Taxes

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

10/09/07 Review of completed tax return FYE 3/31/07 and 0.50 $60.000 $30.00
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processing for mailing by certified mail, return
receipt requested, both the tax return and the
Request for Prompt Determination of Unpaid Taxes

04/07/08 Review file; Compile information needed for
preparation of tax return for period ending 3/31/08;
Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
Bob Rogers, accountant, requesting preparation of
tax return for period ending 3/31/08; Preparation of
Form 7004 Extension and file with Internal Revenue
Service

0.80 $60.000 $48.00

04/18/08 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

10/15/08 Review of completed tax return and related
documents; process all for mailing by certified mail,
return receipt requested; update case information
system and follow-up relating to same

0.60 $60.000 $36.00

03/19/09 Calculate interest on secured liens of Carey Woods
and Louie Allred against Highway 271 property ,
prepare table of all secured liens for Trustee's use
in sale of Highway 271 property

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

04/15/09 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

04/17/09 Review of file for information needed for federal
income tax return for year ending 3/31/09; Draft
letter for Trustee's review and signature to Bob
Rogers

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

05/14/09 Receipt and review of notice from IRS; review file;
scan same and e-mail to Bob Rogers, accountant

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

05/19/09 Prepare letter for Trustee's review and signature to
IRS in response to penalty for deliquent return,
providing copy of extension that was timely filed,
with copies to partners and Bob Rogers

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

05/19/09 Prepare letter for Trustee's signature to Bob Rogers
re: K-1s for tax year end 3/31/09

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

05/21/09 Telephone conference with IRS agent regarding
removal of late filing penalty

0.40 $60.000 $24.00

06/01/09 Telephone call with Bob Rogers, review IRS file
and e-mail to Bob Rogers regarding Form 1065 for
period ending 3/31/09

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

06/03/09 Review of completed tax return and processing for 0.50 $60.000 $30.00
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mailing by certified mail, return receipt requested,
both the tax return and the K-1s to each partner

06/25/09 Receipt and review of notice from IRS removing
penalties for late filing re: return FYE 3/31/08 based
on their review of documents submitted by Trustee

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

10/05/09 Review tax return files for K-1 information
requested by accountant for Billy Pyron and e-mail
same to Wallace Gayle of  Gayle & Associates

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

11/16/09 Review information relating to Highway 271
property and prepare updated projected distribution
report

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

02/01/10 Review of file for information needed for federal
income tax return for final, short year return for year
ending 3/31/10; Draft letter for Trustee's review and
signature to Bob Rogers

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

03/02/10 Telephone call with and e-mail to Bob Rogers
regarding final tax return

0.10 $60.000 $6.00

03/10/10 Telephone conference with Sandra Pyron regarding
status of case and projected distribution

0.20 $60.000 $12.00

03/17/10 Review of completed tax return and processing,
including scanning, mailing by certified mail-return
receipt requested, mailing of K-1s by certified
mail-return receipt requested

0.70 $60.000 $42.00

04/06/10 Update case status and information; Prepare
Annual Report to UST

0.30 $60.000 $18.00

04/20/10 Preparation of Final Report and Proposed
Distribution with all schedules, exhibits and
proposed Order

7.00 $60.000 $420.00

04/20/10 Anticipated time, preparation of distribution checks
and transmittal letters; monitoring file for checks to
clear; preparation of Trustee's Distribution Report
and itemization of distributions; Prepare Form 4 and
submit to UST; closing and archiving file

4.00 $60.000 $240.00

Total for category  PARALEGAL: $2,286.0038.10

POSTAGE

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

11/27/02 Motion to Sell Highway 271, Application to Employ
Attorney

1.00 $13.550 $13.55
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12/23/02 Motion to Sell 1) 105 Dobbs Terrace and 2) 210
Dobbs Terrace

1.00 $13.550 $13.55

12/27/02 Motion to Convert; Trustee's Response to Motion to
Dismiss

1.00 $9.940 $9.94

01/27/03 Notice of Intent to Abandon Lot 20, Sherwood
Forest

1.00 $9.250 $9.25

03/28/03 L Southside 1 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

03/28/03 L Allred Louie 1 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

04/16/03 L Allred Louie 2 1.00 $1.520 $1.52

04/17/03 P Sell Multiple Real Estate 1.00 $13.120 $13.12

04/29/03 L McKinney 2 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

05/13/03 Letter to William Lively 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

05/23/03 2004 Exam of Carey Woods 5.00 $0.370 $1.85

05/28/03 Adv/L Pyron 1 1.00 $9.300 $9.30

06/24/03 Review file; Memo to file and Trustee regarding
2002 federal tax return

0.50 $60.000 $30.00

06/25/03 TaxRet02 L Lyles 1 1.00 $0.740 $0.74

07/22/03 certified mail, notices of forfeit 4.00 $5.210 $20.84

09/22/03 Motion to Sell Lots 4 & 5 Sherwood Forest 1.00 $13.550 $13.55

09/24/03 Kittrell invoice 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

09/24/03 Tax Ret, PDR, K-1s FYE 3-31-01 1.00 $10.360 $10.36

02/05/04 Motion to Sell Lots 90 and Lot 17 1.00 $12.200 $12.20

02/10/04 Notices of default 5.00 $5.210 $26.05

04/29/04 Postage on mailing of Motion to Sell Lot 92
(Bonilla) to Matrix.

1.00 $8.880 $8.88

05/20/04 Application to Employ Andy Guinn, Realtor 0.37 $1.000 $0.37

06/01/04 Mailing of Motion to Sell I-20 property to all on
mailing matrix.

1.00 $9.250 $9.25

06/21/04 TaxRet 3-31-04 L Lyles 1 1.00 $1.200 $1.20

06/30/04 Motion to Sell various Sherwood Forest lots 1.00 $13.550 $13.55

08/05/04 Motion to Sell Lots 45 and 50 Harry Albertson
Addition.

1.00 $8.880 $8.88

10/01/04 L Lyles 2 3.00 $0.370 $1.11

10/05/04 L Lyles 3 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

10/21/04 Motion to Sell Lots 48, 49 and 91 1.00 $10.080 $10.08
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11/09/04 L Lyles 3.00 $0.370 $1.11

11/10/04 L Lyles 4 3.00 $0.370 $1.11

11/17/04 L Guinn 4 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

11/22/04 L Gillen 6 1.00 $0.600 $0.60

11/29/04 TaxRet 03 & 04 L Rogers 1 1.00 $0.740 $0.74

11/29/04 Closing Statement to Gillen & Anderson 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

11/30/04 L Horn 2 - CERT, RRR 1.00 $4.420 $4.42

12/06/04 L Horn 3 1.00 $0.600 $0.60

12/07/04 L Smith Co Title 4 (Peters) 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

12/21/04 L Hefner 2 1.00 $1.800 $1.80

12/22/04 L First Nat'l Bank Winnsboro 1.00 $1.800 $1.80

01/03/05 Tax Ret FYE 3/31/03 and 3/31/04, CERT, RRR &
K-1s

1.00 $28.820 $28.82

01/11/05 L Scales 4 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

01/27/05 L Smith Co Title 5 (Robertson) 1.00 $1.430 $1.43

02/16/05 L Arete Real Estate 1 1.00 $0.830 $0.83

03/03/05 L Bradford 5 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

03/07/05 Rogers fee app 1.00 $1.260 $1.26

03/15/05 L Smith Co Title 6 (Robertson) 1.00 $5.160 $5.16

03/23/05 Motion to Sell Lots 39, 40, 51 & 52 1.00 $10.080 $10.08

03/28/05 L Arete Real Estate 2 1.00 $5.620 $5.62

03/28/05 L Smith Co Title 6 (Robertson) 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

03/30/05 L Bradford 6 1.00 $1.060 $1.06

04/13/05 L Arete Real Estate 3 1.00 $5.210 $5.21

04/18/05 Check #104 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

05/10/05 L Pyron 5 2.00 $0.370 $0.74

05/12/05 plat to Bass/Winston 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

05/12/05 L Gillen 7 and deed 1.00 $0.600 $0.60

05/20/05 L Colbert 1 1.00 $0.600 $0.60

05/24/05 L Bradford 7 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

06/15/05 L Whatley 1.00 $2.720 $2.72

06/22/05 L Horn 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

06/27/05 L Whatley 1.00 $0.740 $0.74

06/28/05 App to Emp Whatley 1.00 $0.370 $0.37
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07/14/05 L Whatley 3 1.00 $1.060 $1.06

07/14/05 L Whatley 1.00 $0.830 $0.83

07/18/05 Tax Ret, PDR, K-1s, cert, RRR 1.00 $18.830 $18.83

07/22/05 FeeApp Rogers 2 to Debtor 1.00 $0.600 $0.60

08/24/05 Check #105 1.00 $0.370 $0.37

11/15/05 L Whatley 4 1.00 $1.200 $1.20

11/21/05 L Horn 5 2.00 $0.370 $0.74

02/13/06 Transfer Claim 3.00 $0.390 $1.17

02/23/06 Motion to Sell Highway 271 Property 1.00 $10.230 $10.23

06/15/06 Form 8736 1.00 $0.390 $0.39

07/18/06 TaxRet FYE 3-31-06 L Rogers 1 1.00 $1.650 $1.65

07/24/06 L One Tall Oak 1 (cert, rrr) 1.00 $5.420 $5.42

08/23/06 TaxRet 2005 and pdr 1.00 $10.480 $10.48

08/30/06 Accountant's 3rd Fee App 2.00 $0.630 $1.26

10/09/06 Accountant Invoice paid 1.00 $0.390 $0.39

10/17/06 L One Tall Oak 2 1.00 $5.440 $5.44

04/24/07 L Shettle 2 4.00 $0.390 $1.56

07/10/07 TaxRet FYE 3-31-07 L Rogers 1 3.00 $0.410 $1.23

07/13/07 POC Objs #9 and #11 3.00 $0.920 $2.76

07/13/07 Motion to Sell Hwy 14 1.00 $11.650 $11.65

09/19/07 L Bradford & Patterson 1 (cert, rrr) 1.00 $11.240 $11.24

10/08/07 Tax Return, PDR and K-1s (2), by certified mail, rrr 1.00 $23.320 $23.32

10/09/07 Tax Return, PDR and K-1s FYE 3/31/07, cert, rrr 1.00 $21.690 $21.69

10/23/07 P Stay Obj - Tyler ISD 1.00 $0.410 $0.41

11/09/07 L Florence 2 1.00 $0.410 $0.41

12/20/07 Note Obligor L Price 2 1.00 $5.210 $5.21

12/20/07 Note Obligor L White 1 2.00 $0.410 $0.82

01/21/08 Objections to claims 1.00 $6.800 $6.80

02/06/08 L White 2 1.00 $5.620 $5.62

02/19/08 L Long 1 1.00 $0.410 $0.41

02/28/08 POC Objs Withdrawals 1.00 $0.580 $0.58

02/29/08 cert, rrr, Int and RFP claim resolution 2.00 $5.380 $10.76

03/03/08 L Echols 3 1.00 $0.580 $0.58

03/18/08 POC Obj #3 - Amended 2.00 $0.580 $1.16
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03/24/08 2nd Amended Obj to Claim #3 2.00 $0.580 $1.16

04/07/08 Form 7004 1.00 $0.410 $0.41

04/07/08 TaxRet FYE 3/31/08 L Rogers 1 3.00 $0.410 $1.23

04/18/08 Abandon Hwy 14 / Sell Hwy 271 1.00 $6.350 $6.35

05/13/08 L Rogers Buddy 1 2.00 $0.420 $0.84

06/04/08 Motion to Continue / Exhibit and Witness List 1.00 $0.420 $0.42

07/09/08 Reply to Pyron's Response Sell Hwy 271 1.00 $0.420 $0.42

07/11/08 Exhibit & Witness List - cert, rrr 1.00 $6.240 $6.24

08/01/08 Brief 1.00 $0.420 $0.42

08/25/08 L Long - files on lot sales 1.00 $8.050 $8.05

10/15/08 TaxRet and K-1s FYE 3/31/08, cert, rrr 1.00 $16.130 $16.13

10/20/08 L Bent Tree 1, cert, rrr 1.00 $5.320 $5.32

12/08/08 L Bent Tree 3 1.00 $0.420 $0.42

03/19/09 L Bent Tree 4 1.00 $0.420 $0.42

05/19/09 TaxRet FYE 3-31-08 L IRS 1 re late filing (cert., rrr) 1.00 $7.540 $7.54

05/19/09 TaxRet FYE 3-31-09 L Rogers 2 1.00 $0.440 $0.44

06/03/09 TaxRet FYE 3/31/09 and K-1s, cert, rrr 1.00 $16.960 $16.96

09/16/09 L Bent Tree 5 1.00 $0.610 $0.61

10/08/09 Attorney's Fee App 1.00 $14.560 $14.56

10/27/09 L Bent Tree 6 - cert, rrr 1.00 $5.540 $5.54

12/08/09 L Echols 5 1.00 $0.610 $0.61

01/20/10 L Smith Co. Clerk 3 1.00 $0.440 $0.44

02/01/10 TaxRet FYE 3-31-2010 L Rogers 1 3.00 $0.440 $1.32

03/17/10 TaxRet FYE 3-31-10 and K-1s - Cert, RRR 1.00 $16.960 $16.96

04/13/10 Estimated postage for bank statements to UST
(TFR and TDR) and final distribution to creditors

1.00 $13.540 $13.54

Total for category  POSTAGE: $615.10157.87

TRAVEL

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

02/12/03 Mileage to Tyler to attend closing and hearing on
motion to sell

80.00 $0.350 $28.00

05/07/03 Mileage to Tyler for Trustee's review of records at
office of Billy Pyron

80.00 $0.350 $28.00

06/04/03 Mileage to Tyler for hearing on Motion to Sell Real 80.00 $0.350 $28.00
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Estate

06/05/03 Mileage to Tyler for 2004 Examination of Carey
Woods

80.00 $0.350 $28.00

08/26/03 Mileage to Tyler for deposition of Sandra Pyron 80.00 $0.350 $28.00

07/16/08 Mileage to Tyler for heraing on Motion to Sell
Highway 271 Property

80.00 $0.585 $46.80

06/22/09 Mileage to Tyler to view Highway 271 property 70.00 $0.550 $38.50

Total for category  TRAVEL: $225.30550.00

TRUSTEE BOND

Date Description TotalHours/Unit Rate

Category:

12/06/02 International Sureties 1.00 $100.000 $100.00

Total for category  TRUSTEE BOND: $100.001.00

$7,029.93Total for case  02-63369:

Grand Total: $7,029.93












































































