UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT . .
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS

Tyler Division
IN RE: } CASE NO. 01-20344
A&H, Inc. )
dba A&H Electric )
) CHAPTER7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE'S FINAL REPORT. APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION,
AND REPORT QF PROPOSED DISTRIBUTION

Bob Anderson, the Trustee of the estate of the above-named debtor(s), certifies under penalty of
perjury, to the Court and United States Trustee, that the trustee has faithfully and properly fulfilled the duties
of his office, that the trustee has examined all proofs of claim as appropriate in preparation for the proposed
distribution, and that the proposed distribution attached hereto is proper and consistent with the law and
rules of the Court. The Trustee applies for the commissions and expenses set forth herein and states that

they are reasonable and proper.

Therefore, the Trustee requests that the Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of

Proposed Distribution be approved.
Date: q /50/03 @( y/(‘\—

Bob Anderson, Trustee
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REVIEWED BY THE UNITED STATES TRUSTEE

I have reviewed the Trustee's Final Report, Application for Compensation, and Report of Proposed
Distribution.

United States Trustee

Date: /0-/4 - ¢ 3 By: M




SCHEDULE A-1

FINAIL. ACCOUNT AS OF: 09/29/03

A.

B.

GROSS RECEIPTS

DISBURSEMENTS

(1) Secured Creditors 0.00
(2)  Administrative Expenses 12,136.54
(3) Priority Creditors 0.00
(4)  Other - distribution of non-estate receipts 3,034.50
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

BALANCE ON HAND

(GROSS ESTATE RECEIPTS: $86,525.05 - 3,034.50 = $83,490.55)

$86,525.05

$15.171.04

$71.354.01



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COI._]RT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS'. . S
MARSHALLDIVISION .., ... 4 ;- q. 10
ORI B SN Bt id
IN RE: § SLEAm L e
§ " CASE NO. 01-20344
A&H, INC. EOD § S o
| § "© 7\ CHAPTER7
DEBTOR AUG 7 2001 §
ORDER G G TRUSTEE'S MOTION TO DISBURSE NON-ESTATE FUN

OnJuly _{| _,2001, TRUSTEE’S MOTION TO DISBURSE NON-ESTATE FUNDS
{the "Motion") was filed by BOB ANDERSON, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE (the "Movant") in the
above-referenced case. The Court finds that the Motion was properly served pursuant to the
Federal and Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it contained the appropriate twenty
(20)-day negative notice language, pursiant to Local Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which
directed any party opposed to the granting of the relief sought by the Motion to file a writien
response within twenty days or the Motion would be desmed by the Court o be unopposed. The
Court finds that no objection or other written response to the Motion has been timely filed by any
party. Due to the failure of any party to file a timely written response, the allegations contained
in the Motion stand unopposed and, therefore, the Court finds that good cause exists for the entry
of the following order.

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the TRUSTEE’S MOTION TO DISBURSE NON-
ESTATE FUNDS filed by BOB ANDERSON, CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE on July _{]
2001, is hereby GRANTED so as to authorme Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, to disburse the
trust fund portion of the $11,470.40-setainage payment received from RPR Construction
Company, Inc., being the syfi of $3,034. 50, to aylor Lightning Protection.

_W , 2001.
BILL PARKER
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

m....‘“om

SIGNED this the

ORDER GRANTING TRUSTEE’S MOTION TO DISBURSE NON-ESTATE FUNDS - Page 1
FADocumenis\TCLIENTS\BSINP Distribute Non-Estate Funds M&O. wpd
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SCHEDULEB
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION

COMPUTATION OF COMMISSIONS (cases filed after 10/22/95)

Total Receipts $83.490.55 25% of First $5,000 § 1.250.00

Less (5,000.00)

Balance 78.490.55 10% of next $45,000 § 4.500.00

Less {45,000.00)

Balance 33.490.55 5% of next $950,000 $ 1,674.53

Less (950,000.00)

Balance 0.00 3% of Remaining Balance § 0.00
TOTAL COMMISSIONS  § 7.424.53

UNREIMBURSED EXPENSES

Recording Fees $ 0.00

Necessary Travel (@ .35/mile) 5 0.00

Paraprofessional (exhibit attached) b 1,110.00

Clerical and Stenographic (exhibit attached) 5 430.00

Photocopies (@ .25/each) $ 278.75

Postage $ 181.10

Long Distance Telephone Charges b 17.25

Other Expenses 5 25.00

TOTAL UNREIMBURSED EXPENSES by 2.042.10

Records:

® Trustee did not take possession of business or personal records of the debtor.

Notice given debtor on to pick up business or personal records in hands of Trustee.

m}




Case No. 01-20344 Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit
A&H, Inc. Page 1
In the United States Bankruptcy Court

Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division

Date Service Performed Time C P| LD
TRUSTEE SERVICES 0 0 0
ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY 0 0 0

2/21/2001 Telephone conference with Michael Smith regarding .70 2 34| 10
lawsuit against Stiles; Review of pleadings; Review of
letter from McNally (.50); Letter to M. McNally
regarding A&H v. Stiles (.20)

3/13/2001 Review bank statements and records for preferences; 70 1 34 0
Letter to Jean Taylor requesting additional information

57212001 Letter to Taylor Lighting regarding claim against trust .20 4 .34 0
fund

5/2/2001 Preparation of form letter to send to numerous account 30 0 0 0
obligors

5/4/2001 Letter to Jean Taylor regarding Taylor Lighting’s .20 5 .68 0
response to Trustee’s inquiry

5/31/2001 Letter to Jean Taylor regarding preferences (.20); Letter .50 3 4.79 0
to Dealers Electric regarding preference (.30)

6/1/2001 Prearation of demand letter to DB Constructors; .50 4 4.42 0
Preparation of letter to A&S Collection regarding status
of collections for Debtor

6/13/2001 Review of accounts receivable records and preparation of 1.50 31 | 112.54 0
numerous demand letters regarding accounts receivable

6/20/2001 Receipt and review of information and documents from .30 12 1.48 0
Taylor Lighting and letter to Mary Jo Schnorbus
regarding same

6/28/2001 Telephone conference with Rocco Kuhn, Hibernia Bank, .30 4 .68 0
regarding secured status; Letter to Jason Searcy
concerning same

6/28/2001 Letter to CSN Sign Company regarding balance 1o be 20 1 .34 0
paid to Trustee

10/24/2001 Review accounts receivable; Telephone conference with .50 2 442 | 10
Mrs. Schnorbus; Letter to Merritt Plaza regarding
account receivable




Case No. 01-20344

Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit

A&H, Inc. Page 2
In the United States Bankrupicy Court
Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division
Date Service Performed Time C P | LD
11/1/2001 Review accounts receivable for collectibility .50 0 0 0
TOTAL ASSET ANALYSIS AND RECOVERY 6.4 0 0 0
0 0 0
ASSET DISPOSITION 0 0 0
5/9/2001 Telephone confcrence with Mary Jo Schnorbus regarding 20 0 0 0
- life insurance
TOTAL ASSET DISPOSITION 0.2 0 0 0
0 0 0
CASE ADMINISTRATION 0 0 0
2/15/2001 Telephone conference with Jean Taylor regarding outline 50 0 0 15
issues of case (.30); Telephone conference with Bill
Watson, auctioneer, to secured assets {.20)
2/19/2001 Letter to Jean Taylor regarding various case issues .40 3 .34 ]
3/2/2001 Telephone conference with Jean Taylor .20 0 0 0
571572001 Telephone conference with Hibernia Bank, Kuhn (.20); 40 0 0 15
Receipt and review of Security Agreement (.20)
6/22/2001 Letter to Rocco Kuhn of Hibernia Bank regarding Bank’s .30 1 37 0
claim of security interest despite lack of perfection
7/25/2001 Letter to Charles Lauffer forwarding endorsed items .20 3 37 0
TOTAL CASE ADMINISTRATION 2 0 0 0
0 0 0
CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND OBJECTIONS 0 0 0
2/15/2001 Telephone conference with Rick Jackson regarding .20 0 0 0
subcontractor claim
TOTAL CLAIMS ADMINISTRATION AND 0.2 0 0 0
OBJECTIONS
0 0 0




Case No. 01-20344 Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit
A&H, Inc. Page 3
In the United States Bankruptcy Court

Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Diviston

Date Service Performed Time C P | LD
TAX ISSUES 0 0 0
12/11/2001 Receipt and review of tax return FYE 9/30/01 from Bob 30 0 0 0
Rogers, accountant
11/6/2002 Receipt and review of tax return FYE 9/30/02 from Bob .30 0 ] 0
Rogers, accountant
9/22/2003 Prepare final tax return S50 0 0 0
' TOTAI TAX ISSUES 1.1 0 g 0
0 0 0
TOTAL TRUSTEE SERVICES, ALL CATETORIES 9.9 0 0 0
0 0 0
SECRETARIAL SERVICES 0 0 0
2/19/2001 Telephone conference with Bill Watson regarding list of .20 6 g 5
assets from schedules and provide same to him
2/26/2001 Set up notebook files for administration as asset case .20 3 0 0
272772001 Review of numerous pleadings, documents and schedules 1.00 0 0 0
and post assets and other case information to management
system
3/9/2001 Preparation of Request for Clerk to Set Bar Date for 20 4 1.11 0
Claims for Trustee’s signamre
3/9/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same (mumerous items) 1.00 10 0 0
3/12/2001 Set up financial file; Open bank account; Preparation of 40 2 0 0
Form W-9 for bank
3/20/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same .20 2 0 0
3/29/2001 Post adjusting entry due to payment on a/r returned NSF .10 0 0 0
4/10/2001 Reconcile bank statement 10 0 0 0
4/18/2001 Additional work on file, including review of outstanding 1.00 0 0 0
accounts receivable; review of and posting regarding
amended schedules




Case No. 01-20344

Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit

A&H, Inc. Page 4
In the United States Bankruptcy Court
Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division
Date Service Performed Time C P} LD
4/18/2001 Discussion with Trustee regarding accounts receivable, .20 0 0
auction, insurance policy and other issues
4/24/2001 Review of schedules, titles and other information and .50 4 0 0
preparation of asset lists in connection with Trustee’s
Motion to Sell Assets at Public Sale
4/27/2001 Mailout of Notice of Public Sale (expenses of mailout .50 0 0 0
charged on attorney fee application)
5/1/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same 20 2 0 0
5/10/2001 Reconcile bank statement 10 0 0 0
5/14/2001 Review of insurance files; Telephone conference with Jim .20 0 0 0
McClain’s office regarding life insurance policy to be
purchased by Mrs. Schnorbus; Notations to file
5/15/2001 Telephone conference with Jim McClain’s office .10 0 0 0
regarding life insurance policy
5/21/2001 Telephone conference with Sandy of Judge Parker’s office 10 0 0 0
regarding undated Certificate of Service on Trustee’s
Application to Employ Attorneys
5/22/2001 Review of listing of accounts receivable listing provided 1.00 0 0 0
by Debtor, review of accounts assigned to collection
agency (A&S), confirmation that all payments received
are reflected by the current balances due, update accounts
receivable list to reflect accounts Trustee will attempt to
collect
5/22/2001 Preparation of Supplemental Certificate of Service to .10 4 1.02 0
Trustee’s Application to Employ Attorneys
5/31/2001 Prepare documents for delivery to Texas Workforce 20 10 0 0
(pertaining to 2001 payroll); Conference with Linda
Fowler of Texas Workforce
6/1/2001 Open checking account; transfer funds to checking and .20 0 0 0
prepare check for payment of adversary filing fee against
Wholesale Electric
6/1/2001 Preparation of deposit, including allocation of auction 40 2 0 0
sales proceeds to various assets




Case No. 01-20344 Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit
A&H, Inc. Page 5
In the United States Bankruptcy Court

Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division

Date Service Performed Time C P| LD
6/1/2001 Preparation of various DOT documents to transfer titles 2.00 120 0 0
on 7 vehicles sold at public sale
6/7/2001 Telephone conference with DB Constructors and fax .20 0 0| 10
requested information to DB
6/12/2001 Reconcile bank statement .10 0 0 0
6/13/2001 Preparation of multiple item deposit and post same .80 8 0 0
6/20/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same .20 4 0 0
6/26/2001 Prepare letter for Trustee’s review and signature to Mary 40 3 .34 0
Jo Schnorbur regarding sale of interest in insurance policy
to her
7/2/2001 Prepare letter for Trustee’s review and signature to 22 10 2 34 0
Acquisition regarding account receivable invoice to
Merritt Plaza and forwarding requested documentation
7/5/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same .20 3 0 0
71512001 Prepare letter for Trustee’s review and signature to .10 3 34 0
Dealers Electric providing documents per their request
7/9/2001 Reconcile bank statement 10 0 0 0
8/2/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same 20 2 0 0
8/9/2001 Reconcile bank statement .10 0 0 0
8/20/2001 Preparation of deposit and post same .20 2 0 0
8/20/2001 Transfer funds to checking; Prepare check to Taylor .30 6 .74 0
Lightning Protection pursuant to Order authorizing
distribution of non-estate funds; Letter for Trustee’s
review and signature to Mike Weir regarding same;
Prepare check to Bill Watson Auctioneer pursuant to
Order approving auctioneer’s fees and expenses
9/19/2001 Reconcile bank statement .10 0 0 ¢
9/21/2001 Preparation of Request for Clerk to Release Claims file to .10 4 .68 0
Trustee




Case No. 01-20344 Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit
A&H, Inc. Page 6
In the United States Bankruptcy Court

Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division

Date Service Performed Time C P| LD

10/5/2001 Review of accounts receivable status and memo to file .50 0 0 0
and Trustee

10/11/2001 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0

11/12/2001 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0

12/13/2001 Transfer funds to checking; Preparation of check to Clerk .20 0 0 0
in payment of adversary proceeding filing fees

12/14/2001 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0

1/13/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0

1/24/2002 Preparation of deposit and post saine .20 2 0 0

2/13/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0

37772002 Preparation of deposit and post same 20 3 0 0

3/8/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 ¢ 0

3/15/2002 Transfer funds to checking; Preparation of check to Bob 20 4 37 0
Rogers for approved accounting fees

3/18/2002 Letter to Michael Smith for Trustee’s signature requesting .20 1 34 0
status report on A&H v. Stiles litigation

3/18/2002 Compare claims to schedules, noting discrepancies for .20 0 0 0
Trustee’s use in reviewing claims for objections

3/21/2002 Letter to Mrs. Schnorbus for Trustee’s signature 10 1 34 0
regarding destruction or return of records

4/1/2002 Office conference with Mary Jo Schnorbus regarding .20 1 0 0
status of case and return of records to her

4/1/2002 Review of accounts receivable and memo to file and 30 0 0 0
trustee

4/8/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0

5/18/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0

6/18/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0

771172002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
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Trustee, Secretarial & Paralegal Exhibit
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In the United States Bankruptcy Court
Eastern District of Texas, Tyler Division
Date Service Performed Time C P | LD
8/12/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
9/12/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
9/19/2002 Prepare letter for Trustee’s signature to Michael Smith 20 1 .37 0
requesting status report on A&H v. Stiles litigation
10/9/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
11/13/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
12/12/2002 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
1/13/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
2/10/2003 Telephone conference with Val Jones® office regarding 20 0 0 5
the Stiles litigation matter; Memo to file and Trustee
regarding same
2/17/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
3/12/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
4/9/2003 Transfer funds to checking and preparation of check to 20 3 37 0
Bob Rogers in payment of accounting fees approved by
Order signed 3/23/03
4/11/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
5/9/2003 Preparation of deposit and post same 20 2 0 0
5/15/2003 Telephone conferences with Chris of the Val Jones Law .20 0 0 5
Office regarding status of A & H Electric Co. v. Stiles;
Memo to Trustee regarding same
5/16/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 G 0 0
6/16/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement 10 0 0 0
7/28/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
8/13/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
8/18/2003 Post all claims, objections, orders and other claim 1.50 0 0 0
' information and prepare projected distribution report for
Trustee's use in preparing attorney’s fee application
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Date Service Performed Time C P| LD
8/19/2003 Mailout of Notice of Fee Application to all parties on .20 0 0 0
matrix (copy and postage expense included on Attorney’s
fee application)
9/15/2003 Reconciliation of bank statement .10 0 0 0
9/29/2003 Telephone conferences with Texas Comptroller and with 50 20 0 0
Texas Workforce to confirm that proof of claim amounts
are still valid
9/29/2003 Preparation of check to Smead, Anderson & Dunn in .20 3 0 0
payment of approved attorney fees and expenses
TOTAL SECRETARIAL SERVICES 21.5 0 0 0
0 0 0
PARALEGAL SERVICES 0 0 0
2/16/2001 UCC-1 lien search via Lexis-Nexis; Telephone .50 0 0 20
conferences with First National Bank (now Hibernia)
regarding obtaining copy of UCC-1
2/16/2001 Telephone conference with Jeff Ashford of Hibernia 20 0 0 0
regarding UCC-1 which was expired but not terminated
3/8/2001 Rescarch and telephone calls to County Clerks and tax 1.00 0 01 20
assessors to determine perfected liens, ad valorem taxes
owed, status of any federal or state tax liens, etc.;
Discussions with Trustee regarding same and memos to
file
4/14/2001 Update Form 1 and Form 2, post interest and confirm .20 0 0 0
balance
4/18/2001 Review of documents provided; Notations to file and tax .50 0 0 0
return information regarding net operating losses
5/30/2001 Telephone conference with Linda Fowler of Texas 20 0 0 0
Workforce Commission regarding payroll records for first
quarter, 2001
6/13/2001 Prepare for Trustee’s review and signature Report of Sale 1.00 268 8.16 0
and various Exhibits to same
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Date Service Performed Time C P| LD
8/3/2001 Review of numerous accounts receivable, Trustee’s prior 2.00 0 0 0
demand letters, and responses received, if any;
Discussion with Trustee regarding which accounts to
continue to pursue, and update records according to same
8/6/2001 Follow up letters for Trustee’s signature on six accounts 1.00 13 3.06 0
receivable, providing additional information, enclosing
backup documentation, or other response as required by
obligor’s response to first demand, if any
10/18/2001 Review file and gather information required by accountant .80 48 0 ]
for preparation of federal income tax return; Prepare
letter for Trustee’s review and signature to Bob Rogers
regarding tax return
10/30/2001 Update case status; Prepare Form 1 and Form 2 and .20 0 0 0
confirm balance
3/29/2002 Telephone conference with Mary Jo Schnorbus regarding .30 0 0 0
status of case and picking up records
4/30/2002 Update case status; Prepare Form 1 and Form 2 and .20 0 0 0
confirm balance
10/24/2002 Review file for information needed by accountant for 40 4 37 0
preparation of tax return for year end 9/30/02; Prepare
letter for Trustee’s review and signature to Bob Rogers
providing information for tax return
11/6/2002 Review, process and mail out by certified mail Estate’s .30 2 9.99 0
federal income tax return FYE 9/30/02 and the Request
for Prompt Determination in connection with same
2/27/2003 Electronically file Accountant’s Fee Application 30 0 0 0
41222003 Update case status; Prepare Form 1 and Form 2, and .20 0 0 0
confirm balance
8/19/2003 Electronically file Attorney’s Fee Application 30 0 0 0
9/22/2003 Telephone conference with Bob Rogers regarding final .50 4 0 0
tax return; Obitain forms required via IRS website; Gather
information required for Trustee to prepare the tax return
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Date Service Performed Time C P| LD

9/23/2003 Additional work on tax return FYE 9/30/03; Prepare for 1.00 0 0 0
Trustee’s review and signature Request for Prompt
Determination to Internal Revenue Service and Trustee’s
Disclosure for attachment to tax return

9/24/2003 Process and mail by certified mail both tax return fye 40 16 9.53 0
9/30/03 and Request for Prompt Determination

9/29/2003 Preparation of Final Report and Proposed Distribution 4.00 353 4.75 0
and attached schedules, including review of claims and
posting/confirming same; preparation of secretarial and
paralegal exhibit; preparation of exhibit for trustee’s time
and services; additional posting of claimant entries for
disbursements made during pendency of the case; tally
expenses; post final interest to money market account and
transfer to deposit account; update property record and
cash receipts and disbursements and confirm balance;
calculation of Trustee's compensation and post same;
preparation of Order approving proposed distribution;
letter for Trustee's signature to United States Trustee

12/31/2003 Anticipated time in preparation of checks for final 3.00 84 7.39 0
distribution; transmittal letter to payees; monitoring file
for all checks to clear; possible preparation of motion to
deposit unclaimed funds in registry of the court;
preparation of final report and report of distribution;
preparation of itemization of distributions; preparation of
Form 4 and electronic submission to office of United
States Trustee; leiter for Trustee's signature to United
States Trustee; monitor file for payment of fee and
archive file after closing

TOTAL PARALEGAL SERVICES 18.5 0 0 0

TOTAL COPY, POSTAGE AND LONG DISTANCE 1115 181.1 | 115




11 U.S.C. Sec. 507(a) (1)
Court Costs and Fees

11 U.5.C Sec. 503{b) (1) {A)
Preservation of Estate
Transportation

Storage

Wages

Estates share FICA
Insurance

Upkeep
Other

M Eg QW

{itemize}

11 U.8.C. Sec. 503(b} (2}
Post~Petition taxes and
related penalties

11 U.8.C. Sec. 503(b)(2)

Compensation and

Reimbursement

A. Compensation of Trustee

B. Expenses of Trustee

C. Compensation of
Attorney to Trustee

D. Expenses of Attorney
to Trustee

E. Compensation of
Trustee's Accountant

F. Compensation of
Ructioneer

G. Expenses of Auctioneer

Court Special Charges
(Excess Notices)

U.5. Trustee fees

Other

(post-petition utilities
paid by property owner -
Claim #11,

Totals:

Mary Jo Schnorbus)

SCHEDULE C

EXPENSES OF ADMINISTRATION

(1) (2) (3) {4)
Amount Amount Previously

Claimed Allowed Paid Due
8 0.00 5 300.00 3 300.00 3 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.60 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7,424.53 7,424.53 0.00 7,424.53
2,042.10 2,042.10 0.00 2,042.10
5,242.50 5,242.50 5,242.50 0.00
682.40 682.40 682.40 0.00
300.00 300.00 300.00 0.00
3,937.05 3,937.05 3,937.05% 0.00
1,674.5% 1,674.59 1,674.59 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
682.00 682.00 0.00 682.00
521,985.17 $22,285.17 $12,136.54 $10,148.63




IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
MARSHALL DIVISION
IN RE: §
§ CASE NO. 01-20344
A&H, INC. §
§ CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR §

ORDER ALLOWING FEES AND EXPENSES OF SMEAD. ANDERSON & DUNN
AS COUNSEL FOR CHAPTER 7 TRUSTEE

On or about August 19, 2003, the Application of Smead, Anderson & Dunn as Counsel
for Trustee for Allowance of Attorney Fees and Expenses was filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7
Trustee (the “Applicant™) in the above-referenced case. The Court finds that the Application was
properly served pursuant to the Federal and Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it
contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice language, pursuant to Local Rule of
Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which directed any party opposed to the granting of the fees and
expenses requested by the Application to file a written objection within twenty days or the
- Application would be deemed by the Court to be unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or
other written response to the Application has been timely filed by any party. Due to the failure of
any party to file a timely written response, the Application stands unopposed and, therefore, the
Court, having reviewed the Application and determined whether the services and expenses as
outlined in the application were actual, reasonable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the
entry of the following order.

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the fees in the amount of $5,242.50 and expenses
in the amount of $682.40 incurred by Applicant Smead, Anderson & Dunn in the representation of
Trustee, for a total amount of $5,924.90, is APPROVED; and the same shall be paid from available
estate funds upon the execution hereof.

Signed on 09/22/2003

BILL PARKER
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

ORDER ALLOWING FEES AND EXPENSES OF ATTORNEY FOR TRUSTEE - Page 1
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT & /.
EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS . AP

MARSHALL DIVISION e f). 7 a /5 '
IN RE: § s '
§ SE-NO. 01-20344
A&H, INC. § EOD N
§ CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR §MAR (5 2002 '

ORDER GRANTING APPLICATION FOR ALLOWANCE OF ACCOUNTANT'S FEES
FILED BY BOB ANDERSON, A FOR CHAPTER 7 TRUSTE

On Febmuary i, 2002, a Trustee's Application for Allowance of Accountant’s Fees (the
"Application") was filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trusgee, (the "Movant") in the above-referenced
case, The Court finds that the Application was properly served pursvant to the Federal and Local Rules
of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice language,
pursuant to Local Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which directed any party opposed to the granting
of the relief sought by the Application to file a written response within fwenly days or the Application
would be deemed by the Coust to be unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or other written
response (o the Application has been timely filed by any party. Due to the failure of any party to file a
timely written response, the allegations contained in the Motion stand unopposed and, therefore, the Court,
having reviewed the Application and having determined that the services and expenses outlined in the
application were actual, reasopable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the entry of the
following order: -

IT 1S THEREFORE ORDERED that the Application for Allowance of Accountant's Fees
Filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, on February .5, 2002,is hereby GRANTED so as to
authorize the Trustee to pay to Robert G. Rogers, C.P.A., to the extent that funds are available, the sum
of $200.00 as payment for his professional fees in connection with the representation of Trustee in this

SIGNED this the E M day Ofm 2002. \@
PA I D S am |
16, -

CK. NOL_ UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JULGE

case.




IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
MARSHALL DIVISION
IN RE: §
§ CASE NO. 01-20344
A&H, INC. §
§ CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR §

ORDER GRANTING TRUSTEE’S SECOND APPLICAT_ION.

FOR ALLOWANCE QOF ACCQUNTANT'S FEES

On February 27, 2003, Trustee’s Second Application for Allowance of Accountant’s Fees (the
“Application™) was filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, (the “Movant”) in the above-referenced case.
The Court finds that the Application was properly served pursuant to the Federal and Local Rules of
Bankruptcy Procedure and that it contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice language,
pursuant to Local Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which directed any party opposed to the granting of
the relief sought by the Application to file a written response within twenty days or the Application would
be deemed by the Court to be unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or other written response to
the Application has been timely filed by any party. Due to the failure of any party to file a timely written
response, the allegations contained in the Motion stand unopposed and, therefore, the Court, having
reviewed the Application and having determined that the services and expenses outlined in the application
were actual, reasonable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the entry of the following order:

ITIS THEREFORE ORDERED that Trustee’s Second Application for Allowance of Accountant’s
Fees Filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee, on February 27, 2003, is hereby GRANTED 50 as to
authorize the Trustee to pay to Robert G. Rogers, C.P.A,, to the extent that funds are available, the sum of
$100.00 as payment of his accountant’s fees in connection with this case.
' Signed on 03/23/2003

BILL PARKER :
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

Ok Foy 2

PAID

DATE. Ll 5 (o3 t [00. 00O

ORDER GRANTING TRUSTEE'S SEOOND APPLICATION FOR ALLOWANCE OF ACCOUNTANT"S FEES - Page 1
FDoaments\TCLIENTS\8523 - A&H\WFee App Rogers 2.wpd

nnnim EQANG AR



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS T R A0S
MARSHALL DIVISION T
"IN RE: § L
CASE NO. 01-20344
A&H, INC. § EOp
§  Ju CHAPTER 7
DEBTOR g L12 20p

ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION AND REI RSEMENT OF EXPEN
OF TRUSTEE’S AUCTIONEER, BILI, WATSON AUCTION SERVICE

On or about June |5 , 2001, the Application for Compensation of Auctioneer and
Reimbursement of Expenses was filed by Bob Anderson, Chapter 7 Trustee (the "Applicant”) in the above-
referenced case. The Court finds that the Application was properly served pursuant to the Federal and
Local Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure and that it contained the appropriate twenty (20)-day negative notice
language, pursuant to Local Rule of Bankruptcy Procedure 9007, which directed any party opposed to the
granting of the fees and expenses requested by the Application to file a writien response within twenty days
or the Application would be deemed by the Court to be unopposed. The Court finds that no objection or
other written Tesponse to the Application has been timely filed by any party. Due to the failure of any
party to file a timely written response, the Application stands unopposed and, therefore, the Court, having
reviewed the Application and determined whether the services and expenses as outlined in the application
were actual, reasonable and necessary, finds that good cause exists for the entry of the following order.

IT IS THEREFORE ORDERED that the fees in the amount of $3,937.05 and expenses in the
amount of $1,674.59 incurred by Auctioneer Bill Watson Auction Service in connection with this Estate,
for a total amount of $5,611.64, is APPROVED; and the same shall be paid from available estate funds
upon the execution hereof.

SIGNED this the,{/ M day of

BILL PARKER
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE

PAID

7132 3 #i03
w3 [20/0
4702~ 23,931.05
Higy- 54, 619-5%

ORDER ALLOWING COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES OF AUCTIONEER - Page 1
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SCHEDULE D

SECURED CLAIMS
Claim Amount Amount Not Amount Previously
No. Claimed Determined Allowed Paid Due
2 4,513.81 3,171.49 1,342.32 0.00 1,342.32
4.513.81 3.171.49 1.342.32 0.00 1.342.32

IDENTIFICATION OF SECURED PARTIES AFFECTED:

Claim Number Name of Creditor

2 County of Harrison, et.al.



SCHEDULE E
PRIORITY CLAIMS OTHER THAN ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES IN THE
FOLLOWING ORDER OF PRIORITY

(1 2 3) 4
Amount Amount Amount Amount
Claimed Allowed Paid Due
1. For Credit extended
Sec. 364(e)(1) b 000 35 000 § 0.00 $ 0.00
2. Claims for failure of "adequate
protection”
Sec. 307(a)(b) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
3. "Gap Claims"
Sec. 507(a)(2) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
4. Wages, etc.
Sec. 507(a)(3) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
5. Contributions to benefit plans
Sec. 507(a}4) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
6. Consumer deposits
Sec. 507(a)(6) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
7. Alimony
Sec. 507(a)(7) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
8. Taxes
Sec. 507(a){8) 2,978.44 2,978.44 0.00 2,978.44
9. Depository Institutions
Sec. 507(a)(9) 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
10. Other: No Basis 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Totals: 2,978.44 2,978.44 0.00 2,978.44
PARTIES AFFECTED:
Claim Number Name of Creditor
9 Texas Comptroller of Public Accounts
13 Texas Workforce Commission
FILED UNSECURED CLAIMS TOTAL: $ 193,389.60

SUBORDINATED UNSECURED CLAIMS: $ 0.00




Printed: 10/01/03 01:57 PM Page: 1

Claims Register

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.
Claims Bar Date;  06/11/01

Claim Claimant Name / Claim Type/ Claim Ref./ Amount Filed/ Paid Claim
Number <Category>, Priority Date Filed Notes Allowed to Date Balance
Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 $7,424.53 $0.00 $7,424.53
2110 Horseshoe Lane (75605) 02/13/01 $7.424.53
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, TX 75606-3343
<2100-00 Trustee Compensation>, 200

Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 $2,042.10 $0.00 $2.042.10
2110 Horseshoe Lane (75605} 02/13/01 $2,042.10
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, TX 75606-3343
<2200-00 Trustee Expenses>, 200

Clerk, United States Bankruptcy Court  Admin Ch. 7 $0.00 $300.00 . $0.00
Ferguson Building, 2nd Floor 02/13/01 $300.00
200 East Ferguson

Tyler, TX 75702
<2700-00 Clerk of the Court Costs (includes adversary and other filing fees)>, 200

Dealers Electrical Supply Unsecured 6916 $11,816.91« $0.00 $11,816.91
P.O. Box 2535 03/21/01 $11,816.91

Objection filed to "priority” status; Order allowing in amount filed only
Waco, TX 76702-2535 as unsecured, non-priority claim signed 4/18/02.

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>, 610

2 County of Harrison, et.al. Secured 10000-00070-00 $4,513.81« $0.00 $1,342.32
clo Michael Reed 04/02/01 0000-000000 $1,342.32
PO Box 26990

Objection to portion of claim; Order disallowing as filed and allowing

Austin, TX 78755 only in amount of $1,342.32 signed 4/18/02.
<4800-00 State and Local Tax Liens (pre-pet. income, sales, pers. prop. - not real prop.)>, 100

3 Cummins Southern Plains Unsecured 1607 $3,446.80 $0.00 $3,446.80
PO Box 90027 04/04/01 $3,446.80
Arlington, TX 76004-3027
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726{a)(2)>, 610

4 Performance Floors Unsecured $378.88 $0.00 $378.88
4003 Wesley 04/09/01 $378.88
Longview, TX 75605
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>, 610

5 Nations Rent Unsecured 100483 $2,902.22 $0.00 $2,902.22
PO Box 7878 04/25/01 $2,902.22

Ft. Worth, TX 76111
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a}(2)>, 610

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 10/01/03 01:57 PM

Page: 2

Claims Register

P.0O. Box 809015
Dallas, TX 75380-9015

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>, 610

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.
Claims Bar Date:  06/11/01
Claim Claimant Name / Claim Type/ Claim Ref./ Amount Filed/ Paid Claim
Number <Category>, Priority Date Filed Notes Allowed te Date Balance

6 Southwestern Bell Yellow Pages Unsecured  501242800-00 $1,467.22 $0.00 $1,467.22
Atin: J David Richmond 05/03/01 $1,467.22
1430 Empire Central, 4th Floor
Dallas, TX 75247
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>, 610

7 Taylor Lightning Protection Unsecured $3,034.50+ $0.00 $0.00
27921 Hwy. Bivd. 05/03/01 $0.00

Objection filed, claim already paid. Disallowed per Order signed
Katy, TX 77494 4/18/02.
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)}{2)>, 610
8 Pete McCarty Oil Co. Unsecured $516.63 $0.00 $516.63

P.C. Box 1436 05/25/01 $516.63
Marshall, TX 75671-1436
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>, 610

9 Texas Comptroller of Public Accounts  Priority 1-75-1075971-9 $2,671.91 $0.00 $2,671.91
Revenue Acctg. / Bankruptcy Section  06/01/01 $2,671.91
P.O. Box 13528 Franchise Tax Ch. 171.
Austin, TX 78711-3528 9/29/03 - Claim amount confirmed by phone (512.463.2173).
<5800-00 Claims of Governmental Units--§ 507(a){8)>, 570

10 Avaya Communications fdba Lucent  Unsecured 0100545884 $170.28 $0.00 $170.28

Technologies 06/05/01 $170.28
clo D&B Bankruptcy Services
P.O. Box 5126
Timonium, MD 21094
<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a){(2)>, 610

11 Mary Jo Schnorbus Admin Ch. 7 $682.00 $0.00 $682.00
602 Lansdowne 06/11/01 $682.00
Marshall, TX 75672
<2420-00 Costs to Secure/Maintain Property (E.g., casualty insurance, locksmith, repairs)>, 200

12 Hibernia National Bank Unsecured $169,656.16 « $0.00 $169,656.16
Attn: Larry Millard 06/11/01 $169,656.16

Obijection filed to secured status; allowed only as unsecured,
non-priority claim per Order signed 9/4/01. The Claim was filed by
Mary Jo Schnorbus, with her address on the claim, however,
distribution will be sent directly to Hibernia National Bank.

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 10/01/03 01:57 PM

Page: 3

Claims Register

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.

Claims Bar Date: 06/11/01

Claim Claimant Name / Claim Type/ Claim Ref./ Amount Filed/ Paid Claim
Number <Category>, Priority Date Filed Notes Allowed to Date Balance
13 Texas Workforce Commission Priority 00-069091-0 $306.53 $0.00 $306.53
Attn: Cashier 06/27/01 $306.53
P.O. Box 149080 9/29/03: Claim amount confirmed via telephone (512.463.2782).
Austin, TX 78714-9080
<5800-00 Claims of Governmental Units-—-§ 507(a)}(8)>, 570
AUC-E  Bill Watson Auction Service Admin Ch. 7 $1,674.59 $1,674.59 $0.00
P.0.Box 713 06/15/01 $1,674.59
Order 7/11/01.
Kilgore, TX 75663-0713
<3620-00 Auctioneer for Trustee Expenses>, 200
TAUC-F  Bill Watson Auction Service Admin Ch. 7 $3,937.05 © $3,937.05 $0.00
P.O.Box 713 06/15/01 $3,937.05
Order 7/11/01.
Kilgore, TX 75663-0713
<3610-00 Auctioneer for Trustee Fees (including buyers premiums)>, 200
ACCT-F  Cox, Rogers and Associates AdminCh. 7 $300.00 $300.00 $0.00
Attn: Robert G. Rogers, CPA 03/05/02 $300.00
703 N. Green Orders: 3/5/02 and 3/23/03.
Longview, TX 75601
<3410-00 Accountant for Trustee Fees (Other Firm)=>, 200
ATTY-E  Smead, Anderson & Dunn Admin Ch. 7 $682.40 $682.40 $0.00
Attn: Bob Anderson 08/18/03 $682.40
P.O. Box 3343 Approved per Order signed 9/22/03.
Longview, TX 75606-3343
<3120-00 Attorney for Trustee Expenses (Trustee Firm)>, 200
'ATTY-F  Smead, Anderson & Dunn Admin Ch. 7 $5,242.50 - $5,242 .50 $0.00
Attn: Bob Anderson 08/18/03 $5,242.50

P.O. Box 3343
Longview, TX 75606-3343

<3110-00 Attorney for Trustee Fees (Trustee Firm)>, 200

Order signed 9/22/03.

Case Total: $12,136.54 $204,824.49



UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
Tyler Division

IN RE: )} CASENO. 01-20344
A&H, Inc. )
dba A&H Electric )
} CHAPTER7
DEBTOR(S) )

TRUSTEE'S REPORT OF PROPOSED FINAL DISTRIBUTION:S

The undersigned Trustee of the cstate hereby submits to the Court and to the United States Trustee this
Report of Proposed Final Distributions.

1. The Court has entered orders which have become final, and which dispose of all objections to claims, all
objections to the Trustee's Final Report, all applications for compensation, and all other matters which must be
determined by the Court before final distribution can be made.

2. The Trustee proposes to make final distribution of the funds of the estate as follows, and will make such
distribution unless written objection thereto is made, filed and served on the Trustee and on the United States Trustee.

1. BALANCE ON HAND $ 71,354.01
2. ADMINISTRATIVE EXPENSES TO BE PAID * $ 10,148.63
3. SECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * 1,342.32
4. PRIORITY CLAIMS TO BE PAID * 2,978.44
5. UNSECURED CLAIMS TO BE PAID * 56,884.62
6. OTHER DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE PAID 0.00
7. TOTAL DISTRIBUTIONS TO BE MADE $ 71,354.01

(SUM OF LINES 2 THROUGH 6)

8. ZERO BALANCE AFTER ALL DISTRIBUTIONS -0-
(LINE 1 LESS LINE 7)

* (SEE ATTACHED SCHEDULE OF PAYEES AND AMOUNTS)

pate,_(0-[- 03 /

Bob Anderson, Trustee
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Claims Distribution Register

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.

Page: 1

Claim #

Date Pri

Clatmant / Amount Amount Paid
Proof / <Category> / Memo Filed Allowed to Date

Claim
Balance

Proposed
Payment

Secured Claims:

2

04/02/01

100

County of Harrison, et.al. 4,513.81 1,342.32 0.00
¢/o Michael Reed *

PO Box 26990

Austin, TX 78755

ci

<4800-00 State and Local Tax Liens (pre-pet. income, sales, pers. prop. - not real prop.)>

Objection to partion of claim; Order disaliowing as filed and allowing only in amount of $1,342.32 signed 4/18/02,

Priority 100: 100% Paid

1,

342.32

1,342.32

Admin Ch. 7 Claims:

02/13/01 200 Bob Anderson 7.,424.53 7,424 53 0.00

02113101

02/13/01

06/11/01

06/15/01

06/15/01

2110 Horseshoe Lane (75605)
P.O. Box 3343

Longview, TX 75606-3343

ci

<2100-00 Trustee Compensation>

Bob Anderson 2,042.10 2,042.10 0.00
2110 Horseshoe Lane (75605)

P.O. Box 3343

Longview, TX 75606-3343

ci

<2200-00 Trustee Expenses>

Clerk, United States Bankruptcy Court 0.00 300.00 300.00
Ferguson Building, 2nd Floor

200 East Ferguson

Tyler, TX 75702

<2700-00 Clerk of the Court Costs (includes adversary and other filing fees)>

Mary Jo Schnorbus 682.00 682.00 0.00
602 Lansdowne

Marshall, TX 75672

ci

<2420-00 Costs to Secure/Maintain Property (E.g., casualty insurance, locksmith, repairs)>

Bill Watson Auction Service 1,674.59 1,674.59 1,674.59
P.O.Box 713

Kilgore, TX 75663-0713

ci

<3620-00 Auctioneer for Trustee Expenses>

Order 7111/01.

P.C. Box 713

Kilgore, TX 75663-0713

ci

<3610-00 Auctioneer for Trustee Fees (including buyers premiums)>
Order 7/11/01.

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed

Bill Watson Auction Service 3,937.05 3,037.05 3,937.05

7,

2,

424,53

042.10

7,424.53

2,042.10



Printed: 10/01/03 01:59 PM Claims Distribution Register Page: 2
Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.
Claimant / Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed
Claim # Date Pri Proof/ <Category>/ Memo Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
TACCT-F 0305002 200 Cox, Rogers and Associates 30000 30000 30000 000 0.00
Aftn: Robert G. Rogers, CPA
703 N. Green
Longview, TX 75601
ci
<3410-00 Accountant for Trustee Fees (Other Firm)>
Orders: 3/5/02 and 3/23/03,
ATIY.E 08/18/03 200 Smead, Anderson & Dumn 68240 68240 68240 000 000
: Attn: Bob Anderson
P.O. Box 3343
Longview, TX 756606-3343
ci
<3120-00 Attorney for Trustee Expenses (Trustee Firm)>
Approved per Order signed 9/22/03.
ATTY-F 08MB/03 200 Smead,Anderson&Dumn 524250 524250 524250 000 000
Attn: Bob Anderson
P.Q. Box 3343
Longview, TX 75606-3343
ci
<3110-00 Attorney for Trustee Fees (Trustee Firm)>
Order signed 9/22/03,
Total for Priority 200: 100% Paid $21,985.17 $22,285.17 $12,136.54 $10,148.63 $10,148.63
Total for Admin Ch. 7 Claims: $21,985.17 $22,285.17 $12,136.54 $10,148.63 $10,148.63
Priority Claims:
9 06/01/01 570 Texas Comptroller of Public Accounts 2,671.91 2,671.91 0.00 2,671.91 2,671.91
Revenue Acctg. / Bankruptcy Section
P.O. Box 13528
Austin, TX 78711-3528
ci
<5800-00 Claims of Governmental Units--§ 507(a)(8)>
Franchise Tax Ch. 171.
9/29/03 - Claim amount confirmed by phone (512.463.2173).
13 06/27/01 570 Texas Workforce Commission ' 306.53 306.53 0.00 306.53 306.53
Aftn: Cashier
P.O. Box 149080
Austin, TX 78714-9080
ci
<5800-00 Claims of Governmental Units—§ 507 (a)(8)>
9/28/03: Ciaim amount confirmed via telephone {512.463.2782).
Total for Priority 570: 100% Paid $2,978.44 $2,978.44 $0.00 $2,978.44 $2,978.44
Total for Priority Claims: $2,978.44 $2,978.44 $0.00 $2,978.44 $2,978.44
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Claims Distribution Register

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.

Page: 3

Claim # Date

Pri

Claimant / Amount Amount
Proof / <Category> / Memo Filed Allowed

Paid
to Date

Claim
Balance

Proposed
Payment

Unsecured Claims:

1 03/21/01

610

Dealers Electrical Supply 11,816.91 11,816.91
P.O. Box 2535 *
Waco, TX 76702-2535

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>

0.00

11,816.91

3,631.30

Objection filed to "priority” status; Order allowing in amount filed only as unsecured, non-priority claim signed 4/18/02.

3 04/04/01

Cummins Southern Plains 3,446.80 3,446.80
PQ Box 90027

Arlington, TX 76004-3027

¢

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>

3,446.80

4 04/09/01

5 04/25/1

Performance Floors 378.88 378.88
4003 Wesley

Longview, TX 75605

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726{a)(2)>

Nations Rent 2,902.22 2,902.22
PO Box 7878

Ft. Worth, TX 76111

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>

6 05/03/01

7 05/03/01

8 05/25/01

10 06/05/01

Southwestern Bell Yellow Pages 1,467.22 1,467.22
Attn: J David Richmond

1430 Empire Central, 4th Floor

Dallas, TX 75247

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a}(2)>

0.00

0.00

2,802.22

1,467.22

1,030.02

Taylor Lightning Protection 3,034.50 0.00
27921 Hwy. Bivd.

Katy, TX 77494

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>
Objection filed, claim already paid. Disallowed per Order signed 4/18/02.

Pete McCarty Qil Co. 516.63 516.63
P.C. Box 1436

Marshall, TX 75671-1436

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>

Avaya Communications fdba Lucent 170.28 170.28
Technologies

c/o D&B Bankruptcy Services

P.C. Box 5126

Timonium, MD 21094

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>

(*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 10/01/03 01:59 PM Claims Distribution Register Page: 4
Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.

Claimant / Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed
Claim # Date Pri Proof/ <Category> { Memo Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment
" 12 06101 610 HibemiaNationalBank T 16965616  169.656.16 000  169,656.16  50,699.07

*

Attn: Larry Millard

P.Q. Box 809015

Datllas, TX 75380-9015

ci

<7100-00 General Unsecured § 726(a)(2)>
Objection filed to secured status; allowed only as unsecured, non-pricrity claim per Order signed 9/4/01. The Claim was filed
by Mary Jo Schnorbus, with her address on the claim, however, distribution will be sent directly to Hibernia National Bank.

Total for Priority 610:  29.88342% Paid $193,389.60  $190,355.10 $0.00  $190,355.10 $56,884.62
Total for Unsecured Claims: $193,389.60  $190,355.10 $0.00  $190,355.10 $56,884.62
Total for Case : $222,867.02 $216,961.03 $12,136.54  $204,824.49 $71,354.01

{*) Denotes objection to Amount Filed



Printed: 10/01/03 02:02 PM

Claims Proposed Distribution

Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.

Report Includes ONLY Claims with a Proposed Distribution

Page: 1

Case Balance: $71,354.01 Total Proposed Payment:  $71,354.01 Remaining Balance: $0.00
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed Remaining
Claim# Claimant Name Type Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment Funds
2 County of Harrison, et.al. Secured 4,513.81* 1,342.32 0.00 1,342.32 1,342.32 70,011.69
Claim Memo: Objection to portion of claim; Order disallowing as filed and allowing only in amount of $1,342.32 signed 4/18/02.
SUBTOTAL FOR SECURED 4,513.81 1,342.32 0.00 1,342.32 1,342.32
Bob Anderson Admin Ch. 7 2,042.10 2,042.10 0.00 204210 2,042.10 67,969.59
<2200-00 Trustee Expenses>
Bob Anderson Admin Ch, 7 7.424.53 7,424 53 0.00 7,424 53 7,424 53 60,545.06
<2100-00 Trustee Compensation=>
11 Mary Jo Schnorbus Admin Ch. 7 682.00 682.00 0.00 682.00 682.00 59,863.06
<2420-00 Costs to Secure/Maintain Property (E.g., casualty insurance, locksmith, repairs)>
Claim Memo:
SUBTOTALFOR ADMINCH. 7 10,148.63 10,148.63 0.00 10,148.63 10,148.63
9 Texas Comptroller of Public  Priority 2,671.91 2,671.91 0.00 2,671.91 2,671.91 57,191.15
Accounts
Claim Memo: Franchise Tax Ch. 171.
9/29/03 - Claim amount confirmed by phone (512.463.2173).
13 Texas Workforce Priority 306.53 306.53 0.00 306.53 306.53 56,884.62
Commission
Claim Memo: 9/29/03: Claim amount confirmed via telephone (512.463.2782).
SUBTOTAL FOR PRIORITY 2,978.44 2,978.44 0.00 2,978.44 2,978.44
1 Dealers Electrical Supply Unsecured 11,816.91* 11,816.91 0.00 11,816.91 3,531.30 53,353.32
Claim Memo:  Objection filed to "priority" status; Order allowing in amount filed only as unsecured, non-priority claim signed 4/18/02.
3 Cummins Southem Plains Unsecured 3,446.80 3,446.80 .00 3,446.80 1,030.02 52,323.30
4 Performance Floors Unsecured 378.88 378.88 0.00 378.88 113.22 52,210.08
5 Nations Rent Unsecured 2,902.22 2,902.22 0.00 2,902.22 867.28 51,342.80
(5] Southwestern Bell Yellow Unsecured 1,467.22 1,467.22 0.00 1,467.22 438.46 50,904.34
Pages
8 Pete McCarty Qil Co. Unsecured 516.63 516.63 0.00 516.63 154,39 50,749.95
10 Avaya Communications fdba Unsecured 170.28 170.28 0.60 170.28 50.88 50,699.07
Lucent Technologies
12 Hibernia Nationat Bank Unsecured 169,656.16* 169,656.16 0.00 169,656.16 50,699.07 0.00

Claim Memo:

Objection filed to secured status; allowed only as unsecured, non-priority claim per Order signed 9/4/01. The Claim was filed by

Mary Jo Schnorbus, with her address on the claim, however, distribution will be sent directly to Hibernia National Bank.

SUBTOTAL FOR UNSECURED

190,355.10

190,355.10

0.00

190,355.10

56,884.62

(*} Denotes objection to Amount Filed
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Claims Proposed Distribution
Case: 01-20344 A&H, Inc.
Report Includes ONLY Claims with a Proposed Distribution

Case Balance: $71,354.01 Total Proposed Payment:  $71,354.01 Remaining Balance: $0.00
Amount Amount Paid Claim Proposed Remaining
Claim# Claimant Name Type Filed Allowed to Date Balance Payment Funds
Total for Case 01-20344 : $207,995.98 $204,824.49 $0.00 $204,824.49 $71,354.01
CASE SUMMARY
Amount Amount Paid Proposed % paid
Filed Allowed to Date Payment

Total Administrative Claims : $10,148.63 $10,148.63 $0.00 $10,148.63 100.000000%

Total Priority Claims : $2,978.44 $2,978.44 $0.00 $2,978.44 100.000000%

Total Secured Claims : $4,513.81 $1,342.32 $0.00 $1,342.32 100.000000%

Total Unsecured Claims : $190,355.10 $190,355.10 $0.00 $56,884.62 29.883423%



IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE EASTERN DISTRICT OF TEXAS
TYLER DIVISION

IN RE: A&H, INC. / BANKRUPTCY CASE: 01-20344
/
/ CHAPTER 7

NOTICE OF FILING OF FINAL REPORT OF TRUSTEE.
APPLICATION FOR COMPENSATION AND PROPOSED DISTRIBUTIONS

NOTICE IS GIVEN that the Trustee’s Final Report and Account, report of Proposed Final Distribution
and Applications for Compensation have been filed. These documents are available for public inspection
at the office of the Bankruptcy Clerk, 200 E. Ferguson, Tyler, Texas 75702, or at the trustee’s office
whose name and address is as follows:

BOB ANDERSON 911 N.W. LOOP 281, SUITE 412 LONGVIEW, TEXAS 75604

The following Applications for Compensation have been filed:

Applicants Fees Requested Expenses Requested
BOB ANDERSON 7424.53 2042.10
Trustee
0.00 0.00

Attorney for Trustee

U. S. Bankruptcy Court 0.00

The trustee’s account shows:
Total Receipts Total Disbursements Balance

$ 86525.05 $ 15171.04 $ 71354.01

In addition to the commissions and fees that may be allowed by the Court, liens and priority claims
which must be paid in advance of general creditors have been allowed in the total amount of
$.4320.76 ; general unsecured claims have been allowed in the amount of $_193389.60
The debtor has/has not been discharged.

Written objections to the Final Report, Application for Compensation and/or proposed Distributions
must be filed with the Clerk of the Court and served on the trustee at the above mentioned address within
30 days from the date of this notice. If no objections are filed, the Court may consider the Report and
Applications without hearing. If objections are filed, a hearing will be held on

at

Date: JAMES D. TOKOPH, Clerk of Court

By:

Deputy Clerk



